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1
SCA Tork #TM1616 500 shts/rl, 96 rls/cs, 4.00” 

length sheet size
CS 1,800  $          55.00  $    99,000.00  $          59.81  $  107,658.00  $          44.14  $    79,452.00 

2
Cascades North River #4064 500 shts/rl, 96 

rls/cs, 4.00” length sheet size
CS 2,105

3
Bedford Paper #SBT-503 500 shts/rl, 96 rls/cs, 

3.75” length sheet size
CS 1,595

4
Bedford Paper #SBT-501 500 shts/rl, 96 rls/cs, 

3.50” length sheet size
CS 1,900  $          39.41  $    74,879.00 

5

Other:

LaPort - Kruger 0575 96/500 2-ply

All American Paper Co. - GJO2550096

Central Poly Bag Corp. - Resolute #235 

4.4:x3.5", 2 ply, 500 sheets, 96 rolls/case

CS 1,595  $           50.60  $    80,707.00  $           60.00  $    95,700.00  $          39.44  $    62,906.80 

6
Tork USA #TJ0922A 1000’/rl, 12 rls/cs, 3.50” 

length sheet size
CS 590  $          43.00  $    25,370.00  $          49.00  $    28,910.00 

7
Kruger Products Embassy #05620 1000’/rl, 8 

rls/cs 3.50” length sheet size
CS 880

8
Kimberly Clark/Scott Essential #07805 1000’/rl, 

12 rls/cs 3.55” length sheet size
CS 590

9
Cascades North River #4097 1000’/rl, 12 rls/cs 

3.50” length sheet size
CS 590

10
Bedford Paper #JRT-404 1000’/rl, 12 rls/cs 3.30” 

length sheet size
CS 590  $          25.98  $    15,328.20  $          32.56  $    19,210.40  $          25.08  $    14,797.20 

11

Other:

All American Paper Co. - GJO2510012

Central Poly Bag Corp. - Resolute #700, 

3.4"x1000' 2 ply, G, 12 rolls/cs

CS 590  $           36.45  $    21,505.50  $           29.99  $    17,694.10 

Item A - Conventional Size Restroom Tissue

Item B - 9" Jumbo Junior Size Restroom Tissue

Central Poly Bag Corp.

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

FURNISH & DELIVER PAPER PRODUCTS (RESTROOM TISSUE, PAPER TOWELS, ETC.) 22-112-FM

BID TABULATION

All American Paper Co. Malor & Company Inc.Laport Inc. Standard Company Valdes LLCGarvey's Office Products
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12
Tork USA Premium #MB540A / 420580 250 

towels/pk,12 pks/cs, 9” x 10”sheet
CS 2,838  $           34.30  $    97,343.40  $          33.00  $    93,654.00  $          49.00  $  139,062.00  $          23.31  $    66,153.78 

13
Kruger Embassy Premium #01540 334 

towels/pk, 12 pks/cs, 9” x 9.5” sheet
CS 2,838

14
Kruger White Swan Classic #01920 334 

towels/pk, 12 pks/cs, 9” x 9.5” sheet
CS 2,838  $          21.65  $    61,442.70 

15
Bedford Paper #MF101 250 towels/pk, 16 

pks/cs, 9.25" x 9.50" sheet
CS 2,838  $          21.00  $    59,598.00 

16
Cascades North River #1342 250 towels/pk, 16 

pks/cs, 9.10" x 9.50"
CS 2,838

17
Scott Essential #01840 250 towels/pk,16 pks/cs, 

9.20" x 9.40"
CS 2,838

18

Other:

Central Poly Bag Corp. - Maral #P2003, 

9.25"x9,5" 16/250/cs (4000)

CS 2,838  $           34.00  $    96,492.00 

19
Wausau Bay West Eco Soft #54000 500 shts/rl, 

96 rls/cs, 4.00” length sheet size
CS 712  $          55.00  $    39,160.00  $          59.00  $    42,008.00 

20
SCA Tork #TM1616 500 shts/rl, 96 rls/cs, 4.00” 

length sheet size
CS 712  $          44.14  $    31,427.68 

21
Cascades North River #4064 500 shts/rl, 96 

rls/cs, 4.00” length sheet size
CS 712

22
Atlas #A250 500 shts/rl, 96 rls/cs, 4.50” sheet 

size
CS 634

23
Bedford Paper #SBT-501 500 shts/rl, 96 rls/cs, 

3.50" length sheet size
CS 712  $          39.41  $    28,059.92 

24

Other: 

Laport Inc. - Kruger 0575 96/500 2-ply

All American Paper Co. - GJO2550096

Central Poly Bag Corp. - Resolute #235, 

4.4"x3.5", 2 ply, 500 sheets, 96 rolls/cs

CS 712  $           50.60  $    36,027.20  $           60.00  $    42,720.00  $          39.44  $    28,081.28 

25
Georgia Pacific Blue Basic (Previously Acclaim) 

#20204 250 towels/pk,16 pks/cs, 9.4” x 9.2” 

sheet

CS 194  $          29.21  $      5,666.74 

26
Kimberly Clark Scott Essential #01804 250 

towels/pk, 16 pks/cs, 9.2” x9.4” sheet
CS 194

27
Tork USA Premium #MB540A / 420580 250 

towels/pk,12 pks/cs, 9” x 10”sheet
CS 194  $           34.30  $      6,654.20  $          33.00  $      6,402.00  $          28.31  $      5,492.14 

28
Cascades Décor #1759 250 towels/pk,16 pks/cs, 

9 ” x 9.5” sheet
CS 194

29
Tork USA  #CB530 250 towels/pk, 16 pks/cs, 

10.13” x 12.75” sheet 
CS 194

30
Bedford Paper #MF101 250 towels/pk, 16 

pks/cs, 9.25" x 9.50" sheet
CS 194  $          21.00  $      4,074.00 

31

Other: 

Laport Inc. - Kruger 01920 MF White 4,000/cs

Central Poly Bag Corp. - Marcal #P2003, 9,5" x 

9.25" 16/250/cs (4000)

CS 194  $           34.00  $      6,596.00  $          21.65  $      4,200.10 

All American Paper Co. Central Poly Bag Corp. Garvey's Office Products Laport Inc. Malor & Company Inc.

Item C - Multi-Fold Paper Towels

Item D - Conventional Size Restroom Tissue

Item E - Multi-Fold Paper Towels

Standard Company Valdes LLC
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32
Wausau Bay West Eco Soft #41090  90 shts/rl, 

30 rls/cs,11” x  9” sheet
CS 166  $          70.00  $    11,620.00 

33
Georgia Pacific Blue (formally Preference) 

#27385  85 shts/rl, 20 rls/cs, 11” x 8.8” sheet
CS 270

34
Kimberly Clark Scott #41482  128 shts/rl, 20 

rls/cs, 11” x 8.75” 
CS 180

35
Tork USA Universal #HB1995  210 shts/rl, 12 

rls/cs, 11” x 9” sheet
CS 222  $          39.00  $      8,658.00 

36
Kruger White Swan #01656 80 shts/rl, 30 rls/cs, 

10.9” x  8.6” sheet
CS 184  $          23.23  $      4,274.32 

37
Bedford Paper #HHT085 85 sheets/rl, 30 rls.cs, 

8" x 11" sheet
CS 194  $          34.38  $      6,669.72  $          22.49  $      4,363.06 

38

Other: 

All American Paper Co. - GJO25012

Central Poly Bag Corp. - Marcal #06350, 11x8 2 

ply, 85 sheets, 30/cs

CS 194  $           32.70  $      6,343.80  $           36.00  $      6,984.00 

39
Marcal Sani-Hanks #682 40 shts/bx, 200 bx/cs, 

7.5” sheet size
CS 96  $          39.00  $      3,744.00 

40
Kruger Products White Swan #08500  80 

shts/bx, 135 bx/cs, 8.0” sheet size
CS 72  $          72.45  $      5,216.40 

41
Sani Facial Tissue #MoreX 40 shts/bx, 200 

bx/cs, 7.88" sheet size
CS 96

42

Other: 

Valdes - Sani Facial Tissue #MoreX 40 shts/bx

All American Paper Co. - GPCW 548550

CS 80  $           40.30  $      3,224.00  $          45.00  $      3,600.00 

43
Wausau Bay West Eco Soft #13000  100 

shts/bx, 30 bxs/cs, 8” sheet size
CS 24  $          29.00  $         696.00  $          50.00  $      1,200.00 

44
Georgia-Pacific Preference #48100 100 shts/bx, 

30 bxs/cs, 8” sheet size
CS 24

45
Kruger Products White Swan #08301   100 

shts/bx, 30 bxs/cs, 7.4” sheet size
CS 24  $          21.50  $         516.00 

46
Cascades North River #4082  100 shts/bx, 30 

bxs/cs, 7.5” sheet 
CS 24

47
Georgia Pacific #GP47410 100 sheets/bx, 30 

bxs/cs, 8.00" sheet
CS 24  $          19.50  $         468.00 

48

Other: 

All American Paper Co. - MRC2930CT

Central Poly Bag Corp. - Central Poly# 2930 

8.5x7.5:, 2 ply, 100/bx, 30/cs

CS 24  $           21.00  $         504.00  $           39.00  $         936.00 

49
Kleenex #11090 White 1 ply, 8” x 600’, 6 rls/cs, 

3,600 ft/cs
CS 3,400  $          75.00  $  255,000.00  $          49.00  $  166,600.00 

50
Georgia Pacific #280-55 Pref Ultra White  1 ply, 

7.87” x 600’, 12 rls/cs, 7,200 ft/cs
CS 1,728

51
Kruger Embassy Supreme #01240 White 1 ply, 

8” x 600’, 6 rls/cs, 3,600 ft/cs
CS 3,400

52
Bedford Paper #HWTW552 White  1 ply, 7.81" x 

800', 6 rls/cs, 4,800ft/cs
CS 3,400  $           48.30  $  164,220.00  $          29.59  $  100,606.00  $          33.82  $  114,988.00  $          26.75  $    90,950.00 

416,529.10$   267,122.10$   527,940.00$   282,571.80$   506,468.74$   323,393.72$   280,789.18$   

Invitations Sent

Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

Laport Inc. Malor & Company Inc. Standard Company Valdes LLC

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

All American Paper Co. Central Poly Bag Corp. Garvey's Office Products

Bid Opening 10/4/2022 @ 2:30 PM DW, NE, YQ

24

0

7

Item I - Hard Roll Paper Towels

NOTES

1. Contractor shall provide only one (1) response per item. 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

Item F - Perforated Roll Towels

Item G - Boxed Facial Tissue (Large)

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

Item H - Boxed Facial Tissue (Large)

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 


