
ITEM
HMA Surface 
Course, Mix 

D, N70

HMA Surface 
Course, Mix 

D, N50

HMA Binder 
Course, IL-

19, N70

HMA Binder 
Course, IL-

19, N50

Polymerized 
HMA Surface 
Course, Mix 

E, N70

Driveway / 
Private Mix

SS-1 Asphalt 
Emulsion 

(Bulk)

SS-1 
Asphalt 

Emulsion (5-
Gal. Pail)

Dumping of 
Asphalt 

Grindings

Dumping of 
Clean 

Concrete

Dumping of 
Broken 
Asphalt

UOM Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton

Location 1 $65.00 $65.00 $62.00 $62.00 $84.00 $65.00 No Bid $65.00 $8.00 8.00$        $8.00

Location 1 $67.50 $66.50 $59.00 $58.00 $120.00 $64.00 No Bid $60.00 $7.75 $7.75 $7.75

Location 1 $67.50 $66.50 $59.00 $58.50 $120.00 $64.00 No Bid $60.00 $7.75 $7.75 $7.75

Location 1 $69.25 $66.75 $61.75 $61.75 $120.00 $65.75 No Bid $60.00 $7.75 No Bid $7.75

Location 1 $71.50 $69.50 $65.75 $64.25 $120.00 $65.75 No Bid $60.00 $7.75 No Bid $7.75

Location 1 $74.25 $71.25 $63.75 $64.75 $120.00 $69.50 No Bid $60.00 $7.75 No Bid $7.75

Location 1 $73.00 $73.00 $67.00 $67.00 $125.00 $73.00 $8.00 $50.00 No Charge No Charge No Charge
Location 2 $73.00 $73.00 $67.00 $67.00 $125.00 $73.00 No Bid $50.00 No Charge No Charge No Charge

Dupage Materials Company, LLC
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Chicago Materials Corporation

Superior Asphalt Materials, LLC

Route 66 Asphalt Company

K-Five Hodgkins LLC

Plote Construction, Inc.
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ITEM
HMA Surface 
Course, Mix 

D, N70

HMA Surface 
Course, Mix 

D, N50

HMA Binder 
Course, IL-

19, N70

HMA Binder 
Course, IL-

19, N50

Polymerized 
HMA Surface 
Course, Mix 

E, N70

Driveway / 
Private Mix

SS-1 Asphalt 
Emulsion 

(Bulk)

SS-1 
Asphalt 

Emulsion (5-
Gal. Pail)

Dumping of 
Asphalt 

Grindings

Dumping of 
Clean 

Concrete

Dumping of 
Broken 
Asphalt

UOM Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Load Load Load

Location 1  $68.00 $66.00 $65.00 $66.00 $94.50 $52.00 $8.00 $50.00 $65.00 $50.00 $65.00
Location 2 $68.00 $66.00 $65.00 $66.00 $94.50 $52.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid $65.00
Location 3 $68.00 $66.00 $65.00 $66.00 $94.50 $52.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid $65.00
Location 4 $68.00 $66.00 $65.00 $66.00 $94.50 $52.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid $65.00

Builders Asphalt, LLC
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