THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

OSTOMY, TRACHEOSTOMY, UROLOGICAL, ENTERAL SUPPLIES
SERVICES AND ENTERAL FEEDING FORMULAS 26-026-DCC

BID TABULATION

v

P;‘l’]frzslz::';al:xx'f:l& MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc.

NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EI'::DEED PRICE EX;—EII::%ED
1 |Adapter for Spike Set 774655 EA | 180 | $ 030 $ 54.00 NO BID

2 ggfcdisng Bag Container E-Pump cs| 2 |$ 11500|$  23000|$ 13540 $  270.80
3 |Feeding Bag Container E-Pump EA 91 $ 383 $ 348.53| $ 451 $ 410.41
4 |G-Tube 14FR w/5cc Balloon EA 26 |'$ 2350 | $ 611.00 NO BID

5 |G-Tube 16FR w/15cc Balloon EA 3 $ 2350 | $ 70.50 NO BID

6 [G-Tube 18FR w/15cc Balloon EA 4 $ 2350 | $ 94.00 NO BID

7 |G-Tube 22FR w/15cc Balloon EA 4 $ 2350 | $ 94.00 NO BID

8 |Kangaroo safety screw pouch BX 3 $ 106.20 | $ 318.60 | $ 14963 | $ 448.89
9 [Spike Set for E-Pump EA [2,195( $ 354 $ 7,770.30 NO BID

10 |[Spike Set for E-Pump EA | 750 | $ 354($ 2,65500( $ 585| $ 4,387.50
11 [Syringe, 60cc Catheter Tip Piston EA [4,310] $ 060| $ 2,586.00( $ 0521 % 2,241.20
12 |Tube Anchor Device EA 7 $ 710( $ 49.70 ( $ 9291 § 65.03
13 ?gg;t( Barrier Rings 13/16” 20 MM BX | 2 |s 27.50| $ 55.00 | § 4167| 8 83.34
14 g‘f/{‘oﬁéa:}fia’r rier EA|l 2 |s 590§  11.80| $ 463|$ 9.26
15 |Convatec Barrier EA 1 $ 236 $ 236 $ 6.88] % 6.88
16 |Convatec Barrier EA 1 $ 210| $ 210| $ 502] % 5.02
17 |Convatec Pouch EA 2 |$ 127 $ 254 % 389 % 7.78
18 |Convatec Pouch EA 1 $ 210| $ 210( $ 582 % 5.82
19 |[Eakin Cohesive Seal Small 2” EA | 302 | $ 349 $ 1,05338( $ 590 $ 1,781.80




THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
OSTOMY, TRACHEOSTOMY, UROLOGICAL, ENTERAL SUPPLIES
SERVICES AND ENTERAL FEEDING FORMULAS 26-026-DCC

BID TABULATION

v

Professional Medical &
Surgical Supply, Inc.

MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc.

NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EI'::DEED PRICE EX;E:E%ED
20 [Hollister Drain/Tube Attachment Device EA 1 710 $ 710| $ 7671 % 7.67
21 |Hollister Pouch EA 1 345| $ 345| § 691 $ 6.91
22 |Hollister Pouch EA 2 1.75( $ 350 $ 3421 $ 6.84
23 [Hollister Pouch EA 1 550 $ 550 $ 659 % 6.59
24 |Ostomy Pouch, 1-1/2” 1 PC Closed w/Filter BX 3 NO BID $ 63.93] $ 191.79
25 |Ostomy Clamp-Repl EA 5 117 $ 585| % 433] % 21.65
26 |Paste Skin Barrier Tube EA 4 622 $ 2488 $ 7401 % 29.60
27 |Pouch 1” Urostomy Convex Barrier BX 1 2350 $ 2350 $ 5435] $ 54.35
2g |Pouch, 2-1/4” Drainable BX | 1 1216 $ 1216 $ 34.11| $ 34.11

10/BX
29 |Pouch, 2-3/4” Drainable w/Filter BX 3 50.74 | $ 152.22 NO BID
30 |Pouch, 2-3/4” Closed End w/Filter BX 20 75.00| $ 1,500.00 NO BID
31 |oopen, 2-347 Surft Natura BX | 2 9250 $  185.00 NO BID
32 |Pouch, 2-3/4” Urostomy w/Accuseal Tap w/Valve | BX 17 1815 $ 308.55| $ 3564 % 605.88
33 gg/‘éc)’(" 2-3/8" Esteem Synergy BX | 1 56.43 | $ 56.43 NO BID
34 ':g;éc)’(" Drainable %" — 2-1/4" BX | 46 2443|$ 112378 $ 4274 $  1,966.04
35 |Pouch, Drainable 7/8 w/Convex Barrier BX 3 2095| $ 62.85 NO BID
36 |Pouch, Drainable Mini Pouch, EX Wear Cut To Fit| BX 2 19.75| $ 3950 $ 50.02 $ 100.04
37 ?g;g(" 2 7Drainable New Image 2 PC Beige BX | 2 15.75| $ 31.50 | $ 27.35| $ 54.70
38 Powder, Stomahesive Protective Powder BTL 1 439| $ 439 $ 486| $ 4.86

10z




THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

OSTOMY, TRACHEOSTOMY, UROLOGICAL, ENTERAL SUPPLIES
SERVICES AND ENTERAL FEEDING FORMULAS 26-026-DCC
BID TABULATION

v

Professional Medical &
Surgical Supply, Inc.

MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc.

EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. |ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
39 [Wafer 2-3/4” FlexWEar BX 47 35.001 $ 1,645.00 NO BID
40 [Wafer 2-3/4” Stomahesive Skin Barrier BX 15 16.26 | $ 24390 $ 44271 $ 664.05
41 [Wafer, 2-1/4” Durahesive Flexible Skin Barrier BX 3 2245| $ 67.35| $ 5823 $ 174.69
42 (Wafer 2-3/4” Durahesive Flexible Skin Barrier BX 2 23.64| $ 47.28| $ 3764 $ 75.28
43 [(Wafer 2-3/4” Stomahesive Skin Barrier BX 6 2099 | $ 125.94| $ 4576 | $ 274.56
44 |Wafer2-3/8" Esteem Synergy BX | 1 2181 $ 21.81| 4176| $ 41.76
10/BX
45 [Wafer Esteem 1PC — Stomahesive 3/8” — 4” BX 15 38.06| $ 570.90 | $ 35421 $ 531.30
Wound Fistula Pouch 4” x 3”
46 5/PKG PKG 3 NO BID NO BID
47 |Convatec Esteem Synergy EA 1 NO BID $ 530 $ 5.30
4g |Shiley EA | 2 6.95| $ 1390 $ 1103 $ 2206
15 MM Cap : : ’ ’
49 |Trach Clean & Care Tray-AirLife EA |[2,840 200| $ 5,680.00( $ 3411 $ 9,684.40
Trach Tube Cuff
50 4DCT EA 5 2250 $ 11250 | $ 9341 $ 46.70
Trach Tube Shiley
51 4DCFS EA 5 56.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 9341 $ 46.70
52 |Trach Tube Shiley EA | 15 2950 $ 44250 $ 67.66| $  1,014.90
4 CFN
53 |Trach Tube Shiley EA | 2 2250 | $ 45.00 | $ 6766 $  135.32
6 CFN
54 |Trach Tube EA| 5 NO BID NO BID
Size 6
55 |1rach Tube EA | 1 NO BID NO BID
Size 7
Trach/Laryn Tube
56 8 Non-Cuffed EA 4 68.50 | $ 274.00 | $ 9341 $ 37.36
57 |Trach/Laryn Tube Non-Cuffed EA 13 68.50 | $ 890.50 | $ 934 $ 121.42
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OSTOMY, TRACHEOSTOMY, UROLOGICAL, ENTERAL SUPPLIES
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Professional Medical &
Surgical Supply, Inc.

MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc.

NO. |ITEM UoM| QTY | PRICE EX;EI'::ZED pRICE | FXTENDED
58 |Trach/Laryn Tube Non-Cuffed EA 11 68.50  $ 753.50 | $ 934 $ 102.74
59 [Tracheostomy Disposable Inner Cannula BX 10 325 $ 3250 $ 934 $ 93.40
60 ?Eilftrhsizi(ggied System Tray EA 21 NO BID NO BID

61 fgt?ﬂ%rcio:?tlex oo EA | 41 300§  123.00| $ 974§ 399.34
62 fgt;‘fg%rciol‘;’ex - EA | 9 3.00| $ 27.00| § 1254 $  112.86
63 ggt&ﬁe;nf:lfema' Self Adhering LF EA | 120 300§  360.00| $ 278§ 333.60
64 ?gt;]reter-CoudeTip-Latex Free Urethral EA 30 217| $ 65.10 | $ 516 3 154.80
65 fgt;‘reter'c"“de Tip-Latex Urethral EA | 39 520§  202.80| $ 516§ 201.24
66 ffftrh;éirfo'ey EA | 10 0.82| $ 8.20 NO BID

67 | aneter-Foley EA | 18 082|$ 1476 $ 4658  83.70
68 fgftrh;éecfo'ey EA | 3 082 $ 2.46 NO BID

69 fgtfrr‘%tsfo'ey EA | 192 082|$ 15744 243|'$ 46656
70 |JaneterFoley EA | 15 082|$  1230|$ 399|$ 5985
71 |JaneterFoley EA | o 082|$  7462|$ 243|$ 22113
72 |SaneterFoley EA | 60 082|$ 4920 $ 399|$ 23940
73 |SaneterFoley EA | 57 082|$ 4674 $ 399|$ 22743
74 gzaftrhgéizFo'ey EA | 71 0.82| $ 58.22 | $ 333§ 23643
75 g;‘ft:‘g;ir'FO'ey EA | 68 0.82| $ 55.76 | $ 399§  271.32
76 |Catheter-Foley EA | 14 082|$  11.48|$ 399|$ 5586

24fr 30cc
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OSTOMY, TRACHEOSTOMY, UROLOGICAL, ENTERAL SUPPLIES
SERVICES AND ENTERAL FEEDING FORMULAS 26-026-DCC

BID TABULATION

v

Professional Medical &
Surgical Supply, Inc.

MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc.

NO. |ITEM uom| QTY |  PRICE EX;EI':;ED PRICE EX;EI'\‘CEI’EED
77 |SaneterFoley EA | 48 082|$  39.36|$ 399§ 191.52
78 ggftrhgéizFO'ey EA | 6 0.82| $ 4.92| $ 399§ 23.94
79 |SaneterFoley EA | 7 0.82| $ 574| $ 394| 5  27.58
80 ggftrhggiz':o'ey EA | 8 0.82| $ 6.56 | $ 1091/ $ 87.28
81 fgftrhgéir;_';‘z;yﬁee EA | 10 3.00| $ 30.00 | $ 9.74| $ 97.40
82 ffftrh;zfrf‘r:?::;ilione EA | 540 078 $  421.20( $ 146|$  788.40
83 (13‘(1)ftr1deTip Urinary Catheter EA | 5 0.90 | $ 450| $ 1096 | $ 54.80
84 ?;‘r‘deﬂp Urinary Catheter EA | 35 0.90 | $ 31.50 | § 1096| $  383.60
85 fgf‘r‘deﬂp Urinary Catheter EA | 26 0.90 | $ 2340 $ 1096 $  284.96
86 |[External Male Freedom Cath-Large EA | 517 1.05]| $ 54285 $ 206 $ 1,065.02
87 |External Male Freedom Cath-Med EA 30 105 $ 3150 $ 2.06| $ 61.80
88 |External Male Freedom Cath-Medium EA | 537 1458  77865| $ 206|$ 1,106.22
89 |External Male Freedom Cath-Small EA | 813 145|$ 1,17885| $ 206| $ 1,674.78
90 |External Male Freedom Cath-Small EA | 335 145( $ 485.75| $ 2.06| $ 690.10
91 |Foley Insertion Tray EA | 880 250 $ 2,200.00| $ 438|$ 385440
92 Tru Close Gravity Drainage Bag EA 4 165/ s 6.60| $ 2679 $ 10716
600 ML
93 |Urinary 18” Extension Drain Tubing EA 11 1.00( $ 11.00( $ 453 $ 49.83
94 |Urinary Cath Leg Strap-Posey EA | 158 350 $ 553.00| $ 545 $ 861.10
95 [Urinary Cath-Secure Anchor Device BX 10 NO BID $ 310 $ 31.00
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Surgical Supply, Inc.

MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc.

NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY |  PRICE EX;EI':;ED PRICE EX;EI"‘C':I’EED
96 ;gg%r{,,'frain Bag Antirflx EA | 1,528 250 $ 3,382000( $ 398|$  6,081.44
97 g(;g?vlr{Leg Bag EA | 15 165| $ 24.75| $ 198| $ 29.70
98 %B%%'Leglp‘bdomen Bag EA | 4 1.65| $ 6.60 NO BID

99 Ezsxuéeo‘?ea”\pp'e cs | 72 2891 $ 2,081.52]| $ 4991 $ 3,593.52
100 E:i“geogea”v"xed Berry cs | 180 2891|$ 520380 $ 4991 $ 8,983.80
101 ?i“;grno""ZShakeW/Carb Steady Vanilla cs | 144 63.95| $ 9,208.80 | $ 5298 | $  7,629.12
102 g':‘;i;gg mgﬁ(%domes cs| 25 57.25| §  1,431.25 NO BID

103 g';‘;i;gg :Aigiﬂ(%dottles cs | 10 59.80 [ $  598.00( $§ 11819 § 1,181.90
104 gtj1°‘§g‘§“;f|§$ﬁk§gttles cs | 10 80.00| $  800.00| $ 13864 $ 1,386.40
105 ge)z’i%:)'g ﬁﬁ'gﬁﬁkggmes cs | 10 3375|$  337.50 NO BID

106 ge)z’i%:)'gﬁﬁ';?ﬁkggmes cs | 120 33.75| $  4,050.00 | $ 71.05| $  8,526.00
107 ge:i%gg ﬁﬁ'gﬁﬁkggmes cs | 64 3875 $ 2,480.00 | $ 76.95| $  4,924.80
108 szE’(rg"(;?arb Steady Vanilla cs | 24 6122 $ 1,469.28/ $ 9845( $  2,362.80
109 gTTSBeoPJEKSSmeS cs| 5 5250 $  262.50 NO BID

10151000 ML RTH Bortes cs | 1 4500|5450 NO BID

m ;Vﬁ?&gg ,'\\IM_P ;CTk:%ottles cs | 12 65.00| $  780.00 | $ 84.32| $ 1,011.84
12 gin:?(l)i(t)%:\)l(l)_iércl-lie;ottles Cs 1 57.50 | $ 57.50 NO BID

113 gi”}f’gg%ﬁ';ﬁegomes cs | 4 57.50| $  230.00| $ 64.85| $  259.40
114 gi”}f’éﬁ%ﬁ‘:ﬁfgotﬂes cs| 2 6000 § 12000 $  6318|$ 12636




THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
OSTOMY, TRACHEOSTOMY, UROLOGICAL, ENTERAL SUPPLIES
SERVICES AND ENTERAL FEEDING FORMULAS 26-026-DCC

BID TABULATION

v

P;‘l’]frzslz::';al:xx'f:l& MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc.
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY |  PRICE EX;EI'::%ED PRICE EX;EI"‘CEI’EED
115 gitfgozdoMpLag?: Bags cs| 12 |s 60.82| $  729.84| $ 6318 $  758.16
116 fgtff 132“231'4 packed cs| 4 |s 7836 $  313.44| $ 5241 $  209.64
GRAND TOTAL| § 72,481.89 $ 87,455.99

NOTES

1. MAR-J Medical Supply, Inc. Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
* No. 36, when multiplied, ($50.02 x 2 = $100.04), resulted in an increase of $11.12.
* No. 77, when multiplied, ($3.99 x 48 = $191.52), resulted in an increase of $167.58.
* No. 114, when multiplied, ($63.18 x 2 = $126.36), resulted in a decrease of ($10.70).

» GRAND TOTAL was corrected from $87,461.39 to $87,455.99.

2. Professional Medical & Surgical Supply, Inc. Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
. 15, when multiplied, ($2.36 x 1 = $2.36), resulted in a decrease of ($0.004).

. 16, when multiplied, ($2.10 x 1 = $2.10), resulted in an increase of $0.001.

. 18, when multiplied, ($2.10 x 1 = $2.10), resulted in an increase of $0.001.

. 25, when multiplied, ($1.17 x 5 = $5.85), resulted in an increase of $0.02.

. 64, when multiplied, ($2.17 x 30 = $65.10), resulted in an increase of $0.10.

. 82, when multiplied, ($0.78 x 540 = $421.20), resulted in a decrease of ($1.80).

* No
*No
* No
*No
* No
*No

» GRAND TOTAL was corrected from $72,483.61 to $72,481.89.

Bid Opening 5/27/2026 @ 2:30 PM

HK, SP

Invitations Sent

32

Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses
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