



THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
PRE-EMPLOYMENT AND ON-SITE DRUG & ALCOHOL SCREENING 24-055-HR
BID TABULATION

✓													
				Elmhurst Occupational Health		Advocate Medical Group		Physicians Immediate Care		Nao Medical		Concentra	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
SECTION A													
1	Post-Offer or Pre-Placement Physical Exam	EA	135	\$ 66.00	\$ 8,910.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 11,475.00	\$ 97.00	\$ 13,095.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 17,550.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 13,230.00
2	5-Panel Drug Screen - DOT & Non-DOT	EA	120	\$ 57.00	\$ 6,840.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 7,920.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 8,040.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 6,960.00
3	Functional Job Screen	EA	35	\$ 195.00	\$ 6,825.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 5,250.00	\$ 94.00	\$ 3,290.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 4,550.00	\$ 123.00	\$ 4,305.00
4	TB Test - T-Spot, Quantiferon Gold	EA	115	\$ 95.00	\$ 10,925.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 7,475.00	\$ 101.00	\$ 11,615.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 11,500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 25,875.00
5	Chest X-Rays - two (2) view PA & Lat	EA	12	\$ 124.00	\$ 1,488.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 1,620.00	\$ 97.00	\$ 1,164.00	\$ 117.00	\$ 1,404.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 1,176.00
6	Pulmonary Function	EA	5	\$ 54.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 335.00
7	OSHA Questionnaire/Certificate	EA	5	\$ 36.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 225.00
8	DOT Breath Alcohol Screen	EA	20	\$ 41.00	\$ 820.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 820.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 900.00
9	Rabies Vaccination (3 doses)	EA	5	\$ 975.00	\$ 4,875.00	\$ 1,788.00	\$ 8,940.00	\$ 1,314.00	\$ 6,570.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 1,587.00	\$ 7,935.00
10	Titers Testing for Rabies Vaccination	EA	12	\$ 77.00	\$ 924.00	\$ 117.00	\$ 1,404.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 5,100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 3,000.00
SECTION A TOTAL					\$ 42,057.00		\$ 45,434.00		\$ 50,294.00		\$ 51,694.00		\$ 63,941.00



				Elmhurst Occupational Health		Advocate Medical Group		Physicians Immediate Care		Nao Medical		Concentra	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
SECTION B: On-site Testing													
11	Annual Random Pool Drug Screen Program Administrative Fee	EA	1	NO BID		\$ 250.00	\$ 250.00	NO BID		NO CHARGE		NO BID	
12	Quarterly On-site Drug & Alcohol Testing Fee	EA	4	NO BID		\$ 240.00	\$ 960.00	NO BID		\$ 1,500.00	\$ 6,000.00	NO BID	
13	On-site DOT 5-Panel Drug Test	EA	100	NO BID		\$ 66.00	\$ 6,600.00	NO BID		\$ 60.00	\$ 6,000.00	NO BID	
14	On-site DOT Breath Alcohol Test	EA	100	NO BID		\$ 45.00	\$ 4,500.00	NO BID		\$ 60.00	\$ 6,000.00	NO BID	
SECTION B TOTAL					NO BID				\$ 12,310.00			NO BID	
										NO BID		\$ 18,000.00	
													NO BID

NOTES													
1. DISA Global Solutions, Inc. has been deemed non-responsive due to not providing required documents.													
2. There are three (3) changes to Elmhurst Occupational Health's bid tab:													
a. Item 3 when multiplied out resulted in an adjusted Extended Price of \$6,825.00 (35 X \$195.00 = \$6,825.00).													
b. Item 9 unit price was adjusted to \$975.00 to reflect 3 doses at \$325 per dose. When multiplied out, this resulted in an Extended Price of \$4,875.00 (5 X \$975.00 = \$4,875.00).													
c. Section A Total increased from \$34,082.00 to \$42,057.00.													
3. There are four (4) changes to Advocate Medical Group's bid tab:													
a. Item 3 when multiplied out resulted in an adjusted Extended Price of \$5,250.00 (35 X \$150.00 = \$5,250.00).													
b. Section A Total decreased from \$53,039.00 to \$45,434.00.													
c. Item 12 unit price adjusted to \$240.00 to account for two (2) hours of labor at \$120 per hour. When multiplied out, this resulted in an adjusted Extended Price of \$960.00 (4 X \$240.00 = \$960.00).													
d. Section B Total increased from \$11,350.00 to \$12,310.00.													

Bid Opening 6/5/2024 @ 2:30 PM	BR, HK, NE
Invitations Sent	79
Total Vendors Requesting Documents	1
Total Bid Responses	5