
NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 MAY 2018 $3,000.00 -70%  $                        900.00 
2 2020 $6,000.00 -20%  $                     4,800.00 
4 NOV 2019 $1,500.00 -36%  $                        960.00 
5 MAY 2020 $500.00 -36%  $                        320.00 
6 NO BID $1,500.00 NO BID NO BID

7 2021 NET 
SHEET $500.00 20%  $                        600.00 

8 2021 NET 
SHEET $500.00 20%  $                        600.00 

9 2021 JANUARY $2,500.00 -50%  $                     1,250.00 
10 NET SHEET $1,000.00 20%  $                     1,200.00 

11 2021 $1,500.00 -40%  $                        900.00 

12 NET SHEET $1,000.00 15%  $                     1,150.00 
13 1/21 $3,000.00 -60%  $                     1,200.00 
14 9/18 $3,000.00 -60%  $                     1,200.00 

15 2021 NET 
SHEET $500.00 20%  $                        600.00 

16 2021 $500.00 -60%  $                        200.00 
17 2021 $1,500.00 -30%  $                     1,050.00 

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
PLUMBING SUPPLIES AND TOOLS 20-133-FM



CLAY VALVE

COOPER B-LINE-STRUT & HANGERS

MANUFACTURER/COMPANY

ANVIL
APOLLO

BELL & GOSSETT
BLACK SWAN

BRAY

BRIDGIT: SOLDER

CANFIELDS: SOLDER

CHARLOTTE PIPE

CRESLINE
ELKHART
FERNCO

FLOWSAFE: SOLDER

GRINNELL
GEORGE FISHER

PIPING, FITTING & VALVE SUPPLIES

ROYAL PIPE & SUPPLY CO.



18 1/20 $1,500.00 -10%  $                     1,350.00 

19 12/20 $500.00 20%  $                        600.00 

20 2021 $2,000.00 -50%  $                     1,000.00 
21 2/21 $2,000.00 -40%  $                     1,200.00 
22 2/21 $600.00 20%  $                        720.00 
23 NO BID 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID
24 2020 $500.00 -20%  $                        400.00 
25 1/2020 $1,000.00 -40%  $                        600.00 
26 2/21 $4,000.00 -40%  $                     2,400.00 
27 3/20 $4,000.00 -36%  $                     2,560.00 
28 12/31/20 $500.00 20%  $                        600.00 
29 1/21 $1,000.00 -15%  $                        850.00 
30 NO BID $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
31 1/21 $500.00 -20%  $                        400.00 
32 2021 $1,000.00 -20%  $                        800.00 
33 1/21 $500.00 -20%  $                        400.00 
34 1/21 $1,500.00 -40%  $                        900.00 
35 NO BID $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
36 1/21 $4,000.00 -50%  $                     2,000.00 
37 1/21 $1,000.00 -10%  $                        900.00 
38 6/20 $5,000.00 -40%  $                     3,000.00 
39 1/21 $1,000.00 -40%  $                        600.00 
40 1/21 $3,000.00 -36%  $                     1,920.00 
41 NO BID $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
42 2/20 $1,500.00 -20%  $                     1,200.00 
43 1/21 $800.00 -40%  $                        480.00 

41,810.00$                    

PRO FLO
RECTORSEAL

JW HARRIS
KENNEDY

LACO
M I F A B

MUELLER INDUSTRIES

GUARDIAN: EYEWASH STATION PARTS

HERCULES CHEMICAL CO.MEGALOC PIPE 
THREAD SEALANT

IDEAL NO HUB BANDS
JR SMITH

WOODFORD
ZURN

PIPING, FITTING & VALVE SUPPLIES SUBTOTAL

VICTAVLIC
VIEGA
WADE
WATTS

WOLVERINE BRASS

RED & WHITE VALVES
SIOUX CHIEF MANUFACTURING

SPEARS
TA CHEN

TYLER PIPE

NIBCO
OATEY
ORION



NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 1/21 $3,000.00 20%  $                     3,600.00 
2 1/21 $4,500.00 20%  $                     5,400.00 

3 1/21 $250.00 -10%  $                        225.00 

4 1/21 $250.00 -10%  $                        225.00 

5 1/21 $2,000.00 -36%  $                     1,280.00 

6 1/21 $2,000.00 -36%  $                     1,280.00 
7 2020 $6,000.00 -20%  $                     4,800.00 
8 3/21 $500.00 -32%  $                        340.00 
9 3/21 $500.00 -32%  $                        340.00 
10 2/19 $500.00 20%  $                        600.00 
11 2/20 $500.00 20%  $                        600.00 
12 2/20 $3,000.00 -50%  $                     1,500.00 
13 12/20 $2,000.00 -40%  $                     1,200.00 
14 12/20 $2,000.00 -40%  $                     1,200.00 
15 1/20 $500.00 -10%  $                        450.00 
16 1/20 $500.00 -10%  $                        450.00 
17 1/20 $1,000.00 -20%  $                        800.00 
18 1/20 $1,000.00 -20%  $                        800.00 
19 1/21 $1,000.00 -40%  $                        600.00 
20 8/19 $1,000.00 -36%  $                        640.00 
21 8/19 $1,000.00 -36%  $                        640.00 
22 5/20 $1,000.00 -36%  $                        640.00 
23 5/20 $1,000.00 -36%  $                        640.00 
24 12/20 $1,000.00 20%  $                     1,200.00 
25 1/21 $500.00 -10%  $                        450.00 
26 1/21 $500.00 -10%  $                        450.00 
27 1/21 $500.00 -60%  $                        200.00 
28 1/21 $500.00 -25%  $                        375.00 

MANUFACTURER/COMPANY

CRANE FIXTURES
CRANE PARTS

ELJER FIXTURES
ELJER PARTS

ELKHART PARTS
ELKAY FIXTURES

ELKAY PARTS
GERBER PARTS

AMERICAN SPECIALTIES FIXTURES

AMERICAN SPECIALTIES PARTS

AMERICAN STANDARD FIXTURES

AMERICAN STANDARD PARTS
APOLLO PARTS

BEMIS FIXTURES
BEMIS PARTS

GERBER FIXTURES
HARVEY PARTS

HAWS FIXTURES
HAWS PARTS

JOSAM FIXTURES

BRADLEY FIXTURES
BRADLEY PARTS

BRASS CRAFT PARTS
CHICAGO FAUCET FIXTURES

CHICAGO FAUCET PARTS

JOSAM PARTS

ACORN FIXTURES
ACORN PARTS

FIXTURES & REPAIR PARTS & TOOLS



29 3/20 $750.00 -25%  $                        562.50 
30 3/20 $750.00 -25%  $                        562.50 
31 2/20 $1,000.00 -15%  $                        850.00 
32 2020 $1,000.00 20%  $                     1,200.00 
33 2020 $1,000.00 20%  $                     1,200.00 
34 2/21 $2,000.00 -36%  $                     1,280.00 
35 2/21 $2,000.00 -36%  $                     1,280.00 
36 1/21 $750.00 -20%  $                        600.00 
37 1/21 $750.00 -20%  $                        600.00 
38 1/21 $1,500.00 -15%  $                     1,275.00 
39 1/21 $1,500.00 -15%  $                     1,275.00 
40 NO BID $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID
41 5/20 $750.00 -35%  $                        487.50 
42 12/19 $2,000.00 -10%  $                     1,800.00 
43 9/20 $5,000.00 -42%  $                     2,900.00 
44 9/20 $5,000.00 -42%  $                     2,900.00 
45 1/21 $500.00 -10%  $                        450.00 
46 1/21 $500.00 -10%  $                        450.00 
47 3/20 $500.00 -20%  $                        400.00 
48 3/20 $500.00 -20%  $                        400.00 
49 7/19 $1,500.00 -40%  $                        900.00 
50 7/19 $1,500.00 -40%  $                        900.00 
51 6/20 $10,000.00 -40%  $                     6,000.00 
52 1/21 $4,000.00 -36%  $                     2,560.00 
53 1/21 $6,000.00 20%  $                     7,200.00 
54 1/2 $6,000.00 20%  $                     7,200.00 
55 1/21 $1,000.00 -36%  $                        640.00 
56 1/21 $1,000.00 -36%  $                        640.00 

 $                   77,437.50 FIXTURES & REPAIR PARTS & TOOLS SUBTOTAL

SYMMONS PARTS
T & S FIXTURES

T & S PARTS
VIEGA
WATTS

SLOAN FIXTURES
SLOAN PARTS

SPEAKMAN FIXTURES

METCRAFT FIXTURES

SPEAKMAN PARTS
SYMMONS FIXTURES

POWERS FIXTURES
POWERS PARTS
PRO FLO PARTS

RICHARDS SPECIALTY TOOLS
RIDGID TOOLS

METCRAFT PARTS

WILLOUGHBY FIXTURES
WILLOUGHBY PARTS

ZURN FIXTURES
ZURN PARTS

MOEN FIXTURES
MOEN PARTS

OASIS FIXTURES
OASIS PARTS

KOHLER FIXTURES
KOHLER PARTS

LEONARD PARTS



NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 1/21 $3,500.00 -35%  $                     2,275.00 

2 NO BID $500.00 NO BID NO BID

3 1/21 $3,000.00 -35%  $                     1,950.00 

4 1/21 $5,000.00 -35%  $                     3,250.00 

5 2/21 $2,500.00 -25%  $                     1,875.00 

 $                     9,350.00 

NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 2/21 $1,000.00 -10%  $                        900.00 

3 2/21 $1,000.00 -10%  $                        900.00 
4 NO BID $8,000.00 NO BID NO BID
5 2/21 $1,000.00 -10%  $                        900.00 
6 1/21 $3,000.00 -40%  $                     1,800.00 

 $                     5,460.00 

HYDROMATIC PUMP
RHEEM

ZOLLER PUMP

REPLACEMENT PUMPS & WATER HEATERS SUBTOTAL

MANUFACTURER/COMPANY

$1,500.00 -36%  $                        960.00 2/192

BRADFORD WHITE

AMES (RPZ PARTS)

AQUA FLOW LUBRICANT (RPZ) 

FEBCO (RPZ PARTS)

MANUFACTURER/COMPANY

RPZ REPAIR PARTS & GREASE SUBTOTAL

WATTS (RPZ PARTS)

ZURN/WILKINS (RPZ PARTS)

A.O. SMITH
BELL & GOSSETT: 

CIRCULATING PUMPS

RPZ REPAIR PARTS & GREASE

REPLACEMENT PUMPS & WATER HEATERS



NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 TYPE K HARD & SOFT PIPE 12/20 $1,000.00 -50%  $                        500.00 
2 TYPE K HARD & SOFT FITTINGS 2/21 $1,000.00 -70%  $                        300.00 
3 TYPE L HARD & SOFT

  
PIPE 12/20 $4,000.00 -50%  $                     2,000.00 

4 TYPE L HARD & SOFT FITTINGS 2/21 $4,000.00 -70%  $                     1,200.00 
5 TYPE M HARD & SOFT

  
PIPE 12/20 $250.00 -50%  $                        125.00 

6 TYPE M HARD & SOFT FITTINGS 2/21 $250.00 -70%  $                          75.00 

 $                     7,800.00 

NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 SCHEDULE 40 PIPE 1/20 $500.00 -60%  $                        200.00 
2 SCHEDULE 40 FITTINGS 1/20 $500.00 -70%  $                        150.00 
3 SCHEDULE 80 PIPE 1/20 $1,250.00 -50%  $                        625.00 
4 SCHEDULE 80 FITTINGS 1/20 $1,250.00 -70%  $                        375.00 

 $                     1,350.00 

NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 1/21 $1,500.00 -50%  $                        750.00 
2 1/21 $1,500.00 -50%  $                        750.00 

 $                     1,500.00 

NO HUB PIPE
NO HUB FITTINGS

COPPER PIPE & FITTINGS SUBTOTAL

CAST IRON

PVC PIPE & FITTINGS SUBTOTAL

DESCRIPTION

CAST IRON SUBTOTAL

DESCRIPTION

7 VIEGA PRO PRESS -
LARGER SIZES XLC FITTINGS 6/20 $6,000.00 -40%  $                     3,600.00 

DESCRIPTION

COPPER PIPE & FITTINGS

PVC PIPE & FITTINGS



NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 SCHEDULE 40 PIPE 2/21 $500.00 -60%  $                        200.00 
2 SCHEDULE 40 FITTINGS 2/21 $500.00 -60%  $                        200.00 
3 SCHEDULE 80 PIPE 2/21 $1,500.00 -50%  $                        750.00 
4 SCHEDULE 80 FITTINGS 2/21 $1,500.00 -60%  $                        600.00 

 $                     1,750.00 

NO.

DATE AND/OR 
TITLE OF 

APPLICABLE 
CATALOG

ESTIMATED 
DOLLAR 
USAGE

% OF 
ADJUSTMENT

(-, +)
EXTENDED PRICE

1 2/21 $500.00 -10%  $                        450.00 
2 2/21 $2,500.00 -80%  $                        500.00 
3 2/21 $1,500.00 -60%  $                        600.00 

 $                     1,550.00 BRASS SUBTOTAL

DESCRIPTION

PIPE
NIPPLES
FITTINGS

BRASS

BLACK IRON PIPE & FITTINGS SUBTOTAL

DESCRIPTION

BLACK IRON PIPE & FITTINGS



 $ 41,810.00 

 $ 77,437.50 

 $ 9,350.00 

 $ 5,460.00 

 $ 7,800.00 

 $ 1,350.00 

 $ 1,500.00 

 $ 1,750.00 

 $ 1,550.00 

 $          148,007.50 

NE, JM
16
2
2

TOTAL BID PRICING

NOTES 
1. Apple Specialties Inc. did not bid a majority of items and did not correctly provide extended price.
2. There is two (2) changes for Royal Pipe & Supply Co., Bid Tab:

a. Zurn Fixtures when multiplied % of adjustment by estimated dollar usage $1,000 x -36% = $640.
b. Zurn Parts when multiplied % of adjustment by estimated dollar usage $1,000 x -36% = $640.

Bid Opening 1/25/2021 2:00 PM
Invitations Sent

Total Vendors Requesting Documents
Total Bid Responses

GRAND TOTAL

PIPING, FITTING & VALVE SUPPLIES SUBTOTAL

FIXTURES & REPAIR PARTS & TOOLS SUBTOTAL

RPZ REPAIR PARTS & GREASE SUBTOTAL

REPLACEMENT PUMPS & WATER HEATERS SUBTOTAL

COPPER PIPE & FITTINGS SUBTOTAL

PVC PIPE & FITTINGS SUBTOTAL

CAST IRON SUBTOTAL

BLACK IRON PIPE & FITTINGS SUBTOTAL

BRASS SUBTOTAL


	PIPING, FITTING & VALVE SUPPLIE

