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1
Port Authority Silk Touch Men's               

Short Sleeve w/Pocket

Size XS - XL

EA 40  $           17.99  $         719.60  $           17.45  $         698.00  $           19.24  $         769.60 

2
Port Authority Silk Touch Men's                  

Short Sleeve w/Pocket

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 10  $           20.99  $         209.90  $           21.95  $         219.50  $           25.24  $         252.40 

3
Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 

Short Sleeve Polo w/Pocket

Size S - XL

EA 20  $           22.99  $         459.80  $           22.85  $         457.00  $           25.24  $         504.80 

4
Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 

Short Sleeve Polo w/Pocket

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 10  $           25.99  $         259.90  $           27.35  $         273.50  $           26.74  $         267.40 

5
Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 

Short Sleeve Polo w/Pocket

Size 5XL - 6XL

EA 5  $           25.99  $         129.95  $           31.85  $         159.25  $           32.74  $         163.70 

6
Port Authority Men's Silk Touch                 

Long Sleeve Polo

Size XS - XL

EA 10  $           18.99  $         189.90  $           18.95  $         189.50  $           20.74  $         207.40 

7
Port Authority Men's Silk Touch                 

Long Sleeve Polo

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 5  $           21.99  $         109.95  $           23.50  $         117.50  $           26.74  $         133.70 

8
Port Authority Men's EZ Cotton               

 Long Sleeve Polo

Size XS - XL

EA 10  $           24.99  $         249.90  $           25.00  $         250.00  $           27.49  $         274.90 

9
Port Authority Men's EZ Cotton                 

Long Sleeve Polo

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 5  $           26.99  $         134.95  $           29.50  $         147.50  $           33.49  $         167.45 

10
Port Authority Ladies Silk Touch, Poly/Cotton 

Short Sleeve Polo

Size XS - XL

EA 15  $           18.99  $         284.85  $           18.00  $         270.00  $           25.99  $         389.85 
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11
Port Authority Ladies Silk Touch, Poly/Cotton 

Short Sleeve Polo

Size 2XL - 6XL

EA 1  $           18.99  $           18.99  $           24.00  $           24.00  $           21.99  $           21.99 

12
Port Authority Ladies EZ Cotton               

Short Sleeve Polo

Size XS - XL

EA 15  $           21.99  $         329.85  $           21.75  $         326.25  $           23.63  $         354.45 

13
Port Authority Ladies EZ Cotton               

Short Sleeve Polo

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 5  $           21.99  $         109.95  $           26.25  $         131.25  $           29.63  $         148.15 

14
Port Authority Ladies Heavyweight Cotton              

Short Sleeve Polo

Size XS - XL

EA 15  $           19.99  $         299.85  $           19.85  $         297.75  $           21.79  $         326.85 

15
Port Authority Ladies Heavyweight Cotton  

Short Sleeve Polo

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 5  $           19.99  $           99.95  $           24.25  $         121.25  $           27.79  $         138.95 

16
Port Authority Ladies Silk Touch, Poly/Cotton 

Long Sleeve Polo

Size XS - XL

EA 10  $           22.99  $         229.90  $           23.25  $         232.50  $           25.24  $         252.40 

17
Port Authority Ladies Silk Touch, Poly/Cotton 

Long Sleeve Polo

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 1  $           22.99  $           22.99  $           27.75  $           27.75  $           31.24  $           31.24 

18
Port Authority Ladies Silk Touch, Performance 

Polyester Knit Long Sleeve Polo

Size XS - XL

EA 5  $           18.99  $           94.95  $           18.50  $           92.50  $           20.74  $         103.70 

19
Port Authority Ladies Silk Touch, Performance 

Polyester Knit Long Sleeve Polo

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 1  $           18.99  $           18.99  $           23.40  $           23.40  $           26.74  $           26.74 

20
Red Kap Dur-Kap Industrial Pant Men's 

Waist 28 - 60, Black
EA 20  $           18.99  $         379.80  $           21.50  $         430.00  $           20.99  $         419.80 

21
Red Kap Red- E-Prest Work Pant Men's

Waist 26 - 62, Black
EA 20  $           18.99  $         379.80  $           24.75  $         495.00  $           36.74  $         734.80 

22
Lee Women's Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Pant

Size 2 - 20;  Inseam: Petite, Med, Long, Black
EA 10  $           42.99  $         429.90  $           26.25  $         262.50 

23
Lee Women's Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Pant

Plus Size 14W - 30W;  

Inseam: Petite, Med, Long, Black

EA 5  $           46.99  $         234.95  $           34.50  $         172.50 

24
Edwards Pinnacle Ladies  Pull-on Pants Ladies

Size XXS - XL, Black 
EA 5  $           31.99  $         159.95  $           30.75  $         153.75  $           33.74  $         168.70 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

Page 2 of 19



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE
PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE
PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE

Cintas Corporation No. 2 Michael's Uniform Company Standard Textile Co., Inc.

25
Edwards Pinnacle Ladies Pull-on Pants Ladies 

Size 2XL - 4XL, Black                                  
EA 5  $           31.99  $         159.95  $           40.00  $         200.00  $           36.74  $         183.70 

26
Port Authority Men's Challenger Jacket 

Size XS - XL
EA 15  $           48.99  $         734.85  $           47.85  $         717.75  $           49.99  $         749.85 

27
Port Authority Men's Challenger Jacket       

Size 2XL - 6XL
EA 5  $           48.99  $         244.95  $           53.85  $         269.25  $           61.99  $         309.95 

28
Port Authority Tall Men's Challenger Jacket       

Size Tall L - 4XL
EA 2  $           52.99  $         105.98  $           56.85  $         113.70  $           58.99  $         117.98 

29
Port Authority Ladies Challenger Jacket      

Size XS - XL
EA 5  $           48.99  $         244.95  $           50.85  $         254.25  $           52.99  $         264.95 

30
Port Authority Ladies Challenger Jacket       

Size 2XL - 4XL
EA 5  $           48.99  $         244.95  $           55.35  $         276.75  $           58.99  $         294.95 

31
Port Authority - Men's Micro Fleece Jacket 

Size XS - XL
EA 10  $           24.99  $         249.90  $           24.75  $         247.50  $           26.74  $         267.40 

32
Port Authority - Men's Micro Fleece Jacket 

Size 2XL - X4L
EA 5  $           24.99  $         124.95  $           29.25  $         146.25  $           28.74  $         143.70 

33
Port Authority - Ladies Micro Fleece Jacket 

Size XS - XL
EA 10  $           24.99  $         249.90  $           24.75  $         247.50  $           26.74  $         267.40 

34
Port Authority - Ladies Micro Fleece Jacket 

Size 2X - 4XL
EA 5  $           24.99  $         124.95  $           29.25  $         146.25  $           28.74  $         143.70 

35
Port Authority Men's Micro Fleece Vest

Size XS - XL
EA 20  $           22.99  $         459.80  $           23.25  $         465.00  $           25.24  $         504.80 

36
Port Authority Men's Micro Fleece Vest

Size 2XL - 4XL
EA 5  $           22.99  $         114.95  $           27.75  $         138.75  $           31.24  $         156.20 

37
Port Authority Ladies Micro Fleece Vest 

Size XS - XL
EA 10  $           22.99  $         229.90  $           23.25  $         232.50  $           25.24  $         252.40 

38
Port Authority Ladies Micro Fleece Vest

Size 2XL - 4XL
EA 5  $           22.99  $         114.95  $           27.75  $         138.75  $           31.24  $         156.20 

39
Hanes Fill Zip Hoodie                                          

Size S - 3XL, Black
EA 5  $           36.99  $         184.95  $           36.15  $         180.75  $           28.97  $         144.85 

40
Port & Company Knit Cap with Cuff 

Size O/S
EA 10  $             7.49  $           74.90  $             7.50  $           75.00  $             4.49  $           44.90 

41 Port Authority Snapback Twill Cap EA 10  $             8.49  $           84.90  $             8.75  $           87.50  $             5.69  $           56.90 

42
Hanes Short-Sleeve Tee Shirt with Pocket 

Size S - XL
EA 80  $           12.99  $      1,039.20  $           13.25  $      1,060.00  $           14.74  $      1,179.20 

43
Hanes Short-Sleeve Tee Shirt with Pocket 

Size 2XL - 3XL
EA 15  $           15.99  $         239.85  $           17.50  $         262.50  $           18.74  $         281.10 
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44
Gildan Short-Sleeve Tee Shirt with Pocket

Size S - XL
EA 20  $           12.99  $         259.80  $           13.25  $         265.00  $           15.02  $         300.40 

45
Gildan Short-Sleeve Tee Shirt with Pocket 

Size 2XL - 3XL
EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           15.75  $           78.75  $           19.02  $           95.10 

46
Gildan Short-Sleeve Tee Shirt with Pocket  

Size 4XL – 5XL
EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           17.75  $           88.75  $           21.02  $         105.10 

47
Hanes Authentic Long Sleeve T-Shirt with  Pocket 

Size S - XL
EA 15  $           12.99  $         194.85  $           16.85  $         252.75  $           18.49  $         277.35 

48
Hanes Authentic Long Sleeve T-Shirt with  Pocket 

Size 2XL - 3XL
EA 5  $           14.99  $           74.95  $           20.00  $         100.00  $           24.49  $         122.45 

49
Port & Company Long-Sleeve Essential Tee with 

Pocket

Size S - XL

EA 10  $           13.99  $         139.90  $           14.45  $         144.50  $           13.99  $         139.90 

50
Port & Company - Long-Sleeve Essential Tee with 

Pocket 

Size 2XL - 3XL

EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           17.30  $           86.50  $           15.99  $           79.95 

51
Port & Company - Long-Sleeve Essential Tee with 

Pocket 

Size 4XL

EA 1  $           15.99  $           15.99  $           18.25  $           18.25  $           18.99  $           18.99 

52
Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 

Short Sleeve Polo w/Pocket

Size S - XL

EA 20  $           22.99  $         459.80  $           22.85  $         457.00  $           25.24  $         504.80 

53
Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 

Short Sleeve Polo w/Pocket

Size 2XL - 3XL

EA 5  $           22.99  $         114.95  $           25.00  $         125.00  $           26.74  $         133.70 

54
Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 

Short Sleeve Polo w/Pocket

Size 4XL - 5XL

EA 1  $           24.99  $           24.99  $           32.00  $           32.00  $           32.74  $           32.74 

55
Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 

Short Sleeve Polo w/Pocket

Size 6XL

EA 1  $           24.99  $           24.99  $           33.30  $           33.30  $           32.74  $           32.74 

56
Gildan Pique Softstyle Short-Sleeve Polo Size S - 

XL
EA 15  $           13.99  $         209.85  $           13.75  $         206.25  $           15.49  $         232.35 

57
Gildan Pique Softstyle Short-Sleeve Polo Size 

2XL - 3XL
EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           16.50  $           82.50  $           17.49  $           87.45 

58
Gildan Pique Softstyle Short-Sleeve Polo Size 

4XL
EA 1  $           15.99  $           15.99  $           16.95  $           16.95  $           19.49  $           19.49 
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59
Port & Company Short-Sleeve Pique Polo Size S - 

XL
EA 15  $           16.99  $         254.85  $           16.50  $         247.50  $           18.49  $         277.35 

60
Port & Company Short-Sleeve Pique Polo Size 

2XL - 3XL
EA 5  $           16.99  $           84.95  $           19.25  $           96.25  $           22.49  $         112.45 

61
Port & Company Short-Sleeve Pique Polo Size 

4XL
EA 1  $           18.99  $           18.99  $           22.50  $           22.50  $           26.49  $           26.49 

62
Port Authority Short-Sleeve Twill Button Shirt with 

Pocket 

Size S - XL

EA 20  $           26.99  $         539.80  $           26.98  $         539.60  $           28.99  $         579.80 

63
Port Authority Short-Sleeve Twill Button Shirt with 

Pocket 

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 10  $           26.99  $         269.90  $           29.65  $         296.50  $           34.99  $         349.90 

64
Red Cap Short-Sleeve Wrinkle-resistant Cotton 

Work Shirt 

Size S - XL

EA 15  $           18.99  $         284.85  $           27.75  $         416.25  $           27.49  $         412.35 

65
Red Cap Short-Sleeve Wrinkle-resistant Cotton 

Work Shirt 

Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 10  $           18.99  $         189.90  $           27.75  $         277.50  $           30.49  $         304.90 

66
Port Authority Long-Sleeve Twill Button with 

Pocket 

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           28.99  $         144.95  $           28.50  $         142.50  $           21.79  $         108.95 

67
Port Authority Long-Sleeve Twill Button with 

Pocket 

Size 2XL - 3XL

EA 5  $           29.99  $         149.95  $           30.75  $         153.75  $           23.79  $         118.95 

68
Port Authority Long-Sleeve Twill Button Shirt 

w/Pocket

Size 4XL - 6XL

EA 5  $           29.99  $         149.95  $           38.00  $         190.00  $           25.79  $         128.95 

69
Red Kap Long-Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant Cotton 

Work Shirt 

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           20.99  $         104.95  $           28.40  $         142.00  $           31.99  $         159.95 

70
Red Kap Long-Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant Cotton 

Work Shirt 

Size 2XL - 3XL

EA 5  $           20.99  $         104.95  $           28.40  $         142.00  $           34.99  $         174.95 

71
Dickies Regular Fit Jean (Rinsed Indigo Blue)

Waist: 28 -50; Lenth: 29 - 36
EA 10  $           21.99  $         219.90  $           27.00  $         270.00  $           28.49  $         284.90 

72
Lee's Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Jean (Pepper 

Stone)

Waist: 29 - 42; Length: 30 - 36

EA 10  $           34.99  $         349.90  $           29.25  $         292.50 

73
Lee's Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Jean (Zion)

Waist: 29 - 42; Length: 30 - 36
EA 10  $           34.99  $         349.90  $           29.25  $         292.50 
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74
Lee's Carpenter Jean (Dark Indigo)

Waist: 29 - 42;  Length: 30 - 36
EA 50  $           26.99  $      1,349.50  $           29.25  $      1,462.50 

75
Lee's Loose Fit Carpenter Jean Big & Tall (Colton 

Blue)

Waist: 36 - 60;  Length: 29 - 36

EA 1  $           26.99  $           26.99  $           33.75  $           33.75 

76
Red Kap Work Pants 

Waist: 28 - 42; Length: 27 - 36
EA 5  $           19.99  $           99.95  $           32.00  $         160.00  $           31.49  $         157.45 

77
Carhartt Duck Insulated Flannel-Lined Jacket with 

Hood 

Size S – 5XL 

EA 5  $         114.99  $         574.95  $         106.00  $         530.00  $         113.74  $         568.70 

78
Carhartt Duck Insulated Flannel-Lined Jacket with 

Hood 

Size M Tall – 4XL Tall 

EA 1  $         120.99  $         120.99  $         116.00  $         116.00  $         123.50  $         123.50 

79
Carhartt Loose Fit Insulated Traditional Coat 

Size S – 4XL
EA 2  $         125.99  $         251.98  $         125.00  $         250.00  $         133.25  $         266.50 

80
Carhartt Loose Fit Insulated Traditional Coat 

Size L – 3XL Tall
EA 1  $         139.99  $         139.99  $         135.00  $         135.00  $         147.88  $         147.88 

81

Carhartt Men's Loose Fit Firm Duck Insulated Bid 

Overall

Size Short M - 4XL, Regular S - 5XL, Tall M - 4XL

EA 10  $         108.99  $      1,089.90  $         115.00  $      1,150.00  $         133.25  $      1,332.50 

82
Port Authority Challenger Jacket

Size XS - 6XL
EA 5  $           49.99  $         249.95  $           47.85  $         239.25  $           49.99  $         249.95 

83
Port Authority Challenger Jacket

Size L - 4XL Tall
EA 1  $           49.99  $           49.99  $           56.85  $           56.85  $           57.99  $           57.99 

84
Port Authority Men's Back-Block Soft Shell Jacket

Size XS – 4XL
EA 15  $           42.99  $         644.85  $           42.50  $         637.50  $           44.74  $         671.10 

85
Majestic Rain Jacket with Hood - Hivis Yellow

Size M – XL
EA 5  $           39.99  $         199.95  $           30.50  $         152.50 

86
Majestic Rain Jacket with Hood - Hivis Yellow

Size 2XL – 6XL
EA 5  $           39.99  $         199.95  $           30.50  $         152.50 

87
Majestic Rain Pant - Hivis Yellow

Size S – XL
EA 5  $           17.99  $           89.95  $           13.95  $           69.75 

88
Majestic Rain Pant - Hivis Yellow

Size 2XL – 6XL
EA 5  $           17.99  $           89.95  $           13.95  $           69.75 

89
Tinley Vision Rain Jacket 

Size M - XL
EA 5  $           71.99  $         359.95  $           69.95  $         349.75 

90
Tinley Vision Rain Jacket 

Size 2XL - 5XL
EA 5  $           75.99  $         379.95  $           73.25  $         366.25 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

Page 6 of 19



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE
PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE
PRICE

EXTENDED 

PRICE

Cintas Corporation No. 2 Michael's Uniform Company Standard Textile Co., Inc.

91
Tinley Vision Rain Pant 

Size S - XL
EA 5  $           38.99  $         194.95  $           39.50  $         197.50 

92
Tinley Vision Rain Pant 

Size 2XL - 5XL
EA 5  $           38.99  $         194.95  $           42.75  $         213.75 

93

VEA® Waterproof High-Visibility Rainsuite Set - 

Lime

Size M - XL

EA 5  $           56.99  $         284.95  $           53.95  $         269.75 

94
Port Authority Cotton Denim Long-Sleeve Shirt 

Size XS - XL
EA 5  $           29.99  $         149.95  $           28.95  $         144.75  $           31.24  $         156.20 

95
Fersten Pullover Hoodie Sweatshirt 

Size XS – 3XL
EA 5  $           22.99  $         114.95  $           36.15  $         180.75  $           36.49  $         182.45 

96
Hanes Fill Zip Hoodie  

Size S – 3XL
EA 5  $           40.99  $         204.95  $           36.15  $         180.75  $           28.97  $         144.85 

97 Port & Company Knit Cap with Cuff Size O/S EA 15  $             6.99  $         104.85  $             7.50  $         112.50  $             4.49  $           67.35 

98 Carhartt Adjustable Baseball Cap Size O/S EA 5  $           22.99  $         114.95  $           23.00  $         115.00  $           19.50  $           97.50 

99
Hanes Short-Sleeve Tee Shirt with Pocket 

Size S - XL
EA 5  $           12.99  $           64.95  $           13.25  $           66.25  $           14.74  $           73.70 

100
Hanes Short-Sleeve Tee Shirt with Pocket 

Size 2XL - 3XL
EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           17.50  $           87.50  $           18.74  $           93.70 

101
Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee Short 

Sleeve 

Size S - XL  

EA 5  $           12.99  $           64.95  $           12.45  $           62.25  $           14.74  $           73.70 

102
Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee Short 

Sleeve 

Size 2XL - 4XL  

EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           16.50  $           82.50  $           18.74  $           93.70 

103
Hanes Authentic Long-Sleeve T-Shirt with Pocket 

Size S - XL
EA 5  $           12.99  $           64.95  $           16.85  $           84.25  $           18.49  $           92.45 

104
Hanes Authentic Long-Sleeve T-Shirt with Pocket 

Size 2XL - 3XL
EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           20.00  $         100.00  $           24.49  $         122.45 

105
Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee Long 

Sleeve 

Size S - XL  

EA 5  $           13.99  $           69.95  $           17.30  $           86.50  $           13.99  $           69.95 

106
Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee Long 

Sleeve 

Size 2XL - 4XL  

EA 5  $           16.99  $           84.95  $           18.25  $           91.25  $           15.99  $           79.95 
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107
Bulwark Long-Sleeve Dress Uniform Shirt  

Size Reg S – 3XL
EA 5  $           60.99  $         304.95  $           82.25  $         411.25  $           88.25  $         441.25 

108
Bulwark Long-Sleeve Dress Uniform Shirt   

Size Tall M– 3XL
EA 1  $           60.99  $           60.99  $           82.25  $           82.25  $           88.25  $           88.25 

109
Bulwark Front Zip Modacrylic Blend Fleece 

Hoodie, Black

Size S - 3XL

EA 5  $         259.99  $      1,299.95  $         283.00  $      1,415.00  $         305.00  $      1,525.00 

110

Bulwark Front Zip Modacrylic Blend Fleece 

Hoodie, Black  

Size Tall M - 3XL

EA 1  $         259.99  $         259.99  $         283.00  $         283.00  $         305.00  $         305.00 

111
Bulwark Full Zip Front Hooded Fleece Sweatshirt, 

Navy  

Size Reg S – 3XL 

EA 2  $         209.99  $         419.98  $         267.00  $         534.00  $         284.00  $         568.00 

112

Bulwark Full Zip Front Hooded Fleece Sweatshirt, 

Navy

Size Tall M - 3XL 

EA 1  $         209.99  $         209.99  $         267.00  $         267.00  $         284.00  $         284.00 

113
Bulwark Zip-Up Front Fleece Jacket  

Size Reg S – 3XL
EA 5  $         155.99  $         779.95  $         179.50  $         897.50  $         191.00  $         955.00 

114
Bulwark Zip-Up Front Fleece Jacket  

Size Tall M – 3XL
EA 1  $         155.99  $         155.99  $         179.50  $         179.50  $         191.00  $         191.00 

115
Bulwark Crewneck Pullover Sweatshirt, Navy 

Size Reg S – 5XL
EA 5  $         146.99  $         734.95  $         179.50  $         897.50  $         192.50  $         962.50 

116
Bulwark Crewneck Pullover Sweatshirt, Navy 

Size Tall L – XL
EA 1  $         146.99  $         146.99  $         179.50  $         179.50  $         192.50  $         192.50 

117
Bulwark Pullover 1/4 Zip Hooded Fleece 

Sweatshirt, Navy 

Size Reg S - 3XL

EA 2  $         172.99  $         345.98  $         203.95  $         407.90  $         218.75  $         437.50 

118

Bulwark Pullover 1/4 Zip Hooded Fleece 

Sweatshirt, Navy 

Size Tall M - 3XL

EA 1  $         172.99  $         172.99  $         203.95  $         203.95  $         218.75  $         218.75 

119
Bulwark Full Zip-Front Cotton Sweatshirt 

Size Reg S - 5XL
EA 2  $         174.99  $         349.98  $         210.95  $         421.90  $         227.75  $         455.50 

120
Bulwark Full Zip-Front Cotton Sweatshirt 

Size Tall M - 5XL
EA 2  $         174.99  $         349.98  $         210.95  $         421.90  $         227.75  $         455.50 

121
Bulwark Thermal Lined Zip-Front Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy

Size Reg S - 4XL

EA 2  $         224.99  $         449.98  $         248.95  $         497.90  $         267.50  $         535.00 

122

Bulwark Thermal Lined Zip-Front Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy

Size Tall L - 4XL

EA 2  $         224.99  $         449.98  $         248.95  $         497.90  $         267.50  $         535.00 
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123
Bullwark Midweight Dungaree Work Pant

Waist 28-50; Length: 24 - 36

Brown / Navy Duck

EA 10  $           58.99  $         589.90  $           86.95  $         869.50  $           92.25  $         922.50 

124
Bulwark Heavyweight Excel Denim Dungaree 

Waist 28 - 50; Length 24 - 36,  Denim / 

Stonewash 

EA 8  $           54.99  $         439.92  $           96.95  $         775.60  $           92.25  $         738.00 

125
Bulwark Classic Heavyweight Excel Jean  

Size 28 – 50; Length 24 - 36  Blue Denim
EA 10  $           46.99  $         469.90  $           74.50  $         745.00  $           78.75  $         787.50 

126
Bulwark Stretch Denim Dungaree Jean  

Size 30 – 50; Length 30 - 36 Blue Denim
EA 8  $           84.99  $         679.92  $           92.50  $         740.00  $           98.25  $         786.00 

127 Bulwark Knit Cap Size Reg M - L Black EA 5  $           34.99  $         174.95  $           33.50  $         167.50  $           34.49  $         172.45 

128
Carhartt Baseball Cap

One Size Fits Most

Black, Navy, Khaki, Shadow

EA 5  $           22.99  $         114.95  $           23.00  $         115.00  $           19.50  $           97.50 

129
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Crew Neck Sweatshirt, 

Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather

Size S - XL

EA 40  $           22.99  $         919.60  $           23.65  $         946.00  $           25.99  $      1,039.60 

130
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Crew Neck Sweatshirt, 

Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather

Size 2XL

EA 15  $           24.99  $         374.85  $           27.85  $         417.75  $           27.99  $         419.85 

131
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Crew Neck Sweatshirt, 

Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather

Size 3XL

EA 3  $           28.99  $           86.97  $           31.75  $           95.25  $           31.99  $           95.97 

132
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Pullover Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather

Size S - XL

EA 10  $           30.99  $         309.90  $           31.95  $         319.50  $           34.24  $         342.40 

133
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Pullover Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           32.99  $         164.95  $           37.95  $         189.75  $           40.24  $         201.20 

134
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Pullover Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather

Size 3XL

EA 3  $           38.99  $         116.97  $           43.86  $         131.58  $           48.24  $         144.72 

135
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Full Zip up Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather 

Size S - XL

EA 30  $           34.99  $      1,049.70  $           36.00  $      1,080.00  $           37.43  $      1,122.90 

136
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Full Zip up Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather 

Size 2XL

EA 15  $           38.99  $         584.85  $           42.50  $         637.50  $           47.43  $         711.45 
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137
Hanes Ultimate Cotton Full Zip up Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Charcoal Heather 

Size 3XL

EA 2  $           46.99  $           93.98  $           48.20  $           96.40  $           47.43  $           94.86 

138
Gildan 100% Cotton Short-Sleeve Adult Pique 

Polo, Black, Navy, Charcoal  

Size S- XL

EA 10  $           13.99  $         139.90  $           13.75  $         137.50  $           15.49  $         154.90 

139
Gildan 100% Cotton Short-Sleeve Adult Pique 

Polo, Black, Navy, Charcoal  

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           15.99  $           15.99  $           16.50  $           16.50  $           17.49  $           17.49 

140
Gildan 100% Cotton Short-Sleeve Adult Pique 

Polo, Black, Navy, Charcoal  

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           15.99  $           15.99  $           16.95  $           16.95  $           19.49  $           19.49 

141
Port Authority 100% Cotton Long Sleeve Polo, 

Black, Navy, Sterling Grey

Size S - XL

EA 10  $           24.99  $         249.90  $           25.00  $         250.00  $           27.49  $         274.90 

142
Port Authority 100% Cotton Long Sleeve Polo, 

Black, Navy, Sterling Grey

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           26.99  $           26.99  $           29.50  $           29.50  $           33.49  $           33.49 

143
Port Authority 100% Cotton Long Sleeve Polo, 

Black, Navy, Sterling Grey

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           26.99  $           26.99  $           29.50  $           29.50  $           33.49  $           33.49 

144
Port Authority 100% Cotton Short-Sleeve Twill 

Button Shirt, Black, Navy, Khaki

Size S-XL

EA 20  $           26.99  $         539.80  $           26.98  $         539.60  $           28.99  $         579.80 

145
SanMar 100% Cotton Short-Sleeve Twill Button 

Shirt, Black, Navy, Khaki

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           28.99  $         144.95  $           29.65  $         148.25  $           34.99  $         174.95 

146
SanMar 100% Cotton Short-Sleeve Twill Button 

Shirt, Black, Navy, Khaki

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           28.99  $           28.99  $           29.65  $           29.65  $           34.99  $           34.99 

147
Port Authority 100% Cotton Long-Sleeve Button 

Shirts, Black, Classic Navy, Khaki

Size S - XL

EA 20  $           28.99  $         579.80  $           28.50  $         570.00  $           21.79  $         435.80 

148
Port Authority 100% Cotton Long-Sleeve Button 

Shirts, Black, Classic Navy, Khaki

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           29.99  $         149.95  $           30.75  $         153.75  $           23.79  $         118.95 

149
Port Authority 100% Cotton Long-Sleeve Button 

Shirts, Black, Classic Navy, Khaki

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           29.99  $           29.99  $           30.75  $           30.75  $           24.79  $           24.79 
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150
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Short-Sleeve Work 

Shirt, Navy, Graphite Grey, Khaki

Size S-XL

EA 15  $           18.99  $         284.85  $           27.75  $         416.25  $           27.49  $         412.35 

151
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Short-Sleeve Work 

Shirt, Navy, Graphite Grey, Khaki

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           18.99  $           18.99  $           27.75  $           27.75  $           30.49  $           30.49 

152
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Short-Sleeve Work 

Shirt, Navy, Graphite Grey, Khaki

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           18.99  $           18.99  $           27.75  $           27.75  $           30.49  $           30.49 

153
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Long-Sleeve Work 

Shirt, Navy, Graphite Grey, Khaki

Size S - XL

EA 15  $           20.99  $         314.85  $           28.40  $         426.00  $           31.99  $         479.85 

154
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Long-Sleeve Work 

Shirt, Navy, Graphite Grey, Khaki

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           20.99  $           20.99  $           28.40  $           28.40  $           34.99  $           34.99 

155
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Long-Sleeve Work 

Shirt, Navy, Graphite Grey, Khaki

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           20.99  $           20.99  $           24.40  $           24.40  $           34.99  $           34.99 

156
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Work Pant Black, 

Khaki 

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 -36

EA 20  $           19.99  $         399.80  $           32.00  $         640.00  $           31.49  $         629.80 

157
Red Kap 100% Men's Cotton Cargo Work Pant, 

Navy, Khaki

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 36

EA 5  $           19.99  $           99.95  $           34.25  $         171.25  $           38.99  $         194.95 

158
Red Kap 100% Cotton Women's Jeans

Size 4 - 18
EA 5  $           19.99  $           99.95  $           23.75  $         118.75  $           23.24  $         116.20 

159
Port Authority Silk Touch Short-Sleeve Polo, 

Navy, Charcoal Heather Grey, Black

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           17.99  $           89.95  $           18.00  $           90.00  $           19.99  $           99.95 

160
Port Authority Silk Touch Short-Sleeve Polo, 

Navy, Charcoal Heather Grey, Black

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           17.99  $           89.95  $           24.00  $         120.00  $           21.99  $         109.95 

161
Port Authority Silk Touch Short-Sleeve Polo, 

Navy, Charcoal Heather Grey, Black

Size 3XL

EA 5  $           19.99  $           99.95  $           24.00  $         120.00  $           25.99  $         129.95 

162
Port Authority Ladies SuperPro React Polo Black, 

Navy, Gusty Grey

Size S - 2XL

EA 10  $           17.99  $         179.90  $           16.50  $         165.00  $           18.49  $         184.90 

163
Lee Jeans Men's Carpenter Fit, 

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 34
EA 200  $           38.99  $      7,798.00  $           29.25  $      5,850.00  NO BID 
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164
Lee Jeans Men's Carpenter Fit, 

Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34
EA 10  $           38.99  $         389.90  $           41.70  $         417.00 

165
Lee Jeans Men's Regular Fit Straight Leg, 

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 36
EA 10  $           38.99  $         389.90  $           29.25  $         292.50 

166
Lee Jeans Men's Regular Fit Straight Leg,

Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34
EA 10  $           38.99  $         389.90  $           36.50  $         365.00 

167
Lee Jeans Men's Relaxed Fit 

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 34
EA 10  $           34.99  $         349.90  $           29.25  $         292.50 

168
Lee Jeans Men's Relaxed Fit 

Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34
EA 10  $           34.99  $         349.90  $           40.25  $         402.50 

169
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Desert Sand

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 36

EA 20  $           32.99  $         659.80  $           33.25  $         665.00  $           35.24  $         704.80 

170
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Desert Sand

Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34

EA 1  $           32.99  $           32.99  $           33.25  $           33.25  $           40.50  $           40.50 

171
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Rinsed Brown

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 36

EA 15  $           32.99  $         494.85  $           33.25  $         498.75  $           35.24  $         528.60 

172
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Rinsed Slate

Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34, Rinsed Brown

EA 1  $           32.99  $           32.99  $           33.25  $           33.25  $           40.50  $           40.50 

173
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Rinsed Slate

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 36

EA 15  $           32.99  $         494.85  $           33.25  $         498.75  $           35.24  $         528.60 

174
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Rinsed Slate

Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34

EA 1  $           32.99  $           32.99  $           33.25  $           33.25  $           40.50  $           40.50 

175
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Rinsed Black

Waist 29 - 42; Length 30 - 36

EA 15  $           32.99  $         494.85  $           33.25  $         498.75  $           35.24  $         528.60 

176
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 

Pants, Rinsed Black

Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34

EA 1  $           32.99  $           32.99  $           33.25  $           33.25  $           40.50  $           40.50 

177
Red Cap Heavyweight Parka with Zip Off Hood, 

Black, Navy

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           99.99  $         499.95  $         126.95  $         634.75  $         125.00  $         625.00 

178
Red Cap Parka with Zip Off Hood  Black, Navy

Size 2XL - 4XL
EA 5  $           99.99  $         499.95  $         126.95  $         634.75  $         125.00  $         625.00 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 
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179
Carhartt Fit Washed Duck Insulated Coverall, 

Short & Regular Length, Black

Size 34W - 50W

EA 1  $         108.99  $         108.99  $         104.00  $         104.00 

180
Carhartt Fit Washed Duck Insulated Coverall, 

Black

Size 52W - 54W

EA 1  $         108.99  $         108.99  $         113.00  $         113.00 

181
Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Bib Overalls, Black

Size 28W - 50W
EA 1  $           88.99  $           88.99  $           90.00  $           90.00 

182
Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Bib Overalls, Black

Size 52W - 54W
EA 1  $           88.99  $           88.99 

183
Carhartt Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated Active 

Jacket, Regular, Brown

Size 36 - 50

EA 1  $         108.99  $         108.99  $         129.50  $         129.50  $         123.50  $         123.50 

184
Jerzees, Long-Sleeve Tee Shirts, Black, Gray, 

Navy, Safety Green, Safety Orange

Size S - XL

EA 15  $           13.99  $         209.85  $           12.60  $         189.00  $           14.75  $         221.25 

185
Jerzees, Long-Sleeve Tee Shirts, Black, Gray, 

Navy, Safety Green, Safety Orange

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           15.99  $           15.99  $           15.60  $           15.60  $           16.75  $           16.75 

186
Jerzees, Long-Sleeve Tee Shirts, Black, Gray, 

Navy, Safety Green, Safety Orange

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           15.99  $           15.99  $           18.35  $           18.35  $           22.75  $           22.75 

187

Jerzees, Long-Sleeve Tee Shirts, Black, Gray, 

Navy, Safety Green, Safety Orange, True Red

Size 4XL

EA 1  $           16.99  $           16.99  $           13.50  $           13.50  $           22.75  $           22.75 

188

Jerzees, Short-Sleeve Tee Shirts w/Pocket, Black, 

Gray, Navy, Safety Green, Safety Orange, True 

Red 

Size S - XL

EA 15  $           12.99  $         194.85  $           13.00  $         195.00  $           14.75  $         221.25 

189

Jerzees, Short-Sleeve Tee Shirts w/Pocket, Black, 

Gray, Navy, Safety Green, Safety Orange, True 

Red 

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           14.99  $           14.99  $           17.31  $           17.31  $           20.75  $           20.75 

190

Jerzees, Short-Sleeve Tee Shirts w/Pocket, Black, 

Gray, Navy, Safety Green, Safety Orange, True 

Red 

Size 3XL - 4XL

EA 1  $           16.99  $           16.99  $           19.45  $           19.45  $           22.75  $           22.75 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 
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191

SanMar Port & Company Sweatshirt Pullover 

Hooded Sweatshirt, Black, Navy, Frost Grey 

Heather, Safety Orange, Safety Green

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           24.99  $         124.95  $           26.00  $         130.00  $           29.74  $         148.70 

192

SanMar Port & Company Sweatshirt Pullover 

Hooded Sweatshirt, Black, Navy, Frost Grey 

Heather, Safety Orange, Safety Green

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           27.99  $           27.99  $           30.50  $           30.50  $           33.74  $           33.74 

193

SanMar Port & Company Sweatshirt Pullover 

Hooded Sweatshirt, Black, Navy, Frost Grey 

Heather, Safety Orange, Safety Green

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           29.99  $           29.99  $           33.65  $           33.65  $           37.74  $           37.74 

194

SanMar Port & Company Sweatshirt Pullover 

Hooded Sweatshirt, Black, Navy, Frost Grey 

Heather, Safety Orange, Safety Green

Size 4XL

EA 1  $           29.99  $           29.99  $           33.65  $           33.65  $           37.74  $           37.74 

195

SanMar Port & Company Essential Fleece 

Crewneck Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Athletic Grey, 

Safety Green, Safety Orange

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           18.99  $           94.95  $           19.60  $           98.00  $           17.74  $           88.70 

196

SanMar Port & Company Essential Fleece 

Crewneck Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Athletic Grey, 

Safety Green, Safety Orange

Size 2XL 

EA 1  $           19.99  $           19.99  $           21.25  $           21.25  $           19.74  $           19.74 

197

SanMar Port & Company Essential Fleece 

Crewneck Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Athletic Grey, 

Safety Green, Safety Orange

Size 3XL,

EA 1  $           22.99  $           22.99  $           23.75  $           23.75  $           23.74  $           23.74 

198

SanMar Port & Company Essential Fleece 

Crewneck Sweatshirt, Navy, Black, Athletic Grey, 

Safety Green, Safety Orange

Size 4XL 

EA 1  $           22.99  $           22.99  $           23.75  $           23.75  $           23.74  $           23.74 

199
Bulwark Dungaree Navy Duck

Waist 28 - 50
EA 10  $           58.99  $         589.90  $           86.95  $         869.50  $           92.25  $         922.50 

200
Bulwark Dungaree Brown Duck

Waist 28 - 50
EA 10  $           58.99  $         589.90  $           86.95  $         869.50  $           92.25  $         922.50 

201
Bulwark Thermal Lined Zip-Front Hooded 

Sweatshirt Regular, Navy

Size S - 5XL

EA 5  $         224.99  $      1,124.95  $         248.95  $      1,244.75  $         267.50  $      1,337.50 
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202
Bulwark Men's Fleece FR Zip-Front Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy

Size S - 2XL

EA 1  $         174.99  $         174.99  $         210.95  $         210.95  $         227.75  $         227.75 

203
Bulwark Men's Fleece FR Thermal-Front Hooded 

Sweatshirt, Navy

Size 3XL - 5XL

EA 1  $         174.99  $         174.99  $         210.95  $         210.95  $         227.75  $         227.75 

204
Men's Midweight FR Crewneck Pullover 

Sweatshirt, Navy

Size S - 2XL

EA 1  $         155.99  $         155.99  $         179.50  $         179.50  $         192.50  $         192.50 

205
Men's Midweight FR Crewneck Pullover 

Sweatshirt, Navy

Size 3XL

EA 1  $         155.99  $         155.99  $         179.50  $         179.50  $         192.50  $         192.50 

206
Bulwark Men's Button Uniform Shirt, Regular  

Grey, Khaki, Navy

Size S - XL

EA 1  $           68.99  $           68.99  $           82.50  $           82.50  $           88.25  $           88.25 

207
Bulwark Men's Button Uniform Shirt, Regular  

Grey, Khaki, Navy

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           68.99  $           68.99  $           82.50  $           82.50  $           88.25  $           88.25 

208
Bulwark Men's Button Uniform Shirt, Regular  

Grey, Khaki, Navy

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           68.99  $           68.99  $           82.50  $           82.50  $           88.25  $           88.25 

209
Bulwark Men's Midweight FR Dress Uniform Shirt, 

Regular, Grey, Khaki, Navy

Size S - XL 

EA 1  $           60.99  $           60.99  $           82.25  $           82.25  $           88.25  $           88.25 

210
Bulwark Men's Midweight FR Dress Uniform Shirt, 

Regular, Grey, Khaki, Navy

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           60.99  $           60.99  $           82.25  $           82.25  $           88.25  $           88.25 

211
Bulwark Men's Midweight FR Dress Uniform Shirt, 

Regular, Grey, Khaki, Navy

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           60.99  $           60.99  $           82.25  $           82.25  $           88.25  $           88.25 

212
Bulwark Duck Deluxe Insulated Bib Overalls, 

Regular, Brown

Size S - 3XL

EA 1  $         289.99  $         289.99  $         375.50  $         375.50  $         391.50  $         391.50 

213
Bulwark Duck Deluxe Insulated Bib Overalls, Tall, 

Brown

Size Large - 2XL

EA 1  $         289.99  $         289.99  $         375.50  $         375.50  $         391.50  $         391.50 

214 Bulwark Knit Cap, One Size, Brown EA 5  $           34.99  $         174.95  $           35.50  $         177.50  $           34.49  $         172.45 
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215
Bulwark FR Lined Bomber Jacket, Regular (No 

Hood), Brown

Size S - 3XL

EA 1  $         142.99  $         142.99  $         210.95  $         210.95  $         222.50  $         222.50 

216
Bulwark Team Jacket, Regular Navy

Size S - 3XL
EA 1  $         138.99  $         138.99  $         185.50  $         185.50  $         196.25  $         196.25 

217
Team Jacket, Bulwark, Tall Navy

Size Large - XL
EA 1  $           46.99  $           46.99  $         185.50  $         185.50  $         196.25  $         196.25 

218
Bulwark Men's Classic Heavyweight Excel FR 

Denim Jeans, Blue Denim

Size 29 - 42

EA 10  $           46.99  $         469.90  $           74.50  $         745.00  $           78.75  $         787.50 

219
Bulwark Men's Classic Heavyweight Excel FR 

Denim Jeans, Blue Denim

Size 44 - 50

EA 1  $           56.99  $           56.99  $           74.50  $           74.50  $           78.75  $           78.75 

220
Bulwark Men's Stretch Denim Dungaree, 

Size 30 - 50
EA 5  $           56.99  $         284.95  $           74.50  $         372.50  $           78.75  $         393.75 

221

SanMar Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee 

Cotton, Long-Sleeve, Navy, Black, Athletic Grey, 

Lime

Size S - XL

EA 20  $           13.99  $         279.80  $           14.45  $         289.00  $           13.99  $         279.80 

222

SanMar Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee 

Cotton, Long-Sleeve, Navy, Black, Athletic Grey, 

Lime

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           16.99  $           84.95  $           17.30  $           86.50  $           15.99  $           79.95 

223

SanMar Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee 

Cotton, Long-Sleeve, Navy, Black, Athletic Grey, 

Lime

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           16.99  $           16.99  $           18.25  $           18.25  $           16.99  $           16.99 

224

SanMar Port & Company Essential 100% Cotton 

Pocket Tee, Short-Sleeve,  Athletic Heather, 

Black, Charcoal, Navy, Orange, Lime

Size S - XL

EA 20  $           12.99  $         259.80  $           12.45  $         249.00  $           14.74  $         294.80 

225

SanMar Port & Company Essential 100% Cotton 

Pocket Tee, Short-Sleeve,  Athletic Heather, 

Black, Charcoal, Navy, Orange, Lime

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           15.99  $           79.95  $           16.50  $           82.50  $           18.74  $           93.70 
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226

SanMar Port & Company Essential 100% Cotton 

Pocket Tee, Short-Sleeve,  Athletic Heather, 

Black, Charcoal, Navy, Orange, Lime

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           15.99  $           15.99  $           16.50  $           16.50  $           18.74  $           18.74 

227
Gildan Ultra Cotton 100% T-Shirt

Safety Orange, Safety Green

Size S - 2XL

EA 10  $             8.99  $           89.90  $             8.80  $           88.00  $           11.00  $         110.00 

228
Gildan Ultra Cotton 100% T-Shirt 

Safety Orange, Safety Green

Size 3XL

EA 10  $           10.99  $         109.90  $           13.98  $         139.80  $           14.00  $         140.00 

229
Bulwark Dungaree FR Pants Comfort Touch 

Brown Duck

 Size 29 - 42

EA 1  $           58.99  $           58.99  $           86.95  $           86.95  $           92.25  $           92.25 

230
Bulwark Dungaree FR Pants Comfort Touch 

Brown Duck

Size 44 - 50

EA 1  $           58.99  $           58.99  $           86.95  $           86.95  $           92.25  $           92.25 

231

SanMar Cornerstone Short-Sleeve Moisture-

Wicking Mesh Pocket Tee Shirts w/Reflective 

Tape ANSI Class 3, Safety Yellow, Safety Orange 

Size S - XL

EA 10  $           21.99  $         219.90  $           22.50  $         225.00  $           24.49  $         244.90 

232

SanMar Cornerstone Short-Sleeve Moisture-

Wicking Mesh Pocket Tee Shirts w/Reflective 

Tape ANSI Class 3, Safety Yellow, Safety Orange 

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           23.99  $         119.95  $           24.00  $         120.00  $           26.49  $         132.45 

233

SanMar Cornerstone Short-Sleeve Moisture-

Wicking Mesh Pocket Tee Shirts w/Reflective 

Tape ANSI Class 3, Safety Yellow, Safety Orange

Size 3XL

EA 3  $           23.99  $           71.97  $           26.98  $           80.94  $           30.49  $           91.47 

234

SanMar Cornerstone Long-Sleeve Safety T-Shirts 

w/Pocket ANSI Class 3 w/Reflective Tape, Safety 

Yellow, Safety Orange

Size S - 2XL

EA 5  $           26.99  $         134.95  $           26.25  $         131.25  $           28.24  $         141.20 
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235

SanMar Cornerstone Long-Sleeve Safety T-Shirts 

w/Pocket ANSI Class 3 w/Reflective Tape, Safety 

Yellow, Safety Orange

Size 3XL

EA 5  $           28.99  $         144.95  $           30.75  $         153.75  $           34.24  $         171.20 

236

SanMar Cornerstone High Visibility ANSI 107 

Class 3 Full-Zip Hoodie w/Reflective Tape, Safety 

Lime, Safety Orange 

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           42.99  $         214.95  $           44.85  $         224.25  $           46.99  $         234.95 

237

SanMar Cornerstone High Visibility ANSI 107 

Class 3 Full-Zip Hoodie w/Reflective Tape, Safety 

Lime, Safety Orange

 Size 2XL

EA 3  $           44.99  $         134.97  $           46.35  $         139.05  $           48.99  $         146.97 

238

SanMar Cornerstone High Visibility ANSI 107 

Class 3 Full-Zip Hoodie w/Reflective Tape, Safety 

Lime, Safety Orange

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           44.99  $           44.99  $           49.35  $           49.35  $           52.99  $           52.99 

239

Port Authority Colorblock Short-Sleeve 3 Button 

Polo, Engine Red/Black, Royal/Black, Black/Iron 

Grey, Navy/Blue Lake 

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           24.99  $         124.95  $           26.25  $         131.25  $           28.24  $         141.20 

240

Port Authority Colorblock Short-Sleeve 3 Button 

Polo, Engine Red/Black, Royal/Black, Black/Iron 

Grey, Navy/Blue Lake

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           26.99  $         134.95  $           27.75  $         138.75  $           30.24  $         151.20 

241

Port Authority Colorblock Short-Sleeve 3 Button 

Polo, Engine Red/Black, Royal/Black, Black/Iron 

Grey, Navy/Blue Lake

Size 3XL

EA 5  $           26.99  $         134.95  $           30.75  $         153.75  $           34.24  $         171.20 

242

Port Authority Short-Sleeve 2 Button Polo, Engine 

Red, Dark Green, Iron Grey, Blue, Lake, Royal, 

Navy, Black

Size S - XL

EA 5  $           23.99  $         119.95  $           24.75  $         123.75  $           27.24  $         136.20 

243

Port Authority Short-Sleeve 2 Button Polo, Engine 

Red, Dark Green, Iron Grey, Blue, Lake, Royal, 

Navy, Black

Size 2XL

EA 5  $           25.99  $         129.95  $           26.25  $         131.25  $           29.24  $         146.20 
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244

Port Authority Short-Sleeve 2 Button Polo, Engine 

Red, Dark Green, Iron Grey, Blue, Lake, Royal, 

Navy, Black

Size 3XL

EA 5  $           25.99  $         129.95  $           29.00  $         145.00  $           33.24  $         166.20 

245
Ladies Lee Ultra Lux Flex Motion Bootcut Jeans, 

Majestic

Size 2 - 18

EA 4  $           39.99  $         159.96  $           32.25  $         129.00 

246
Ladies Lee Ultra Lux Flex Motion Bootcut Jeans, 

Royal Chakra , #3408946 Majestic

Size 2 - 18

EA 2  $           39.99  $           79.98  $           32.25  $           64.50 

247
Port Authority Men's Micro Fleece Vest, Black, 

Navy, Pewter

Size S - XL

EA 1  $           24.99  $           24.99  $           25.50  $           25.50  $           27.49  $           27.49 

248
Port Authority Men's Micro Fleece Vest, Black, 

Navy, Pewter

Size 2XL

EA 1  $           26.99  $           26.99  $           26.98  $           26.98  $           29.49  $           29.49 

249
Port Authority Men's Micro Fleece Vest, Black, 

Navy, Pewter

Size 3XL

EA 1  $           26.99  $           26.99  $           29.95  $           29.95  $           33.49  $           33.49 

250
Port Authority Watch Cap One Size Fits Most 

Black                                                             
EA 5  $             9.99  $           49.95  $             9.95  $           49.75  $           11.74  $           58.70 

62,731.91$     66,459.66$     57,410.69$     

Invitations Sent

Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

26

1

3

GRAND TOTAL

NOTES

1. Cintas Corporation No. 2 Extended Price and Grand Total do not match and are highlighted to note errors. Grand Total sum corrected to $62,731.91 from $63,047.87.

2. Michael's Uniform Company's Extended Price and Grand total do not match and are highlighted to note errors. Grand Total sum corrected to $66,459.66 from 

$66,470.91

3. Standard Textile Co., Inc.'s Extended Price do not match and are highlighted to note errors.

Bid Opening 01/04/2024 @ 2:30 PM
DW, NE, 

BR
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