
NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE

1 Kiosk Stand EA 2  $         427.00  $         854.00  $         435.37  $         870.74  $         480.00  $         960.00  $         441.00  $         882.00 

2 Kiosk Stand Feet EA 2  $         151.00  $         302.00  $         148.18  $         296.36  $         167.00  $         334.00  $         150.00  $         300.00 

3 Kiosk Touch Screen EA 2  $         898.00  $      1,796.00  $      1,402.61  $      2,805.22  $      1,420.00  $      2,840.00  $      1,390.00  $      2,780.00 

4 Desktop PC EA 80  $         814.00  $    65,120.00  $      1,119.67  $    89,573.60  $      1,130.00  $    90,400.00  $      1,164.00  $    93,120.00 

5 Laptop EA 5  $      1,282.00  $      6,410.00  $      1,334.42  $      6,672.10  $      1,580.00  $      7,900.00  $      1,721.00  $      8,605.00 

6 Developer Desktop EA 1  $      3,586.50  $      3,586.50  $      4,434.69  $      4,434.69  $      4,820.00  $      4,820.00  $      4,606.00  $      4,606.00 

7 Printer EA 15  $         330.00  $      4,950.00  $         326.39  $      4,895.85  $         235.00  $      3,525.00  $         372.00  $      5,580.00 

8 Large Monitor EA 1  $      1,580.00  $      1,580.00  $      2,385.96  $      2,385.96  $      2,200.00  $      2,200.00  $      2,478.00  $      2,478.00 

9 Rolling TV Cart Stand EA 1  $         589.00  $         589.00  $         669.34  $         669.34  $         700.00  $         700.00  $         673.00  $         673.00 

10 USB-C Hub EA 8  $           37.00  $         296.00  $           29.91  $         239.28  $           25.00  $         200.00  $           30.00  $         240.00 

11 Webcam EA 10  $           26.00  $         260.00  $           28.84  $         288.40  $           28.50  $         285.00  $           29.00  $         290.00 

12 Headset EA 20  $           21.00  $         420.00  $           22.96  $         459.20  $           24.00  $         480.00  $           25.00  $         500.00 

13 Monitor Privacy Screen EA 20  $           62.00  $      1,240.00  $           69.53  $      1,390.60  $           71.00  $      1,420.00  $           67.00  $      1,340.00 

14 25-ft HDMI Cable EA 5  $           21.25  $         106.25  $           21.09  $         105.45  $           23.00  $         115.00  $           12.00  $           60.00 

15 3-ft HDMI Cable EA 15  $             7.75  $         116.25  $             5.76  $           86.40  $             7.00  $         105.00  $             5.00  $           75.00 

16 USB-C Female to USB-A Male Adapter EA 10  $             9.25  $           92.50  $             6.96  $           69.60  $             9.00  $           90.00  $             9.00  $           90.00 

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
COMPUTERS, MONITORS, LAPTOPS & ACCESSORIES 25-098-CCC
BID TABULATION


Insight Public Sector, Inc. Logicalis, Inc. Tech Advanced Computers, 

Inc. Tallgrass Systems Ltd.



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE

17 USB-C Female to USB-A Female Adapter EA 10  $             9.25  $           92.50  $             6.20  $           62.00  $           11.00  $         110.00  $             9.00  $           90.00 

18 USB-C Male to USB-A Female Adapter EA 10  $             9.25  $           92.50  $             8.76  $           87.60  $             7.00  $           70.00  $           10.00  $         100.00 

19 USB-C Male to USB-A Male Adapter EA 10  $             9.25  $           92.50  $             5.88  $           58.80  $           14.00  $         140.00  $           11.00  $         110.00 

20 USB 64GB Thumb Drive EA 20  $           10.50  $         210.00  $           10.39  $         207.80  $           10.00  $         200.00  $           14.00  $         280.00 

88,206.00$     115,658.99$   116,894.00$  122,199.00$  GRAND TOTAL

Tallgrass Systems Ltd.


Insight Public Sector, Inc. Logicalis, Inc. Tech Advanced Computers, 

Inc.



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE

1 Kiosk Stand EA 2  $         430.56  $         861.12  $         412.00  $         824.00  $         540.88  $      1,081.76 

2 Kiosk Stand Feet EA 2  $         296.40  $         592.80  $         139.75  $         279.50  $         147.53  $         295.06 

3 Kiosk Touch Screen EA 2  $      1,387.13  $      2,774.26  $      1,325.00  $      2,650.00  $         900.75  $      1,801.50 

4 Desktop PC EA 80  $      1,339.15  $  107,132.00  $      1,075.00  $    86,000.00 

5 Laptop EA 5  $      1,978.37  $      9,891.85  $      1,520.00  $      7,600.00  $      1,643.59  $      8,217.95 

6 Developer Desktop EA 1  $      4,514.82  $      4,514.82 

7 Printer EA 15  $         271.06  $      4,065.90  $         265.00  $      3,975.00  $         265.80  $      3,987.00 

8 Large Monitor EA 1  $      4,549.26  $      4,549.26  $      1,815.00  $      1,815.00  $      1,854.65  $      1,854.65 

9 Rolling TV Cart Stand EA 1  $         661.93  $         661.93  $         625.00  $         625.00  $         517.30  $         517.30 

10 USB-C Hub EA 8  $           53.64  $         429.12  $           19.50  $         156.00 

11 Webcam EA 10  $         166.93  $      1,669.30  $           24.50  $         245.00  $           25.03  $         250.30 

12 Headset EA 20  $           22.79  $         455.80  $           20.25  $         405.00  $           20.86  $         417.20 

13 Monitor Privacy Screen EA 20  $           68.75  $      1,375.00  $           60.00  $      1,200.00  $           61.50  $      1,230.00 

14 25-ft HDMI Cable EA 5  $           18.12  $           90.60  $             7.75  $           38.75  $             7.26  $           36.30 

15 3-ft HDMI Cable EA 15  $             3.68  $           55.20  $             1.10  $           16.50  $             0.98  $           14.70 

16 USB-C Female to USB-A Male Adapter EA 10  $             9.48  $           94.80  $             3.90  $           39.00  $             6.59  $           65.90 

17 USB-C Female to USB-A Female Adapter EA 10  $             9.36  $           93.60  $             7.90  $           79.00  $           48.00  $         480.00 

18 USB-C Male to USB-A Female Adapter EA 10  $           14.74  $         147.40  $             2.50  $           25.00  $             7.57  $           75.70 

19 USB-C Male to USB-A Male Adapter EA 10  $             8.74  $           87.40  $             2.50  $           25.00  $             7.22  $           72.20 

Brightcentra, Inc.

 NO BID  NO BID 

 NO BID 

Southern Computer 
Warehouse

 NO BID 

Pace Systems, Inc.



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE

20 USB 64GB Thumb Drive EA 20  $           10.28  $         205.60  $             7.90  $         158.00  $           10.76  $         215.20 

139,747.76$   106,155.75$   20,612.72$    

Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

143
18
8

Bid Opening 8/21/2025 @ 2:30 PM SR, HK

NOTES
1. Pace Systems, Inc.'s Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
    a. NO. 13, when multiplied, ($68.75 x 20 = $1,375.00), resulted in an increase of $1,303.50.
    b. GRAND TOTAL was corrected from $142,510.16 to $139,747.76.
2. ODP Business Solutions, LLC has been deemed non-responsive due to not including required document(s).

Pace Systems, Inc. Brightcentra, Inc. Southern Computer 
Warehouse


	Stacked

