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Dumping 
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Dumping of 
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Concrete

Dumping 
of Broken 
Asphalt

UOM Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton
$23.21 $31.39 $37.14 $17.39 $28.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.81 $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.77 No Charge $9.77
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of Asphalt 
Grindings
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Concrete

Dumping 
of Broken 
Asphalt

UOM Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton
$17.68 $24.88 $34.92 $14.63 $16.53 $27.43 $46.78 $50.48 $19.33 $30.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$10.40 $17.60 No Bid No Bid $9.25 No Bid $38.00 No Bid $16.55 $23.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$10.70 $19.00 No Bid $8.40 $10.00 $21.20 $38.00 $42.00 $13.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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UOM Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton Ton
Delivered to Highway Garage $22.98 $30.50 $32.00 $21.00 $22.25 $20.00 $52.50 $56.00 $29.00 $32.00 No Bid $16.25 $15.00 $19.75
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S. Schroeder Trucking, Inc.

Vendor Plant Site

Vendor Plant Site

Delivered to Highway Garage
Location 1 - Bolingbrook
Location 2 - Bartlett

E.D. Shands LLC

Location 1 - Lincolnshire

Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC 

Vendor Plant Site

Location 2 - McCook

Delivered to Highway Garage

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
2023 CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS (SECTION 2 - COURSE AND FINE AGGREGATES) 
23-023-DOT

Ozinga Ready Mix, Inc.

Vendor Plant Site

HWRXE
Highlight

HWRXE
Highlight

HWRXE
Highlight

HWRXE
Highlight

HWRXE
Highlight



Delivered to Highway Garage $23.95 $31.60 $33.20 $21.92 $22.51 $20.90 $53.38 $56.68 $29.10 $33.08 No Bid $17.50 $16.25 $20.00

DW, NE
54
1
4Total Bid Responses Received

NOTES

Bid Opening 3/13/23 @ 2:30 P.M.
Invitations Sent

Total Bidders Requesting Documents
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