THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

FURNISH & DELIVER ELITE EX™ LONG-TERM BEDS 25-042-DCC
BID TABULATION

v

ALCO Sales & Service Co. Tiles in Style LLC Garson Group
NO. [ITEM uoMm|QTy{  PRICE EXJEE:?EED PRICE EX;EINC%ED PRICE EX;E:E%ED

1 Elite EX™ Long-Term Beds EA | 56 | § 133200 $ 7459200} $ 455500| $ 255,080.00] $ 1,580.00| $ 88,480.00
2 |Assembly EA 56 | $ 3000($ 168000 % 749.00| § 41,94400| % 330.00| $ 18,480.00
3 [Shipping EA | 56 | § 73.00| $ 4,088.00 ’ NG CHARGE $ 4000| $ 224000
4  |Head & Footboard — 42°, walnut EA | 56 | § 1340061 $ 7,504.00 NO CHARGE NO BID
5 [Footboard Mounted Staff Control EA | 568 | $ 8325( § 4,662,00 NO CHARGE NO BID
6 |Soft Touch Assist Rail EA | 56 | $ 18'9.00 $ 10,584.00 NO CHARGE NO BID
7 |Underbed Lighting EA | 56 | § 138.75| $ 7,770.00 NO CHARGE NO BID

GRAND TOTAL | $ 110,880.00 $ 297.024.00 $ 109,200.00

NOTES

1. Medline Industries, LP has been deemed non-responsive due to proposed product not meeting Bid specifications.
2. Rehabmart eCommerce Solutions, LLC has been deemed non-responsive for not providing price as requested.

3. ReMED Services LLC has been deemed non-rescnsive for not providing price as requested.

4. Venus Supplies & Constructions has been deemed non-responsive for not providing required forms.

Bid Opening 3/27/2025 @ 2:30 PM| BR, DW
Invitations Sent 87
Total Vendors Requesting Documents 6
Total Bid Responses 7




