THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES 25-041-DOT

BID TABULATION

v

v

Barricade Lites, Inc.

Traffic Control & Protection,
LLC dba

Lightle Enterprises of Ohio,

All In Safety Corp.

High Star Traffic LLe
NO. |ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;E:\(I:DEED PRICE EX;—IEII\(I:EI)EED PRICE EX;—IEII\(I:EI)EED PRICE EX;E:\(I:DEED
1 |28" Orange Cones with Reflective Collar EA | 250 16.45| $ 4,11250| $ 18301 $ 4,575.00| $ 1530 $ 3,825.00 1085 $ 2,712.50
2 [Orange Traffic Barrel EA | 50 48.05( $ 2,40250( $ 57.70| $ 2,885.00| $ 43.00| $ 2,150.00 64.98( $  3,249.00
3 |Tire Ring for Orange Traffic Barrel EA | 20 10.00| $ 200.00| $ 540| $ 108.00| $ 460( $ 92.00 6.00| $ 120.00
4 |Verticade EA | 50 162.42| $ 8,121.00| $ 146.00( $  7,300.00 NO BID NO BID
5 |Orange Vertical Panel EA | 50 59.75( $ 2,987.50| $ 54151 $ 2,707.50| $ 26.00| $ 1,300.00 30.88( $ 1,544.00
6 |20 Ib. Rubber Base for Orange Vertical Panel EA | 50 19.95( $ 997.50| $ 20.25| $ 1,01250( $ 18.50( $ 925.00 2356 $ 1,178.00
7 E;:if;?g;;g:gsfgjti;D"eC“O”a' Barricade EA | 50 28.75|'$ 1,437.50| $ 22.80|$ 1,140.00| $ 1850 $  925.00 21.13|$  1,056.50
8 [Type | Barricade EA | 100 75.10( $ 7,510.00| $ 7835 % 7,835.00| $ 55.00( $ 5,500.00 NO BID
9 |Type | Barricade — Extended Legs EA | 25 80.05($ 2,001.25| $ 130.90( $ 3,27250| $ 59.00( $ 1,475.00 NO BID
10 |Type Ill Barricade EA | 10 23650 $ 2,365.00| $ 23460| $ 2,346.00| $ 247.00| $ 2,470.00 NO BID
11 |6’ A-Frame & Board Barricade EA [ 10 156.45( $ 1,564.50| $ 156.25( $ 1,562.50| $ 157.00( $ 1,570.00 NO BID
12 |8 A-Frame & Board Barricade EA 10 189.95($ 1,899.50| $ 18550 $ 1,855.00| $ 192.00( $ 1,920.00 NO BID
13 |10’ A-Frame & Board Barricade EA 10 22260 $ 2,226.00( $ 21450 ¢ 2,145.00| $ 227.00|1 $ 2,270.00 NO BID
GRAND TOTAL| $ 37,824.75 $ 38,744.00 $ 24,422.00 $ 9,860.00
NOTE

1. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC's had two (2) corrections to the bid tab.

a. NO. 4 was adjusted to NO BID, as Bidder is unable to meet the specifications for this item.
b. GRAND TOTAL decreased by ($1,300.00), from $25,722.00, for an adjusted GRAND TOTAL of $24,422.00.

Bid Opening 4/16/25 @ 2:30 PM

BR, HK, SR

Invitations Sent 150
Total Vendors Requesting Documents 4
Total Bid Responses 4
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