
THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
EXAMINATION G LOVES 23-1 O2-DCC
BID TABULATION

GRAND TOTAL

1 - Medline amount per case or box has been updated to reflect number of boxes per case or gloves per box.
2' wilburn Medical lnc. is deemed non-responsive in providing pricing to include shipping anJspecial delivery fees
3- Shamrock Manufacturing Company is deemed non-responsive in providing a minimum of 12d cases p"1 oid"r.
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Omni Medical Supply

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 256.20

$ 256.20

$ 256.20

$ 2s6.20

$ 3,236.80

s 35,547.00

$ 36,414.00

$ 2,890.00

No Bid

$ 79,112.6A

PRICE

$ 21.35

$ 21.35

$ 21.35

$ 21.35

b 2.89

$ 2.89

$ 2.89

$ 2.89

Uweport

EXTENDED
PRICE

s 288.00

$ 288.00

$ 288.00

s 288.00

$ 2,788.80

$ 30,627.00

$ 31,374.00

$ 2,490.00

$ 4,490 00

$ 72,921.8A

PRICE

$ 24.00

$ 24.00

s 24_00

$ 24.00

$ 2.49

$ 2.49

s 2.49

$ 249

$ 4,49

lnterboro Packaging Corp

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 237.60

$ 237.60

$ 237 60

$ 237 60

$ 2,620.80

$ 28,782,00

$ 29,484.00

$ 2,340_00

$ 2,900.00

$ 67 ,O77.20

PRICE

$ 19.80

$ 19.80

$ 19.80

$ 19.80

$ 2.34

$ 2.34

$ 2.34

$ 2.34

$ 2.90

Professional Medical &
Surgical Supply

EXTENDED
PRICE

s 203.40

$ 203.40

$ 203.40

$ 203.40

$ 2,324.00

$ 2s,522.50

$ 26,145.00

$ 2,075.00

$ 6,500.00

$ 63,380.10

PRICE

$ 16.95

s 15.95

$ 16.9s

$ 16.9s

$ 2.08

5 2.08

$ 2-08

$ 2.OA

$ 6.50

QTY

12

12

12

12

1,120

12,300

12,600

1,000

1,000

UOM

CS

CS

nc

CS

BX

BX

BX

BX

BX

ITEM

Vlnyl Exam Gloves, Small

Vinyl Exam Gloves. Medium

Vinyl Exam Gloves, Large

Vinyl Exam Gloves, X-Large

Medi Pak Performance, Small

Pak Performance, Medium

Non-sterile Nitrile Performance, Large

Non-sterile Nitrile Performance, X-Large

Non-sterile Latex, X-Large

NO.

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

o

I

VC, RJ

54

7

II

ing 912612O23 2.30Bid

lnv;tations
Total Vendors Documents

Total Bid



Medline

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 287.s2

$ 287.52

$ 287.52

$ 287.52

$ 5,512-76

$ 60,434.00

$ 6.1,908.00

$ 5,896.00

$ 9.1 1 8.40

$ 144,019.24

PRICE

s 35.94

$ 35.94

$ 3s.94

$ 35-94

s 14.74

$ 14.74

s 14.74

$ 14.74

$ 8.2A

Nashville EMS Supply

EXTENDED
PRICE

s 540.00

$ 540.00

$ 540.00

$ 540.00

$ 4,312.00

$ 47,355.00

$ 48,510.00

$ 3,850.00

$ 7,900.00

$ 114,087.00

PRICE

$ 4s.00

s 45.00

$ 45.00

s 45.00

$ 3.85

$ 3.85

$ 3.85

$ 3.85

c 7.90

Performance Safety Group

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 599.88

$ 599.88

$ 599.88

$ 599.88

$ 4,020"80

$ 44,157.00

$ 45,234.00

$ 3,590.00

$ 4,990.00

$ 104,331.32

PRICE

$ 49.99

$ 49.99

$ 49.99

$ 49.93

$ 359

$ 3.59

b 3.59

$ 3.59

s 4.99

The Glove Box

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 398.04

$ 398.04

$ 398.04

$ 398.04

$ 3,662.40

$ 40,221,00

$ 41,202.A0

$ 3,270.00

$ 4,570.00

$ 94,517.56

PRICE

$ 33.17

$ 33.17

$ 33.17

$ 33.17

$ 3.27

I 3-27

$ 327

$ 3.27

$ 4.57

Omni Medical Supply

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 256 20

$ 256.20

$ 256.20

$ 256.20

$ 3,841.60

$ 42,189.00

$ 43,218.00

$ 3,430.00

No Bid

$ 93,703.40

PRICE

s 21.35

$ 21.35

$ 21.3s

$ 21.35

$ 3.43

$ 3.43

$ 3.43

$ 3.43

School Health

EXTENDED
PRICE

s 314.40

$ 314.40

$ 314.40

s 314_40

$ 3,505.60

$ 38,499.00

$ 39,438.00

$ 3,130.00

$ 6.230.00

$ 92,060.20

PRICE

$ 26.20

$ 26.20

$ 26"20

$ 26.20

$ 3.13

$ 3.13

s 3.13

$ 3. 13

$ 6.23

EXAMI NATION GLOVES 23-].02-DCC
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TLB Holdings, lnc.

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 1,140.00

$ 1,140.00

$ 1,140.00

$ 1 , 140.00

$ 19,880.00

$ 218,325.00

$ 223,6s0.00

$ 17,750.00

No Bid

$ 484,165.00

PRICE

$ 95.00

$ 95.00

$ 95.00

$ 95.00

$ 17.75

$ 17.75

$ 17.7s

$ 17.75

Sida Medical

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 249.60

$ 249.60

$ 249_60

$ 249.60

$ 12,208.00

$ 134,070.00

$ 137,340"00

$ 10,900.00

No Bid

$ 295,516 40

PRICE

$ 20.80

$ 20.80

$ 20.80

$ 20.80

$ 10.90

$ 10.90

$ 10.90

$ 10.90

Medfirst Healthcare Supply

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 372.00

$ 372.00

$ 372.00

$ 372.00

$ 10,169.60

$ 111,684.00

$ 114,408.00

$ 9,080.00

$ 5,190.00

$ 252,019.60

PRICE

$ 31.00

$ 31.00

$ 31.00

$ 31.00

b 9.08

$ 9.08

$ 9.08

$ 9.08

$ 5. 19

Omnicare Group

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 504.00

$ 504.00

$ 504.00

$ 504.00

$ 6,720.00

$ 73,800.00

$ 75,600_00

$ 6,000.00

$ 6,000.00

$ 170,136.00

PRICE

$ 42.00

$ 42.00

$ 42.00

$ 42.00

$ 6.00

$ 6.00

$ 6.00

$ 6.00

$ 6.00

Ebisu Supplies LLC

EXTENDED
PRICE

$ 307.80

$ 307.80

$ 307.80

$ 307.80

$ 8,915.20

$ 97,908.00

$ 32,130.00

$ 2,550.00

$ 2,550.00

$ 145,284.40

PRICE

$ 25.65

$ 25_65

$ 25.65

$ 25.65

$ 7.96

s 7.96

$ 2.55

b 2.55

$ 2.55

EXAM INATION GLOVES 23-102-DCC
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