THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
NON-HIGHWAY RED DYED FUEL 24-074-FM
BID TABULATION

v

Mohr Oil Company

Al Warren Oil Co Inc.

Bell Fuels Service Co.

Feece Oil Company

NO. |ITEM UOM|QTY MARK-UP MARK-UP MARK-UP MARK-UP
SECTION A: Diesel Fuel
Ultra-Low Sulfur No. 1 and No. 2 Diesel Fuel -
1 Red Dyed, Non-Highway Use GAL | 1 $ 030 $ 048] $ 063 $ 0.70
EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. (ITEM UOM|QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SECTION B: Additives
2 [Power Service Bio Kleen - 16 oz BTL | 100 NO BID $ 29.92|1% 299200 $ 3299 % 3,299.00| $ 30.36| $ 3,036.00
2.1 |ET Biobor BTL | 100 | $ 30.00( $ 3,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 |Power Service Clear Diesel - 1 Gallon GAL | 100 NO BID $ 52.80( $ 5,280.00( $ 56.25( $ 5,625.00( $ 43.00| $ 4,300.00
3.1 [ET Pro Force GAL | 100 | $ 31.00( $ 3,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTES
Bid Opening 6/11/2024 @ 4:00 PM| BR, HK
Invitations Sent 13
Total Vendors Requesting Documents 0
Total Bid Responses 4
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