



**THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE  
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT  
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS 26-021-DOT  
BID TABULATION**

| ITEM                                    | HMA Surface Course, N70 | HMA Surface Course, N50 | HMA Binder Course, IL-19, N70 | HMA Binder Course, IL-19, N50 | Polymerized HMA Surface Course, N70 | Driveway / Private Mix | SS-1 Asphalt Emulsion | SS-1 Asphalt Emulsion | Dumping of Asphalt Grindings | Dumping of Clean Concrete | Dumping of Broken Asphalt |
|-----------------------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------------|-------------------------------|-------------------------------------|------------------------|-----------------------|-----------------------|------------------------------|---------------------------|---------------------------|
| UOM                                     | TON                     | TON                     | TON                           | TON                           | TON                                 | TON                    | GAL                   | PAIL                  | TON                          | TON                       | TON                       |
| SECTION A - BITUMINOUS PAVING MATERIALS |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| DuKane Asphalt Co.                      |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| Location 1                              | \$ 65.00                | \$ 65.00                | \$ 62.00                      | \$ 62.00                      | \$ 84.00                            | \$ 65.00               | No Bid                | \$ 65.00              | \$ 8.00                      | \$ 8.00                   | \$ 8.00                   |
| Superior Asphalt Materials, LLC         |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| Location 1                              | \$ 67.50                | \$ 66.50                | \$ 59.00                      | \$ 58.00                      | \$ 120.00                           | \$ 64.00               | No Bid                | \$ 60.00              | \$ 7.75                      | \$ 7.75                   | \$ 7.75                   |
| Chicago Materials Corporation           |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| Location 1                              | \$ 67.50                | \$ 66.50                | \$ 59.00                      | \$ 58.50                      | \$ 120.00                           | \$ 64.00               | No Bid                | \$ 60.00              | \$ 7.75                      | \$ 7.75                   | \$ 7.75                   |
| Dupage Materials Company, LLC           |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| Location 1                              | \$ 69.25                | \$ 66.75                | \$ 61.75                      | \$ 61.75                      | \$ 120.00                           | \$ 65.75               | No Bid                | \$ 60.00              | \$ 7.75                      | No Bid                    | \$ 7.75                   |
| Route 66 Asphalt Company                |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| Location 1                              | \$ 71.50                | \$ 69.50                | \$ 65.75                      | \$ 64.25                      | \$ 120.00                           | \$ 65.75               | No Bid                | \$ 60.00              | \$ 7.75                      | No Bid                    | \$ 7.75                   |
| K-Five Hodgkins LLC                     |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| Location 1                              | \$ 74.25                | \$ 71.25                | \$ 63.75                      | \$ 64.75                      | \$ 120.00                           | \$ 69.50               | No Bid                | \$ 60.00              | \$ 7.75                      | No Bid                    | \$ 7.75                   |
| Plote Construction, Inc.                |                         |                         |                               |                               |                                     |                        |                       |                       |                              |                           |                           |
| Location 1                              | \$ 73.00                | \$ 73.00                | \$ 67.00                      | \$ 67.00                      | \$ 125.00                           | \$ 73.00               | \$ 8.00               | \$ 50.00              | No Charge                    | No Charge                 | No Charge                 |
| Location 2                              | \$ 73.00                | \$ 73.00                | \$ 67.00                      | \$ 67.00                      | \$ 125.00                           | \$ 73.00               | No Bid                | \$ 50.00              | No Charge                    | No Charge                 | No Charge                 |