PROPOSAL PRICING FORM

Section |: Contact Information

Please complete the contact information below.

BID NUMBER: 25-064-SHF

COMPANY NAME: Worldwide Travel Staffing, Limited

CONTACT PERSON: Leo R. Blatz, C.E.O.

CONTACT EMAIL: LBlatz@worldwidetravelstaffing.com

Section ll: Pricin

All goods and services shall be shipped F.O.B. Destination. The quantities listed below are

canvasing quantities and do not represent the number of hours required to fulfill the contract.

Year 1

NO. | ITEM UoM QTy PRICE
L ﬁi%?ii“i"r'}‘sﬁffe;oo a.m. - 6:30 p.m. HR 1 62.00
< zz?nﬁge—’d#iggeszoo p.m. - 6:30 a.m. HE ! 62.00
3 g:gféz;e?&t:‘rggy 6:00 a.m. - 6:30 p.m. HR 1 62.00
4 g:ﬂ:?éz;e? sbtﬁ;y 6:00 p.m. - 6:30 a.m. HR 1 62.00
. 52%;:;';%3‘ 811, 5130 B.AL HR 1 6200
1. e 1
7 Medical Director HR 1 No bid
8 Medical Director (On-Call) HR 1 No bid
9 Psychiatrist HR 1 No bid
10 | Psych Staff HR 1 90.00
11 | Dentist HR 1 No bid
12 | Director of Nursing HR 1 92.00
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13 | Nurse Practitioner HR 1 $ 105.00
YEAR 1 -GRAND TOTAL | § 659.00
GRAND TOTAL
(In words) Six Hundred and Fifty Nine Dollars and Zero Cents
Year 2
NO. | ITEM UoMm QTy PRICE
1 ﬁiiiﬁé‘i“i"pﬁ‘é?fe:oo am. —6:30 p.m. HR 1 $ 6400
2 | Momday - Friday 600 pm. 630 a.m BB 1 3 Gado
3 g:tgt:?(tiz;e? S':Lunrgzy 6:00 a.m. — 6:30 p.m. L 1 § 6s00
4 g:tgljf(t’g;e;ﬂ Sl\t:unrcsi':y 6:00 p.m. - 6:30 a.m. HR 1 4 oAmd
9 53?&25’2%3’ 16, ~8:30 HR L $ 6400
- 53?3??2%3’ :rrs: —6:30 am. R 1 $ 6400
7 | Medical Director HR 1 $ Nobid
8 Medical Director (On-Call) HR 1 $ Nobid
9 | Psychiatrist HR 1 $ Nobid
10 | Psych Staff HR 1 $ 9500
11 | Dentist HR 1 $ Nobid
12 | Director of Nursing HR 1 $ 94.00
13 | Nurse Practitioner HR 1 $ 110.00
YEAR 2 -GRAND TOTAL | $ 683.00
GRAND TOTAL
(inwords)  Six Hundred and Eighty Three Dollars and Zero Cents
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Year 3

NO. | ITEM uom QTy PRICE
1 ﬁiﬂ?&?’f"pﬁg?fsm am. —6:30 p.m. HR 1 66.00
2 z?)ﬁ;iridF’:‘iggeG:OO p.m.—-8:30 a.m. A 1 6e.00
3 g:?&::i:\;e? gul:lr::y 6:00 a.m. — 6:30 p.m. bR 1 .0t
: gﬁﬂfﬁiffs”&'ﬁ:y 6:00 p.m. - 6:30 a.m, HR 1 ooaR
. Sgﬁéﬁsrgdog :r;e -6:30 p.m. HR 1 66.00
8 52%5;:3)3& :r;e —6:30 a.m. — j gaxp
74 Medical Director HR 1 No bid
8 Medical Director (On-Call) HR 1 No bid
9 Psychiatrist HR 1 No bid
10 | Psych Staff HR 1 100.00
11 Dentist HR 1 No bid
12 | Director of Nursing HR 1 96.00
13 | Nurse Practitioner HR 1 115.00
YEAR 3 - GRAND TOTAL 707.00
GRAND TOTAL
(Inwords)  Seven Hundred and Seven Dollars and Zero Cents
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ion lll: Holida - rvices

Bidder shall provide a list of holidays included in Holiday Rate(s).

1. New Year's Day 8. Christmas Day
2. Martin Luther King, Jr. Day 9.

3. Memorial Day 10.

4. Juneteenth 1.

5. Independence Day 1%

g. Labor Day 13.

7. Thanksgiving Day 14.

Check the appropriate boxes below to indicate if the service is included in the fee, available at an additional
charge or not available.

Services Included | Additional Not
List of any non-mandatory services provided. in Fee Fee Available

Section lli: Certification

By signing below, the Bidder agrees to provide the required goods and/or services described in the Bid
Specifications for the prices quoted on this Proposal Pricing Fo

Printed Name: _Lec R. Blatz Signature;

Date: 1013(,/?02- ‘

T v

Title: C.E.O.
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