



THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
 FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
 RENTAL OF MEDICAL EQUIPMENT 25-002-DCC
 BID TABULATION

NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	AdvaCare Systems		Integra Healthcare Equipment		Custom Medical Solutions		Arjo Inc.	
				DAILY RENTAL PRICE	EXTENDED DAILY PRICE	DAILY RENTAL PRICE	EXTENDED DAILY PRICE	DAILY RENTAL PRICE	EXTENDED DAILY PRICE	DAILY RENTAL PRICE	EXTENDED DAILY PRICE
1	Low Air Loss and Alternating Pressure Therapy Mattress – 36" x 80", 400 lb. weight capacity, safety side bolsters, built-in integrated heel slope, with or without pump	EA	15	\$ 3.50	\$ 52.50	\$ 4.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 6.26	\$ 93.90
2	Low Air Loss and Alternating Pressure Therapy Mattress – 36" x 80", 500 lb. weight capacity, built-in side bolsters, fowler boost	EA	30	\$ 5.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 750.00	\$ 21.43	\$ 642.90
3	Low Air Loss and Alternating Pressure Therapy Mattress - 42" x 80", 600 lb. weight capacity, Pulsation Therapy	EA	18	\$ 6.00	\$ 108.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 108.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 21.44	\$ 385.92
4	Low Air Loss and Alternating Pressure Therapy Mattress - 48" x 80", 1000 lb. weight capacity	EA	18	\$ 7.00	\$ 126.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 144.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 21.44	\$ 385.92
5	Bariatric Low Bed Frame - Expands from 36" - 48" wide and 80" long, 800 lb. weight capacity, 9-inch low position	EA	10	\$ 8.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 39.50	\$ 395.00
6	Standard Floor Bed - 36" x 80", expands from 80" - 84" long, 330 lb. weight capacity	EA	15	\$ 10.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 20.52	\$ 307.80
7	Foam Mattress - 36" x 80"	EA	15	\$ 2.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 5.53	\$ 82.95
8	Safety Bolster Overlay - 36"	EA	30	\$ 1.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 150.00	NO BID	
9	Safety Bolster Overlay - 42"	EA	10	\$ 1.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 1.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	
10	Safety Bolster Overlay - 48"	EA	10	\$ 2.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 7.00	\$ 70.00	NO BID	
11	Floor Bed High Safety Mat - 9"	EA	20	\$ 2.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 100.00	NO BID	
12	Floor Bed Assist Rails	EA	15	\$ 1.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 75.00	NO BID	
GRAND TOTAL				\$ 816.50		\$ 832.00		\$ 3,225.00		\$ 2,294.39	

NOTES

Bid Opening 1/27/2025 @ 2:30 PM	BR, HK
Invitations Sent	78
Total Vendors Requesting Documents	2
Total Bid Responses	4