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1
Bulwark Front Zip Modacrylic Blend Fleece 
Hoodie, Regular, Black
Size S – 2XL

EA 5  $         320.00  $      1,600.00  $         400.74  $      2,003.70 

2
Bulwark Front Zip Modacrylic Blend Fleece 
Hoodie, Tall, Black
Size M – 3XL

EA 1  $         320.00  $         320.00  $         400.74  $         400.74 

3
Bulwark Full Zip Front Hooded Fleece Sweatshirt, 
Regular, Navy
Size S – 3XL

EA 2  $         299.00  $         598.00  $         378.99  $         757.98 

4
Bulwark Full Zip Front Hooded Fleece Sweatshirt, 
Tall, Navy
Size M – 3XL

EA 1  $         299.00  $         299.00  $         378.99  $         378.99 

5 Bulwark Lined Bomber Jacket, Regular 
Size S – 3XL EA 1  $         185.00  $         185.00  $         240.24  $         240.24 

6 Bulwark Long-Sleeve Dress Uniform Shirt, Long
Size M – 3XL EA 2  $           90.00  $         180.00  $           95.49  $         190.98 

7
Bulwark Long-Sleeve Dress Uniform Shirt, 
Regular
Size S – 3XL

EA 9  $           90.00  $         810.00  $           95.49  $         859.41 

8
Bulwark Men’s Classic Heavyweight Excel FR 
Jean, Denim
Size Waist 28 – 50; Length 24 – 36

EA 16  $           88.00  $      1,408.00  $           93.24  $      1,491.84 

9
Bulwark Men’s FR Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt, 
Long, Navy
Size M – 3XL

EA 1  $         179.00  $         179.00  $         234.24  $         234.24 

10
Bulwark Men’s FR Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt, 
Regular, Navy
Size S – 3XL

EA 2  $         179.00  $         358.00  $         234.24  $         468.48 

11

Bulwark Men’s Heavyweight Excel FR 
Comfortouch Deluxe Insulated Duck
Deluxe Bib Overall, Regular, Brown 
Size S – 3XL

EA 1  $         330.00  $         330.00 

12

Bulwark Men’s Heavyweight Excel FR 
Comfortouch Deluxe Insulated Duck Deluxe Bib 
Overall, Long, Brown
Size Large – 2XL

EA 1  $         330.00  $         330.00 

13
Bulwark Men’s Midweight Excel FR Team, 
Regular
Size S – 3XL

EA 2  $         165.00  $         330.00  $         210.99  $         421.98 

14
Bulwark Men’s Midweight FR Crewneck Pullover 
Sweatshirt, Long
Size M – 5XL

EA 2  $         160.00  $         320.00  $         205.74  $         411.48 

15
Bulwark Men’s Midweight FR Crewneck Pullover 
Sweatshirt, Regular
Size S – 5XL

EA 6  $         160.00  $         960.00  $         205.74  $      1,234.44 

16
Bulwark Men’s Midweight FR Dungaree Pants, 
Color - Brown and Navy Duck
Size Waist 29 – 50; Length 24 – 36

EA 27  $           82.00  $      2,214.00  $         105.24  $      2,841.48 
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17 Bulwark Men's Button Uniform Shirt 
Size S – 3XL EA 2  $           87.00  $         174.00  $           95.49  $         190.98 

18
Bulwark Men's Fleece FR Zip-Front Hooded 
Sweatshirt, Long, Navy
Size M – 5XL

EA 3  $         174.00  $         522.00  $         242.49  $         727.47 

19
Bulwark Men's Fleece FR Zip-Front Hooded 
Sweatshirt, Long, Navy
Size S – 2XL

EA 3  $         174.00  $         522.00  $         242.49  $         727.47 

20 Bulwark Men's Loose FR Stonewashed Jean
Size Waist 30 – 50; Length 29 – 36 EA 5  $           82.00  $         410.00  $           93.24  $         466.20 

21 Bulwark Modacrylic FR Knit Cap, Regular, Black
Size M – L EA 10  $           39.00  $         390.00  $           44.49  $         444.90 

22
Bulwark Thermal Lined Zip-Front Hooded 
Sweatshirt, Long, Navy 
Size M – 5XL

EA 2  $         195.00  $         390.00  $         285.24  $         570.48 

23
Bulwark Thermal Lined Zip-Front Hooded 
Sweatshirt, Regular, Navy 
Size S – 5XL

EA 7  $         195.00  $      1,365.00  $         285.24  $      1,996.68 

24 Bulwark Zip-Up Front Fleece Jacket, Long
Size M – 3XL EA 1  $         159.00  $         159.00  $         205.74  $         205.74 

25 Bulwark Zip-Up Front Fleece Jacket, Regular
Size S – 3XL EA 5  $         159.00  $         795.00  $         205.74  $      1,028.70 

26 Carhartt FR Full Swing Quick Duck Coat, Regular
Size S – 2XL EA 1  $         269.00  $         269.00 

27 Carhartt HV Force Relaxed Class 2 T-Shirt
Size S – 2XL EA 50  $           42.00  $      2,100.00 

28 Carhartt HV Force Relaxed Class 2 T-Shirt
Size 3XL – 4XL EA 5  $           47.00  $         235.00 

29 Carhartt HV Force Relaxed Class 3 T-Shirt
Size S – 2XL EA 50  $           47.00  $      2,350.00 

30 Carhartt HV Force Relaxed Class 3 T-Shirt
Size 3XL – 4XL EA 5  $           50.00  $         250.00 

31
Carhartt Iconic K288 Midweight Logo Sleeve 
Hooded Sweatshirt
Size S – 2XL

EA 10  $           56.00  $         560.00 

32
Carhartt Iconic K288 Midweight Logo Sleeve 
Hooded Sweatshirt
Size 3XL – 4XL

EA 1  $           59.00  $           59.00 

33
Carhartt HV Thermal Lined Full Zip Class 3 
Sweatshirt
Size M – 2XL

EA 25  $           86.00  $      2,150.00 
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34 Carhartt Loose Straight Denim Dungaree
Size Waist 30 – 54; Length 30 – 36 EA 10  $           49.00  $         490.00 

35 Carhartt FR Quick Duck Snap on Hood 
Size – One Size EA 1  $           64.00  $           64.00 

36
Carhartt Iconic J140 Firm Duck Active Jacket, 
Regular
Size S – 4XL

EA 5  $         125.00  $         625.00 

37 Carhartt Iconic J140 Firm Duck Active Jacket, Tall
Size M – 4XL EA 1  $         125.00  $         125.00 

38
Carhartt J130 Washed Duck Active Jacket, 
Regular
Size S – 2XL

EA 1  $         120.00  $         120.00  $         134.49  $         134.49 

39 Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Bib Overall
Size Waist 30 – 50; Length 30 - 36 EA 2  $         138.00  $         276.00 

40
Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Insulated Bid 
Overall, Regular
Size S – 5XL

EA 5  $         138.00  $         690.00  $         144.24  $         721.20 

41
Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Insulated Bid 
Overall, Short
Size M – 4XL

EA 5  $         138.00  $         690.00  $         144.24  $         721.20 

42
Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Insulated Bid 
Overall, Tall
Size M – 4XL

EA 5  $         138.00  $         690.00  $         144.99  $         724.95 

43
Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Insulated Traditional 
Coat, Big & Tall
Size XL – 4XL

EA 5  $         142.00  $         710.00  $         161.49  $         807.45 

44
Carhartt Loose Fit Firm Duck Insulated Traditional 
Coat, Regular
Size S – 2XL

EA 1  $         138.00  $         138.00  $         145.74  $         145.74 

45
Carhartt Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated 
Coveralls
Size S – 4XL

EA 1  $         160.00  $         160.00 

46 Carhartt Rugged Baseball Cap 
Size – One Size EA 20  $           29.00  $         580.00 

47 Dickies Regular Fit Jean,
Size Waist: 28 – 50; Lenth: 29 – 36 EA 30  $           42.00  $      1,260.00  $           60.24  $      1,807.20 

48
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 
Pants
Size Waist 30 – 42; Length 30 – 36

EA 65  $           45.00  $      2,925.00  $           72.99  $      4,744.35 

49
Dickies Relaxed Fit Heavyweight Duck Carpenter 
Pants
Size: Waist 44 – 50; Length 30 – 34

EA 5  $           45.00  $         225.00  $           72.99  $         364.95 

50 Fersten Forestville Pullover Hoodie Sweatshirt
Size XS – 3XL EA 25  $           38.00  $         950.00 
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51 Gildan G240 Long Sleeve T-Shirt Ultra Cotton
Size S – XL EA 5  $           10.00  $           50.00  $           15.24  $           76.20 

52 Gildan G240 Long Sleeve T-Shirt Ultra Cotton
Size 2XL EA 1  $           12.00  $           12.00  $           24.49  $           24.49 

53
Gildan Softstyle Adult Pique Polo, 100% Cotton, 
Short-Sleeve
Size S – XL

EA 10  $           12.00  $         120.00  $           17.49  $         174.90 

54
Gildan Softstyle Adult Pique Polo, 100% Cotton, 
Short-Sleeve
Size 2XL

EA 4  $           13.50  $           54.00  $           26.74  $         106.96 

55
Gildan Softstyle Adult Pique Polo, 100% Cotton, 
Short-Sleeve
Size 3XL – 4XL

EA 3  $           14.00  $           42.00  $           20.49  $           61.47 

56 Gildan T-Shirt Ultra Cotton 
Size S – XL EA 10  $             8.00  $           80.00  $           12.24  $         122.40 

57 Gildan T-Shirt Ultra Cotton 
Size 2XL EA 10  $           10.00  $         100.00  $           15.24  $         152.40 

58 Gildan T-Shirt Ultra Cotton
Size 3XL EA 3  $           12.00  $           36.00  $           25.49  $           76.47 

59 Gildan Ultra Cotton T-Shirt with a Pocket
Size 2XL EA 20  $           13.00  $         260.00  $           22.24  $         444.80 

60 Gildan Ultra Cotton T-Shirt with a Pocket
Size 4XL EA 4  $           15.00  $           60.00  $           25.24  $         100.96 

61 Gildan Ultra Cotton T-Shirt with a Pocket
Size 5XL EA 1  $           16.00  $           16.00  $           25.24  $           25.24 

62 Gildan Ultra Cotton T-Shirt with a Pocket
Size S - XL EA 25  $           11.00  $         275.00  $           15.24  $         381.00 

63 Hanes Long Sleeve T-Shirt with a Pocket
Size 2XL EA 15  $           13.00  $         195.00  $           21.74  $         326.10 

64 Hanes Long Sleeve T-Shirt with a Pocket
Size S – 2XL EA 35  $           11.50  $         402.50  $           19.74  $         690.90 

65 Hanes Long Sleeve T-Shirt with a Pocket
Size 3XL EA 5  $           13.50  $           67.50  $           22.74  $         113.70 

66 Hanes Men’s Authentic Pocket T-Shirt 
Size 2XL – 3XL EA 20  $           14.50  $         290.00  $           17.24  $         344.80 

67 Hanes Men’s Authentic Pocket T-Shirt 
Size S – XL EA 85  $           11.00  $         935.00  $           15.24  $      1,295.40 
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68
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Full-Zip Heavyweight 
Fleece Hoodie
Size S – XL

EA 30  $           31.00  $         930.00 

69
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Full-Zip Heavyweight 
Fleece Hoodie 
Size 2XL

EA 15  $           35.00  $         525.00 

70
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Full-Zip
Heavyweight Fleece Hoodie 
Size 3XL

EA 2  $           40.00  $           80.00 

71
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Full-Zip Heavyweight 
Fleece Hoodie, Black 
Size S – 3XL

EA 50  $           39.00  $      1,950.00  $           50.49  $      2,524.50 

72
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Heavyweight Fleece 
Crewneck Sweatshirt
Size S – XL

EA 40  $           24.00  $         960.00  $           27.99  $      1,119.60 

73
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Heavyweight Fleece 
Crewneck Sweatshirt
Size 2XL

EA 15  $           25.00  $         375.00  $           29.99  $         449.85 

74
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Heavyweight Fleece 
Crewneck Sweatshirt
Size 3XL

EA 3  $           27.00  $           81.00  $           33.24  $           99.72 

75
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Heavyweight Fleece 
Hoodie
Size S – XL

EA 10  $           29.00  $         290.00  $           34.74  $         347.40 

76
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Heavyweight Fleece 
Hoodie
Size 2XL

EA 5  $           33.00  $         165.00  $           48.99  $         244.95 

77
Hanes Ultimate Men’s Heavyweight Fleece 
Hoodie
Size 3XL

EA 3  $           35.00  $         105.00  $           56.99  $         170.97 

78
Hi-Vis Pullover Hooded Fleece Sweatshirt Cat 2 
FR
Size M – 3XL

EA 7  $         205.00  $      1,435.00  $         363.99  $      2,547.93 

79
Hi-Vis Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt Black and 
Yellow Cat 3 FR
Size M – 3XL

EA 7  $         260.00  $      1,820.00  $         471.99  $      3,303.93 

80
Jerzees Dri-Power 50/50 Unisex Long-Sleeve T-
Shirt
Size S – XL

EA 16  $           11.00  $         176.00  $           17.49  $         279.84 

81
Jerzees Dri-Power 50/50 Unisex Long-Sleeve T-
Shirt
Size 2XL

EA 1  $           12.50  $           12.50  $           19.49  $           19.49 

82
Jerzees Dri-Power 50/50 Unisex Long-Sleeve T-
Shirt
Size 3XL

EA 1  $           15.00  $           15.00  $           24.49  $           24.49 

83
Jerzees Dri-Power 50/50 Unisex Long-Sleeve T-
Shirt
Size 4XL

EA 1  $           17.00  $           17.00 

84 Jerzees Dri-Power 5050 Unisex Pocket T-Shirt
Size 2XL – 3XL EA 1  $           16.00  $           16.00  $           22.74  $           22.74 
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85 Jerzees Dri-Power 5050 Unisex Pocket T-Shirt
Size 4XL – 5XL EA 1  $           16.00  $           16.00  $           26.74  $           26.74 

86 Jerzees Dri-Power 5050 Unisex Pocket T-Shirt
Size S – XL EA 15  $           12.00  $         180.00  $           16.74  $         251.10 

87
Lee Men’s 100% Cotton Carpenter Jeans, Dark 
Indigo
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length 30 – 36

EA 50  $           42.00  $      2,100.00 

88
Lee Men’s 100% Cotton Regular Fit
Straight Leg Heavyweight Jeans 
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length 30 – 36

EA 10  $           40.00  $         400.00 

89
Lee Men’s 100% Cotton Regular Fit Straight Leg 
Heavyweight Jeans 
Size Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34

EA 10  $           40.00  $         400.00 

90 Lee Men’s Carpenter Fit
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length 30 – 36 EA 200  $           50.00  $    10,000.00 

91
Lee Men’s Legendary Workwear Loose Fit 
Carpenter Jean (Big & Tall), Colton Blue
Size Waist 36 – 60; Length 29 – 36

EA 10  $           52.00  $         520.00 

92
Lee Men’s Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Jean in 
Tomas
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length: 30 – 36

EA 25  $           42.00  $      1,050.00 

93
Lee Men’s Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Jean, Medium 
Stone
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length 30 – 36

EA 25  $           42.00  $      1,050.00 

94 Lee Men’s Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Jeans
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length 30 – 34 EA 10  $           42.00  $         420.00 

95 Lee Men’s Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Jeans
Size Waist 44 - 60; Length 30 - 34 EA 10  $           42.00  $         420.00 

96 Lee Men's Carpenter Fit
Size Waist 44 – 60; Length 30 – 34 EA 10  $           53.00  $         530.00 

97
Lee Women’s Ultra Lux Comfort with Flex Motion 
Bootcut Jeans
Waist: Size 2 – 18; Length 30 - 34

EA 6  $           48.00  $         288.00 

98
Lee Women's Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Pants All 
Day
Size Waist Size 2 – 20; Length 29 – 33

EA 5  $           49.00  $         245.00 

99
Lee Women's Relaxed Fit Straight Leg Pants All 
Day Plus
Size Waist 14W – 30W; Length 29 – 34

EA 5  $           51.00  $         255.00 

100
Majestic High Visibility Waterproof Rain Jacket, 
Yellow
Size M – XL

EA 1  $           45.00  $           45.00 

101
Majestic High Visibility Waterproof Rain Jacket, 
Yellow
Size 2XL – 6XL

EA 1  $           45.00  $           45.00 
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102
Majestic High Visibility Waterproof Rain Pants, 
ANSI, Yellow
Size 2XL – 6XL

EA 1  $           20.00  $           20.00 

103
Majestic High Visibility Waterproof Rain Pants, 
ANSI, Yellow
Size S – XL

EA 1  $           20.00  $           20.00 

104 Port & Company Combed Ring Spun Pique Polo
Size 2XL – 3XL EA 5  $           22.00  $         110.00  $           26.49  $         132.45 

105 Port & Company Combed Ring Spun Pique Polo
Size 4XL EA 1  $           23.00  $           23.00  $           27.49  $           27.49 

106 Port & Company Combed Ring Spun Pique Polo
Size S – XL EA 15  $           18.00  $         270.00  $           20.49  $         307.35 

107
Port & Company Essential Fleece Crewneck 
Sweatshirt
Size S – XL

EA 5  $           18.00  $           90.00  $           23.49  $         117.45 

108
Port & Company Essential Fleece Crewneck 
Sweatshirt
Size 2XL

EA 1  $           20.50  $           20.50  $           25.49  $           25.49 

109
Port & Company Essential Fleece Crewneck 
Sweatshirt
Size 3XL

EA 1  $           21.50  $           21.50  $           28.49  $           28.49 

110
Port & Company Essential Fleece Crewneck 
Sweatshirt
Size 4XL

EA 1  $           21.50  $           21.50  $           28.49  $           28.49 

111
Port & Company Essential Fleece Pullover 
Hooded Sweatshirt
Size S – XL

EA 5  $           25.00  $         125.00  $           30.99  $         154.95 

112
Port & Company Essential Fleece Pullover 
Hooded Sweatshirt
Size 2XL

EA 1  $           27.00  $           27.00  $           35.99  $           35.99 

113
Port & Company Essential Fleece Pullover 
Hooded Sweatshirt
Size 3XL

EA 1  $           30.00  $           30.00  $           39.99  $           39.99 

114
Port & Company Essential Fleece Pullover 
Hooded Sweatshirt
Size 4XL

EA 1  $           30.00  $           30.00  $           39.99  $           39.99 

115
Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee Short 
Sleeve
Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 11  $           14.00  $         154.00  $           18.49  $         203.39 

116
Port & Company Essential Pocket Tee Short 
Sleeve
Size S – XL

EA 25  $           11.00  $         275.00  $           14.49  $         362.25 

117 Port & Company Knit Cap with Cuff 
Size – One Size EA 50  $           10.00  $         500.00  $           10.74  $         537.00 

118
Port & Company Long Sleeve Essential Pocket 
Tee
Size 2XL - 3XL

EA 20  $           15.50  $         310.00  $           21.24  $         424.80 
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119
Port & Company Long Sleeve Essential Pocket 
Tee
Size 4XL

EA 2  $           15.50  $           31.00  $           23.24  $           46.48 

120
Port & Company Long Sleeve Essential Pocket 
Tee
Size S – XL

EA 45  $           13.00  $         585.00  $           18.24  $         820.80 

121 Port and Company Women’s Core Blend Tee
Size S – 2XL EA 7  $           10.00  $           70.00  $           12.99  $           90.93 

122 Port Authority Dry Zone Colorblock Ottoman Polo
Size S – XL EA 5  $           26.00  $         130.00  $           30.24  $         151.20 

123 Port Authority Dry Zone Colorblock Ottoman Polo
Size 2XL EA 5  $           27.00  $         135.00  $           33.24  $         166.20 

124 Port Authority Dry Zone Colorblock Ottoman Polo
Size 3XL EA 5  $           29.00  $         145.00  $           36.24  $         181.20 

125 Port Authority Dry Zone Ottoman Polo 
Size S – XL EA 5  $           25.00  $         125.00  $           28.74  $         143.70 

126 Port Authority Dry Zone Ottoman Polo 
Size 2XL EA 5  $           26.00  $         130.00  $           30.74  $         153.70 

127 Port Authority Dry Zone Ottoman Polo 
Size 3XL EA 5  $           28.00  $         140.00  $           34.74  $         173.70 

128 Port Authority EZCotton Long Sleeve Polo Shirt
Size S – XL EA 35  $           25.00  $         875.00  $           31.74  $      1,110.90 

129 Port Authority EZCotton Long Sleeve Polo Shirt
Size 2XL EA 2  $           26.00  $           52.00  $           33.74  $           67.48 

130 Port Authority EZCotton Long Sleeve Polo Shirt
Size 3XL EA 2  $           28.00  $           56.00  $           37.74  $           75.48 

131 Port Authority Ladies C-Free Double Knit ¼-Zip
Size XS – 2XL EA 5  $           28.00  $         140.00  $           33.99  $         169.95 

132 Port Authority Ladies Microfleece Jacket
Size 2X – 4XL EA 5  $           29.00  $         145.00  $           38.24  $         191.20 

133 Port Authority Ladies Microfleece Jacket
Size XS – XL EA 15  $           25.00  $         375.00  $           30.24  $         453.60 

134 Port Authority Long Sleeve Denim Shirt 
Size XS – XL EA 5  $           28.00  $         140.00  $           34.74  $         173.70 

135 Port Authority Long Sleeve Twill Shirt 
Size S – XL EA 30  $           28.00  $         840.00  $           34.74  $      1,042.20 
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136 Port Authority Long Sleeve Twill Shirt 
Size 2XL EA 10  $           29.00  $         290.00  $           36.74  $         367.40 

137 Port Authority Long Sleeve Twill Shirt 
Size 3XL EA 2  $           31.00  $           62.00  $           40.74  $           81.48 

138 Port Authority Long Sleeve Twill Shirt 
Size 4XL – 6XL EA 5  $           35.00  $         175.00  $           36.74  $         183.70 

139
Port Authority Men’s Silk Touch Performance 
Pocket Polo
Size 2XL – 4XL

EA 10  $           24.00  $         240.00  $           30.74  $         307.40 

140
Port Authority Men’s Silk Touch Performance 
Pocket Polo
Size XS – XL

EA 50  $           20.00  $      1,000.00  $           22.74  $      1,137.00 

141 Port Authority Men's Accord Microfleece Vest
Size S – XL EA 1  $           26.00  $           26.00  $           30.24  $           30.24 

142 Port Authority Men's Accord Microfleece Vest
Size 2XL EA 1  $           27.00  $           27.00  $           33.24  $           33.24 

143 Port Authority Men's Accord Microfleece Vest
Size 3XL EA 1  $           29.00  $           29.00  $           37.24  $           37.24 

144 Port Authority Men's Back-Block Soft Shell Jacket
Size XS – 4XL EA 15  $           42.00  $         630.00  $           48.99  $         734.85 

145 Port Authority Men's Challenger Jacket 
Size 2XL – 6XL EA 5  $           49.00  $         245.00  $           70.49  $         352.45 

146 Port Authority Men's Challenger Jacket 
Size XS – XL EA 25  $           44.00  $      1,100.00  $           56.49  $      1,412.25 

147 Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 
Polo with Pocket Size S – XL EA 100  $           25.00  $      2,500.00  $           29.49  $      2,949.00 

148 Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 
Polo with Pocket Size 2XL – 4XL EA 15  $           29.00  $         435.00  $           37.49  $         562.35 

149 Port Authority Men's Heavyweight Cotton Pique 
Polo with Pocket Size 5XL – 6XL EA 7  $           31.00  $         217.00  $           43.49  $         304.43 

150 Port Authority Men's Microfleece Jacket 
Size 2XL – 4XL EA 5  $           30.00  $         150.00  $           32.24  $         161.20 

151 Port Authority Men's Microfleece Jacket 
Size XS – XL EA 25  $           26.00  $         650.00  $           30.24  $         756.00 

152 Port Authority Men's Microfleece Vest 
Size 2XL – 4XL EA 5  $           29.00  $         145.00  $           38.24  $         191.20 
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153 Port Authority Men's Microfleece Vest 
Size XS – XL EA 20  $           25.00  $         500.00  $           28.74  $         574.80 

154
Port Authority Men's Silk Touch Performance 
Long Sleeve Polo
Size XS – XL

EA 40  $           21.00  $         840.00  $           22.74  $         909.60 

155
Port Authority Men's Silk Touch Performance 
Long Sleeve Polo 
Size 2XL – 4XL

EA 5  $           25.00  $         125.00  $           30.65  $         153.25 

156 Port Authority Short Sleeve Twill Shirt 
Size S – XL EA 40  $           27.00  $      1,080.00  $           33.24  $      1,329.60 

157 Port Authority Short Sleeve Twill Shirt 
Size 2XL - 4XL EA 16  $           31.00  $         496.00  $           41.24  $         659.84 

158 Port Authority Silk Touch™ Polo 
Size S – XL EA 5  $           21.00  $         105.00  $           22.74  $         113.70 

159 Port Authority Silk Touch™ Polo 
Size 2XL EA 5  $           22.00  $         110.00  $           24.74  $         123.70 

160 Port Authority Silk Touch™ Polo 
Size 3XL EA 5  $           24.00  $         120.00  $           28.74  $         143.70 

161 Port Authority Snapback Fine Twill Cap 
Size – One Size EA 30  $           11.00  $         330.00  $           12.24  $         367.20 

162 Port Authority Tall Men's Challenger Jacket, Tall
Size L – 4XL EA 3  $           54.00  $         162.00  $           62.49  $         187.47 

163 Port Authority Watch Cap, Black 
Size – One Size EA 5  $           13.00  $           65.00  $           13.74  $           68.70 

164 Port Authority Women’s Challenger Jacket
Size 2XL – 4XL EA 5  $           51.00  $         255.00  $           71.24  $         356.20 

165 Port Authority Women’s Challenger Jacket
Size XS – XL EA 5  $           47.00  $         235.00  $           63.24  $         316.20 

166
Port Authority Women’s Colorblock Microfleece 
Jacket
Size XS – 2XL

EA 6  $           26.00  $         156.00  $           30.99  $         185.94 

167 Port Authority Women’s EZCotton Polo Shirt
Size XS – XL EA 15  $           23.00  $         345.00  $           27.99  $         419.85 

168 Port Authority Women’s EZCotton Polo Shirt
Size 2XL – 4XL EA 5  $           27.00  $         135.00  $           35.99  $         179.95 

169
Port Authority Women’s Long Sleeve Silk Touch 
Polo
Size XS – XL

EA 10  $           25.00  $         250.00  $           26.49  $         264.90 
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170
Port Authority Women’s Long Sleeve Silk Touch 
Polo
Size 2XL – 4XL

EA 1  $           29.00  $           29.00  $           34.49  $           34.49 

171
Port Authority Women’s Microfleece ½-Zip 
Pullover
Size XS – 2XL

EA 4  $           27.00  $         108.00  $           28.74  $         114.96 

172 Port Authority Women’s Microfleece Vest
Size 2XL - 4XL EA 5  $           29.00  $         145.00  $           36.74  $         183.70 

173 Port Authority Women’s Microfleece Vest
Size XS - XL EA 20  $           25.00  $         500.00  $           28.74  $         574.80 

174 Port Authority Women’s Pique Knit Polo Shirt
Size XS – XL EA 5  $           26.00  $         130.00  $           27.99  $         139.95 

175 Port Authority Women’s Pique Knit Polo Shirt
Size 2XL – 4XL EA 1  $           30.00  $           30.00  $           35.99  $           35.99 

176
Port Authority Women’s Silk Touch Performance 
¼-Zip
Size S – 2XL

EA 5  $           23.00  $         115.00  $           23.49  $         117.45 

177
Port Authority Women’s Silk Touch
Performance Long Sleeve Polo Shirt 
Size XS – XL

EA 10  $           22.00  $         220.00  $           22.74  $         227.40 

178
Port Authority Women’s Silk Touch Performance 
Long Sleeve Polo Shirt 
Size 2XL - 4XL

EA 1  $           26.00  $           26.00  $           30.74  $           30.74 

179
Port Authority Women’s Silk Touch Poly/Cotton 
Pique Polo Shirt
Size XS - XL

EA 25  $           21.00  $         525.00  $           21.24  $         531.00 

180
Port Authority Women’s Silk Touch Poly/Cotton 
Pique Polo Shirt
Size 2XL - 6XL

EA 1  $           28.00  $           28.00  $           29.24  $           29.24 

181
Port Authority Women’s SuperPro React Polo 
Shirt
Size S – 2XL

EA 10  $           21.00  $         210.00  $           21.99  $         219.90 

182 Red Cap Heavyweight Parka 
Size S – XL EA 5  $           99.00  $         495.00  $         137.41  $         687.05 

183 Red Cap Heavyweight Parka 
Size 2XL – 4XL EA 5  $           99.00  $         495.00  $         137.41  $         687.05 

184
Red Cap Men’s Long Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant 
Cotton Work Shirt
Size S – XL

EA 20  $           27.00  $         540.00  $           33.99  $         679.80 

185
Red Cap Men’s Long Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant 
Cotton Work Shirt
Size 2XL

EA 5  $           27.00  $         135.00  $           33.99  $         169.95 

186
Red Cap Men’s Long Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant 
Cotton Work Shirt
Size 3XL

EA 2  $           27.00  $           54.00  $           33.99  $           67.98 



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
EMPLOYEE UNIFORMS AND CLOTHING 26-024-FM 
BID TABULATION


Silk Screen Express, Inc. Standard Textile Co., Inc.

187
Red Cap Men’s Short Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant 
Cotton Work Shirt
Size S – XL

EA 35  $           27.00  $         945.00  $           30.99  $      1,084.65 

188
Red Cap Men’s Short Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant 
Cotton Work Shirt
Size 2XL

EA 5  $           27.00  $         135.00  $           33.99  $         169.95 

189
Red Cap Men’s Short Sleeve Wrinkle-Resistant 
Cotton Work Shirt
Size 3XL

EA 5  $           27.00  $         135.00  $           33.99  $         169.95 

190 Red Kap Men’s Dur-Kap® Industrial Pant
Size Waist 28 – 60, Length 30 – 36 EA 20  $           28.00  $         560.00  $           28.74  $         574.80 

191 Red Kap Men's Cotton Cargo
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length 30 – 36 EA 5  $           38.00  $         190.00  $           44.49  $         222.45 

192 Red Kap Men's Plain Front Cotton Pants
Size Waist 29 – 42; Length 30 – 36 EA 25  $           35.00  $         875.00  $           40.74  $      1,018.50 

193 Red Kap Red Men’s Red-E-Prest® Work Pant
Size Waist 26 – 60; Length 30 – 36 EA 20  $           32.00  $         640.00  $           30.99  $         619.80 

194 Red Kap Women’s Straight Fit Jean 
Size Waist 4 – 18; Length 28 - 32 EA 5  $           32.00  $         160.00  $           31.74  $         158.70 

195
SanMar Cornerstone® ANSI 107 Class
3 Heavy-Duty Fleece Full-Zip Hoodie 
Size S – XL

EA 5  $           42.00  $         210.00  $           51.99  $         259.95 

196
SanMar Cornerstone® ANSI 107 Class 3 Heavy-
Duty Fleece Full-Zip Hoodie
Size 2XL

EA 3  $           43.00  $         129.00  $           53.99  $         161.97 

197
SanMar Cornerstone® ANSI 107 Class
3 Heavy-Duty Fleece Full-Zip Hoodie 
Size 3XL

EA 1  $           45.00  $           45.00  $           57.99  $           57.99 

198
SanMar Cornerstone® ANSI 107 Class 3 Mesh 
Long Sleeve Tee
Size S – 2XL

EA 5  $           24.00  $         120.00  $           31.74  $         158.70 

199
SanMar Cornerstone® ANSI 107 Class 3 Mesh 
Long Sleeve Tee
Size 3XL

EA 5  $           26.00  $         130.00  $           37.74  $         188.70 

200
SanMar Cornerstone® ANSI 107 Class 3 Short 
Sleeve Snag-Resistant Reflective T-Shirt
Size S – 2XL

EA 15  $           21.00  $         315.00  $           27.24  $         408.60 

201 SanMar Cornerstone® ANSI 107 Class 3 Short 
Sleeve Snag-Resistant Reflective T-Shirt EA 3  $           23.00  $           69.00  $           33.24  $           99.72 

202 Tinley Vision Rain Jacket 
Size 2XL – 5XL EA 1  $           71.00  $           71.00 

203 Tinley Vision Rain Jacket 
Size M – XL EA 1  $           69.00  $           69.00 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 
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204 Tinley Vision Rain Pant
Size 2XL – 5XL EA 1  $           52.00  $           52.00 

205 Tinley Vision Rain Pant 
Size S – XL EA 1  $           50.00  $           50.00 

206
VEA® Waterproof High-Visibility Rainsuit Set 
(Lime)
Size M – XL

EA 1  $           70.00  $           70.00 

207 Logo Set-Up Fee (Initial One-Time Fee) EA 1

6,597.00$       7,026.60$       

Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

NOTES
1. Standard Textile Co., Inc. Extended Price was adjusted to correct for submission errors.
2. UniFirst Corporation has been deemed non-responsive due to not including required document.

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

GRAND TOTAL

 NO BID 

 NO CHARGE  NO CHARGE 

Bid Opening 4/2/2026 @ 2:30 PM HK, SP
41
5
3
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