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PRICE

1  Heavy Duty Submersible Pump EA 3  $    44,396.33  $  133,188.99  $    40,450.00  $  121,350.00  $    61,412.00  $  184,236.00  $    58,288.88  $  174,866.64 

2  3/16” 316L SS Lifting Chains LFT 90  $           28.87  $      2,598.30  $         235.00  $    21,150.00  $           44.66  $      4,019.40  NO BID  NO BID 

3  316L SS Guiderail Support System EA 3  $      7,533.00  $    22,599.00  $    16,110.00  $    48,330.00  $    10,800.00  $    32,400.00  NO BID  NO BID 

4  4” Submersible Pump EA 2  $      7,985.00  $    15,970.00  $    11,630.00  $    23,260.00  $    11,841.00  $    23,682.00  $      4,710.69  $      9,421.38 

5  3/16” 316L SS Lifting Chains LFT 40  $           14.95  $         598.00  $           38.00  $      1,520.00  $           20.50  $         820.00  NO BID  NO BID 

6  316L SS Guiderail Support System EA 2  $      1,886.00  $      3,772.00  $      5,595.00  $    11,190.00  $      3,022.00  $      6,044.00  NO BID  NO BID 

178,726.29$   226,800.00$   251,201.40$   184,288.02$   

Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

Tiles In Style LLC #2

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
JOF SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS 26-044-PW
BID TABULATION

NOTES
1. Flow-Technics, Inc.'s Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
    a. NO. 1, when multiplied, ($44,396.33 x 3 = $133,188.99), resulted in a decrease of $0.01.
    b. NO. 2, when multiplied, ($28.87 x 90 = $2,598.30), resulted in an increase of $0.30.
    c. GRAND TOTAL was corrected from $178,726.00 to $178,726.29.
2. Superior Industrial Equipment, LLC was deemed non-responsive for an incomplete submission.
3. Xylem Water Solutions, U.S.A., Inc. was deemed non-responsive for not providing price as requested.
4. Facilities Management has requested a contingency of 10%, $178,726.29 + $17,872.63 (contingency) = $196,598.92 contract request.
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