THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
AUTOMOTIVE AND HEAVY-DUTY BODY REPAIR 23-071-DOT
BID TABULATION

v

Al Piemonte Ford Sales

Mac's Body Shop Inc.

EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. [ITEM UOM | QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
SECTION 1: Automotive Body Repair
1 [Body Labor HR 250 | $ 60.00( $ 15,000.00( $ 52.00| $ 13,000.00
2 |Paint Labor HR 100 | $ 60.00| $ 6,000.00| $ 52.00( $ 5,200.00
3 |Paint and Suplies HR 100 | $ 39.00( $ 3,900.00( $ 33.00( $ 3,300.00
4 |Mechanical HR 100 | $ 165.00| $ 16,500.00| $ 80.00( $ 8,000.00
5 |Frame HR 50 $ 95.00( $ 4,750.00( $ 80.00 $ 4,000.00
6 |Towing Charge lway | 20 | $ 250.00( $ 5,000.00( $ 125.00| $ 2,500.00
SECTION 2: Automotive Motor Crash Guide
% MARK-UP [ EXTENDED | % MARK-UP | EXTENDED
NO. |ITEM EST. VALUE DISCOUNT PRICE DISCOUNT PRICE
7 |Annual Expected Expenditure $10,000.00 -30.00% $ 7,000.00 -5.00% $ 9,500.00
TOTAL: AUTOMOTIVE BODY REPAIR| $ 58,150.00 $ 45,500.00

Al Piemonte Ford Sales

Mac's Body Shop Inc.

SECTION 3: Heavy-Duty Body Repair

EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. |ITEM UOM | QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
8 |Body Labor HR 100 | $ 65.00( $ 6,500.00 No Bid
9 |Paint Labor HR 40 $ 65.00| $ 2,600.00 No Bid
10 |[Paint and Suplies HR 40 $ 42.00( $ 1,680.00 No Bid
11 [Mechanical HR 50 $ 185.00| $  7,400.00 No Bid
12 |Frame HR 40 [ $ 95.00 $  3,800.00 No Bid
13 |Towing Charge 1-way 6 $ 400.00| $ 2,400.00 No Bid
SECTION 4: Heavy-Duty Motor Crash Guide
% MARK-UP | EXTENDED | % MARK-UP | EXTENDED
NO. |ITEM EST. VALUE DISCOUNT PRICE DISCOUNT PRICE
14 |Annual Expected Expenditure $10,000.00 -30.00% $  7,000.00 No Bid
TOTAL: HEAVY-DUTY BODY REPAIR| $ 31,380.00 $ -
NOTES

Bid Opening 5/11/2023 @ 2:30 PM VC, NE
Invitations Sent 21
Total Vendors Requesting Documents 0
Total Bid Responses 2



Roula Eikosidekas
Highlight

Roula Eikosidekas
Highlight

Roula Eikosidekas
Highlight


	Sheet1

