THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
CHEMICALS AND PUMP REPLACEMENT
PARTS 26-035-PW

BID TABULATION

v

Hawkins, Inc.

NO. [ITEM UoM | QTY PRICE EX;:::DEED
1 |Gas Chlorine Cylinders LB | 150 | $ 1.1526 | $ 172.89
2 |Hydrofluosilicic Acid (Fluoride) LB | 400 | $ 0.9315( $ 372.60
3 |Potassium Carbonate, 47% GAL| 1 | $ 9.29| $ 9.29
4 |King Lee Technologies Antiscalant 0100 LB | 400 | $ 3.23| $ 1,292.00
5 |Calcium Hypochlorite Pool Tablets 3” LB | 50 | $ 389 $ 194.50
6 |Granular Calcium Hypochlorite LB | 50 | $ 389 $ 194.50
7 |M3 Quick Connect 3/8” Pump Tubes EA 119% 96.00| $ 96.00
8 |[M3 2-Channel Quick Disconnect QNEE EA 119% 47191 | $ 471.91
9 |M3 Pump Quick Connects 3/8” EA 1 $ 96.00| $ 96.00
10 [M3 Roller Assemblies EA 119% 334.29( $ 334.29
11 |Black Pressure Regulators EA 1 No Bid
12 |Polyethylene Chemical Tubing EA 1 No Bid
13 |Marpene TM LoadSure Tubing Element EA 1 No Bid
14 |520REM Pumphead EA 1 No Bid

GRAND TOTAL $ 3,233.98
NOTES

1. Hawkins, Inc. Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
» NO. 3, when multiplied, ($9.29 x 1 = $9.29), resulted in a decrease of $501.66.

Bid Opening 5/22/2026@ 11:00 AM.| SR, SP

Invitations Sent 28

Total Vendors Requesting Documents 0

Total Bid Responses 1




