



**THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
PROPLAN CANINE AND FELINE PET
FOOD 26-067-ANS
BID TABULATION**



				Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc.	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
SECTION 1 - CANINE					
1	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Puppy/Shredded Blend Chicken & Rice Formula	BAG	12	\$ 63.09	\$ 757.08
2	Pro Plan Chicken and Rice Entrée Classic	CS	19	\$ 23.03	\$ 437.57
3	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets UR Urinary Ox/St Formula	BAG	1	\$ 82.18	\$ 82.18
4	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets UR Urinary Ox/St	CS	1	\$ 38.42	\$ 38.42
5	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets Urinary Ox/St Savory Selects with Chicken in Gravy	CS	2	\$ 38.42	\$ 76.84
6	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric Formula	BAG	8	\$ 79.93	\$ 639.44
7	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric	CS	3	\$ 38.68	\$ 116.04
8	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric Savory Selects Chicken	CS	7	\$ 38.68	\$ 270.76
9	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets NF Kidney Function	BAG	1	\$ 85.31	\$ 85.31
10	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets HA Hydrolyzed Protein Salmon Flavor	BAG	4	\$ 95.09	\$ 380.36
11	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets HA Hydrolyzed Protein Chicken Formula	BAG	1	\$ 95.09	\$ 95.09
12	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets HA Hydrolyzed Protein Chicken Flavor	CS	10	\$ 45.32	\$ 453.20
13	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets OM Overweight Management	BAG	2	\$ 78.64	\$ 157.28



				Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc.	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
14	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets OM Overweight Management	CS	6	\$ 41.15	\$ 246.90
15	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets NF Kidney Function	CS	5	\$ 38.68	\$ 193.40
16	Pro Plan Specialized Adult Small Breed Sensitive Skin & Stomach Salmon and Rice Formula	BAG	1	\$ 36.62	\$ 36.62
17	Pro Plan Specialized Adult Small Breed Formula	BAG	89	\$ 36.62	\$ 3,259.18
18	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Adult Shredded Blend Chicken & Rice Formula	BAG	100	\$ 61.61	\$ 6,161.00
19	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Chicken & Rice Entrée Classic	CS	92	\$ 23.03	\$ 2,118.76
20	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Adult Beef & Rice Entrée Classic	CS	64	NO BID	
21	Pro Plan Specialized Adult Large Breed Formula Dry Dog Food	BAG	38	\$ 65.17	\$ 2,476.46
22	Pro Plan Specialized Adult Sensitive Skin & Stomach Salmon & Rice Formula	BAG	2	NO BID	
23	Pro Plan Specialized Adult Sensitive Skin & Stomach Salmon & Rice Entrée	CS	2	\$ 28.05	\$ 56.10
24	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric Fiber Balance Dry	BAG	1	\$ 79.93	\$ 79.93
25	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric Low Fat dry	BAG	14	\$ 79.93	\$ 1,119.02
26	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric Low Fat	CS	11	\$ 38.68	\$ 425.48
27	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora Diarrhea Response Kit - Small Dog	CS	1	NO BID	
28	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora Diarrhea Response Kit - Medium Dog	CS	1	NO BID	
29	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora Diarrhea Response Kit - Large Dog	CS	2	NO BID	
30	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora PRO Synbiotic Action	BOX	1	\$ 125.94	\$ 125.94



				Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc.	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
31	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora PRO Diarrhea Response Kit - Small Dog	CS	1	NO BID	
32	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora PRO Diarrhea Response Kit - Medium Dog	CS	1	NO BID	
33	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora PRO Diarrhea Response Kit - Large Dog	CS	2	NO BID	
SECTION 2 - CANINE & FELINE					
34	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets CN Critical Nutrition - Cat and Dog	CS	8	\$ 56.95	\$ 455.60
SECTION 3 - FELINE					
35	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Kitten Chicken & Rice Dry Formula	BAG	230	\$ 22.69	\$ 5,218.70
36	Pro Plan Development Kitten Chicken & Liver Entrée	CS	101	\$ 34.69	\$ 3,503.69
37	Pro Plan Development Kitten Favorites Variety Pack	CS	53	NO BID	
38	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets OM Overweight Management	BAG	2	\$ 67.95	\$ 135.90
39	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets OM Overweight Management Savory Selects	CS	3	\$ 50.04	\$ 150.12
40	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets UR Urinary St/Ox	CS	4	\$ 52.70	\$ 210.80
41	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets UR Savory Selects Urinary St/Ox	CS	3	\$ 52.70	\$ 158.10
42	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets UR Urinary St/Ox	BAG	1	\$ 71.96	\$ 71.96
43	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric	BAG	11	\$ 64.63	\$ 710.93
44	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric	CS	5	\$ 51.37	\$ 256.85
45	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets EN Gastroenteric Savory Selects	CS	5	NO BID	



				Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc.	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
46	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets HA Hydrolyzed Protein	BAG	9	\$ 54.78	\$ 493.02
47	Pro Plan Specialized Sensitive Skin & Stomach Grain Free Duck Entrée	CS	11	NO BID	
48	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Chicken & Rice Formula Dry Cat Food	BAG	125	\$ 39.43	\$ 4,928.75
49	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Salmon & Rice Formula Dry Cat Food	BAG	51	\$ 39.43	\$ 2,010.93
50	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Chunky Chicken Entrée	CS	97	\$ 31.71	\$ 3,075.87
51	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Adult chicken, Tuna & Wild Rice Entrée in Sauce	CS	2	\$ 31.71	\$ 63.42
52	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Adult Chicken & Rice Entrée in Gravy	CS	2	\$ 31.71	\$ 63.42
53	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Adult Salmon & Rice Entrée in Sauce	CS	2	\$ 31.71	\$ 63.42
54	Pro Plan Complete Essentials Adult Tuna Entrée in Sauce	CS	2	\$ 31.71	\$ 63.42
55	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets NF Kidney Function Advanced Care	BAG	1	\$ 45.04	\$ 45.04
56	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets NF Kidney Function Advanced Care	CS	1	\$ 50.02	\$ 50.02
57	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets DM Dietetic Management	BAG	1	\$ 57.62	\$ 57.62
58	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets DM Dietetic Management	CS	3	\$ 49.67	\$ 149.01
59	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora Diarrhea Response Kit	CS	3	\$ 113.94	\$ 341.82
60	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora PRO Synbiotic Action	BOX	1	\$ 125.94	\$ 125.94
61	Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora PRO Diarrhea Response Kit	CS	2	NO BID	



				Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc.	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
SECTION 4 - SAMPLE ADOPTION BAGS					
62	Canine Adoption Sample Bag	BAG	1	NO BID	
63	Kitten Adoption Sample Bag	BAG	1	NO BID	
64	Feline Adoption Same Bag	BAG	1	NO BID	
GRAND TOTAL					\$ 42,292.71

NOTES
1. Patterson Veterinary was deemed non-responsive due to incomplete submission.

Bid Opening 08/05/2026 @ 11:00 AM	SP, HK
Invitations Sent	4
Total Vendors Requesting Documents	6
Total Bid Responses	2