THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

INFECTIOUS MEDICAL WASTE DISPOSAL 24-060-SHF
BID TABULATION

v

Stericycle, Inc MedXwaste
EXTENDED EXTENDED
NO. |ITEM UoOM|QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 Medlcgl Waste Container Pick-Up - 51 gallon EA | 300 $ 3250| §  9.750.00 NO BID
capacity
11 Med|cgl Waste Container Pick-Up - 30 gallon EA | 510 NO BID $ 28.00| $ 14.280.00
capacity
2 |Additional On Call Pick-Up EA 1 $ 3250 $ 3250 $ 85.00( $ 85.00
3 |State of lllinois Manifest Fee EA 1 NO CHARGE $ 400( $ 4.00
4 Sharps Container - 1 gt. capacity, red, packed cs 3 |s 19571 $ 587.13 | $ 295.00| $ 885.00
100/case
5 Sharps Container - 5 gt. capacity, beige, packed cs | 12 NO BID $ 6575 $ 789.00
20/case
51 Sharps Container - 5 gt. capacity, beige, packed cs s | s 129083 | $  1,038.64 NO BID
32/case
6 Sharps Container - 8 gt. capacity, red, packed cs | a8 NO BID NO BID
10/case
6.1 Sharps Container - 8 qt. capacity, beige, packed cs | 24 |s 11379| $ 273096 | $ 86.25| $  2,070.00
20/case
GRAND TOTAL| $ 14,139.23 $ 18,113.00
NOTES

1. There are three (3) changes to Stericycle's bid tab:

a

b

C.

. For Item 5, pricing was provided for an alternate case size of 32 per case. Due to the lager case size, the QTY was

reduced to 8 to account for equivalent usage. This resulted in an extended price of $1,038.64.

. For Item 6, pricing was provided for an alternate case size of 20 per case. Due to the lager case size, the QTY was

reduced to 24 to account for equivalent usage. This resulted in an extended price of $2,730.96.
Adjusted Grand Total decreased from $18,242.95 to $14,139.23.

2. There is one (1) change to MedXwaste's bid tab:

a.

For Item 6, pricing was provided for an alternate case size of 20 per case. Due to the lager case size, the QTY
was reduced to 24 to account for equivalent usage. This resulted in an extended price of $2,070.00.

Bid Opening 6/6/2024 @ 2:30 PM| BR, VC

Invitations Sent 135

Total Vendors Requesting Documents 0

Total Bid Responses 2




	Sheet1 (2)

