
NO. ITEM PRICE 
DELIVERED

PICKUP PRICE 
BOLINGBROOK

PICKUP PRICE 
BARTLETT

PICKUP PRICE 
McCOOK

PRICE 
DELIVERED

PICKUP PRICE 
LINCOLNSHIRE

PICKUP PRICE 
LEMONT

1 CA-6 Crushed Stone  $ 21.28  $ 14.00  $ 14.00  NO BID  $ 26.00  NO BID  NO BID 

2 CA-7 Crushed Stone  $ 28.28  $ 21.00  $ 23.00  NO BID  $ 32.00  NO BID  NO BID 

3 FA-1 Sand  $ 35.92  NO BID  NO BID  $ 26.00  $ 33.50  NO BID  NO BID 

4 FA-5 Limestone Screenings  $ 15.50  NO BID  $ 9.25  NO BID  $ 21.00  NO BID  NO BID 

5 FA-6 Birdseye/Trench Backfill (Sand)  $ 18.28  $ 11.00  $ 11.00  NO BID 

5a FA-6  $ 24.50  NO BID  NO BID 

5b Birdseye  $ 32.00  NO BID  NO BID 

6 Stone Rip Rap-Class A1  $ 33.45  NO BID  $ 27.20  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

7 Stone Rip Rap-Class A3  $ 54.78  $ 46.00  $ 47.00  NO BID  $ 61.00  NO BID  NO BID 

8 Stone Rip Rap-Class A4  $ 58.50  NO BID  $ 50.00  NO BID  $ 62.50  NO BID  NO BID 

9 CS-01 4” Stone  $ 23.00  $ 18.55  $ 16.75  NO BID  $ 32.00  NO BID  NO BID 

10 CA-16 3/8” Chip Stone  $ 41.78  $ 34.50  NO BID  NO BID  $ 41.00  NO BID  NO BID 

11 Porous Granular Embankment (PGE)  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

12 Dumping of Asphalt Grinding  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

13 Dumping of Clean Concrete  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO CHARGE  $ 100.00 

14 Dumping of Broken Asphalt  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
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THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - COARSE FINE AGGREGATES & PORTLAND CONCRETE CEMENT 25-014-DOT
BID TABULATION


Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC Ozinga Ready Mix Concrete, Inc.
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1 Class Sl Concrete (4.6) Bag Mix  NO BID  $              222.50 

2 Class Sl Concrete Special (6.1) Bag Mix  NO BID  $              224.25 

3 High Early Mix (Class PP-1)  NO BID  $              242.00 

4 CLSM Mix #3  NO BID  $              200.00 

5 Calcium Chloride (1%)  NO BID  $ 4.50 

6 Calcium Chloride (2%)  NO BID  $ 9.00 

7 Retarder  NO BID  $ 4.25 

8 Super Plasticizer  NO BID  $ 9.00 

9 2'x2'x6' Concrete Blocks  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 100.00$  

10 2'x2'x6' Concrete Corner Blocks  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 85.00$  

11 2'x2'x3' Concrete Blocks  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 65.00$  

Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

SECTION B: PORTLAND CONCRETE CEMENT
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