



THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
TRASH CAN AND RECYCLING CAN LINERS 26-051-FM
BID TABULATION

				Central Poly-Bag Corp.		Warehouse Direct, Inc.		Interboro Packaging Corporation		The Standard Companies		North American Corporation of Illinois, LLC a BradyPLUS Company	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1a	Liner Size: 24" x 23" Thickness: 0.35 mil Color: Clear Case Count: 500 liners	CS	175	\$ 9.44	\$ 1,652.00	\$ 9.85	\$ 1,723.75	\$ 8.68	\$ 1,519.00	\$ 10.78	\$ 1,886.50		
1b	Case Count:_____liners	CS	87.5									\$ 19.55	\$ 1,710.63
2a	Liner Size: 24" x 33" Thickness: 0.35 mil Color: Gray Case Count: 500 liners	CS	50	\$ 12.66	\$ 633.00	\$ 9.80	\$ 490.00	\$ 11.74	\$ 587.00	\$ 10.71	\$ 535.50	NO BID	
2b	Case Count:_____liners	CS											
3a	Liner Size: 24" x 23" Thickness: 0.45 mil Color: Clear Case Count: 250 liners	CS	600	\$ 11.31	\$ 6,786.00			\$ 6.94	\$ 4,164.00			NO BID	
3b	Case Count: 500 liners	CS	300			\$ 12.39	\$ 3,717.00			\$ 13.53	\$ 4,059.00		
4a	Liner Size: 30" x 36" Thickness: 0.45 mil Color: Clear Case Count: 250 liners	CS	1,850	\$ 13.99	\$ 25,881.50	\$ 12.40	\$ 22,940.00	\$ 13.82	\$ 25,567.00	\$ 13.55	\$ 25,067.50	\$ 18.29	\$ 33,836.50
4b	Case Count:_____liners	CS											
5a	Liner Size: 30" x 36" Thickness: 0.50 mil Color: Clear Case Count: 250 liners	CS	300	\$ 14.80	\$ 4,440.00	NO BID		\$ 13.98	\$ 4,194.00	\$ 13.55	\$ 4,065.00	\$ 18.29	\$ 5,487.00
5b	Case Count:_____liners	CS											



				Central Poly-Bag Corp.		Warehouse Direct, Inc.		Interboro Packaging Corporation		The Standard Companies		North American Corporation of Illinois, LLC a BradyPLUS Company	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
6a	Liner Size: 30" x 36" Thickness: 0.50 mil Color: Gray Case Count: 250 liners	CS	125	\$ 14.91	\$ 1,863.75	\$ 11.81	\$ 1,476.25	\$ 12.34	\$ 1,542.50	\$ 12.90	\$ 1,612.50	NO BID	
6b	Case Count:_____liners	CS											
7a	Liner Size: 30" x 36" Thickness: 0.50 mil Color: Black Case Count: 250 liners	CS	25	\$ 14.91	\$ 372.75	\$ 12.40	\$ 310.00	\$ 13.24	\$ 331.00	\$ 13.55	\$ 338.75	\$ 14.46	\$ 361.50
7b	Case Count:_____liners	CS											
8a	Liner Size: 38" x 58" Thickness: 22 mic (high density) Color: Clear Case Count: 150 liners	CS	50	\$ 23.66	\$ 1,183.00	\$ 28.15	\$ 1,407.50	\$ 23.34	\$ 1,167.00	\$ 30.75	\$ 1,537.50	\$ 26.87	\$ 1,343.50
8b	Case Count:_____liners	CS											
9a	Liner Size: 40" x 46" Thickness: 1.10 mil Color: Clear Case Count: 250 liners	CS	1,620	\$ 38.45	\$ 62,289.00			\$ 44.32	\$ 71,798.40				
9b	Case Count: 125 liners	CS	3,240			\$ 21.45	\$ 69,498.00			\$ 23.43	\$ 75,913.20	\$ 35.05	\$ 113,562.00
10a	Liner Size: 40" x 46" Thickness: 1.10 mil Color: Gray Case Count: 250 liners	CS	250	\$ 33.60	\$ 8,400.00	\$ 45.16	\$ 11,290.00	\$ 43.18	\$ 10,795.00	\$ 49.32	\$ 12,330.00	\$ 23.71	\$ 5,927.50
10b	Case Count:_____liners	CS											



				Central Poly-Bag Corp.		Warehouse Direct, Inc.		Interboro Packaging Corporation		The Standard Companies		North American Corporation of Illinois, LLC a BradyPLUS Company	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
11a	Liner Size: 40" x 46" Thickness: 1.10 mil Color: Black Case Count: 250 liners	CS	175	\$ 33.70	\$ 5,897.50			\$ 40.24	\$ 7,042.00			\$ 18.43	\$ 3,225.25
11b	Case Count: 125 liners	CS	350			\$ 20.39	\$ 7,136.50			\$ 22.28	\$ 7,798.00		
12a	Liner Size: 40" x 46" Thickness: 3 mil Color: Black Case Count: 100 liners	CS	250	\$ 36.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 46.65	\$ 11,662.50	\$ 40.32	\$ 10,080.00	\$ 50.96	\$ 12,740.00	NO BID	
12b	Case Count: _____liners	CS											
GRAND TOTAL					\$ 128,398.50		\$ 131,651.50		\$ 138,786.90		\$ 147,883.45		\$ 165,453.88

NOTES													
1. Unipack Corp. has been deemed non-responsible.													
2. Warehouse Direct's Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:													
a. NO. 5a was deemed no bid due to unacceptable alternate.													
b. NO. 6a when mulitplied, (\$11.81 x 125 = \$1,476.25), resulted in a decrease of (\$1,476.25).													
c. GRAND TOTAL was corrected from \$136,837.25 to \$131,651.50													
c. North American Corporation of Illinois, LLC a BradyPLUS Company's Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:													
a. NO. 3a was deemed no bid due to unacceptable alternate.													
b. NO. 11a when mulitplied, (\$18.43 x 175 = \$3,225.25), resulted in a decrease of (\$4,837.88).													
c. GRAND TOTAL was corrected from \$173,644.25 to \$165,453.88													

Bid Opening 6/25/2025 @ 11:00 AM	DW, SR, BR
Invitations Sent	75
Total Vendors Requesting Documents	6
Total Bid Responses	6