## **SECTION 7 - BID FORM PRICING**

Bidder may attach additional sheets if further discounts will be given and/or explained. For example, if one manufacturer has multiple discounts for different categories, these can be attached on separate sheets.

All invoicing must be auditable and pricing list with discount reflected must accompany all invoices in order to process payment. This information will be cross referenced with the bid discount percentages submitted.

|     |  | PIPING, FITTING &                                | VALVE SUPPLIES            |                              |                |
|-----|--|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO, | MANUFACTURER/COMPANY                                   | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1   | ANVIL  | MAY 2018   | \$3,000.00                | - 70 %                       | \$ 900.00      |
| 2   | APOLLO   | 2020   | \$6,000.00                | - 20 %                       | \$ 4,800.00)   |
| 3   | BELL & GOSSETT   | Nov. 2019  | \$1,500.00                | -34 %                        | \$ 960.00      |
| 4   | BLACK SWAN   | MAY 2020   | \$500.00                  | -36 %                        | \$ 320.00      |
| 5   | BRAY   | NO BIS   | \$1,500.00                | 8 XX %                       | \$             |
| 6   | BRIDGIT: SOLDER  | 2021 NET SHEET                                   | \$500.00                  | +20 %                        | \$ 600.00      |
| 7   | CANFIELDS: SOLDER                                      | 2021 NET SHEET                                   | \$500.00                  | +20 %                        | \$ 600.00      |
| 8   | CHARLOTTE PIPE   | 2021 - JANUARY                                   | \$2,500.00                | - 50 %                       | \$ 1.250.00    |
| 9   | CLAY VALVE   | NET SHEET  | \$1,000.00                | +20 %                        | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 10  | COOPER B-LINE-STRUT &<br>HANGERS                       | 2021   | \$1,500.00                | -40 %                        | \$ 900.00      |
| 11  | CRESLINE   | NET SHEET  | \$1,000.00                | + 15%                        | \$ 1,150,00    |
| 12  | ELKHART  | 1/21   | \$3,000.00                | -60 %                        | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 13  | FERNCO   | 9/18   | \$3,000.00                | -60 %                        | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 14  | FLOWSAFE: SOLDER                                       | 2021 NETS#86T                                    | \$500.00                  | +20%                         | \$ 400.00      |
| 15  | GRINNELL   | 2021   | \$500.00                  | -bu %                        | \$ 200.00      |
| 16  | GEORGE FISHER  | 2021   | \$1,500.00                | -30 %                        | \$ 1050.00     |
| 17  | GUARDIAN: EYEWASH<br>STATION PARTS                     | 1/20   | \$1,500.00                | -/0 %                        | \$ 1,350.00    |
| 18  | HERCULES CHEMICAL<br>CO.MEGALOC PIPE THREAD<br>SEALANT | 12/20  | \$500.00                  | + 20 %                       | \$ 600.00      |
| 19  | IDEAL NO HUB BANDS                                     | 2021   | \$2,000.00                | -50 %                        | \$ 1,000.00    |
| 20  | JR SMITH   | 2/2/   | \$2,000.00                | -41) %                       | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 21  | JW HARRIS  | 2/2/   | \$600.00                  | +20%                         | \$ 720.00      |
| 22  | KENNEDY  | NO BID   | 1,500.00                  | %                            | \$             |
| 23  | LACO   | 2020   | \$500.00                  | -20%                         | \$ 400.00      |
| 24  | MIFAB  | 1/2020   | \$1,000.00                | -40 %                        | \$ 600,00      |
| 25  | MUELLER INDUSTRIES                                     | 2/21   | \$4,000.00                | -40 %                        | \$ 2,400.00    |
| 26  | NIBCO  | 3/20   | \$4,000.00                | -36 %                        | \$ 2,580.00    |
| 27  | OATEY  | 12/31/20   | \$500.00                  | +20 %                        | \$ 600,00      |
| 28  | ORION  | 1/21   | \$1,000.00                | -15 %                        | \$ 850.00      |
| 29  | PRO FLO  | NO BID   | \$2,000.00                | %                            | \$             |
| 30  | RECTORSEAL   | 1/21   | \$500.00                  | - 20 %                       | \$ 400.00      |
| 31  | RED & WHITE VALVES                                     | 2021   | \$1,000.00                | -20%                         | \$ 800.00      |
| 32  | SIOUX CHIEF<br>MANUFACTURING                           | 1/2/   | \$500.00                  | - 20 %                       | \$ 400.00      |
| 33  | SPEARS   | 1/21   | \$1,500.00                | -40 %                        | \$ 900.00      |

| 34 | TA CHEN         | NO BID | \$2,000.00          | %              | \$              |
|----|-----------------|--------|---------------------|----------------|-----------------|
| 35 | TYLER PIPE      | 1/21   | \$4,000.00          | -57 %          | \$<br>2,000.00  |
| 36 | VICTAVLIC       | 1/2/   | \$1,000.00          | -10%           | \$<br>900.00    |
| 37 | VIEGA           | 6/20   | \$5,000.00          | -40%           | \$<br>3,000,00  |
| 38 | WADE            | 1/21   | \$1,000.00          | -Y0%           | \$<br>600.00    |
| 39 | WATTS           | 1/2/   | \$3,000.00          | -36 %          | \$<br>1,920,00  |
| 40 | WOLVERINE BRASS | NO BID | \$2,000.00          | %              | \$              |
| 41 | WOODFORD        | 2/20   | \$1,500.00          | -20%           | \$<br>1,200.00  |
| 42 | ZURN            | 1/2/   | \$800.00            | -40 %          | \$<br>480,00    |
|    |                 | PIPING | , FITTING & VALVE S | SUPPLIES TOTAL | \$<br>41,810,00 |

|     |                               |  | IR PARTS & TOOLS          | Ť                            |                |
|-----|-------------------------------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO. | MANUFACTURER/COMPANY          | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1   | ACORN FIXTURES                | 1/21   | \$3,000.00                | +20 %                        | \$ 3,600.00    |
| 2   | ACORN PARTS                   | 1/21   | \$4,500.00                | +20 %                        | \$ 5,400.00    |
| 3   | AMERICAN SPECIALTIES FIXTURES | 1/2/   | \$250.00                  | -10 %                        | \$ 225,00      |
| 4   | AMERICAN SPECIALTIES PARTS    | 1/21   | \$250.00                  | -10 %                        | \$ 225.00      |
| 5   | AMERICAN STANDARD FIXTURES    | 1/21   | \$2,000.00                | -36 %                        | \$ 1,28000     |
| 6   | AMERICAN STANDARD PARTS       | 1/21   | \$2,000.00                | -36 %                        | \$ 1,280.00    |
| 7   | APOLLO PARTS                  | 2020   | \$6,000.00                | -20%                         | \$ 4.800.00    |
| 8   | BEMIS FIXTURES                | 3/21   | \$500.00                  | -32 %                        | \$ 340.00      |
| 9   | BEMIS PARTS                   | 3/21   | \$500.00                  | -32%                         | \$ 340.00      |
| 10  | BRADLEY FIXTURES              | 2/19   | \$500.00                  | +20%                         | \$ 600,00      |
| 11  | BRADLEY PARTS                 | 2/19   | \$500.00                  | +20%                         | \$ 600,00      |
| 12  | BRASS CRAFT PARTS             | 2/20   | \$3,000.00                | -50 %                        | \$ 1,500,00    |
| 13  | CHICAGO FAUCET FIXTURES       | 12/20  | \$2,000.00                | -40 %                        | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 14  | CHICAGO FAUCET PARTS          | 12/20  | \$2,000.00                | -YO %                        | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 15  | CRANE FIXTURES                | 1/20   | \$500.00                  | -/0 %                        | \$ 450.00      |
| 16  | CRANE PARTS                   | 1/20   | \$500.00                  | -10 %                        | \$ 450.00      |
| 17  | ELJER FIXTURES                | 1/20   | \$1,000.00                | -20 %                        | \$ 800.00      |
| 18  | ELJER PARTS                   | 1/20   | \$1,000.00                | -20 %                        | \$ 800.00      |
| 19  | ELKHART PARTS                 | 1/21   | \$1,000.00                | -70 %                        | \$ 600.00      |
| 20  | ELKAY FIXTURES                | 8/19   | \$1,000.00                | ~36 %                        | \$ 640.00      |
| 21  | ELKAY PARTS                   | 8/19   | \$1,000.00                | -36 %                        | \$ 640.00      |
| 22  | GERBER PARTS                  | 5/20   | \$1,000.00                | - 36 %                       | \$ 64000       |
| 23  | GERBER FIXTURES               | 5720   | \$1,000.00                | - 34. %                      | \$ 640,00      |
| 24  | HARVEY PARTS                  | 12/20  | \$1,000.00                | +20 %                        | \$ 1,200-00    |
| 25  | HAWS FIXTURES                 | 1/21   | \$500.00                  | -10 %                        | \$ 450.00      |
| 26  | HAWS PARTS                    | 1/21   | \$500.00                  | ~/0 %                        | \$ 450.00      |
| 27  | JOSAM FIXTURES                | 1/2/   | \$500.00                  | -6D %                        | \$ 200.00      |
| 28  | JOSAM PARTS                   | 1/21   | \$500.00                  | -25 %                        | \$ 375.00      |
| 29  | KOHLER FIXTURES               | 3/20   | \$750.00                  | -25 %                        | \$ 162.00      |
| 30  | KOHLER PARTS                  | 3/20   | \$750.00                  | -25%                         | \$ 162.50      |
| 31  | LEONARD PARTS                 | 2/20   | \$1,000_00                | -15%                         | \$ 800.00      |
| 32  | METCRAFT FIXTURES             | 2020   | \$1,000.00                | +20 %                        | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 33  | METCRAFT PARTS                | 2020   | \$1,000.00                | +20%                         | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 34  | MOEN FIXTURES                 | 2/21   | \$2,000.00                | -36 %                        | \$ 1,280.00    |
| 35  | MOEN PARTS                    | 2/21   | \$2,000.00                | -36 %                        | \$ 1,280.00    |
| 36  | OASIS FIXTURES                | 1/2/   | \$750.00                  | -20 %                        | \$ 600.00      |
| 37  | OASIS PARTS                   | 1/21   | \$750.00                  | -20%                         | \$ 600,00      |
| 38  | POWERS FIXTURES               | 1/21   | \$1,500.00                | -15 %                        | \$ 1275.00     |
| 39  | POWERS PARTS                  | 1/2/   | \$1,500.00                | -15 %                        | \$ PM 127 1,27 |
| 40  | PRO FLO PARTS                 | NO BID   | \$2,000.00                | %                            | \$             |
| 41  | RICHARDS SPECIALTY TOOLS      | 5/20   | \$750.00                  | -35%                         | \$ 487.50      |
| 42  | RIDGID TOOLS                  | 12/19  | \$2,000.00                | -10%                         | \$ 1,800.00    |

| 43 | SLOAN FIXTURES      | 9/20            | \$5,000.00  | -42 %  | \$<br>2,900.00 |
|----|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|--------|----------------|
| 44 | SLOAN PARTS         | 9/20            | \$5,000.00  | -42%   | \$<br>2,900.00 |
| 45 | SPEAKMAN FIXTURES   | 1/21            | \$500.00    | -10 %  | \$<br>400.00   |
| 46 | SPEAKMAN PARTS      | 1/21            | \$500.00    | -10 %  | \$<br>450.00   |
| 47 | SYMMONS FIXTURES    | 3/20            | \$500.00    | -20%   | \$<br>400,00   |
| 48 | SYMMONS PARTS       | 3/20            | \$500.00    | -20%   | \$<br>400.00   |
| 49 | T & S FIXTURES      | 7/19            | \$1,500.00  | -40 %  | \$<br>900.00   |
| 50 | T & S PARTS         | 7/19            | \$1,500.00  | -40 %  | \$<br>900-00   |
| 51 | VIEGA               | 6/20            | \$10,000.00 | -40 %  | \$<br>6,000.00 |
| 52 | WATTS               | 1/21            | \$4,000.00  | -36 %  | \$<br>2,580.00 |
| 53 | WILLOUGHBY FIXTURES | 1/2/            | \$6,000.00  | + 20 % | \$<br>7,200.00 |
| 54 | WILLOUGHBY PARTS    | 1/2             | \$6,000.00  | +20 %  | \$<br>7,200,00 |
| 55 | ZURN FIXTURES       | 1/21            | \$1,000.00  | -36%   | \$<br>740,00   |
| 56 | ZURN PARTS          | 1/21            | \$1,000.00  | -36 %  | \$<br>740.00   |
|    |                     | \$<br>77,637,50 |             |        |                |

|     |                           | RPZ REPAIR PA                                    | ARTS & GREASE             |                              |                |
|-----|---------------------------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO. | MANUFACTURER/COMPANY      | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1   | AMES (RPZ PARTS)          | 1/21   | \$3,500.00                | -35 %                        | \$ 2275.00     |
| 2   | AQUA FLOW LUBRICANT (RPZ) | NO BIO   | \$500.00                  | %                            | \$             |
| 3   | FEBCO (RPZ PARTS)         | 1/2/   | \$3,000.00                | -31 %                        | \$ 1,950.00    |
| 4   | WATTS (RPZ PARTS)         | 1/21   | \$5,000.00                | -35%                         | \$ 3,250-(2)   |
| 5   | ZURN/WILKINS (RPZ PARTS)  | 2/2/   | \$2,500.00                | -25%                         | \$ 1,875,00    |
|     |                           | F  | RPZ REPAIR PARTS &        | GREASE TOTAL                 | \$ 9,350,00    |

| NO_ | MANUFACTURER/COMPANY                 | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
|-----|--------------------------------------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| 1   | A.O. SMITH                           | 2/21   | \$1,000.00                | -10 %                        | \$ 900,00      |
| 2   | BELL & GOSSETT:<br>CIRCULATING PUMPS | 2/19   | \$1,500.00                | -36 %                        | \$ 960.00      |
| 3   | BRADFORD WHITE                       | 2/21   | \$1,000.00                | -10 %                        | \$ 900.00      |
| 4   | HYDROMATIC PUMP                      | NO BID   | \$8,000.00                | %                            | \$             |
| 5   | RHEEM                                | 2/21   | \$1,000.00                | -/0 %                        | \$ 900.00      |
| 6   | ZOLLER PUMP                          | 1/2/   | \$3,000.00                | -40 %                        | \$ 1,800.00    |
|     |                                      | REPLACEME  | NT PUMPS & WATER          | HEATERS TOTAL                | \$ 5,460.00    |

|                              |   |           | COPPER P   | IPE & FITTINGS            |                              |                |
|------------------------------|---|-----------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO.                          | DES   | SCRIPTION | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1                            | TYPE K<br>HARD &<br>SOFT                    | PIPE      | 12/20  | \$1,000.00                | -JD %                        | \$ 50000       |
| 2                            | TYPE K<br>HARD &<br>SOFT                    | FITTINGS  | 2/2/   | \$1,000.00                | -70 %                        | \$ 300,00      |
| 3                            | TYPE L<br>HARD &<br>SOFT                    | PIPE      | 12/20  | \$4,000.00                | % CL-                        | \$ 2,000.00    |
| 4                            | TYPE L<br>HARD &<br>SOFT                    | FITTINGS  | 2/21   | \$4,000.00                | -70%                         | \$ 1,200.00    |
| 5                            | TYPE M<br>HARD &<br>SOFT                    | PIPE      | 12/20  | \$250.00                  | - m %                        | \$ 125.00      |
| 6                            | TYPE M<br>HARD &<br>SOFT                    | FITTINGS  | 2/21   | \$250.00                  | -70%                         | \$ 75.00       |
| 7                            | VIEGA PRO<br>PRESS -<br>LARGER<br>SIZES XLC | FITTINGS  | 6/20   | \$6,000.00                | -40 %                        | \$ 3,600.00    |
| COPPER PIPE & FITTINGS TOTAL |   |           |  |                           |                              | \$ 7,800.00    |

|    |                |          | PVC PIP  | E & FITTINGS              |                              |                |
|----|----------------|----------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO | DES            | CRIPTION | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1  | SCHEDULE<br>40 | PIPE     | 1/20   | \$500.00                  | -60 %                        | \$ 200-00      |
| 2  | SCHEDULE<br>40 | FITTINGS | 1/20   | \$500.00                  | -70 %                        | \$ /50.00      |
| 3  | SCHEDULE<br>80 | PIPE     | 1/20   | \$1,250.00                | -50 %                        | \$ 625.00      |
| 4  | SCHEDULE<br>80 | FITTINGS | 1/20   | \$1,250.00                | -70 %                        | \$ 375.00      |
|    |                |          |  | PVC PIPE 8                | R FITTINGS TOTAL             | 1,35000        |

|     |                 | CA   | AST IRON                  |                              |                |
|-----|-----------------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO. | DESCRIPTION     | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1   | NO HUB PIPE     | 1/2/   | \$1,500.00                | -50 %                        | \$ 750.00      |
| 2   | NO HUB FITTINGS | 1/21   | \$1,500.00                | -50 %                        | \$ 750.00      |
|     |                 |  | (                         | CAST IRON TOTAL              | \$ 1,500.00    |

|     |                |          | BLACK IRC  | N PIPE & FITTINGS         |                              |                |
|-----|----------------|----------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO. | DES            | CRIPTION | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1   | SCHEDULE<br>40 | PIPE     | 2/2/   | \$500.00                  | -60 %                        | \$ 200.00      |
| 2   | SCHEDULE<br>40 | FITTINGS | 2/21   | \$500.00                  | -60 %                        | \$ 200.00      |
| 3   | SCHEDULE<br>80 | PIPE     | 2/21   | \$1,500.00                | -50 %                        | \$ 75D.cd      |
| 4   | SCHEDULE<br>80 | FITTINGS | 2/2/   | \$1,500.00                | -60 %                        | \$ 600,00      |
|     |                |          |  | BLACK IRON PIPE 8         | & FITTINGS TOTAL             | \$ 1,750,00    |

|     |             |  | BRASS                     |                              |                |
|-----|-------------|--|---------------------------|------------------------------|----------------|
| NO. | DESCRIPTION | DATE AND/OR<br>TITLE OF<br>APPLICABLE<br>CATALOG | ESTIMATED<br>DOLLAR USAGE | % OF<br>ADJUSTMENT<br>(-, +) | EXTENDED PRICE |
| 1   | PIPE        | 2/21   | \$500.00                  | -10 %                        | \$ 450.00      |
| 2   | NIPPLES     | 2/21   | \$2,500.00                | -80 %                        | \$ 500.00      |
| 3   | FITTINGS    | 2/21   | \$1,500.00                | -60 %                        | \$ 600.00      |
|     |             |  |                           | BRASS TOTAL                  | \$ 1550.00     |

| TOTAL BID PRICING                       |                  |
|---|------------------|
| PIPING, FITTING & VALVE SUPPLIES TOTAL  | \$<br>41,810.00  |
| FIXTURES & REPAIR PARTS & TOOLS TOTAL   | \$<br>77,637,50  |
| RPZ REPAIR PARTS & GREASE TOTAL         | \$<br>9,350.00   |
| REPLACEMENT PUMPS & WATER HEATERS TOTAL | \$<br>5,460,00   |
| COPPER PIPE & FITTINGS TOTAL            | \$<br>7,800.00   |
| PVC PIPE & FITTINGS TOTAL               | \$<br>1,350.00   |
| CAST IRON TOTAL                         | \$<br>1,500.00   |
| BLACK IRON PIPE & FITTINGS TOTAL        | \$<br>1,750.00   |
| BRASS TOTAL                             | \$<br>1,550.00   |
| GRAND TOTAL                             | \$<br>148,207.50 |

## **SECTION 8 - BID FORM SIGNATURE PAGE**

The Contractor agrees to provide the service, and/or supplies as described in this solicitation and subject, without limitation, to all specifications, terms, and conditions herein contained.

I acknowledge the receipt of the following addenda.

Addenda No. \_\_\_, \_\_\_, and \_\_\_ issued thereto.

Signature on File

(Signature and Title)

CORPORATE SEAL (If available)

BID MUST BE SIGNED AND NOTARIZED (WITH SEAL) FOR CONSIDERATION

| Subscribed and sworn to before me this | day of                 | AD, 20 |
|--|------------------------|--------|
| (Notary Public)                        | My Commission Expires: |        |
|  | SEAL                   |        |

## **SECTION 9 - MANDATORY FORM** PLUMBING SUPPLIES AND TOOLS

(PLEASE TYPE OR PRINT THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION)

Full Name of Bidder

(Secretary or Partner)

|   | Full Name of Bidder       | RUGAE PIFE & SUPPLET CO  |                  |                           |                              |  |
|---|---------------------------|--|------------------|---------------------------|------------------------------|--|
|   | Main Business Address     |  |                  |                           |                              |  |
|   | City, State, Zip Code     |  |                  |                           |                              |  |
|   | Telephone Number          | 708-345-2070   | Email<br>Address | ROYALSUAPLY WAOL. COM     |                              |  |
|   | Bid Contact Person        | LARRY GREENSPON  |                  |                           |                              |  |
|   | the Owner/Sole Proprietor | a Member authorized to sign on behalf of the Partnership and that the members of the | C                | Officer of the Corpor     | a Member of the Join Venture |  |
|   |                           | TO VA  | raithership (    | of Officers of the Corpor | ation are as follows.        |  |
|   | ARRY GREENS               |  | 3                | (Vice Pres                | ident or Dortner)            |  |
|   | (President or Par         |  |                  | (Vice-Pres                | sident or Partner)           |  |
| 1 | ARRY GREENS               | PON  |                  |                           |                              |  |

Further, the undersigned declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid as principals are those named herein; that this bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation; that he has fully examined the proposed forms of agreement and the contract specifications for the above designated purchase, all of which are on file in the office of the Procurement Officer, DuPage County, 421 North County Farm Road, Wheaton, Illinois 60187, and all other documents referred to or mentioned in the contract documents, specifications and attached exhibits.

(Treasurer or Partner)

Further, the undersigned proposes and agrees, if this bid is accepted, to provide all necessary machinery, tools, apparatus, and other means of construction, including transportation services necessary to furnish all the materials and equipment specified or referred to in the contract documents in the manner and time therein prescribed.

Further, the undersigned certifies and warrants that he is duly authorized to execute this certification/affidavit on behalf of the Bidder and in accordance with the Partnership Agreement or by-laws of the Corporation, and the laws of the State of Illinois and that this Certification is binding upon the Bidder and is true and accurate.

Further, the undersigned certifies that the Bidder is not barred from bidding on this contract as a result of a violation of either 720 Illinois Compiled Statutes 5/33 E-3 or 5/33 E-4, bid rigging or bid-rotating, or as a result of a violation of 820 ILCS 130/1 et seq., the Illinois Prevailing Wage Act.

The undersigned certifies that he has examined and carefully prepared this bid and has checked the same in detail before submitting this bid, and that the statements contained herein are true and correct.

If a Corporation, the undersigned, further certifies that the recitals and resolutions attached hereto and made a part hereof were properly adopted by the Board of Directors of the Corporation at a meeting of said Board of Directors duly called and held and have not been repealed nor modified, and that the same remain in full force and effect. (Bidder may be requested to provide a copy of the corporate resolution granting the individual executing the contract documents authority to do so.)

Further, the Bidder certifies that he has provided equipment, supplies, or services comparable to the items specified in this contract to the parties listed in the reference section below and authorizes the County to verify references of business and credit at its option.