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THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

RENTAL OF MEDICAL EQUIPMENT - BEDS 2O-14Z-CARE
BID TABULATION

ADVACARE SYSTEMS

Extended Price

$ 3,600.00

$ 3,240.00

$ 3,240.00

$ eoo.oo

$ 2,400.00

$ 900.00

$ 300.00

$ 1,200.00

$ 450.00

$ 900.00

$ 3,600.00

Monthly
Rental Rate

$ 120.00

$ 180.00

$ 180.00

$ 60.00

$ 240.00

$ 30.00

$ 30.00

$ 60.00

$ 30.00

$ 60-00

$ 240-00

Daily
Rental
Rate

$ 4.00

$ 6.00

$ 6.00

$ 2.00

$ 8.00

$ 1.oo

$ 1.00

$ 2.00

$ 1.00

$ 2.00

$ 8.00

atv
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Monthly
Rent-to-

Own Rate

$ 127.72

$ 153.72

$ 154.55

$ 4s.50

$ 260.48

$ 7.29

$ 9.89

$ 25.83

No Bid

$ s.el

$ 169.55

Purchase
Price

$ 1,s32.70

$ 1,844.70

$ 1,974.70

$ 546.00

$ 3,12s.00

$ 87.s0

$ 1 18.75

$ 310.00

No Bid

$ 119.00

$ 1,695.00

Item

Mattress 500 lb.Capacity

Mattress 600 lb.Capacity

Mattress 1000 lb.Capacity

Mattress 400 lb. Capacity

Bed frame 800 lb. Capacity

Safety Bolster Overlay 36"

Safety Bolster Overlay 48"

Floorbed High Safety Mat

Floor Bed Assist Rails

Foam Mattress 36" x 80"

Floor Bed 330 lb. Gapacity

No

1

2

3

4

5

b

7

8

o

10

11

INTEGRA HEALTH EQUIPMENT

Extended Prica

$ 3,82s.00

$ 5,400.0c

$ 6,480.0C

$ 2,475.AC

$ 4,500.0c

$ 450.0c

$ 300.0c

$ 1,200.0c

$ 225.0C

$ 450.0c

$ 4,050.00

Monthly
Rental Rate

$ 127.5A

$ 300.00

$ 360.00

$ 165.00

$ 450.00

$ 15.00

$ 30.00

$ 60.00

$ 15.00

$ 30.00

$ 270.00

Daily
Rental
Rate

$ 4-25

$ 10.00

$ 12.00

$ 5.50

$ 15.00

$ 0.50

$ 1.00

$ 2.00

$ 0.50

$ 1.00

$ 9.00

otv
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Monthly
Rent-to-Own

Rate

$ 65-00

$ 225.00

$ 270.00

$ 85.00

$ 3s5.00

$ 1 1.00

$ 15.00

$ 30.00

$ 9.00

$ 15.00

s 218.00

Purchase
Price

$ 650.00

$ 2,24A.00

$ 2,685.00

$ 825.00

$ 3,552-00

$ 115.00

$ 145.00

$ 295.00

$ 86.00

$ 1s0.00

$ 2,175.00

rOTAL $

X 12 months = GRAND TOTAL $

20,730.00

248,760.00

TOTAL $

X 12 months = GRAND TOTAL $

29,355.0C

352,260.00

TOTAL $

X 12 months = GRAND TOTAL $
37,395.00

448,740.0O

TOTAL $

X 12 months = GRAND TOTAL $

66,712.8C

800,553.60

FITZSIMMONS HOSPITAL SERVICES

Extended Price

$ 8,100.00

$ 5,670.00

$ 8,100.00

$ 4.050-00

$ 5,400.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 900.00

$ 225.40

$ 1,350.00

$ 3.600.00

Monthly
Rental Rate

$ 270.00

$ 315.00

$ 450.00

$ 270.00

$ 540.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 45.00

$ 15.00

$ 90.00

$ 240.00

Daily
Rental
Rate

$ 9.00

$ 10.50

$ 15.00

$ s.00

$ 18.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1.50

$ 0.50

$ 3.00

$ 8.00

otv
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Monthly
Rent-to-

Own Rate

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Purchase
Price

$ 1,883.25

$2,228.25

$ 2,632.50

$ 1,883.25

$ 3,555.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 300.00

No Bid

$ 404.00

$2.292.AA

Item

Mattress 500 lb.Capacity

Mattress 600 lb.Capacity

Mattress 1000 lb.Capacity

Mattress 400 lb. Capacitv

Bed frame 800 lb. Capacitv

Safetv Bolster Overlav 36"

Safetv Bolster Overlav 48"

Floorbed Hiqh Safetv Mat

Floor Bed Assist Rails

Foam Mattress 36" x 80"

Floor Bed 330 lb. Capacitv

No

I

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

o

10

11

SIZEWISE

Extended Price

$ 10,422.0C

$ 7,295.40

$ 7,295.40

s 4.072.50

$ 2A.262.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2,169.00

$ '15,196.5C

Monthly
Rental Rate

$ 347.40

$ 405.30

$ 405.30

$ 271.50

$ 2,026.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 144.60

$ 1,013.10

Daily
Rental
Rate

$ 1 1.58

$ 13.51

$ 13.51

$ 9.05

$ 67.54

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 4.82

$ 33.77
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Monthly
Rent-to-Own

Rate

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Purchase
Price

$ 2,980.40

$ 3,613.57

$ 3,613.57

$ 858.39

$ 7.366.43

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 447.74

$ 6.461.91



AGILITI

Extended Price

$ 13.257.00

$ 11.032.20

$ 11,032.20

$ 5,346.00

$ 12,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 570.00

No Bid

$ 855.00

$ 13,500.00

Monthly
Rental Rate

$ 44'1.90

$ 612.90

$ 612.90

$ 356.40

$ 1,200.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 28.50

No Bid

$ s7.00

$ 900.00

Daily
Rental
Rate

s14.73

$ 20.43

$ 20.43

$ 1 1.88

$40.00
No Bid

No Bid

$ o.e5

No Bid

$ 1.90

$ 30.00
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Monthly
Rent-to-

Own Rate

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Purchase
Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Item

Mattress 500 lb.Capacitv

Mattress 600 lb.Capacity

Mattress 1000 lb.Capacity

Mattress 400 lb. Capacitv

Bed frame 800 lb. Capacity

Safety Bolster Overlay 36"

Safety Bolster Overlay 48"

Floorbed Hiqh Safety Mat

Floor Bed Assist Rails

Foam Mattress 36" x 80"

Floor Bed 330 lb. Capacity

No

1

2
a

4

5

6

7

I
I

10

11

CUSTOM MEDICAL SOLUTIONS

Extended Price

$ 13.500.00

$ 7.830.00

$ 15,120.00

$ 5,850.00

$ 22,500-00

$ 5,400.00

$ 2,400.00

$ 3,000.00

$ 1,800.00

$ 2,250-00

$ 6,750.00

Monthly
Rental Rate

$ 450.00

$ 435.00

$ 840.00

$ 390.00

$ 2,250.00

$ 180.00

$ 240.00

$ 150.00

$ 120.00

$ 150.00

$ 450.00

Daily
Rental
Rate

$ 1s.00

$ 14.50

$ 28.00

$ 13.00

$ 75.00

$ 6.00

$ 8.00

$ 5.00

$ 4.00

$ 5.00

$ 15.00
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Monthly
Rent-to-Own

Rate

s 357.09

$ 338.76

$ 427.50

$ 261.98

$ 1,B63.44

$ 38.36

$ 71.25

$ 41.11

$ 27.40

$ 23.57

$ 240.60

Purchase
Price

$ 3.895.00

$ 3.695.00

$ 3,900.00

$ 2,390.00

$ 17,000.00

$ 350.00

$ 650.00

$ 375.00

$ 250.00

$ 215-00

$ 2,195.00

TOTAL $

X 12 months = GRAND TOTAL $

67,592.40

81 1 ,108.80

TOTAL $

X 12 months = GRAND TOTAL $ 1

86,400-00

800.00

TOTAL $ 87,294.00

X 12 months = GRAND TOTAL $ 1,047,528.00

TOTAL $ 89,419-20

X 12 months $ 1,073,030.40

MOBILITY CITY OF DUPAGE COUNTY

Extended Price

$ 17,100.00

$ 16,740.00

$ 17,820.00

$ 4,950.00

$ 11,100.00

$ 1,350.00

$ 540.00

$ 1,620.00

$ 414.00

$ 1,260.00

$ '14,400.00

Monthly
Rental Rate

$ 570.00

$ 930.00

$ 990.00

$ 330.00

$ 1,110.00

$ 45.00

$ 54.00

$ 81.00

$ 27.60

$ 84.00

$ 960.00

Daily
Rental
Rate

$ 19.00

$ 31.00

$ 33.00

$ 11.00

$ 37.00

$ 1.50

$ 1.80

$ 2.70

$ 0.92

$ 2.80

$ 32.00

otv
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Monthly
Rent-to-

Own Rate

$ 686.00

$ 1,094.00

$ 1,178.00

$ 379.00

$ 1,279.00

$ 52.00

$ 64.00

$ 94.00

$ 32.00

$ 98.00

$ 1,128.00

Purchase
Price

$ 4,'l I 3.00

$ 6,563.00

$ 7,070.00

$2,275.00

$ 7,676.00

$ 31s.00

$ 385.00

$ 560.00

$ 192.00

$ 588.00

$ 6,769.00

Item

Mattress 500 lb.Capacitv

Mattress 600 lb.Capacity

Mattress 1000 lb.Capacitv

Mattress 400 lb. Capacity

Bed frame 800 lb. Capacity

Safety Bolster Overlay 36"

Safety Bolster Overlay 48"

Floorbed High Safety Mat

Floor Bed Assist Rails

Foam Mattress 36" x 80"

Floor Bed 330 lb. Capacity

No

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

Extended Price

$ 20,052.00

$ 12,A31.2O

$ 17,280.00

$ 8,136.00

$ 22,470.OA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 4,500.00

$ 4,950.00

Monthly Ren

$ 668.40

$ 668.40

$ 960.00

$ 542.40

$ 2,247.AA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 300.00

330

Daily Ren

$ 22.28

$ 22.28

$ 32.00

$ 18.08

$ 74.90

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 10.00

11

Oty
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15
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15

Monthlv Rer

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ARJO

Purchase Pri

$ 4,334.06

$ 4,334.06

$ 10,877.28

$ 3,830.17

$ 21,456.28

No Bid

No Bid

$ 680.00

No Bid

$ 800.00

1442.29



NOTES
1. For Agiliti, conections were made to Extended Prices for ltems 1,2,3 and 4. The Total was corrected from $67,580.25 to $67,592.40.

For Custom Medical Solutions, corrections were made to Extended Prices for lterns 2-5 and 7-11- The Total was conected from
$67,580.25 to $67,592.40.

For Mobility City of DuPage, a conections was made to the EXended Prices for ltems 7. The Total was corrected from $87,424 to $87,294

lnvitations I
5
8

rl Vendors Requesting Documents
Total Bid Responses


