
NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

1 12 Gauge 1-3/4” X 1-3/4” X 8’ Length EA 1  $ 33.00  $ 33.00  $ 37.44  $ 37.44 

2 12 Gauge 1-3/4” X 1-3/4” X 10’ Length EA 1000  $ 40.10  $            40,100.00  $ 41.60  $            41,600.00 

3 12 Gauge 1-3/4” X 1-3/4” X 11’ Length EA 1  $ 45.00  $ 45.00  $ 48.76  $ 48.76 

4 12 Gauge 2” X 2”, 3’ 6” X 42” Length EA 1000  $ 20.70  $            20,700.00  $ 17.02  $            17,020.00 

5 12 Gauge 2” X 2” X 6’ Length EA 500 35.50$   $            17,750.00  $ 28.96  $            14,480.00 

6 Signpost Cap for 1-3/4” X 1-3/4” Square Post for 
Flat Blade12” Length (Part #514TCG134) EA 250  $ 10.40  $ 2,600.00  $ 5.00  $              1,250.00 

7 Break Away Coupler – 1-3/4” Square Posts
(#BOS 13414) EA 1  $ 390.00  $ 390.00  $ 150.00  $ 150.00 

8 Fasteners – Steel Drive Rivet EA 1500  $ 0.97  $ 1,455.00  $ 0.52  $ 780.00 

9 Unistrut Stabilization Anchor Sleeve EA 1  $ 67.00  $ 67.00  $ 95.00  $ 95.00 

83,140.00$             75,461.20$             

1 SIGNPOST REFLECTORS: RED PANELS EA 250  $ 40.00  $            10,000.00 

2 SIGNPOST REFLECTORS: YELLOW PANELS EA 250  $ 40.00  $            10,000.00 

3 SIGNPOST RELFECTORS: FLOURESCENT 
YELLOW GREEN PANNELS EA 25  $ 40.00  $              1,000.00 

4 LDS-FY341.5 3M Linear Delineation Panels 34” x 
1.5”, Yellow, 50/carton EA 1  $ 440.25  $ 440.25  $ 250.00  $ 250.00 

5 LDS-W341.5 3M Linear Delineation Panels 34” x 
1.5”, White, 50/carton EA 1  $ 440.25  $ 440.25  $ 250.00  $ 250.00 

880.50$  21,500.00$             

  

SECTION 2 TOTAL: 

SECTION 1 TOTAL: 
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LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

SECTION 1: SIGNPOSTS AND MATERIALS

NO BID

SECTION 2: SIGNPOST REFLECTORS & LINEAR DELINEATION PANELS

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE 
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT 
SIGN SHOP SUPPLIES 23-058-DOT 
BID TABULATION

NO BID NO BID



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

1 Scotch lite Electro-Cut (EC) Film Series 1170 Sq Ft 1  $                     1.10  $                     1.10  $                     1.15  $                     1.15 

2 Scotch Cal Series 7725 Vinyl BLK&WHT  Sq Ft 1  $                     1.30  $                     1.30  $                     1.51  $                     1.51 

3 48” width, 12 years warranted, Acrylic (50-yard 
rolls) ROLL 12  $                 912.00  $            10,944.00  $                 690.00  $              8,280.00 

4 36” width, 12 years warranted, Acrylic (50-yard 
rolls) ROLL 12  $                 684.00  $              8,208.00  $                 517.50  $              6,210.00 

5 36” width, 12 years warranted, Vinyl Black & White ROLL 4  $                 588.80  $              2,355.20  $                 679.50  $              2,718.00 

6 Scotch Lite Protective Overlay Film Series 1160 Sq Ft 1  $                     1.64  $                     1.64  $                     1.86  $                     1.86 

7 36” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $                 738.00  $              2,952.00  $                 837.00  $              3,348.00 

8 48” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $                 984.00  $              3,936.00  $              1,116.00  $              4,464.00 

9
Scotch Lite Diamond Grade – DG3 Reflective 
Sheeting Series 4090 (Type ZZ) Pressure 
Sensitive ASTM (Type 11)

Sq Ft 1  $                     2.68  $                     2.68  $                     2.80  $                     2.80 

10 6” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 201.00  $                 201.00  $                 210.00  $                 210.00 

11 9” x 50 yards ROLL 6  $                 301.50  $              1,809.00  $                 315.00  $              1,890.00 

12 12” x 50 yards ROLL 12  $                 402.00  $              4,824.00  $                 420.00  $              5,040.00 

13 18” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 603.00  $                 603.00  $                 630.00  $                 630.00 

14 24” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $                 804.00  $              3,216.00  $                 840.00  $              3,360.00 

15 30” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,005.00  $              1,005.00  $              1,050.00  $              1,050.00 

16 36” x 50 yards ROLL 6  $              1,206.00  $              7,236.00  $              1,260.00  $              7,560.00 

17 48” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $              1,608.00  $              6,432.00  $              1,680.00  $              6,720.00 

18
Scotch Lite Diamond Grade – DG3 Fluorescent 
Reflective Sheeting YELLOW GREEN Series 4083 
(Type ZZ)

Sq Ft 1  $                 268.00  $                 268.00  $                     2.80  $                     2.80 

19 12” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 402.00  $                 402.00  $                 420.00  $                 420.00 

20 24” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 804.00  $                 804.00  $                 840.00  $                 840.00 
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SECTION 3: REFLECTIVE SHEETING ROLLED GOODS



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

21 30” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,005.00  $              1,005.00  $              1,050.00  $              1,050.00 

22 36” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,206.00  $              1,206.00  $              1,260.00  $              1,260.00 

23
Scotch Lite Diamond Grade – DG3 Fluorescent 
Reflective Sheeting YELLOW Series 4081 (Type 
ZZ)

Sq Ft 1  $                     2.68  $                     2.68  $                     2.80  $                     2.80 

24 9” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 301.50  $                 301.50  $                 315.00  $                 315.00 

25 12” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 402.00  $                 402.00  $                 420.00  $                 420.00 

26 18” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 603.00  $                 603.00  $                 630.00  $                 630.00 

24 24” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 804.00  $                 804.00  $                 840.00  $                 840.00 

28 30” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,005.00  $              1,005.00  $              1,050.00  $              1,050.00 

29 36” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $              1,206.00  $              4,824.00  $              1,260.00  $              5,040.00 

30 48” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,608.00  $              1,608.00  $              1,680.00  $              1,680.00 

31 Scotch Lite Diamond Grade – DG3 Reflective 
Sheeting BLUE Series 4095 (Type ZZ) Sq Ft 1  $                     2.68  $                     2.68  $                     2.80  $                     2.80 

32 12” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 402.00  $                 402.00  $                 420.00  $                 420.00 

33 24” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 804.00  $                 804.00  $                 840.00  $                 840.00 

34 30” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,005.00  $              1,005.00  $              1,050.00  $              1,050.00 

35 36” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,206.00  $              1,206.00  $              1,260.00  $              1,260.00 

36 Scotch Lite Diamond Grade – DG3 Florescent 
Reflective Sheeting ORANGE Series 4084 Sq Ft 1  $                     2.80  $                     2.80  $                     2.80  $                     2.80 

37 12” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 420.00  $                 420.00  $                 420.00  $                 420.00 

38 24” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $                 840.00  $                 840.00  $                 840.00  $                 840.00 

39 30” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              1,050.00  $              1,050.00  $              1,050.00  $              1,050.00 

40 36” x 50 yards ROLL 2  $              1,260.00  $              2,520.00  $              1,260.00  $              2,520.00 

41 48” x 50 yards ROLL 2  $              1,680.00  $              3,360.00  $              1,680.00  $              3,360.00 

42 Scotch Lite Reflective Sheeting Series IJ680 CR Sq Ft 1  $                     4.90  $                     4.90  $                     6.27  $                     6.27 
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NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

43 36” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $              2,188.25  $              2,188.25  $ 2,821.25  $ 2,821.25 

44 48” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $              2,917.50  $            11,670.00  $ 3,761.67  $            15,046.68 

45 Scotch Lite Diamond Grade Series 983 
Conspicuity RED / WHITE Sq Ft 1  $ 4.20  $ 4.20  $ 5.35  $ 5.35 

46 1” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $ 52.50  $ 52.50  $ 66.88  $ 66.88 

47 2” x 50 yards ROLL 12  $ 105.00  $              1,260.00  $ 133.75  $ 1,605.00 

48 3” x 50 yards ROLL 1  $ 157.50  $ 157.50  $ 200.64  $ 200.64 

49 Scotch Lite Reflective Sheeting Engineer Grade 
Series 3200DP (Type B) Pressure Sensitive Sq Ft 1  $              1.49  $              1.49  $ 1.63  $ 1.63 

50 36” x 50 yards ROLL 3  $ 670.50  $              2,011.50  $ 730.31  $ 2,190.93 

51 48” x 50 yards ROLL 3  $ 894.00  $              2,682.00  $ 973.75  $ 2,921.25 

52 Scotch Lite Reflective Sheeting Engineer Grade 
Series 3200 (Type B) Pressure Sensitive Sq Ft 1  $              1.49  $              1.49  $ 1.63  $ 1.63 

53 12” x 50 yards ROLL 2  $ 233.50  $ 467.00  $ 244.50  $ 489.00 

54 36” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $ 670.50  $              2,682.00  $ 730.31  $ 2,921.24 

55 48” x 50 yards ROLL 4  $ 894.00  $              3,576.00  $ 973.75  $ 3,895.00 

56 Clear Plastic Application Tape (TPM-5) for EC Film Sq Ft 1  $ 0.38  $ 0.38  $ 0.38  $ 0.38 

57 9” x 100 yards ROLL 5  $ 84.38  $ 421.90  $ 85.50  $ 427.50 

58 12” x 100 yards ROLL 20  $ 112.50  $              2,250.00  $ 114.00  $ 2,280.00 

59 18” x 100 yards ROLL 20  $ 168.75  $              3,375.00  $ 171.00  $ 3,420.00 

60 24” x 100 yards ROLL 5  $ 225.00  $              1,125.00  $ 228.00  $ 1,140.00 

61 Standard Application Tape (SCPS-2, SCPM-3) 
TPM-5 for VINYL and EC Film Sq Ft 1  $ 0.32  $ 0.32  $ 0.72  $ 0.72 

62 6” x 100 yards ROLL 1  $ 48.00  $ 48.00  $ 108.00  $ 108.00 

63 12” x 100 yards ROLL 5  $ 96.00  $ 480.00  $ 216.00  $ 1,080.00 

64 18” x 100 yards ROLL 5  $ 144.00  $ 720.00  $ 324.00  $ 1,620.00 

65 24” x 100 yards ROLL 5  $ 192.00  $ 960.00  $ 432.00  $ 2,160.00 
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NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

$           114,715.01 121,212.87$           

1 12" x 18" BLANKS EA 100  $ 5.01  $ 501.00  $ 6.38  $ 638.00 

2 12" x 18" R7-2A (NO PARKING) Symbol 3 Color EA 100  $ 5.15  $ 515.00  $ 6.38  $ 638.00 

3 12" x 36" BLANKS EA 200  $ 10.02  $              2,004.00  $ 12.75  $ 2,550.00 

4 12" x 42" BLANKS EA 200  $ 11.69  $              2,338.00  $ 14.88  $ 2,976.00 

5 18" x 24" Border Faces EA 1  $ 10.02  $ 10.02  $ 12.75  $ 12.75 

6 18" x 72" BLANKS EA 100  $ 30.06  $              3,006.00  $ 32.00  $ 3,200.00 

7 24" County Route Marker (M1-6) EA 50  $ 13.90  $ 695.00  $ 17.00  $ 850.00 

8 24" x 30" Border Faces EA 100  $ 16.70  $              1,670.00  $ 21.25  $ 2,125.00 

9 24" x 48" (BLANKS) EA 1  $ 26.72  $ 26.72  $ 34.00  $ 34.00 

10 30" x 30" (RLMTR) EA 50  $ 20.88  $              1,044.00  $ 26.56  $ 1,328.00 

11 30" x 36" Border Faces EA 100  $ 25.05  $              2,505.00  $ 31.88  $ 3,188.00 

12 30" x 36" Regulatory Signs EA 100  $ 25.05  $              2,505.00  $ 31.88  $ 3,188.00 

13 36" x 36" Regulatory Signs EA 300  $ 30.06  $              9,018.00  $ 38.25  $            11,475.00 

14 36" x 36" BLANKS EA 1  $ 30.06  $ 30.06  $ 38.25  $ 38.25 

15 36" x 60" BLANKS EA 1  $ 50.10  $ 50.10  $ 63.75  $ 63.75 

16 36” x 72” BLANKS EA 1  $ 60.12  $ 60.12  $ 76.50  $ 76.50 

17 48”x 48” BLANKS EA 1  $ 53.44  $ 53.44  $ 68.00  $ 68.00 

18 30” x 30” (Includes Circles and Octagon) EA 100  $ 20.88  $              2,088.00  $ 26.56  $ 2,656.00 

19 36” x 36” (Includes Circles and Octagon) EA 100  $ 30.06  $              3,006.00  $ 38.25  $ 3,825.00 

20 24” x 24” (Sign Face 3 or More Colors) EA 1  $ 16.00  $ 16.00  $ 17.00  $ 17.00 
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SECTION 4: SIGN FACES



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

21 30” x 30” (Sign Face 3 or More Colors) EA 100  $ 25.00  $              2,500.00  $ 32.00  $ 3,200.00 

22 36” x 36” (Sign Face 3 or More Colors) EA 200  $ 36.00  $              7,200.00  $ 42.00  $ 8,400.00 

23 12” x 24” (M1-51 END 4” Yellow/Blue with Border) EA 25  $ 7.20  $ 180.00  $ 8.50  $ 212.50 

24 12” x 24” (M1-51 BEGIN 4” Yellow/Blue with 
Border) EA 25  $ 7.20  $ 180.00  $ 8.50  $ 212.50 

25 18” Stop Sign EA 50  $ 7.52  $ 376.00  $ 9.56  $ 478.00 

26 30” x 36” B/O Detour EA 1  $ 28.00  $ 28.00  $ 31.88  $ 31.88 

27 48” x 48” B/O Detour EA 1  $ 60.00  $ 60.00  $ 68.00  $ 68.00 

28 48” x 72” B/O Detour EA 1  $ 90.00  $ 90.00  $ 102.00  $ 102.00 

29 12” x 12” W3-3 Signal Ahead Stickers (3 colors) 
NO BORDER EA 100  $ 4.20  $ 420.00  $ 4.25  $ 425.00 

30 12” x 36” Object Markers Right / Left EA 200  $ 10.02  $              2,004.00  $ 12.75  $ 2,550.00 

31 12” x 36” BLANKS EA 50  $ 10.02  $ 501.00  $ 12.75  $ 637.50 

32 12” x 42” BLANKS EA 50  $ 11.69  $ 584.50  $ 14.88  $ 744.00 

33 18” x 24” BLANKS EA 1  $ 10.02  $ 10.02  $ 12.75  $ 12.75 

34 24” x 24” BLANKS EA 1  $ 13.36  $ 13.36  $ 17.00  $ 17.00 

35 24” x 30” Chevrons EA 200  $ 16.70  $              3,340.00  $ 21.25  $ 4,250.00 

36 24” x 48” Double & Single Arrow EA 20  $ 26.72  $ 534.40  $ 34.00  $ 680.00 

37 30” x 36” BLANKS EA 1  $ 25.05  $ 25.05  $ 31.88  $ 31.88 

38 36” x 36” Border Plates & Warning Signs EA 300  $ 30.06  $              9,018.00  $ 38.25  $            11,475.00 

39 36” x 60” BLANKS EA 1  $ 50.10  $ 50.10  $ 63.75  $ 63.75 

40 36” x 72” BLANKS EA 1  $ 60.12  $ 60.12  $ 76.50  $ 76.50 

41 48” x 48” BLANKS EA 1  $ 53.44  $ 53.44  $ 68.00  $ 68.00 

42 18” x 18” (Includes Circles) EA 1  $ 7.52  $ 7.52  $ 9.56  $ 9.56 
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NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

43 36” x 36 (Sign Faces 3 or more colors) (W3-5) 
various Speed Limits EA 50  $ 36.00  $              1,800.00  $ 42.00  $ 2,100.00 

44 24” x 24” (Includes Circles) EA 10  $ 13.36  $ 133.60  $ 17.00  $ 170.00 

45 30” x 30” (Includes Circles & Text) EA 10  $ 21.00  $ 210.00  $ 26.56  $ 265.60 

46 36” x 36” (Includes Circles) EA 10  $ 30.06  $ 300.60  $ 38.25  $ 382.50 

47 12” x 24” W16-7L (Arrow) EA 25  $ 6.68  $ 167.00  $ 8.50  $ 212.50 

48 12” x 24” W16-9 (Ahead) EA 25  $ 6.68  $ 167.00  $ 8.50  $ 212.50 

49 30” x 30 (R10-15) Left and Right EA 25  $ 20.88  $ 522.00  $ 26.56  $ 664.00 

50 36” x 36” (S1-1, S2-1) Series 3983 EA 25  $ 30.06  $ 751.50  $ 38.25  $ 956.25 

51 24” x 48” (S4-100) Series 3983 EA 25  $ 26.72  $ 668.00  $ 34.00  $ 850.00 

52 24” x 36” (S4-102) Series 3983 EA 25  $ 20.04  $ 501.00  $ 25.50  $ 637.50 

53 36” x 36” Series 3983 Bicycle, Ped, Ped Bike EA 50  $ 30.20  $              1,510.00  $ 38.25  $ 1,912.50 

65,107.67$             81,056.42$             

1 6” x 12” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 2.10  $ 2.10  $ 1.82  $ 1.82  $ 2.65  $ 2.65 

2 6” x 18” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 3.00  $ 3.00  $ 2.72  $ 2.72  $ 3.97  $ 3.97 

3 6” x 24” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 3.90  $ 3.90  $ 3.63  $ 3.63  $ 5.30  $ 5.30 

4 6” x 30” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 4.88  $ 4.88  $ 4.54  $ 4.54  $ 6.62  $ 6.62 

5 9” x 18” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 4.40  $ 4.40  $ 4.08  $ 4.08  $ 5.96  $ 5.96 

6 9” x 24” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 5.85  $ 5.85  $ 5.45  $ 5.45  $ 7.95  $ 7.95 

7 9” x 30” GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 7.31  $ 731.00  $ 6.81  $ 681.00  $ 5.46  $ 546.00 

8 9” x 36” GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 8.78  $ 878.00  $ 8.17  $ 817.00  $ 6.53  $ 653.00 

9 12” x 18” GAGE 0.080 EA 250  $ 5.85  $ 1,462.50  $ 5.45  $ 1,362.50  $ 4.54  $              1,135.00 
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SECTION 5: ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS

NO BID



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO MDSOULUTIONS US STANDARD SIGN 

10 12" x 36" GAGE 0.080 (NO HOLES) STREET 
NAMES EA 500  $ 11.50  $ 5,750.00  $ 10.89  $ 5,445.00  $ 8.71  $              4,355.00 

11 12” x 36” GAGE 0.080 (PUNCHED) EA 50  $ 11.70  $ 585.00  $ 10.89  $ 544.50  $ 8.71  $ 435.50 

12 12” x 42” GAGE 0.080 (NO HOLES) STREET 
NAMES EA 500  $ 13.50  $ 6,750.00  $ 12.71  $ 6,355.00  $ 10.36  $              5,180.00 

13 18” x 24” GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 11.70  $ 1,170.00  $ 10.89  $ 1,089.00  $ 8.71  $ 871.00 

14 24” x 24” GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 15.60  $ 1,560.00  $ 14.52  $ 1,452.00  $ 11.62  $              1,162.00 

15 24” x 24” GAGE 0.080 (ROUTE MARKER – SEE 
ATTACHED) M1-6 EA 100  $ 16.20  $ 1,620.00  $ 14.52  $ 1,452.00  $ 14.08  $              1,408.00 

16 24” x 30” GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 19.50  $ 1,950.00  $ 18.15  $ 1,815.00  $ 14.53  $              1,453.00 

17 24” X 36” GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 23.40  $ 2,340.00  $ 21.78  $ 2,178.00  $ 17.42  $              1,742.00 

18 48” x 48” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 62.40  $ 62.40  $ 58.08  $ 58.08  $ 68.48  $ 68.48 

19 30” X 30” ROUND GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 24.38  $ 24.38  $ 22.69  $ 22.69  $ 24.05  $ 24.05 

20 36” X 36” ROUND GAGE 0.080 EA 25  $ 35.10  $ 877.50  $ 32.67  $ 816.75  $ 27.15  $ 678.75 

21 30” x 36” GAGE 0.080 EA 200  $ 29.25  $ 5,850.00  $ 27.23  $ 5,446.00  $ 22.63  $              4,526.00 

22 30” STOP SIGN GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 23.80  $ 2,380.00  $ 22.69  $ 2,269.00  $ 17.25  $              1,725.00 

23 24” x 48” GAGE 0.100 EA 1  $ 37.60  $ 37.60  $ 36.30  $ 36.30  $ 41.66  $ 41.66 

24 18” STOP SIGN GAGE 0.080 EA 25  $ 8.78  $ 219.50  $ 8.17  $ 204.25  $ 6.21  $ 155.25 

25 36” X 36” (STOP) GAGE 0.080 EA 250  $ 35.10  $ 8,775.00  $ 32.67  $ 8,167.50  $ 24.84  $              6,210.00 

26 36” X 36” GAGE 0.080 EA 250  $ 35.10  $ 8,775.00  $ 32.67  $ 8,167.50  $ 26.66  $              6,665.00 

27 36” x 36” (SCHOOL PENTAGON) GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 35.10  $ 3,510.00  $ 32.67  $ 3,267.00  $ 25.30  $              2,530.00 

28 30” x 30” GAGE 0.080 EA 100  $ 24.38  $ 2,438.00  $ 22.69  $ 2,269.00  $ 18.85  $              1,885.00 

29 18” X 72” GAGE 0.125 EA 100  $ 52.20  $ 5,220.00  $ 50.96  $ 5,096.00  $ 42.42  $              4,242.00 

30 12” X 24” GAGE 0.080 EA 1  $ 7.80  $ 7.80  $ 7.26  $ 7.26  $ 10.55  $ 10.55 

31 30” X 72” GAGE 0.125 EA 1  $ 87.00  $ 87.00  $ 84.94  $ 84.94  $ 84.59  $ 84.59 



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

  
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32 24” x 72” GAGE 0.125 EA 1  $ 69.60  $ 69.60  $ 67.95  $ 67.95  $ 69.76  $ 69.76 

33 18” X 48” GAGE 0.125 EA 1  $ 34.80  $ 34.80  $ 33.98  $ 33.98  $ 39.09  $ 39.09 

34 18” X 54” GAGE 0.125 EA 1  $ 39.15  $ 39.15  $ 38.22  $ 38.22  $ 46.63  $ 46.63 

35 18” x 96” GAGE 0.10 EA 1  $ 56.40  $ 56.40  $ 54.45  $ 54.45  $ 59.16  $ 59.16 

36 36” x 60” GAGE 0.10 EA 1  $ 70.50  $ 70.50  $ 68.06  $ 68.06  $ 67.67  $ 67.67 

37 36” x 72” GAGE 0.10 EA 1  $ 84.60  $ 84.60  $ 81.72  $ 81.72  $ 93.77  $ 93.77 

38 48” x 60” GAGE 0.10 EA 1  $ 94.00  $ 94.00  $ 90.80  $ 90.80  $ 90.25  $ 90.25 

39 48” X 72” GAGE 0.10 EA 1  $ 112.80  $ 112.80  $ 108.96  $ 108.96  $ 108.27  $ 108.27 

40 54” X 24” GAGE 0.10 EA 25  $ 42.30  $ 1,057.50  $ 40.86  $ 1,021.50  $ 28.87  $ 721.75 

41 54” X 18” GAGE 0.10 EA 25  $ 31.73  $ 793.25  $ 30.65  $ 766.25  $ 22.09  $ 552.25 

65,497.41$             61,457.40$             49,667.88$             

1 ROAD WORK AHEAD - W20-1 EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

2 ONE LANE ROAD AHEAD - W20-4 EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

3 MERGE LEFT SYMBOL - W4-2L EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

4 MERGE RIGHT SYMBOL - W4-2R EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

5 RIGHT LANE CLOSED AHEAD - W20-5R EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

6 LEFT LANE CLOSED AHEAD - W20-5L EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

7
RIGHT LANE CLOSED AHEAD W/CHANGEABLE 
PANEL.
Changeable panel shall say “LEFT”

EA 10  $ 40.00  $ 400.00 

8
CHANGEABLE PANEL – LEFT Changeable panel 
shall say “LEFT” and be sized to fit over the “Right” 
of the Changeable Right Lane Closed Sign above.

EA 10  $ 40.00  $ 400.00 

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

SECTION 5 TOTAL: 

SECTION 6: ROLLUP SIGNS



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
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9
CHANGEABLE PANEL – ONE Changeable panel 
shall say “ONE” and be sized to fit over the “Right” 
of the Changeable Right Lane Closed Sign above.

EA 10  $ 40.00  $ 400.00 

10 MOWING AHEAD - W21-8 EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

11 FLAGGER SYMBOL - W20-7 EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

12 ROUGH GROOVED SURFACE - W8- I106 EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

13 BUMP - W8-1 EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

14 CLEAN UP CREW WORKING - I1-I107c EA 20  $ 133.00  $              2,660.00 

15 STEEL PLATE AHEAD – W8-24 EA 10  $ 133.00  $              1,330.00 

16 OTHER MUTCD ROLLUP SIGNS EA 10  $ 140.00  $              1,400.00 

17
SIGN STANDS – Aluminum Signs
Collapsible Coil Spring Sign Stand for use with 
48”x48” aluminum traffic signs

EA 50  $ 196.00  $              9,800.00 

18 Kwik Deploy Bracket for wood, u-channel, or 
square post mounting for signs above (2 per sign). EA 50  $ 149.00  $              7,450.00 

19 Kwik Deploy Bracket for wood, u-channel, or 
square post mounting for signs above (2 per sign). EA 40  $ 72.00  $              2,880.00 

40,020.00$             

1
Primerless Tape (Long Lines and Skips) (non-
linered) – Illinois Specifications Type B
White - 4” x 30 Yards

EA 4  $ 243.75  $ 975.00 

2
Primerless Tape (Long Lines and Skips) (non-
linered) – Illinois Specifications Type B
White - 6” x 30 Yards

EA 4  $ 365.63  $              1,462.52 

3
Primerless Tape (Long Lines and Skips) (non-
linered) – Illinois Specifications Type B
Yellow - 4” x 30 Yards

EA 4  $ 243.75  $ 975.00 

4 Wet Reflective Removeable Tape
White – 4” x 40 Yards EA 8  $ 146.00  $              1,168.00 NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

NO BID

NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

SECTION 6 TOTAL: 

 NO BID NO BID

SECTION 7: PAVEMENT MARKING TAPE

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID

 NO BID NO BID



NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE PRICE EXTENDED PRICE
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5 Wet Reflective Removeable Tape
White – 6” x 40 Yards EA 8  $ 219.00  $              1,752.00 

6 Wet Reflective Removeable Tape
Yellow – 4” x 40 Yards EA 8  $ 146.00  $              1,168.00 

7 Wet Reflective Removeable Tape
Yellow – 6” x 40 Yards EA 8  $ 219.00  $              1,752.00 

9,252.52$               

Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

SECTION 7  TOTAL: 

72
4
3

Bid Opening 06/08/23 @ 2:30 PM NE, MP

NOTES
1. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio corrections to Totals:

a. Section 3 Total corrected to $114,715.01 from $112,015.68, due to miscalculation in submittal.
b. Section 4 Total corrected to $65,107.67 from $65,251.67, due to miscalculation in submittal.
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