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Direct, Inc.

Laser Pro 
Company, Inc.

ODP Business 
Solutions, LLC

NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 50F1X00CTS EA 1  $             38.00  $             29.95  $             43.99  $             48.00  $             71.57  $           249.21  NO BID 
2 787-1 EA 1  $             30.00  $             79.95  $             63.99  $             57.00  $           114.80  $             39.00  NO BID 
3 C4127X EA 1  $             24.00  $             24.95  $             28.84  $             38.00  $             55.04  $             44.50  NO BID 
4 C7115XCTA EA 1  $             13.00  $             10.95  $             12.91  $             22.00  $             33.84  $             44.50  NO BID 
5 CB435A EA 1  $               6.00  $             10.95  $               8.99  $             10.00  $             32.18  $             37.00  $             69.78 
6 CC364ACTA EA 1  $             21.00  $             21.95  $             23.99  $             26.00  $             65.13  $             92.00  $           239.99 
7 CE255ACTA EA 1  $             15.00  $             17.95  $             17.95  $             22.00  $             54.28  $             65.00  $           141.43 
8 CE390A EA 1  $             21.00  $             21.95  $             21.50  $             27.00  $             68.23  $           107.00  $           151.53 
9 CE410A EA 1  $             12.00  $             14.95  $             13.24  $             14.00  $             46.20  $             68.50  $             82.78 
10 CF226A EA 1  $             18.00  $             24.95  $             15.35  $             14.00  $             66.23  $             66.00  $             99.24 
11 CF226XCTA EA 1  $             26.00  $             27.95  $             18.97  $             15.00  $             88.85  $           101.00  $           175.24 
12 CF230A EA 1  $             17.00  $             14.95  $             11.93  $             11.00  $           114.39  $             59.00  $             60.51 
13 CF230XCTS EA 1  $             18.00  $             17.95  $             11.60  $             12.00  $             52.59  $             67.00  $             90.35 
14 CF232ACD EA 1  $             21.00  $             14.95  $             15.60  $             11.00  $             39.13  $             59.00  $             79.68 
15 CF248A EA 1  $             18.00  $             14.95  $               9.60  $             15.00  $             36.23  $             35.00  $             57.99 
16 CF258A EA 1  $             58.00  $             44.95  $             41.11  $             44.00  $           133.74  $           160.00  $           103.29 
17 CF280XCTA EA 1  $             18.00  $             14.95  $             12.00  $             13.00  $             51.18  $             95.50  $           150.73 
18 CF281A EA 1  $             29.00  $             24.95  $             21.93  $             27.00  $             69.78  $           107.00  $           177.92 
19 CF283A EA 1  $             15.00  $             10.95  $               7.65  $               9.00  $             34.13  $             37.00  $             64.55 
20 CF287XCTA EA 1  $             29.00  $             32.95  $             29.00  $             26.00  $           101.77  $           145.00  $           250.98 
21 CF410XCTA EA 1  $             21.00  $             24.95  $             18.98  $             17.00  $             73.27  $             84.50  $           134.79 
22 CF411XCTA EA 1  $             22.00  $             24.95  $             18.98  $             17.00  $             84.58  $             86.50  $           180.45 
23 CF412XCTA EA 1  $             22.00  $             24.95  $             18.98  $             17.00  $             84.58  $             86.50  $           180.45 
24 CF413XCTA EA 1  $             22.00  $             24.95  $             18.98  $             17.00  $             84.58  $             86.50  $           180.45 
25 FX4 EA 1  $             19.00  $             24.95  $             82.75  $             34.00  $             63.68  $             60.50  $             49.16 
26 HP 58A OEM EA 1  $           116.00  $           109.99  $           115.70  $             94.50  $           113.53  $           123.55  $           103.29 
27 Q5942ACTAU EA 1  $             22.00  $             24.95  $             25.34  $             25.00  $             72.82  $             83.50  $           168.16 
28 Q5949XCTA EA 1  $             11.00  $             14.95  $             15.20  $             17.00  $             38.76  $             66.00  $           169.88 
29 Q7553ACTA EA 1  $               9.00  $             10.95  $             10.49  $             16.00  $             34.24  $             51.00  $             96.84 
30 Q7553XCTA EA 1  $             11.00  $             14.95  $             11.30  $             13.00  $             38.77  $             80.00  $           167.55 

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
TONER CARTRIDGES 24-088-FIN
BID TABULATION




Printing 

Supplies USA 
LLC

American Toner 
& Ink

LD Products, 
Inc.

The Tree 
House, Inc.

Warehouse 
Direct, Inc.

Laser Pro 
Company, Inc.

ODP Business 
Solutions, LLC

31 REMAN8773 EA 1  $               3.00  $               2.95  $               2.60  $               6.00  $               6.34  $               7.00  NO BID 
32 REMAN8775 EA 1  $               3.00  $               2.95  $               2.55  $               6.00  $               6.34  $               7.00  NO BID 
33 REMANHP94 EA 1  $               7.00  $               3.95  $               4.40  $             12.00  $             31.61  $             15.50  $             27.66 
34 REMANHP95 EA 1  $             11.00  $               6.95  $               6.60  $             13.00  $             10.55  $             15.50  $             33.99 
35 REMANHP98 EA 1  $               7.00  $               2.95  $               4.20  $               7.00  $               7.98  $             28.00  $             38.29 
36 TK362 EA 1  $             23.00  $             14.95  $             20.79  $             20.00  NO BID  $             45.00  $             86.49 
37 TK362 OEM EA 1  $             65.00  $             69.99  $             66.32  $             61.95  NO BID  $             70.55  NO BID 
38 UNIVC9720A EA 1  $             32.00  $             29.95  $             39.00  $             68.00  $             74.95  $             97.50  $           178.98 
39 UNIVC9722A EA 1  $             32.00  $             29.95  $             39.00  $             40.00  $             74.95  $           104.00  $           242.50 
40 UNIVCB435ACTA EA 1  $               6.00  $             10.95  $               9.55  $             10.00  $             32.18  $             37.00  $             69.78 
41 UNIVCE278ACTA EA 1  $               8.00  $             10.95  $               8.00  $             13.00  $             32.58  $             44.50  $             77.11 
42 UNIVCE280A EA 1  $             16.00  $               9.95  $             10.75  $             15.00  $             34.59  $             50.00  $             86.43 
43 UNIVCE410XCTA EA 1  $             12.00  $             14.95  $             13.00  $             15.00  $             48.07  $             68.50  $           134.79 
44 UNIVCE411ACTA EA 1  $             12.00  $             14.95  $             13.00  $             14.00  $             44.97  $             70.50  $           180.45 
45 UNIVCE412ACTA EA 1  $             12.00  $             14.95  $             13.00  $             14.00  $             44.97  $             70.50  $           180.45 
46 UNIVCE413ACTA EA 1  $             12.00  $               9.95  $             13.00  $             14.00  $             44.97  $             70.50  $           180.45 
47 UNIVCE505ACTA EA 1  $             16.00  $               9.95  $             13.25  $             11.00  $             34.89  $             49.00  $           145.68 
48 UNIVCE505XCTA EA 1  $             11.00  $             10.95  $             13.00  $             13.00  $             52.79  $             93.00  $           137.29 
49 UNIVCF283CTA EA 1  $             15.00  $             10.95  $               8.00  $               9.00  $             34.13  $             37.00  $             64.55 
50 UNIVQ261ACTA EA 1  $               6.00  $             10.95  $               8.00  $             35.00  $             31.85  $             31.00  $           301.12 
51 W1480A EA 1  $             48.00  $             49.95  $             50.29  $             52.00  $             87.57  $           160.00  $           207.39 

 $        1,079.00  $        1,122.53  $        1,125.14  $        1,177.45  $        2,754.38  $        3,658.31  $        5,800.41 

Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

17
0
7

Bid Opening 7/16/2024 @ 4:00 PM BR, HK

GRAND TOTAL

NOTES
1. Printing Supplies USA LLC provided a corrected OEM toner cartridge price for Item 26 of $116.00, which resulted in a corrected Grand Total of $1,079.00.
2. Grand Total for American Toner & Ink was incorrectly entered as $403.39. This was adjusted to $1,122.53.
3. Grand Total for LD Products, Inc. was incorrectly entered as $1,125.13. This was adjusted to $1,125.14.
4. The Tree House, Inc. provided a corrected OEM toner cartridge price for Item 26 of $94.50 and Item 37 of $61.95, which resulted in a corrected Grand Total of $1,177.45.
5. Warehouse Direct, Inc. provided a corrected OEM toner cartridge price for Item 26 of $113.53, which resulted in a corrected Grand Total of $2,754.38.
6. Laser Pro Company, Inc. provided a corrected OEM toner cartridge price for Item 37 of $70.55, which resulted in a corrected Grand Total of $3,658.31.
7. Grand Total for ODP Business Solutions, LLC was incorrectly entered as $20,722.68. This was adjusted to $5,800.41.




