
421 N. COUNTY FARM ROAD
WHEATON, IL 60187

www.dupagecounty.gov

DU PAGE COUNTY
Public Works Committee

Regular Meeting Agenda

Room 3500B9:00 AMTuesday, June 16, 2026

1. CALL TO ORDER

2. ROLL CALL

3. CHAIRMAN'S REMARKS - CHAIR CHILDRESS

4. PUBLIC COMMENT

5. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

5.A.

Public Works Committee - Regular Meeting Minutes - Tuesday, June 2, 2026

26-1707

6. BID AWARD

6.A.

Recommendation for the approval of a contract to Hawkins, Inc., for chemicals, chemical 
parts and supplies on an as needed basis, for Public Works, for the period of June 16, 
2026 to June 15, 2027, for a total contract amount not to exceed $ 20,000; per bid 
#26-035-PW.

26-1708

7. BID RENEWAL

7.A.

Recommendation for the approval of a contract to Sheffield Safety and Loss Company, 
LLC, to provide Safety Program Management for various County Departments, for the 
period of June 25, 2026 to June 24, 2027, for a total contract amount not to exceed 
$150,000; per RFP #25-046-PW. First of three options to renew.

PW-P-0017-26

7.B.

Recommendation for the approval of a contract to Mid American Water, for Waterous 
Pacer Hydrants, for the period of June 26, 2026 to June 25, 2027, for a total contract 
amount not to exceed $62,500; per bid #24-078-PW. Second of three options to renew.

PW-P-0018-26

8. INFORMATIONAL

8.A.

Memorial Park Dedication Ceremony, June 16, 2026, at 12:30 P.M.

26-1709

8.B.

Public Works 2025 Audit Financial Result Review

26-1710
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Public Works Committee Regular Meeting Agenda June 16, 2026

9. OLD BUSINESS

10. NEW BUSINESS

11. ADJOURNMENT
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Minutes 421 N. COUNTY FARM
ROAD

WHEATON, IL 60187
www.dupagecounty.gov

File #: 26-1707 Agenda Date: 6/16/2026 Agenda #: 5.A.
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421 N. COUNTY FARM ROAD
WHEATON, IL 60187

www.dupagecounty.gov
DU PAGE COUNTY
Public Works Committee

Final Summary

9:00 AM Room 3500BTuesday, June 2, 2026

1. CALL TO ORDER

9:00 AM meeting was called to order by Chair Michael Childress at 9:00 AM.

2. ROLL CALL

PRESENT Childress, DeSart, Galassi, Garcia, and Zay

REMOTE Ozog

MOTION TO ALLOW REMOTE PARTICIPATION

Member DeSart moved and Member Garcia seconded a motion to allow Member Ozog to 
conduct the meeting via teleconference/remotely.

RESULT: APPROVED

Dawn DeSartMOVER: 

SECONDER: Paula Garcia

3. CHAIRMAN'S REMARKS - CHAIR CHILDRESS

No remarks were offered.

4. PUBLIC COMMENT

No public comments were offered.

5. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

5.A.

Public Works Committee - Regular Meeting Minutes - Tuesday, May 19, 2026

26-1566

RESULT: APPROVED

Michael ChildressMOVER: 

SECONDER: Dawn DeSart

6. CONSENT ITEMS

6.A.

Public Works - APGN Inc. d/b/a APG-Neuros - Contract is being extended to November 

26-1567
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Public Works Committee Summary - Final June 2, 2026

30, 2026, due to delays in construction and installation of the Neuros blowers for the 
Woodridge Greene Valley Wastewater Treatment Plant.

RESULT: APPROVED

Michael ChildressMOVER: 

SECONDER: Jim Zay

7. PUBLIC UTILITY

7.A.

Recommendation for the approval of a contract to the City of Wheaton, to provide fire 
alarm monitoring services for the County campus, for Facilities Management, for the 
period of July 1, 2026 through June 30, 2027, for a contract total amount not to exceed 
$21,420. Per 55 ILCS 5/5-1022(c) - not suitable for competitive bids. (Public Utility)

26-1568

Vice Chair Jim Zay asked for clarification on what services would be provided by the 
City of Wheaton and Chief Administrative Officer Nick Kottmeyer and Deputy Director 
of Facilities Management Geoffrey Matteson answered.

RESULT: APPROVED

Michael ChildressMOVER: 

SECONDER: Paula Garcia

8. BID RENEWAL

8.A.

Recommendation for the approval of a contract to Baker Tilly Advisory Group, LP, to 
provide accounting services and support related to the Pursuit of the Federal Renewable 
Energy Tax Credit as part of the Inflation Reduction Act 2022, for Facilities 
Management, for the period of June 17, 2026 through June 16, 2027, for a total contract 
amount not to exceed $23,500; per RFP #25-028-FM. First of three options to renew.

26-1569

RESULT: APPROVED

Michael ChildressMOVER: 

SECONDER: Paula Garcia

8.B.

Recommendation for the approval of a contract to Ashland Lock & Security Solutions, to 
provide locksmith services, maintenance and installation, as needed for County facilities, 
for Facilities Management, for the period of July 19, 2026 through July 18, 2027, for a 
contract total amount not to exceed $25,000, per renewal of bid #23-079-FM. Third and 
final option to renew.

26-1570
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Public Works Committee Summary - Final June 2, 2026

RESULT: APPROVED

Michael ChildressMOVER: 

SECONDER: Paula Garcia

8.C.

Recommendation for the approval of a contract to Ashland Door Solutions LLC, to 
provide door maintenance, door sales, and installation, as needed for County facilities, for 
Facilities Management, for the period of July 19, 2026 through July 18, 2027, for a 
contract total amount not to exceed $45,000; per renewal of bid #23-080-FM. Third and 
final option to renew.

FM-P-0019-26

RESULT: APPROVED AND SENT TO FINANCE

Michael ChildressMOVER: 

SECONDER: Paula Garcia

9. OLD BUSINESS

No old business was discussed.

10. NEW BUSINESS

Chief Administrative Officer Nick Kottmeyer informed the Public Works Committee that a bid 
that was recently opened for the JOF Stormwater and Wastewater pump stations will discharge 
Public Works Committee and go directly to Finance and County Board. Member Ozog and 
Member Garcia asked clarifying questions and Chief Administrative Officer Nick Kottmeyer and 
Deputy Director of Public Works Sean Reese responded. 

11. ADJOURNMENT

With no further business, the meeting was adjourned.
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Public Works Requisition under $30,000 421 N. COUNTY FARM
ROAD

WHEATON, IL 60187
www.dupagecounty.gov

File #: 26-1708 Agenda Date: 6/16/2026 Agenda #: 6.A.
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NO. ITEM UOM QTY PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE

1 Gas Chlorine Cylinders LB 150  $         1.1526  $         172.89 

2 Hydrofluosilicic Acid (Fluoride) LB 400  $         0.9315  $         372.60 

3 Potassium Carbonate, 47% GAL 1  $             9.29  $             9.29 

4 King Lee Technologies Antiscalant 0100 LB 400  $             3.23  $      1,292.00 

5 Calcium Hypochlorite Pool Tablets 3” LB 50  $             3.89  $         194.50 

6 Granular Calcium Hypochlorite LB 50  $             3.89  $         194.50 

7 M3 Quick Connect 3/8” Pump Tubes EA 1  $           96.00  $           96.00 

8 M3 2-Channel Quick Disconnect QNEE EA 1  $         471.91  $         471.91 

9 M3 Pump Quick Connects 3/8” EA 1  $           96.00  $           96.00 

10 M3 Roller Assemblies EA 1  $         334.29  $         334.29 

11 Black Pressure Regulators EA 1

12 Polyethylene Chemical Tubing EA 1

13 Marpene TM LoadSure Tubing Element EA 1

14 520REM Pumphead EA 1

3,233.98$       

Invitations Sent

Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

28

0

1

NOTES

1. Hawkins, Inc. Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:

    • NO. 3, when multiplied, ($9.29 x 1 = $9.29), resulted in a decrease of $501.66.

Bid Opening 5/22/2026@ 11:00 A.M. SR, SP

GRAND TOTAL

P

Hawkins, Inc.

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

CHEMICALS AND PUMP REPLACEMENT 

PARTS 26-035-PW

BID TABULATION

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 
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Public Works Requisition $30,000.01+ 421 N. COUNTY FARM
ROAD

WHEATON, IL 60187
www.dupagecounty.gov

File #: PW-P-0017-26 Agenda Date: 6/16/2026 Agenda #: 7.A.

AWARDING RESOLUTION
ISSUED TO SHEFFIELD SAFETY AND LOSS, LLC

TO PROVIDE SAFETY PROGRAM REVIEW FOR VARIOUS DUPAGE COUNTY DEPARTMENTS
FOR PUBLIC WORKS

(CONTRACT TOTAL NOT TO EXCEED $150,000)

WHEREAS, proposals have been accepted and processed in accordance with County Board policy; and

WHEREAS, the Public Works Committee recommends County Board approval for the issuance of a
contract to Sheffield Safety and Loss, LLC, to provide safety program management for various County
Departments as needed, for the period June 25, 2026 through June 24, 2027, for Public Works.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that County Contract, covering said, to provide safety
program management for various County Departments as needed, for the period June 25, 2026 through June 24,
2027, for Public Works, be, and it is hereby approved for issuance of a contract by the Procurement Division to,
Sheffield Safety and Loss, LLC, 24216 W. Lockport St., Plainfield, Illinois, 60544, for a contract total amount
not to exceed $150,000, per renewal of RFP #25-046-PW. First of three options to renew.

Enacted and approved this 23rd day of June, 2026 at Wheaton, Illinois.

________________________________
DEBORAH A. CONROY, CHAIR

DU PAGE COUNTY BOARD

Attest: ___________________________________
JEAN KACZMAREK, COUNTY CLERK
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The County of DuPage
CONTRACT RENEWAL AGREEMENT 25-046-PW

Page 1 of 1 
 

 

 

  

The County of DuPage 
Finance Department 

Procurement Division, Room 3-400 
421 North County Farm Road 

Wheaton, Illinois 60187 

 
CONTRACT RENEWAL AGREEMENT 

 

This contract made and entered into by The County of DuPage, 421 North County Farm 
Road, Wheaton, Illinois, 60187, hereinafter called the “COUNTY” and Sheffield Safety & Loss 
Control, LLC. located at 24216 W. Lockport Street, Plainfield, Illinois 60544, hereinafter called the 
“CONTRACTOR”, witnesseth; 

The COUNTY and the CONTRACTOR have previously entered into a Contract, pursuant 
to Bid #25-046-PW which became effective on 6/25/2025 and which will expire 6/24/2026. The 
contract is subject to the first of three options to renew for a twelve (12) month period.   

The contract renewal shall be effective on the date of last signature and shall terminate 
on 6/24/2027. 

The parties now agree to renew said agreement, upon the same terms as previously 
agreed to, as specified in the original contract. 

 
THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE 

 
CONTRACTOR 

 
  

 

 
SIGNATURE 

 

 

Henry Kocker 
 

            

 
PRINTED NAME 

 
PRINTED NAME 

 

  Buyer I 
 

            

 
PRINTED TITLE 

 
PRINTED TITLE 

 

  
 

  

 
DATE 

 
DATE 

Paul Wojcieszak

President

5/18/2026
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√
Criteria Available Points

Sheffield Safety 
and Loss 

Control, Inc.
Hygieneering, Inc.

Firm Qualifications 30 28 26

Key Qualifications 25 23 22

Project Understanding 25 24 21

Price 20 20 17

Total 100 96 86

124,800.00$        148,050.00$            

100% 84%

20 17

RFP Posted on 4/24/2025
Bid Opened On 5/9/2025, 10:00 A.M. by DW, BR, SR

Invitations Sent 162
Total Requesting Documents 1
Total Bid Responses Received 5

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
SAFETY PROGRAM MANAGER 25-046-PW
BID TABULATION

Fee and Rate Proposal (Design Only)

Percentage of points

Points awarded
(wtd against lowest price)

NOTES
1.  John Newquist has been deemed nonresponsive for not including required document(s). 
2.  National Safety Consulting has been deemed nonresponsive for not including required document(s). 
3.  Virtelligence, Inc. has been deemed nonresponsive for not including required document(s). 
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Public Works Requisition $30,000.01+ 421 N. COUNTY FARM
ROAD

WHEATON, IL 60187
www.dupagecounty.gov

File #: PW-P-0018-26 Agenda Date: 6/16/2026 Agenda #: 7.B.

AWARDING RESOLUTION
ISSUED TO MID AMERICAN WATER,

TO PROVIDE WATEROUS PACER HYDRANTS
ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS

FOR PUBLIC WORKS
(CONTRACT TOTAL NOT TO EXCEED $62,500)

WHEREAS, bids have been taken and processed in accordance with County Board policy; and

WHEREAS, the Public Works Committee recommends County Board approval for the issuance of a
contract to Mid American Water, to provide waterous pacer hydrants for Public Works on an as needed basis,
for the period June 26, 2026 through June 25, 2027, for Public Works.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that County Contract, covering said, to provide waterous
pacer hydrants for Public Works on an as needed basis, for the period June 26, 2026 through June 25, 2027, for
Public Works, be, and it is hereby approved for issuance of a contract by the Procurement Division to, Mid
American Water, 1500 Mountain Street, Aurora, Illinois, 60502, for a contract total amount not to exceed
$62,500.00, per renewal option under bid award #24-078-PW. Second of three options to renew.

Enacted and approved this 23rd day of June, 2026 at Wheaton, Illinois.

________________________________

DEBORAH A. CONROY, CHAIR
DU PAGE COUNTY BOARD

Attest: ___________________________________

JEAN KACZMAREK, COUNTY CLERK
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30



Procurement Review Comprehensive Checklist 
Procurement Services Division 

This form must accompany all Purchase Order Requisitions 

SECTION 1: DESCRIPTION 

General Tracking Contract Terms 

FILE ID#: RFP, BID, QUOTE OR RENEWAL#: INITIAL TERM WITH RENEWALS: 

24-078-PW 1 YR + 3 X 1 YR TERM PERIODS 

COMMITTEE: TARGET COMMITTEE DATE: PROMPT FOR RENEWAL: 

PUBLIC WORKS 06/16/2026 3 MONTHS 

CURRENT TERM TOTAL COST: MAX LENGTH WITH ALL RENEWALS: 

$62,500.00 FOUR YEARS 

Vendor Information Department Information 

VENDOR: VENDOR#: DEPT: 

Mid-American Water 11215 Public Works 

VENDOR CONTACT: VENDOR CONTACT PHONE: DEPT CONTACT PHONE#: 

Eric Lowe 847-345-7388 630-985-7400

VENDOR CONTACT EMAIL: VENDOR WEBSITE: DEPT REQ#: 

eridowe@midamericanwater.com 

Overview 

INITIAL TERM TOTAL COST: 

$62,500.00 

CONTRACT TOTAL COST WITH ALL 
RENEWALS: 

$250,000.00 

CURRENT TERM PERIOD: 

SECOND RENEWAL 

DEPT CONTACT NAME: 

Dwane Kozak 

DEPT CONTACT EMAIL: 

dwane.kozak@dupagecounty.gov 

DESCRIPTION Identify scope of work, item(s) being purchased, total cost and type of procurement (i.e., lowest bid, RFP, renewal, sole source, etc.). 
Recommendation for the approval of a contract to Mid American Water, for Waterous Pacer Hydrants, for the period of June 26, 2026 to June 25,2027, 
for a total contract amount not to exceed $62,500, per most qualified offer, per bid #24-078-PW, second of three to renew. 

JUSTIFICATION Summarize why this procurement is necessary and what objectives will be accomplished 
Replacement of water hydrants is necessary periodically due to deterioration of old hydrants from age and/or unrepairable hydrant damage. Having 
these hydrants in Public Works stock is prudent so they are available when needed, particularly in an emergency situation. 

SECTION 2: DECISION MEMO REQUIREMENTS 

DECISION MEMO NOT REQUIRED Select an item from the following dropdown menu to identify why a Decision Memo (Section 3) is not required. 

RENEWAL

DECISION MEMO REQUIRED Select an item from the following dropdown menu to identify why a Decision Memo (Section 3) is required. 

SECTION 3: DECISION MEMO 

STRATEGIC IMPACT Select an item from the following dropdown menu of County's strategic priorities that this action will most impact. 

SOURCE SELECTION Describe method used to select source. 

RECOMMENDATION Describe staff recommendation and provide justification. Identify at least 2 other options to accomplish this request, including 
AND status quo, (i.e., take no action). 
TWO 

ALTERNATIVES 

Form under revision control 04/12/2024 31



32



33



34



NO ITEM QTY PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 
PRICE PRICE EXTENDED 

PRICE

1 Red 5-1/4" Waterous Pacer Hydrant 6' 3  $      5,005.53  $    15,016.59  $      5,014.00  $    15,042.00  $      5,060.00  $    15,180.00  $      5,260.00  $    15,780.00 

2 Red 5-1/4" Waterous Pacer Hydrant 5'6" 3  $      4,925.92  $    14,777.76  $      4,935.00  $    14,805.00  $      4,970.00  $    14,910.00  $      5,170.00  $    15,510.00 

3 Yellow 5-1/4" Waterous Pacer Hydrant 6' 3  $      5,005.53  $    15,016.59  $      5,014.00  $    15,042.00  $      5,060.00  $    15,180.00  $      5,260.00  $    15,780.00 

4 Yellow 5-1/4" Waterous Pacer Hydrant 5'6" 3  $      4,925.92  $    14,777.76  $      4,935.00  $    14,805.00  $      4,970.00  $    14,910.00  $      5,170.00  $    15,510.00 

59,588.70$    59,694.00$    60,180.00$    62,580.00$    

HK, BR
6
2
5Total Bid Responses

NOTES                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        
1. Sigelock Systems, LLC did not meet the bid specifications and has been deemed non-responsive.                                                                                           

Bid Opening 06/07/2024 @ 2:30 PM
Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
WATEROUS PACER HYDRANTS FOR PUBLIC WORKS 24-078-PW
BID TABULATION

GRAND TOTAL

MID-AMERICAN WATER, INC. CORE & MAIN, LP

  
 ZIEBELL WATER SERVICE 

PRODUCTS, INC. 
 WATER PRODUCTS 

COMPANY 
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Informational 421 N. COUNTY FARM
ROAD

WHEATON, IL 60187
www.dupagecounty.gov

File #: 26-1709 Agenda Date: 6/16/2026 Agenda #: 8.A.
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Informational 421 N. COUNTY FARM
ROAD

WHEATON, IL 60187
www.dupagecounty.gov

File #: 26-1710 Agenda Date: 6/16/2026 Agenda #: 8.B.
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