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PRICE

1 Flat Sheet EA 480  $              3.40  $       1,632.00  $              4.49  $       2,155.20  $              4.00  $       1,920.00  $              6.10  $       2,928.00  $              4.00  $       1,920.00  $              4.65  $       2,232.00 

2 Pillowcase EA 2,160  $              0.74  $       1,598.40  $              0.95  $       2,052.00  $              0.89  $       1,922.40  $              1.89  $       4,082.40  $              0.75  $       1,620.00  $              0.90  $       1,944.00 

3 Knitted Fitted Sheet EA 480  $              5.49  $       2,635.20  $              3.76  $       1,804.80  $              3.31  $       1,588.80  $              8.50  $       4,080.00  $              4.00  $       1,920.00  $              4.35  $       2,088.00 

4 Close View Thermal Blanket EA 420  $              8.00  $       3,360.00  $              5.36  $       2,251.20  $              7.95  $       3,339.00  $            16.00  $       6,720.00  $              6.00  $       2,520.00  $              6.95  $       2,919.00 

5 Underpad EA 2,350  $              4.80  $     11,280.00  $              9.17  $     21,549.50  $              9.05  $     21,267.50  $            15.00  $     35,250.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

6 Pillow EA 216  $              7.90  $       1,706.40  $              4.65  $       1,004.40  $              4.64  $       1,002.24  $            25.00  $       5,400.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

7 Hamper Bag EA 280  $            11.00  $       3,080.00  $            10.45  $       2,926.00  $            12.69  $       3,553.20  $            10.50  $       2,940.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

8 Patient Gown EA 1,800  $              3.51  $       6,318.00  $              3.43  $       6,174.00  $              4.09  $       7,362.00  $              8.75  $     15,750.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

9 Bath Towel EA 17,000  $              1.20  $     20,400.00  $              1.23  $     20,910.00  $              1.35  $     22,950.00  $              2.99  $     50,830.00  $              1.05  $     17,850.00  $              1.11  $     18,870.00 

10 Washcloth EA 48,000  $              0.14  $       6,720.00  $              0.13  $       6,240.00  $              0.15  $       7,200.00  $              0.76  $     36,480.00  $              0.15  $       7,200.00  $              0.13  $       6,240.00 

58,730.00$      67,067.10$      72,105.14$      164,460.40$    33,030.00$      34,293.00$      

Acme Supply Co., Ltd Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.

THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
VARIOUS LINENS FOR CARE CENTER 26-028-DCC
BID TABULATION


Rajan Barad dba Now Linens 

LLC Standard Textile Medline Industries, Inc. Immaculate Laundry of Albany 
Park LLC

GRAND TOTAL



THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
VARIOUS LINENS FOR CARE CENTER 26-028-DCC
BID TABULATION



Invitations Sent
Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses

NOTES
1. Direct Supply, Inc. was deemed non-responsive due to not including required documents.
2. Medline Industries, Inc.'s Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
    a. NO. 2, when multiplied, ($0.95 x 2,160 = $1,922.40), resulted in a decrease of $2.40.
    b. NO. 3, when multiplied, ($3.31 x 480 = $1,588.80), resulted in a decrease of $1.92.
    c. NO. 5, when multiplied, ($9.05 x 2,350 = $21,267.50), resulted in an increase of $11.75.
    d. NO. 6, when multiplied, ($4.64 x 216 = $1,002.24), resulted in a decrease of $0.54.
    e. NO. 7, when multiplied, ($12.69 x 280 = $3,553.20), resulted in a decrease of $1.17.
    f.  NO. 8, when multiplied, ($4.09 x 1,800 = $7,362.00), resulted in an increase of $7.50.
    g. NO. 9, when multiplied, ($1.35 x 17,000 = $22,950.00), resulted in a decrease of $13.60.
    h. NO. 10, when multiplied, ($0.15 x 48,000 = $7,200.00), resulted in a decrease of $118.63.
    i.  GRAND TOTAL was corrected from $77,224.15 to $72,105.14.
3. Immaculate Laundry of Albany Park, LLC's Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
    a. NO. 2, when multiplied, ($1.89 x 2,160 = $4,082.40), resulted in an increase of $0.40.
    b. GRAND TOTAL was corrected from $164,460.00 to $164,460.40.
4. Acme Supply Co., LTD's Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
    a. NO. 1, when multiplied, ($4.00 x 480 = $1.920.00) resulted in a decrease of $384.00.
    b. GRAND TOTAL was corrected from $33,414.00 to $33,030.00.
5. Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.'s Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
    a. NO. 4, when multiplied, ($6.95 x 420 = $2,919.00), resulted in a decrease of $19,000.00.
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