Section |I: Contact Information

Please complete the contact information below.

BiD PRICING FORM

BID NUMBER: 26-026-DCC

COMPANY NAME: Professional Medical & Surgical Supply, Inc,
CONTACT PERSON: Alan Ferry

CONTACT EMAIL:

alanf@promedsupply.com

Section ll: Pricing

Quantities listed are estimates and are intended for canvassing purposes only. For items without a listed MANUFACTURER or ITEM ID, bidders shall
furnish this information. All goods shall be shipped F.O.B. Destination.

NO. | ITEM MANUFACTURER ITEM ID uom | QTY PRICE EXJSE%ED
SECTION 1 — ENTERAL SUPPLIES
1 Adapter for Spike Set 774655 (600-VEDO0O1) Vesco ENT-CED-12163246 | EA 180 | $0.30 $54.00
Feeding Bag Container E-Pump
2 30/CS (150-773656) Kendall ENT-KEN-73656 CS 2 $ 115.00 $ 230.00
3 | Feeding Bag Container E-Pump (150-773656-EA) Kendall ENT-KEN-773656 EA 91 $3.83 $348.53
4 G-Tube 14FR w/5cc Balloon (500-GT14) Novartis ENT-NES-087414 EA 26 $23.50 $611.00
§ | G-Tube 16FR w/15cc Balloon (500-GT16) Novartis ENT-NES-087416 | EA | 3 | $2350 $70.50
6 G-Tube 18FR w/15cc Balloon  (500-GT18) Navartis ENT-NES-087418 EA 4 $23.50 $94 .00
7 G-Tube 22FR w/15cc Balloon  (500-GT22) Novartis ENT-NES-087422 EA 4 $2350 $94 .00
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NO.

ITEM

MANUFACTURER

ITEMID

UoMm

QTY

PRICE

EXTENDED

PRICE
8 | Kangaroo safety screw pouch (150.775650t-ea) Cardinal 775659 BX 3 $106.20 $318.60
9 Spike Set for E-Pump (150-775659t-ea) Kendall ENT-KEN-774655 EA | 2,195 | $3.54 $7.770.30
10 | Spike Set for E-Pump (150-7756591-ea) Kendall ENT-KEN-775659 EA | 750 | $3.54 $2,655.00
11 Syringe, 60cc Catheter Tip Piston (500-560141) Amsino ENT-PRO-PC700 EA 4310 | $0.60 $2,586.00
12 | Tube Anchor Device (HOL9780-EA) Hollister ENT-HOL-9780 EA 7 $7.10 $49.70
SECTION 1- SUBTOTAL | $14 881.63
SECTION 2 - OSTOMY SUPPLIES
13 ?gg;t( Barier Rings 13/16° 20 MM el Hollister OST-HOL-7805 | BX | 2 | $,5 9 S
14 g?}f%acs}f Barrier (HOL14603) Holister 14503 EA | 2 |S$590 $11.80
15 | Convatec Barrier (CVT4131-61) Convatec 413161 EA 1 $2.364 $2.364
16 | Convatec Barrier (CVT1252-59) Convatec 125259 EA 1 $2.099 $2.099
17 | Convatec Pouch (CVT4019-34) Convatec 401934 EA 2 $1.27 $2.54
18 | Convatec Pouch (CVT1252-61) Convatec 125261 EA 1 $2.099 $2.099
19 | Eakin Cohesive Seal Small 2°  (cvT8390-02) Convatec OST-CON-839002 EA 302 | $3.488 $1,053.38
20 | Hollister Drain/Tube Attachment DeVice(HOL978 0-EA) Hollister $780 EA 1 $7.10 $7.10
21 | Hollister Pouch (HOL8450) Hollister 8450 EA 1 $3.45 $3.45
22 | Hollister Pouch (HOL18113) Hollister 18113 EA 2 $1.75 $3.50
23 | Hollister Pouch (HOL18013) Hollister 18013 EA 1 $5.50 $550
24 | Ostomy Pouch, 1-1/2" 1 PC Closed w/Filter Convatec OST-CON-175771 BX 3 $NO BID $NO BID
25 | Ostomy Clamp-Repl (CVT1756-35) Convatec OST-CON-175635 EA 5 $1.174 $587
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NO. | ITEM MANUFACTURER ITEMID uom | ary PRICE R
26 | Paste Skin Barrier Tube (HOL79300) Hollister OST-HOL-79300 EA 4 $6.22 $24.88
27 | Pouch 1" Urostomy Convex Barrier Hollister OST-HOL-8484 B8X 1 $ $
(HOL8484) 23.50 23.50
28 ?S/UBC)?' 2-1/4" Drainable (CVT4015-13) Convatec OST-CON-401513 BX 1 $ 12.16 $1216
29 | Pouch, 2-3/4" Drainable wiFilter (HOL3804) Hollister QST-HOL-3804 BX 3 $50.74 $152.22
30 | Pouch, 2-3/4" Closed End wiFilter (CVT4015-28) Convatec OST-CON-401528 BX 20 $75.00 $1,500.00
Pouch, 2-3/4" Surfit Natura
Pouch, 2-3/4" Urostomy w/Accuseal Tap
32 | WwValve (CVT4015-46) Convatec OST-CON-401546 BX 17 | $18.15 $ 30855
Pouch, 2-3/8" Esteem Synergy
33 60/BX (CVT4092-84) Convatec OST-CON-409284 BX 1 $ 56.43 $ 56.43
Pouch, Drainable %" — 2-1/4"
34 1 108X (CvTo227.71)|  Convatec OST-CON-022771 | BX | 46 | $54 43 5112378
35 | Pouch, Drainable 7/8 w/Convex Bar{rll_{ecr) L8511) Hollister OST-HOL-8511 BX 3 $ 20.95 $ 62 85
Pouch, Drainable Mini Pouch, EX Wear Cut .
Pouch, 2 %"Drainable New Image 2 PC Beige .
37 10/BX (HOL18104) Hollister OST-HOL-18104 BX 2 $ 15.75 $ 31.50
Powder, Stomahesive Protective Powder
38 102 (CVT0255-10) Convatec OST-CON-025510 BTL 1 $4.39 $4'39
39 | Wafer 2-3/4" FlexWEar (HOL3724) Hollister OST-HOL-3724 BX 47 $35.00 $1.645.00
40 | wafer 2-3/4" Stomahesive Skin Barriei CVT4015.77) Convatec OST-CON-401577 BX 15 ) $16.26 $243.90
41 | Wafer, 2-1/4" Durahesive Flexible Skin Barr}?\n, 411 89}9{}“‘3‘3 OST-CON-411804 BX 3 $22.45 $67.35
42 | Wafer 2-3/4" Durahesive Flexible Skin Barri{éw 4131 -aqu)r;vatec OST-CON-413163 BX 2 $23.64 $47.28
43 | Wafer 2-3/4” Stomahesive Skin Barriqbv-l-1252 65) Convatec OST-CON-125266 BX 6 $20.99 $125.94
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NO. |ITEM MANUFACTURER ITEM ID uom | aty PRICE 2l
PRICE
fer 2-3/8" Est
aq | YHEIEr Steem SYNEMSY  cvTaosa.sey|  Convatec OST-CON-405458 | BX | 1 | $ 2181 $ 2181
45 | Wafer Esteem 1PC — Stomahesive 3/8" - ?CVT 4165HJ8)Convatec OST-CON-416908 BX 15 $38.06 $570.90
46 | pioundFistula Pouch 47x:3 Convatec SUP-CON-839221 |PKG | 3 | $NOBID $NO BID
SECTION 2 - SUBTOTAL 7.401.64
SECTION 3 - TRACHEOSTOMY SUPPLIES
47 | Convatec Esteem Synergy Convatec 409284 EA 1 $NO BID SNO BID
Shile .
48 15 MKA Cap (109-CAP) Shlley EA 2 $ 6.95 $ 13.90
49 | Trach Clean & Care Tray-AirLife (500-TKIT-2C) Amsino TRA-CRF-3T4691 EA (2840 $200 $5,680.00
50 | grocn Tube Cuft (109-4DCT) Shiley Shiley 4DCT EA | 5 | s2250 $112.50
51 Igégg el (109-4DCFS) Shiley TRA-SHI4DCFS | EA | 5 | $56.00 $ 280.00
Trach Tube Shile :
52 | 4 oeN y (109-4CFN) Shiley TRA-SHI4CFN EA | 15 | $2050 $ 442.50
53 grg';';f”be Shiky (109-6CFN) Shiley TRA-SHI-6CFN | EA | 2 | $22.50 $ 45.00
Trach Tube
54 |ges 502060 EA 5 $ NOBID $ NOBID
Trach Tube
55 | gie7 503070 EA 1 $ NO BID $ NOBID
Trach/Laryn Tube .
5 | 8 Non-Cuffed (109-8CFS) Shiley TRA-SHI-8CFS EA 4 ¥ 68.50 $274.00
57 | Trach/Laryn Tube Non-Cuffed (109-4CFS) Shiley TRA-SHI-4CFS EA 13 | $68.50 $890.50
58 | Trach/Laryn Tube Non-Cuffed {109-6CFS) Shiley TRA-SHI-6CFS EA 1" $68.50 $753.50
59 | Tracheostomy Disposable Inner Cannula (109 4pycy  Shiley TRA-SHI-4DIC BX 10 | $3.25 $32.50
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NO. | ITEM MANUFACTURER ITEM ID uom | QTY PRICE i
SECTION 3 - SUBTOTAL | g 04 40
SECTION 4 - UROLOGICAL SUPPLIES
6o | San Sticone S ratom Trey Bardia URO-BAR-802016 | EA | 21 | $ NOBID $NO BID
el ?g tI?re t1(2;(:';0!3,9)( Free (500-FC16058) Amsino lil)JYRNOD.nDS%}.z EA | 41 | %300 $123.00
62 | 15 Fr30cc Latex Free  (500-FC18308) Amsino 170630180 EA | 9 13300 $27.00
63 ggﬂfj‘% nf;ﬁe'"a' Seif Adhering L(goo-Ecm) Bard URO-RCH-33101 | EA | 120 | $449 N
64 | (apeter-Coude Tip-Latex Free U'et(grgg_e 16) Mentor URO-COL-816 | EA | 30 | $,, 0 $65.00
65 | Satheter-Coude Tip-Latex U'et“'a('BU o10116) Bardia URO-BAR-010116 | EA | 39 | $5 $902.80
65 | {atheter Foley (500-FC1430) Kendall URO-KEN-624149 | EA | 10 | $0.82 $ 8.20
67 | Saneter-Foley (500-FC1405) Kendall URO-KEN-3558 | EA | 18 | $ 0.82 $14.76
68 fgftrhgsizFOIey (500-FC1630) Kendall URO-KEN-3601 EA 3 $0.82 $2 46
69 fg;’:etsfc"':mey (500-FC1605) Kendall URO-KEN-3560 | EA | 192 | §0.82 $ 157 .44
70 | VahsterFoley (500-FC1830) Kendall URO-KEN-3607 | EA | 15 | $ 0.82 $ 12.30
79 | SEneter-Foley (500-FC1805) Kendall URO-KEN-3563 | EA | 91 | $qg2 $ 74.62
72 | SEheler-Foley (500-FC2030) Kendall URO-KEN-3611 | EA | 60 | $0.82 $49.20
73 | Seineter-Foley (500-FC2005) Kendall URO-KEN-3565 | EA | 57 | $0.82 $46.74
74 | SEnSerFoley (500-FC2230) Kendall URO-KEN-3614 | EA | 71 | $0.82 $58.22
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EXTENDED

NO. | ITEM MANUFACTURER ITEM ID UOM | QTY PRICE PRICE
Catheter-Fole

5 | prsee (500-FC2205) Kendall URO-KEN-3567 | EA | 68 | $0.82 $55.76
Catheter-Foley

78 | 2afr 30ec (500-FC2430) Kendall URO-KEN-3618 EA 14 | $0.82 $11.48

77 gfftrhgf:‘é’“'ey (500-FC2405) Kendall URO-KEN-3570 | EA | 48 | $0.82 $39.36
Catheter-Fole

78 | 2t 30ce (500-FC2630) Kendall URO-KEN-3619 | EA | 6 | $0.82 $4.92

79 | Satneter-Foley (500-FC2605) Kendall URO-KEN-3573 | EA | 7 | $0.82 $5.74
Catheter-Fole

80 | Jafr 30cc y (500-FC2830) Kendall URO-KEN-3623 EA 8 $ 0.82 $6.56
Catheter-Foley URG-MDL-

81 | 18fr Scc Latex Free (500-FC1805S) DYND11503 EA | 10 | $3.00 $ 30.00
Cath-Straight Tip

82 | {4tr 16" Intm Silicone (028-414) URO-COL-414 EA | 540 | $ 78333 $ 423.00
Coude Tip Urinary Catheter URO-MDL-

83 | 1anr (500-UC14C) DYND11214 EA | 5 | 3090 $4.50
Coude Tip Urinary Catheter URO-MDL-

84 | 161r (500-UC16C) pynD11216H | A | 35 | $o90 $31.50
Coude Tip Urinary Catheter URO-MDL-

85 | 181 (500-UC18C) pynD11218H | FA | 28 | So.90 $23.40

86 | External Male Freedom Cath-Large (028-8400) URO-COL-8400 EA | 517 | $1.05 $542 85

87 | External Male Freedom Cath-Med (028-8205) URO-COL-8205 EA 30 $1.05 $31.50

88 | External Male Freedom Cath-Medium (5556200 URO-MEN-6200 EA 537 | $1.45 $778.65

89 | External Male Freedom Cath-Small  (028-8200) URO-COL-8200 EA | 813 | $1.45 $1,178.85

90 | External Male Freedom Cath-Small (028-6130-EA) URO-MEN-6130 EA 335 | $1.45 $485 75

91 | Foley Insertion Tray (500-CKIT) URQO-AMS-AS890 EA | 880 | $2.50 $2200.00

92 | goaSypse Gravity Drainage Bag 504, B70) URO-URE-TC600L | EA | 4 | $165 o

93 | Urinary 18" Extension Drain Tubing(500-LBET-18) Kendall URO-KEN-731900 EA 11 $1.00 $11.00
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EXTENDED

NO. | ITEM MANUFACTURER ITEM ID uom | Qry PRICE ORI
94 | Urinary Cath Leg Strap-Posey (HOLS343) Posey URO-POS-8143 EA | 158 | $3.50 $553.00
95 | Urinary Cath-Secure Anchor Device URO-MCI-5445-9 BX 10 $NO BID SNO BID
96 ggﬁ%ﬂf’ai" Bag Antirflx  500-DBAG-2L) URO-AMS-AS312 | EA |15281( $250 $ 3,820.00
o7 | sonany Leg Bag (500-LB20) URO-AMS-AS306N | EA | 15 |5, o $ 24.75
98 %g%% teg / Abdomen Bag (500-LB30) URO-MDI-87004 | EA | 4 | $, ~p $6.60
SECTION 4 - SUBTOTAL | $ 14 472 ¢
SECTION 5 - ENTERAL FEEDING FORMULAS
g9 | Casure Clear Apple (154-64903)|  Abbott-Ross CS | 72 | $,5899 $2,081.52
100 | Canpor el e (154-64900)[  Abbott-Ross CS | 180 [ S8 g1 $5,203.80
101 gl‘u:esmoaz Shake w/Carb Steady Va(r:i;l:-s?801) Abbott-Ross cs | 144 | _ 5 9.208.80
L g:lﬁeé?ag ML RTH Boties (154-62671)|  Abbott-Ross CS | 25 | %5725 $1.431.25
TN oo (154-62677)|  Abbott-Ross CS | 10 | $5989 ¥598.00
104 | gt 000 ML AT Bottes (154-62679) |  Abbott-Ross CS | 10 | % 8ooo ¥800.00
105 | 3 i?,’010'3 S (154-62682)| ~ Abbott-Ross CS | 10 | 33375 $33750
106 | 3% ?01062 LA (154-652683)|  Abbott-Ross CS | 120 | $33 75 $4,050.00
107 gexv?o:)'g ML T Botties (154-62681)|  Abbot-Ross CS | 64 | $3595 $2.480.00
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EXTENDED

NO. | ITEM MANUFACTURER ITEMID UOM | QTY PRICE PRICE
108 | Dangoz ooy Ve (154-64803)|  Abbott-Ross CS | 24 | 8692 $1.469.28
109 | T?ggaoinafkggmes (154-62701)|  Abboft-Ross €S 1 5 | %550 $262.50
110 | 51,000 ML RTH Bottes (154-64811)  Abbott-Ross CS | 1 | %4500 ¥45.00
1 ;wxf&'): ML AT Bottles (154-68048)  Abbott-Ross CS | 12 | 34500 $780.00
Ui gin;?clnict)% S (154-62696)|  Abbott-Ross CS | 1 | 85750 ¥57.50
113 | Gx1000 ML R Botties  (154-62607)|  Abbott-Ross Cs | 4 | S5 $230.00
(7 Pl e S (154-62699)|  Abbott-Ross CS 1 2 | %g00 $420.00
115 g‘;tfgozdoMpLagfreg Bags (159-44146) Nestle CSs 12 | $ 60.82 $ 729.84
116 1K§t: 1F1arcr)nzs 1.4 packed (808-2030027)|  Kate Farms CS | 4 | 8,546 $ 31344
SECTION 5 - SUBTOTAL 30,198.43
GRAND TOTAL | § 72.483.61
GRAND TOTAL
(Inwords)  SEVENTY-TWO THOUSAND, FOUR HUNDRED EIGHTY-THREE DOLLARS AND SIXTY ONE CENTS
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Section lll: Catalog Pricing

During the contract period, the County may order additional products not specified in the Bid Pricing Form.

Bidder shall submit its catalog list and provide a percentage mark-up or discount for items that may be
purchased under the contract

NO. | ITEM MARK-UR o

1 Enteral Supplies 20 %
2 Ostomy Supplies 20 % W
3 Tracheostomy Supplies 20 %
4 Urological Supplies 20 %
5 Enteral Feeding Formulas 20 %

Section lli: Certification

By signing below, the Bidder agrees to provide the required goods and/or services described in the Bid
Specifications for the prices quoted on this Bid Pricing Form.

Printed Name: Alan Ferry Signature:

Title: COO Date: 5/26/2026
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DuPage County

Finance Department
Procurement Division

421 North County Farm Road
Room 3-400

Wheaton, lllinois 60187-3978

MANDATORY FORM

Section |: Contact Information

Complete the contact information below.

BID NUMBER: 26-026-DCC

COMPANY NAME: Professional Medical &n Surgical Supply, Inc.
MAIN ADDRESS: 1917 Garnet Ct

C|TY, STATE, ZIP CODE: New Lenox, lL 60451

TELPHONE NO.: 800-648-5190

BID CONTACT PERSON: |Alan Ferry

CONTACT EMAIL: alanf@promedsupply.com

Section li: Contract Administration Information

Complete the contract administration information below.

CORRESPONDENCE TO CONTRACTOR: REMIT TO CONTRACTOR:
NAME: Professional Medical & Surgical Supply, Inc, NAME: Professional Medical & Surgical Supply, Inc,
CONTACT: Alan Ferry CONTACT: Alan Ferry
ADDRESS: 11917 Garnet Ct ADDRESS: 11917 Garnet Ct
CITY, ST., ZIP: | New Lenox, IL. 60451 CITY, ST., ZIP:| New Lenox, IL. 60451
PHONE NO.:  1800-648-5190 PHONENO-: |800-648-5190
EMAIL: alanf@promedsupply.com EMAIL alanf@promedsupply.com

Rev. 1-2025



Section HI: Certification
The undersigned certifies that they are:

O The Owner or Sole 0O A Member authorized to &3 An Officer of the O A Member of the Joint
Proprietor sign on behalf of the Corporation Venture
Partnership

Herein after called the Bidder and that the members of the Partnership or Officers of the Corporation are as follows:

Terry Barnes

(President or Partner) (Vice-President or Partner)

{Secretary or Partner) (Treasurer or Partner)

Further, the undersigned declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid as principals are those named herein;
that this bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation; that he has fully examined the proposed
forms of agreement and the contract specifications for the above designated purchase, all of which are on file in the office
of the Procurement Officer, DuPage County, 421 North County Farm Road, Wheaton, Illinois 60187, and all other
documents referred to or mentioned in the contract documents, specifications and attached exhibits, including Addenda
No NA , and issued thereto.

Further, the undersigned proposes and agrees, if this bid is accepted, to provide all necessary machinery, tools, apparatus,
and other means of construction, including transportation services necessary to furnish all the materials and equipment
specified or referred te in the contract documents in the manner and time and at the price therein prescribed.

Further, the undersigned certifies and warrants that they are duly authorized to execute this certification/affidavit on behalf
of the Bidder and in accordance with the Partnership Agreement or by-laws of the Corporation, and the laws of the State of
lllinois and that this Certification is binding upon the Bidder and is true and accurate.

Further, the undersigned certifies that the Bidder is not barred from bidding on this contract as a result of a violation of either
Chapter 720 lllinois Compiled Statutes 5/33 E-3 or 5/33 E-4, bid rigging or bid-rotating, or as a result of a violation of 820
ILCS 130/1 et seq., the lllincis Prevailing Wage Act.

The undersigned certifies that they have examined and carefully prepared this bid and have checked the same in detail
before submitting this bid, and that the statements contained herein are true and correct.

If a Corporation, the undersigned, further certifies that the recitals and resolutions attached hereto and made a part hereof
were properly adopted by the Board of Directors of the Corporation at a meeting of said Board of Directors duly called and
held and have not been repealed nor modified, and that the same remain in full force and effect. (Bidder may be requested
to provide a copy of the corporate resolution granting the individual executing the contract documents authority to do so.)

Further, the Bidder certifies that it has provided equipment, supplies, or services comparable to the items specified in this
contract to the parties listed in the reference section below and authorizes the County to verify references of business and
credit at its option.

Finally, the Bidder, if awarded the contract, agrees to do all other things required by the contract documents, and that it will
take in full payment therefore the sums set forth in the bidding schedule (subject to unit quantity adjustments based upon
actual usage).

By signing below, the Bidder agrees to the terms of this Mandatory Form and cenrtifies _that -_@ on this form is
true and correct to the best of its knowledge.

Printed Name: Alan Ferry Signature:

Title: oo Date: 5/26/2026

Rev. 1-2025





