THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

PLUMBING TOOLS AND SUPPLIES 25-004-FM
BID TABULATION

v

Royal Pipe & Supply Company

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.

e s Ml o v
SECTION 1 - PIPING, FITTING & VALVE
1 |Anvil $ 3,000.00 -70% $ 900.00 NO BID
2 |Apollo $ 6,000.00 -20% $ 4,800.00 NO BID
3 |Bell & Gossett $ 1,500.00 -30% $ 1,050.00 NO BID
4 |Black Swan $ 500.00 -36% $ 320.00 NO BID
5 |Bray $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID
6 |Bridgit: Solder $ 500.00 25% $ 625.00 NO BID
7 |Canfields: Solder $ 500.00 25% $ 625.00 NO BID
8 [Charlotte Pipe $ 2,500.00 -40% $ 1,500.00 NO BID
9 |[Clay Valve $ 1,000.00 NO BID NO BID
10 |Cooper B-Line-Strut & Hangers $ 1,500.00 -40% $ 900.00 NO BID
11 [Cresline $ 1,000.00 25% $ 1,250.00 NO BID
12 |Elkhart $ 3,000.00 -60% $ 1,200.00 -30% $ 2,100.00
13 |Fernco $ 3,000.00 -50% $ 1,500.00 -30% $ 2,100.00
14 |Flowsafe: Solder $ 500.00 25% $ 625.00 NO BID
15 |Grinnell $ 500.00 -50% $ 250.00 NO BID
16 |George Fisher $ 1,500.00 -40% $ 900.00 NO BID
17 |Guardian: Eyewash Station Parts $ 1,500.00 -10% $ 1,350.00 -30% $ 1,050.00
18 E;f‘#ﬁfegzesrzgﬂnfo'Mega'oc $  500.00 25% $ 625.00 NO BID
19 [ldeal No Hub Bands $ 2,000.00 -50% $ 1,000.00 NO BID
20 [Jr Smith $ 2,000.00 -40% $ 1,200.00 -30% $ 1,400.00
21 [Jw Harris $ 600.00 25% $ 750.00 NO BID
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22 |Kennedy $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID

23 |Laco $ 500.00 -20% $ 400.00 NO BID

24 [MIFAB $ 1,000.00 -40% $ 600.00 NO BID

25 |Mueller Industries $ 4,000.00 -40% $ 2,400.00 NO BID

26 |Nibco $ 4,000.00 -36% $ 2,560.00 -30% $ 2,800.00
27 |Oatey $ 500.00 25% $ 625.00 INO BID

28 |Orion $ 1,000.00 25% $ 1,250.00 NO BID

29 |ProFlo $ 2,000.00 25% $ 2,500.00 NO BID

30 |Rectorseal $ 500.00 -20% $ 400.00 -30% $ 350.00
31 |Red & White Valves $ 1,000.00 -20% $ 800.00 NO BID

32 |Sioux Chief Manufacturing $ 500.00 -20% $ 400.00 -30% $ 350.00
33 |[Spears $ 1,500.00 -36% $ 960.00 NO BID

34 |Ta Chen $ 2,000.00 NO BID NO BID

35 |Tyler Pipe $ 4,000.00 -50% $ 2,000.00 NO BID

36 |Victavlic $ 1,000.00 25% $ 1,250.00 NO BID

37 [Viega $ 5,000.00 -40% $ 3,000.00 -30% $ 3,500.00
38 [Wade $ 1,000.00 -40% $ 600.00 NO BID

39 |Watts $ 3,000.00 -32% $ 2,040.00 -30% $ 2,100.00
40 |Wolverine Brass $ 2,000.00 NO BID NO BID

41  |Woodford $ 1,500.00 -20% $ 1,200.00 NO BID

42 |Zurn $ 800.00 -40% $ 480.00 -30% $ 560.00

SECTION 2 - FIXTURES, TOOLS & PARTS
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43 |Acorn Fixtures $ 3,000.00 25% $ 3,750.00 -30% $ 2,100.00
44 |Acorn Parts $ 4,500.00 25% $ 5,625.00 -30% $ 3,150.00
45 |American Specialties Fixtures $ 250.00 -10% $ 225.00 NO BID
46 |American Specialties Parts $ 250.00 -10% $ 225.00 NO BID
47 |American Standard Fixtures $ 2,000.00 -32% $ 1,360.00 NO BID
48 |American Standard Parts $ 2,000.00 -32% $ 1,360.00 -30% $ 1,400.00
49 |Apollo Parts $ 6,000.00 -20% $ 4,800.00 NO BID
50 |Bemis Fixtures $ 500.00 -32% $ 340.00 -30% $ 350.00
51 [Bemis Parts $ 500.00 -32% $ 340.00 NO BID
52 [Bradley Fixtures $ 500.00 25% $ 625.00 -30% $ 350.00
53 ([Bradley Parts $ 500.00 25% $ 625.00 -30% $ 350.00
54 ([Brass Craft Parts $ 3,000.00 -40% $ 1,800.00 NO BID
55 |Chicago Faucet Fixtures $ 2,000.00 -40% $ 1,200.00 -30% $ 1,400.00
56 |Chicago Faucet Parts $ 2,000.00 -40% $ 1,200.00 -30% $ 1,400.00
57 |Crane Fixtures $ 500.00 NO BID NO BID
58 [Crane Parts $ 500.00 25% $ 625.00 NO BID
59 |Eljer Fixtures $ 1,000.00 -20% $ 800.00 NO BID
60 [(Eljer Parts $ 1,000.00 -20% $ 800.00 NO BID
61 |[Elkhart Parts $ 1,000.00 -40% $ 600.00 -30% $ 700.00
62 |Elkay Fixtures $ 1,000.00 -32% $ 680.00 -30% $ 700.00
63 |Elkay Parts $ 1,000.00 -32% $ 680.00 -30% $ 700.00
64 |[Gerber Parts $ 1,000.00 -32% $ 680.00 -30% $ 700.00
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65 |Gerber Fixtures $ 1,000.00 -36% $ 640.00 -30% $ 700.00
66 |Harvey Parts $ 1,000.00 25% $ 1,250.00 NO BID

67 |Haws Fixtures $ 500.00 -10% $ 450.00 NO BID

68 |Haws Parts $ 500.00 -10% $ 450.00 -30% $ 350.00
69 |Josam Fixtures $ 500.00 -40% $ 300.00 -30% $ 350.00
70 [Josam Parts $ 500.00 -20% $ 400.00 NO BID

71 |Kohler Fixtures $ 750.00 -25% $ 562.50 NO BID

72 |Kohler Parts $ 750.00 -25% $ 562.50 -30% $ 525.00
73 [Leonard Parts $ 1,000.00 -10% $ 900.00 -30% $ 700.00
74 [Metcraft Fixtures $ 1,000.00 25% $ 1,250.00 NO BID

75 |Metcraft Parts $ 1,000.00 25% $ 1,250.00 -30% $ 700.00
76 |Moen Fixtures $ 2,000.00 -36% $ 1,280.00 -30% $ 1,400.00
77 |Moen Parts $ 2,000.00 -36% $ 1,280.00 -30% $ 1,400.00
78 [Oasis Fixtures $ 750.00 -20% $ 600.00 -30% $ 525.00
79 [Oasis Parts $ 750.00 -20% $ 600.00 -30% $ 525.00
80 |Powers Fixtures $ 1,500.00 -10% $ 1,350.00 -30% $ 1,050.00
81 [Powers Parts $ 1,500.00 -10% $ 1,350.00 -30% $ 1,050.00
82 |Pro Flo Parts $ 2,000.00 25% $ 2,500.00 NO BID

83 [Richards Specialty Tools $ 750.00 -25% $ 562.50 NO BID

84 |Ridgid Tools $ 2,000.00 -10% $ 1,800.00 -30% $ 1,400.00
85 [Sloan Fixtures $ 5,000.00 -40% $ 3,000.00 -30% $ 3,500.00
86 [Sloan Parts $ 5,000.00 -40% $ 3,000.00 -30% $ 3,500.00




THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
PLUMBING TOOLS AND SUPPLIES 25-004-FM
BID TABULATION

v

Royal Pipe & Supply Company

Best Plumbing Specialties, Inc.

TR s sl e M
87 |Speakman Fixtures $ 500.00 -10% 450.00 -30% $ 350.00
88 [Speakman Parts $ 500.00 -10% 450.00 -30% $ 350.00
89 [Symmons Fixtures $ 500.00 -20% 400.00 -30% $ 350.00
90 |Symmons Parts $ 500.00 -20% 400.00 -30% $ 350.00
91 |T & S Fixtures $ 1,500.00 -40% 900.00 -30% $ 1,050.00
92 [T & S Parts $ 1,500.00 -40% 900.00 -30% $ 1,050.00
93 [Viega $ 10,000.00 -40% 6,000.00 -30% $ 7,000.00
94 |Watts $ 4,000.00 -36% 2,560.00 -30% $ 2,800.00
95 |Willoughby Fixtures $ 6,000.00 25% 7,500.00 NO BID
96 [Willoughby Parts $ 6,000.00 25% 7,500.00 -30% $ 4,200.00
97 |Zurn Fixtures $ 1,000.00 -32% 680.00 -30% $ 700.00
98 |Zurn Parts $ 1,000.00 -32% 680.00 -30% $ 700.00

SECTION 3 - RPZ REPAIR PARTS & GREASE
99 |Ames - RPZ Parts $3,500.00 -25% 2,625.00 NO BID
100 |Aqua Flow Lubricants - RPZ $500.00 NO BID NO BID
101 |Febco - RPZ Parts $3,000.00 -25% 2,250.00 NO BID
102 |Watts - RPZ Parts $5,000.00 -30% 3,500.00 -30% $ 3,500.00
103 [Zurn/Wilkins - RPZ Parts $2,500.00 -25% 1,875.00 NO BID

SECTION 4 - REPLACEMENT PUMPS & WATER HEATERS
104 [A.O. Smith $ 1,000.00 -20% 800.00 NO BID
105 |Bell & Gossett Circulating Pumps $ 1,500.00 -30% 1,050.00 NO BID
106 (Bradford White $ 1,000.00 -20% 800.00 NO BID
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107 [Hydromatic Pump $ 8,000.00 |[NO BID NO BID
108 |Rheem $ 1,000.00 -10% $ 900.00 NO BID
109 |Zoller Pump $ 3,000.00 -36% $ 1,920.00 NO BID
SECTION 5 - COPPER PIPE & FITTINGS
110 [Type K - Hard & Soft Pipe $ 1,000.00 -45% $ 550.00 NO BID
111 [Type K - Hard & Soft Fittings $ 1,000.00 -60% $ 400.00 NO BID
112 |Type L - Hard & Soft Pipe $ 4,000.00 -45% $ 2,200.00 NO BID
113 |Type L - Hard & Soft Fittings $ 4,000.00 -60% $ 1,600.00 NO BID
114 [Type M - Hard & Soft Pipe $ 250.00 -45% $ 137.50 NO BID
115 [Type M - Hard & Soft Fittings $ 250.00 -60% $ 100.00 NO BID
116 \L’;gzrpsrf;zsrffc Fitings $  6,000.00 -40% $  3,600.00 NO BID
SECTION 6 - PVC PIPE & FITTINGS
117 |Schedule 40 - Pipe $ 500.00 -50% $ 250.00 NO BID
118 |Schedule 40 Fittings $ 500.00 -70% $ 150.00 NO BID
119 |Schedule 80 - Pipe $ 1,250.00 -50% $ 625.00 NO BID
120 |Schedule 80 - Fittings $ 1,250.00 -70% $ 375.00 NO BID
SECTION 7 - CAST IRON
121 |No Hub Pipe $ 1,500.00 -50% $ 750.00 NO BID
122 |No Hub Fittings $ 1,500.00 -50% $ 750.00 NO BID
SECTION 8 - BLACK IRON PIPE & FITTINGS
123 |Schedule 40 - Pipe $ 500.00 -50% $ 250.00 NO BID
124 |Schedule 40 Fittings $ 500.00 -60% $ 200.00 NO BID
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125 |Schedule 80 - Pipe $ 1,500.00 -50% $ 750.00 NO BID
126 |Schedule 80 - Fittings $ 1,500.00 -50% $ 750.00 NO BID
SECTION 9 - BRASS
127 |Pipe $ 500.00 -10% $ 450.00 NO BID
128 [Nipples $ 2,500.00 -80% $ 500.00 NO BID
129 (Fittings $ 1,500.00 -60% $ 600.00 NO BID
GRAND TOTAL| $ 157,640.00 $ 69,685.00
NOTES
;égzsggil)%r.nbing Specialties, Inc. provided 30% off catalog price listing for selected items. Grand Total corrected from $163,911.83 to

2. Global Equipment Company Inc. has been deemed non responsive for not providing required documentation.

Bid Opening 1/23/2025 @ 2:30 PM HK, BR
Invitations Sent 20
Total Vendors Requesting Documents 1
Total Bid Responses 3




