



Ozinga Ready Mix, Inc.															
Vendor Plant Site		CA 6 Crushed Stone	CA 7 Crushed Stone	FA 1 Sand	FA 5 Limestone Screenings	FA 6 Birdseye/Tren ch Backfill (Sand)	Stone Rip Rap-Class A1	Stone Rip Rap-Class A3	Stone Rip Rap-Class A4	Cs-01 4" Stone	CA-16 3/8 Chip Stone	Porous Granular Materials	Dumping of Asphalt Grindings	Dumping of Clean Concrete	Dumping of Broken Asphalt
	UOM	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton
Delivered to Highway Garage		\$23.21	\$31.39	\$37.14	\$17.39	\$28.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.81	\$39.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Location 1 - Lincolnshire		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.77	No Charge	\$9.77

[illegible]

E.D. Shands LLC															
Vendor Plant Site		CA 6 Crushed Stone	CA 7 Crushed Stone	FA 1 Sand	FA 5 Limestone Screenings	FA 6 Birdseye/Tren ch Backfill (Sand)	Stone Rip Rap-Class A1	Stone Rip Rap-Class A3	Stone Rip Rap-Class A4	Cs-01 4" Stone	CA-16 3/8 Chip Stone	Porous Granular Materials	Dumping of Asphalt Grindings	Dumping of Clean Concrete	Dumping of Broken Asphalt
	UOM	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton	Ton
Delivered to Highway Garage		\$22.98	\$30.50	\$32.00	\$21.00	\$22.25	\$20.00	\$52.50	\$56.00	\$29.00	\$32.00	No Bid	\$16.25	\$15.00	\$19.75

[illegible]

Delivered to Highway Garage		\$23.95	\$31.60	\$33.20	\$21.92	\$22.51	\$20.90	\$53.38	\$56.68	\$29.10	\$33.08	No Bid	\$17.50	\$16.25	\$20.00
-----------------------------	--	---------	---------	---------	---------	---------	---------	---------	---------	---------	---------	--------	---------	---------	---------

NOTES

Bid Opening 3/13/23 @ 2:30 P.M.	DW, NE
Invitations Sent	54
Total Bidders Requesting Documents	1
Total Bid Responses Received	4