



THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
ZYMO PUMP RENTAL 21-048-CARE
QUOTE TABULATION

					Wolf Medical Supply					Zymo Solutions LLC					Infusystem					Omni Medical				Serinity Medical				
NO	ITEM	UOM	QTY	TERM	PURCHASE PRICE	DAILY RATE	MONTHLY RATE	YEARLY RATE	EXTENDED PRICE	PURCHASE PRICE	DAILY RATE	MONTHLY RATE	YEARLY RATE	EXTENDED PRICE	PURCHASE PRICE	DAILY RATE	MONTHLY RATE	YEARLY RATE	EXTENDED PRICE	PURCHASE PRICE	DAILY RATE	MONTHLY RATE	YEARLY RATE	PURCHASE PRICE	DAILY RATE	MONTHLY RATE	YEARLY RATE	
Section 1																												
1	Zymo Pole Mounted Pump Fusion Pump System	MO	12	LEASE		\$ 1.81	\$ 55.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 7,920.00		No Bid	\$ 75.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 9,600.00		\$ 2.50	\$ 75.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 10,800.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
2	Zymo Pole Mounted Pump Fusion Pump System	EA	1	PURCHASE	\$ 2,025.00					\$ 1,760.00					\$ 1,950.00						\$ 2,100.00				\$ 2,750.00			No Bid
3	Zymo 40" Secondary Administration Set (50/box)	BX	12	PURCHASE	\$ 56.81				\$ 681.72	No Bid					\$ 38.00				\$ 456.00	\$ 43.50				\$ 99.00				
4	Zymo 105" Primary Administration Set (50/box)	BX	12	PURCHASE	\$ 209.92				\$ 2,519.04	No Bid					\$ 152.00				\$ 1,824.00	\$ 60.00				\$ 175.00				

Section 2																												
1	Additional Product Line Supplementals Discount (-) or Mark-Up (+)					0%				0%					15%					0%								-5%

NOTES
1. The daily rate is same for monthly rate and yearly rate charge.

Invitations Sent	8
Total Vendors Requesting Documents	0
Total Bid Responses	0