THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS 26-021-DOT

BID TABULATION

v

Superior
Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC Asphalt

Materials, LLC
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

NO. |ITEM UOM| QTY DELIVERED LOCATION1 LOCATION 2 | LOCATION 3 | LOCATION 1

SECTION B - COARSE AND FINE AGGREGATES

1 |CA-6 Crushed Stone TON| 1 |$ 22,78 | $ 1550 | $ 15.50 NO BID $ 9.95
2 |CA-7 Crushed Stone TON| 1 | $ 30.28 | $ 23.00( $ 25.00 NO BID NO BID
3 |FA-1 Sand TON| 1 | $ 38.92 NO BID NO BID $ 29.00 NO BID
4  |FA-5 Limestone Screenings TON| 1 [ $ 16.50 NO BID $ 10.25 NO BID NO BID
5 |FA-6 Sand TON| 1 | $ 19.28( $ 12.00| $ 12.00 NO BID NO BID
6 |Stone Rip Rap-Class Al TON| 1 | $ 38.45 NO BID $ 32.20 NO BID NO BID
7 |Stone Rip Rap-Class A3 TON| 1 | $ 59.78 $ 51.00| $ 52.00 NO BID NO BID
8 |Stone Rip Rap-Class A4 TON| 1 | $ 63.50 NO BID $ 55.00 NO BID NO BID
9 |CS-01 4" Stone TON| 1 | $ 2450| $ 20.05( $ 18.25 NO BID NO BID
10 |[CA-16 3/8” Chip Stone TON| 1 | $ 4453 $ 37.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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