THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT

SIGN SHOP SUPPLIES 25-113-DOT
BID TABULATION
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Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EINCDEED PRICE EX;EINCDEED PRICE EX;EINCDEED PRICE EX;EINCDEED PRICE EX;EINCDEED PRICE EX;EII\‘CDEED
Section 1 - Signposts and Materials

1 (12 Gauge 1-1/2" X 1-1/2" X 1’ Length EA 1 8.28( $ 8.28 351 % 351 $ 5.09( $ 5.09 NO BID $ 7.00| $ 7.00 NO BID
2 12 Gauge 1-3/4” X 1-3/4” X 8’ Length EA 1 3341 $ 33.41 2531 $ 2531 $ 3555 $ 35.55 NO BID $ 29.00| $ 29.00 NO BID
3 |12 Gauge 1-3/4” X 1-3/4" X 10’ Length EA |1,000 35.95| $ 35,950.00 34.73| $ 34,730.00| $ 4444 $ 44,440.00 NO BID $ 36.00| $ 36,000.00 NO BID
4 |12 Gauge 1-3/4” X 1-3/4” X 11’ Length EA 1 43.08( $ 43.08 3480 $ 34.80| $ 48.99( $ 48.99 NO BID $ 40.00( $ 40.00 NO BID
5 |12 Gauge 2" X 2", 3' 6” X 42" Length EA |1,000 17.98| $ 17,980.00 15.12| $ 15,120.00( $ 17.61| $ 17,610.00 NO BID $ 16.17| $ 16,170.00 NO BID
6 12 Gauge 2" X 2" X 6’ Length EA | 500 27.98| $ 13,990.00 25.63| $ 12,815.00| $ 32.34| $ 16,170.00 NO BID $ 28.00| $ 14,000.00 NO BID
7 ?;g{‘gf;é;;? gn;i/‘(‘;;tlgﬂfggi;e; ostfor | ga | 250 NO BID 11.43| $ 285750 $ 463 $ 1,157.50 NO BID $ 500 $  1,250.00 NO BID
8 E;iiz)Away Coupler - 1-3/4" Square Posts (#BOS| gx | NO BID 63.44| $ 63.44| $ 23.17| $ 23.17 NO BID $ 15000 $  150.00 NO BID
9 |Fasteners — Steel Drive Rivet EA | 1,500 NO BID 0.44| $ 660.00| $ 0.29( $ 435.00 NO BID $ 0.65( $ 975.00 NO BID
10 |Unistrut Stabilization Anchor Sleeve EA 1 NO BID 14.32( $ 14.32| $ 13.58| $ 13.58 NO BID $ 75.00( $ 75.00 NO BID
Section 1 Total $ 68,004.77 $ 66,323.88 $ 79,938.88 NO BID $ 68,696.00 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED
Section 2 - Signpost Reflectors
Category 1 - Signpost Reflectors
1 |BriteSide® BSF Red Panels EA | 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4218 | $ 10,545.00| $ 45.00 | $ 11,250.00 NO BID
2 |BriteSide® BSF Fluorescent Yellow Panels EA | 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4551 | $ 11,377.50| $ 45.00 | $ 11,250.00 NO BID
3 BriteSide® BSF Fluorescent Yellow Green Panels| EA | 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 4551 $ 11,377.50| $ 45.00 | $ 11,250.00 NO BID
Category 2 - Linear Delineation Panels
4 )';Eisjnse‘hfwsv %“g;:a'r‘tgfar Delineation Panels 317 g |4 NO BID NO BID $ 49800 $  498.00 NO BID $  900.00| $  900.00 NO BID
5 t?ssw\?v“hllts i“é'/zﬂahg‘far Delineation Panels 31" | ¢ | 4 NO BID NO BID $  498.00|$  498.00 NO BID $  900.00|$  900.00 NO BID
Section 2 Total NO BID NO BID $ 996.00 $ 33,300.00 $ 35,550.00 NO BID
Section 3 - Reflective Sheeting Rolled Goods
1 [Scotchlite™ Electro-Cut™ (EC) Film Series 1170 |[SQ FT| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1.15| $ 1.15 NO BID $ 1.13| $ 1.13 NO BID
2 |Scotchcal™ Series 7725 Vinyl Black & White SQFT 1 NO BID NO BID $ 179 $ 1.79 NO BID $ 1.53| $ 1.53 NO BID
3 fj;g‘;”idth’ 12 years warranted, Acrylic (S0-yard o6 |95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $  918.00| $ 11,016.00 NO BID
4 fg;‘;"idth' 12 years warranted, Acrylic (S0-yard 1oy | 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 68350 $  8262.00 NO BID
5 \‘mi‘t’!dth’ 12 years warranted, Vinyl Black & ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $  80550| $  3,222.00 NO BID $ 68850 $ 2,754.00 NO BID
6 SCOt(?hliteTM P_rotective Overlay Film with premask soFl 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1904 s 194 NO BID $ 175 $ 175 NO BID
- Series 1160i
7 |36” x50 yards ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $ 871.88| $  3,487.52 NO BID $ 787.50 $  3,150.00 NO BID
8 [48” x50 yards ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $ 1,16250| $  4,650.00 NO BID $ 1,050.00| $ 4,200.00 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. |ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED
9 (81?3?[;:hzligTI:reDsGs?Jrlzesffr?;ii\tli?/cszS:eS?iMngl(%%;eill;ogo SQOFT 1 NO BID NO BID $ 3.21| $ 3.21 NO BID 2.60| $ 2.60 NO BID
10 |6 x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 240.75| $ 240.75 NO BID 195.00| $ 195.00 NO BID
11 |9 x50 yards ROLL| 6 NO BID NO BID $ 316.41( $ 1,898.46 NO BID 29250 $  1,755.00 NO BID
12 |12" x 50 yards ROLL| 12 NO BID NO BID $ 481.50( $  5,778.00 NO BID 390.00( $  4,680.00 NO BID
13 |18”x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 722.25( $ 722.25 NO BID 585.00( $ 585.00 NO BID
14 |24" x 50 yards ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $ 963.00( $  3,852.00 NO BID 780.00( $  3,120.00 NO BID
15 |30” x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,203.75| $ 1,203.75 NO BID 975.00( $ 975.00 NO BID
16 36" x 50 yards ROLL| 6 NO BID NO BID $ 1,44450| $ 8,667.00 NO BID 1,170.00| $  7,020.00 NO BID
17 148" x 50 yards ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $ 1,926.00| $ 7,704.00 NO BID 1,560.00| $  6,240.00 NO BID
18 \S(Zﬁ;f;"Cier:;fg:rizguigzsgf;‘;;eg;?ive Sheeting | pqf 1 NO BID NO BID $ 281| 2.81 NO BID 2.60| $ 2.60 NO BID
19 |12"x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 42150| $ 421.50 NO BID 390.00( $ 390.00 NO BID
20 (24" x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 843.00| $ 843.00 NO BID 780.00| $ 780.00 NO BID
21 30" x50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,053.75| $ 1,053.75 NO BID 975.00( $ 975.00 NO BID
22 (36" x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,26450| $ 1,264.50 NO BID 1,170.00| $ 1,170.00 NO BID
3 gﬁzg?rllge;»; ”—0 \32:; rli:ell.slo;ce);ie(r_\l}ylzzflze;)tive SQFT 1 NO BID NO BID $ 281 $ 2.81 NO BID 2.60| $ 2.60 NO BID
24 [9" x50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 316.13| $ 316.13 NO BID 29250 $ 292.50 NO BID
25 |12" x50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 42150| $ 421.50 NO BID 390.00( $ 390.00 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED
26 |18" x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 632.25| $ 632.25 NO BID $ 585.00| $ 585.00 NO BID
27 |24" x 50 yards ROLL 1 NO BID NO BID $ 843.00( $ 843.00 NO BID $ 780.00| $ 780.00 NO BID
28 [30” x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,053.75| $ 1,053.75 NO BID $ 975.00| $ 975.00 NO BID
29 |36” x 50 yards ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $ 126450 $ 5,058.00 NO BID $ 1,170.00| $  4,680.00 NO BID
30 [48" x50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,686.00| $ 1,686.00 NO BID $ 1,560.00| $ 1,560.00 NO BID
31 gﬁzg?r']ze‘;rusigg?:sd 4%;""5"?;;'); 3(23)3 Reflective oo gl 1 NO BID NO BID $ 281| s 2.81 NO BID $ 2.60| $ 2.60 NO BID
32 [12" x50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 421.50( $ 421.50 NO BID $ 390.00| $ 390.00 NO BID
33 |24" x 50 yards SQFT 1 NO BID NO BID $ 843.00| $ 843.00 NO BID $ 780.00| $ 780.00 NO BID
34 (30" x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,053.75| $ 1,053.75 NO BID $ 975.00| $ 975.00 NO BID
35 |36” x50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 126450 $ 1,264.50 NO BID $ 1,170.00| $ 1,170.00 NO BID
s [Scohhe Damond o DS Foressent s 4 oo weo s zmls  zm|  owose |5 ze|s  zs|  nomo
37 12" x 50 yards ROLL 1 NO BID NO BID $ 436.50| $ 436.50 NO BID $ 390.00| $ 390.00 NO BID
38 [24” x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 873.00| $ 873.00 NO BID $ 780.00| $ 780.00 NO BID
39 |30” x 50 yards ROLL 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,091.25| $ 1,091.25 NO BID $ 993.75| $ 993.75 NO BID
40 (36" x 50 yards ROLL| 2 NO BID NO BID $ 1,30950| $ 2,619.00 NO BID $ 1,19250| $  2,385.00 NO BID
41 48" x 50 yards ROLL| 2 NO BID NO BID $ 1,746.00| $  3,492.00 NO BID $ 1,590.00| $ 3,180.00 NO BID
42 |Scotchlite™ Reflective Sheeting Series 1J680 CR [SQ FT| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 5.69| $ 5.69 NO BID $ 545 $ 5.45 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. |ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED
43 (36" x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 256050 $ 2,560.50 NO BID $ 245250 $ 245250 NO BID
44 148" x 50 yards ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $ 3,414.00| $ 13,656.00 NO BID $ 3,270.00| $ 13,080.00 NO BID
15 |G ety Rod i oenes 988 sQF1 1 NO BID NO BID $ 4.00| $ 4.00 NO BID $ 374 8 374 NO BID
46 [1"x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 4750| $ 47.50 NO BID $ 46.75| $ 46.75 NO BID
47 [2" x50 yards ROLL| 12 NO BID NO BID $ 98.50| $  1,182.00 NO BID $ 93.50| $  1,122.00 NO BID
48 |3"x 50 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 14250 $ 142.50 NO BID $ 14025 $ 140.25 NO BID
5 o v e £ o2 lsor 1 0B NoeD s amls  1m NosID s amls i 05D
50 |36” x 50 yards ROLL 3 NO BID NO BID $ 871.50( $ 2,614.50 NO BID $ 508.50| $ 1,525.50 NO BID
51 (48" x 50 yards ROLL| 3 NO BID NO BID $ 1,164.00( $  3,492.00 NO BID $ 678.00( $  2,034.00 NO BID
52 ggi’:sh“;:;g Sf;'g;g";g::;ﬂ”g;’;ﬁzc2er Grade |go el NO BID NO BID $ 1.19| $ 1.19 NO BID $ 113| $ 113 NO BID
53 [12” x 50 yards ROLL| 2 NO BID NO BID $ 178.50| $ 357.00 NO BID $ 169.50| $ 339.00 NO BID
54 |36” x 50 yards ROLL 4 NO BID NO BID $ 535.50( $ 2,142.00 NO BID $ 508.50| $ 2,034.00 NO BID
55 [48” x 50 yards ROLL| 4 NO BID NO BID $ 714.00( $  2,856.00 NO BID $ 672.00( $  2,688.00 NO BID
56 Eillif" Plastic Application Tape (TPM-5) for EC o e 4 NO BID NO BID $ 0.65| $ 0.65 NO BID $ 0.34| $ 0.34 NO BID
57 [9”x 100 yards ROLL| 5 NO BID NO BID $ 84.38| $ 421.90 NO BID $ 76.50| $ 382.50 NO BID
58 [12” x 100 yards ROLL| 20 NO BID NO BID $ 112.50( $ 2,250.00 NO BID $ 102.00( $ 2,040.00 NO BID
59 (18" x 100 yards ROLL| 20 NO BID NO BID $ 168.75( $  3,375.00 NO BID $ 153.00( $  3,060.00 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign

NO. |ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED
60 [24” x 100 yards ROLL| 5 NO BID NO BID $ 225.00( $ 1,125.00 NO BID 204.00( $  1,020.00 NO BID
61 i,taa,\;fisrfgfvpmisitfr? dT;CpeFi(lfnCPS—Z SCPM-3) oo pl 1 NO BID NO BID $ 036| $ 0.36 NO BID 034 $ 034 NO BID
62 |6”x 100 yards ROLL| 1 NO BID NO BID $ 108.00| $ 108.00 NO BID 51.00( $ 51.00 NO BID
63 |12"x 100 yards ROLL| 5 NO BID NO BID $ 216.00( $  1,080.00 NO BID 102.00| $ 510.00 NO BID
64 [18"x 100 yards ROLL| 5 NO BID NO BID $ 121.50| $ 607.50 NO BID 153.00| $ 765.00 NO BID
65 24" x 100 yards ROLL| 5 NO BID NO BID $ 432.00|1 $ 2,160.00 NO BID 204.00| $ 1,020.00 NO BID
Section 3 Total NO BID NO BID $ 107,324.31 NO BID $ 111,913.34 NO BID

Section 4 - Sign Faces

1 [12"x 18" Blanks EA | 100 18.00| $  1,800.00 NO BID $ 344 $ 344.00 NO BID 525 $ 525.00 NO BID
2 |12" x 18" R7-2A (No Parking) Symbol 3 Color EA | 100 20.00( $  2,000.00 NO BID $ 3.55( $ 355.00 NO BID 638 $ 638.00 NO BID
3 [12” x 18" No Motor Vehicles EA | 100 18.00| $  1,800.00 NO BID $ 355( $ 355.00 NO BID 6.38 | $ 638.00 NO BID
4 |12 x 36" Blanks EA | 200 32.00| $  6,400.00 NO BID $ 6.87| $ 1,374.00 NO BID 1050 | $  2,100.00 NO BID
5 [12"x 42" Blanks EA | 200 36.00| $  7,200.00 NO BID $ 8.02| $ 1,604.00 NO BID 12.25| $  2,450.00 NO BID
6 |18"x 24" Border Faces EA | 1 35.00( $ 35.00 NO BID $ 6.87| $ 6.87 NO BID 16.00 | $ 16.00 NO BID
7 [18"x 72" Blanks EA | 100 76.00| $  7,600.00 NO BID $ 2061 $  2,061.00 NO BID 31.50 [ $  3,150.00 NO BID
8 |24" County Route Marker (M1-6) EA | 50 45.00| $  2,250.00 NO BID $ 9.36| $ 468.00 NO BID 17.00 | $ 850.00 NO BID
9 |24" x 30" Border Faces EA | 100 48.00| $  4,800.00 NO BID $ 11.65| $ 1,165.00 NO BID 1750 | $  1,750.00 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED
10 |24" x 48" Blanks EA | 1 70.00( $ 70.00 NO BID $ 18.32| $ 18.32 NO BID 3200 $ 32.00 NO BID
11 |30" x 30" (RLMTR) EA | 50 54.00| $ 2,700.00 NO BID $ 14.31] $ 715.50 NO BID 3000 $ 1,500.00 NO BID
12 |30" x 36" Border Faces EA | 100 62.00| $ 6,200.00 NO BID $ 17.18| $ 1,718.00 NO BID 26.25| $ 2,625.00 NO BID
13 |30" x 36" Regulatory Signs EA | 100 63.00| $ 6,300.00 NO BID $ 17.18| $  1,718.00 NO BID 31.88| $ 3,188.00 NO BID
14 |36" x 36" Regulatory Signs EA | 300 74.00( $ 22,200.00 NO BID $ 20.81| $  6,243.00 NO BID 38.25| $ 11,475.00 NO BID
15 |36" x 36" Blanks EA | 1 75.00| $ 75.00 NO BID $ 2061 $ 20.61 NO BID 3150 | $ 31.50 NO BID
16 |36" x 60" Blanks EA | 1 130.00| $ 130.00 NO BID $ 34.35( $ 34.35 NO BID 5250 | $ 52.50 NO BID
17 |36 x 72" Blanks EA | 1 160.00| $ 160.00 NO BID $ 41.22| $ 41.22 NO BID 63.00 | $ 63.00 NO BID
18 |48"x 48" Blanks EA | 1 115.00| $ 115.00 NO BID $ 36.64( $ 36.64 NO BID 56.00 | $ 56.00 NO BID
19 |30” x 30” (Includes Circles and Octagon) EA | 100 60.00| $  6,000.00 NO BID $ 14.31| $ 1,431.00 NO BID 2788 | $ 2,788.00 NO BID
20 |36" x 36" (Includes Circles and Octagon) EA | 100 85.001 $ 8,500.00 NO BID $ 20.61| $ 2,061.00 NO BID 3750 | $ 3,750.00 NO BID
21 |24” x 24" (Sign Face 3 or More Colors) EA | 1 53.00| $ 53.00 NO BID $ 9.36| $ 9.36 NO BID 14.00 [ $ 14.00 NO BID
22 30" x 30” (Sign Face 3 or More Colors) EA | 100 65.00| $ 6,500.00 NO BID $ 1451 $  1,451.00 NO BID 34.00| $  3,400.00 NO BID
23 (36 x 36" (Sign Face 3 or More Colors) EA | 200 90.00( $ 18,000.00 NO BID $ 20.81| $  4,162.00 NO BID 50.00 | $ 10,000.00 NO BID
24 |12" x 24" (M1-51 END 4" Yellow/Blue with Border) | EA | 25 4500| $ 1,125.00 NO BID $ 468| $ 117.00 NO BID 850 $ 212.50 NO BID
25 éi"ré‘ef)“" (M1-51 BEGIN 4 Yellow/Blue with EA | 25 4500 $  1,125.00 NO BID $ 468/ $  117.00 NO BID 850|$ 21250 NO BID
26 |18 Stop Sign EA | 50 33.00( $ 1,650.00 NO BID $ 5.15| $ 257.50 NO BID 956 | $ 478.00 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED
27 |30” x 36” B/O Detour EA | 1 55.00( $ 55.00 NO BID $ 17.38| $ 17.38 NO BID 3825|$ 38.25 NO BID
28 |48” x 48” B/O Detour EA | 1 90.00| $ 90.00 NO BID $ 36.84| $ 36.84 NO BID 68.00 | $ 68.00 NO BID
29 |48 x 72" B/O Detour EA | 1 160.00| $ 160.00 NO BID $ 55.16| $ 55.16 NO BID 102.00 | $ 102.00 NO BID
30 ;20 é‘olri;:’V3'3 Signal Ahead Stickers (3 colors) | g5 | 109 16.00| $  1,600.00 NO BID $ 239|$  239.00 NO BID 700|$  700.00 NO BID
31 |12" x 36” Object Markers Right / Left EA | 200 34.00( $ 6,800.00 NO BID $ 6.87| $ 1,374.00 NO BID 1275 $  2,550.00 NO BID
32 |12" x 36” Blanks EA | 50 33.00| $ 1,650.00 NO BID $ 6.87| $ 343.50 NO BID 1050 | $ 525.00 NO BID
33 [12" x 42" Blanks EA | 50 37.00( $ 1,850.00 NO BID $ 8.02| $ 401.00 NO BID 1225 $ 612.50 NO BID
34 (18" x 24" Blanks EA | 1 33.00| $ 33.00 NO BID $ 6.87| $ 6.87 NO BID 1050 | $ 10.50 NO BID
35 (24" x 24" Blanks EA | 1 43.00| $ 43.00 NO BID $ 9.16| $ 9.16 NO BID 14.00 [ $ 14.00 NO BID
36 [24” x 30" Chevrons EA | 200 50.00| $ 10,000.00 NO BID $ 11.86| $  2,372.00 NO BID 21.25| $  4,250.00 NO BID
37 |24 x 48" Double & Single Arrow EA | 20 73.00( $  1,460.00 NO BID $ 18.52| $ 370.40 NO BID 34.00 | $ 680.00 NO BID
38 (30" x 36” Blanks EA | 1 63.00| $ 63.00 NO BID $ 17.18| $ 17.18 NO BID 2625 | $ 26.25 NO BID
39 (36" x 36" Border Plates & Warning Signs EA | 300 76.00| $ 22,800.00 NO BID $ 20.81| $ 6,243.00 NO BID 38.25| $ 11,475.00 NO BID
40 (36" x 60” Blanks EA | 1 132.00| $ 132.00 NO BID $ 28.63| $ 28.63 NO BID 5250 | $ 52.50 NO BID
41 36" x 72" Blanks EA | 1 164.00| $ 164.00 NO BID $ 41.22| $ 41.22 NO BID 63.00 | $ 63.00 NO BID
42 |48 x 48" Blanks EA | 1 117.00| $ 117.00 NO BID $ 36.74| $ 36.74 NO BID 56.00 | $ 56.00 NO BID
43 |18” x 18" (Includes Circles) EA | 1 46.00| $ 46.00 NO BID $ 525( $ 5.25 NO BID 788 $ 7.88 NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE Ex;gl'\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED
44 32;(’)‘55;1%2 Faces 3 ormore colors) (W3-5) | ga | 50 85.00| $  4,250.00 NO BID $ 2091 $  1,045.50 NO BID 4950 | $  2,475.00 NO BID
45 (24" x 24" (Includes Circles) EA | 10 54.00| $ 540.00 NO BID $ 9.16| $ 91.60 NO BID 17.00 [ $ 170.00 NO BID
46 [30” x 30” (Includes Circles & Text) EA | 10 65.00| $ 650.00 NO BID $ 14.41| $ 144.10 NO BID 26.56 | $ 265.60 NO BID
47 |36 x 36” (Includes Circles) EA | 10 88.00| $ 880.00 NO BID $ 20.61| $ 206.10 NO BID 38.25| $ 382.50 NO BID
48 |12" x 24" W16-7L (Arrow) EA | 25 23.00| $ 575.00 NO BID $ 488| $ 122.00 NO BID 850 | $ 212.50 NO BID
49 (12" x 24" W16-9 (Ahead) EA | 25 23.00| $ 575.00 NO BID $ 488 $ 122.00 NO BID 850 | $ 212.50 NO BID
50 (30" x 30 (R10-15) Left and Right EA | 25 56.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID $ 1431 $ 357.75 NO BID 26.56 | $ 664.00 NO BID
51 (36" x 36" (S1-1, S2-1) Series 3983 EA | 25 80.00| $  2,000.00 NO BID $ 20.81| $ 520.25 NO BID 3825 $ 956.25 NO BID
52 (24" x 48" (S4-100) Series 3983 EA 25 72.001 $ 1,800.00 NO BID $ 18.52| $ 463.00 NO BID 3400 | $ 850.00 NO BID
53 (24" x 36" (S4-102) Series 3983 EA | 25 54.00| $ 1,350.00 NO BID $ 13.74| $ 343.50 NO BID 2550 | $ 637.50 NO BID
54 |36 x 36” Series 3983 Bicycle, Ped, Ped Bike EA | 50 80.00| $  4,000.00 NO BID $ 20.61| $ 1,030.50 NO BID 3825|$ 1,912.50 NO BID
Section 4 Total $ 179,871.00 NO BID $ 43,928.00 NO BID $ 81,964.23 NO BID
Section 5 - Aluminum Sign Blanks
1 |6 x 12" Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 250 $ 2.50 3.42( $ 3.42
2 |6”x 18” Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 338 $ 3.38 512 $ 5.12
3 |6”x24” Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 450| $ 4.50 6.83| $ 6.83
4 6" x 30" Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 563 $ 5.63 8.54( $ 8.54




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED
5 |9”x 18” Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.06| $ 5.06 7.69| $ 7.69
6 |9”x 24” Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.75| $ 6.75 10.25] $ 10.25
7 |9 x 30" Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 797 $ 797.00 6.93| $ 693.00
8 |9”x 36” Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 956 | $ 956.00 8.28| $ 828.00
9 [12" x 18" Gauge 0.080 EA | 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.38$ 1,595.00 5.75| $ 1,437.50
10 |12"x 36" Gauge 0.080 (No Holes) Street Names | EA [ 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1275 $  6,375.00 11.06| $ 5,530.00
11 |12” x 36” Gauge 0.080 (Punched) EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1275 | $ 637.50 11.06| $ 553.00
12 |12” x 42" Gauge 0.080 (No Holes) Street Names | EA | 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.88 [ $  7,440.00 13.15| $  6,575.00
13 |15" x 21" Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 930 $ 9.30 14.64| $ 14.64
14 |15” X 48” Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2125 | $ 21.25 44.72| $ 44.72
15 |18 x 24" Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1275 $  1,275.00 11.06| $  1,106.00
16 |24” x 24” Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.00 [ $  1,700.00 14.75| $  1,475.00
17 iﬁ;’éf:{;)el\ff%e 0.080 (Route Marker — See EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.00 | $  1,800.00 17.87| $  1,787.00
18 |24” x 30” Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2125|$ 2,125.00 18.45| $  1,845.00
19 |24” X 36” Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2550 | $ 2,550.00 2211 $  2,211.00
20 |48” x 48” Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 68.00 | $ 68.00 86.49| $ 86.49
21 |30” X 30" Round Gauge 0.080 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28.13 | $ 28.13 30.16| $ 30.16




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign

NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED PRICE EX;E:\(':DEED

22 |36” X 36" Round Gauge 0.080 EA | 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3825( $ 956.25 34.19( $ 854.75
23 [30” x 36” Gauge 0.080 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 31.88|$ 6,376.00 28.70( $ 5,740.00
24 [30” Stop Sign Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2500 | $ 2,500.00 22.14( $  2,214.00
25 [24” x 48" Gauge 0.100 EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 34.00 | $ 34.00 52.64| $ 52.64
26 |18 Stop Sign Gauge 0.080 EA | 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.56 | $ 239.00 7.97| $ 199.25
27 |36” X 36” (Stop) Gauge 0.080 EA | 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 36.00 $ 9,000.00 31.88| $  7,970.00
28 |[36” X 36” Gauge 0.080 EA | 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3825 $ 9562.50 33.83( $ 8,457.50
29 [36” x 36” (School Pentagon) Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3825 $ 3,825.00 3234 $ 3,234.00
30 (30" x 30” Gauge 0.080 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2656 | $  2,656.00 2391 $ 2,391.00
31 (18" X 72" Gauge 0.125 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 59.67 | $ 5,967.00 53.81( $ 5,381.00
32 [12” X 24" Gauge 0.080 EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 850 | $ 8.50 13.30( $ 13.30
33 [30” X 72" Gauge 0.125 EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 83.75| $ 83.75 107.05| $ 107.05
34 |24 x 72" Gauge 0.125 EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 79.56 | $ 79.56 88.25( $ 88.25
35 [18” X 48" Gauge 0.125 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.78 | $ 39.78 49.39| $ 49.39
36 [18” X 54" Gauge 0.125 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4475 | $ 44.75 58.88( $ 58.88
37 [18” x 96” Gauge 0.10 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 79.56 | $ 79.56 74.79| $ 74.79
38 [36” x 60" Gauge 0.10 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 99.45 | $ 99.45 85.63( $ 85.63




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. |ITEM uoM| QTY |  PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED
39 |36”x 72" Gauge 0.10 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 119.00 | $  119.00 11847 $ 11847
40 |48" x 60" Gauge 0.10 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 125.00 | $  125.00 11420 $  114.20
41 48" X 72" Gauge 0.10 EA | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12750 | $  127.50 137.01| $  137.01
42 |54” X 24" Gauge 0.10 EA | 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4781 $ 119525 3659|$ 91475
43 |54” X 18" Gauge 0.10 EA | 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3586 | $  896.50 27.99|$ 69975
Section 5 Total NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 71,419.35 $ 63,213.97
Section 6 - Rollup Signs
1 |Road Work Ahead - W20-1 EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |One Lane Road Ahead - W20-4 EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 |Merge Left Symbol - W4-2L EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 |Merge Right Symbol - W4-2R EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5  |Right Lane Closed Ahead - W20-5R EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |Left Lane Closed Ahead - W20-5L EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 gir?:r:gf:;ec;c;i? ;hjf‘ga\;v,{fgla:‘??eab'e Panel. | £a | 10 145.00| $  1,450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 g:;?fgﬁ.?!,eazzng S:‘Z‘Zfé tcohzt“g\f:ﬂﬁepf‘g%ﬂﬁ'_' EA | 10 3150| $  315.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 gﬁffgilaé’-'ifdaﬂil;ifeﬁetfzfgsifﬂee ‘,’,;?gﬂf‘" EA | 10 3150| $  315.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 |Mowing Ahead - W21-8 EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Barricade Lites, Inc. Decker Supply Inc. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Lordon Inc. MD Solutions US Standard Sign
NO. [ITEM UOM| QTY |  PRICE EX;EINCDEED PRICE EX;EI'\'CDEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED PRICE EX;EI'\(':DEED
11 |Flagger Symbol - W20-7 EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |Rough Grooved Surface - W8- 1106 EA 10 140.00( $ 1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |Bump - ws-1 EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 |Clean Up Crew Working - 11-1107¢ EA | 20 140.00| $  2,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 |Steel Plate Ahead — W8-24 EA | 10 140.00| $  1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 |Other Mutcd Rollup Signs EA 10 140.00( $ 1,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 2;!5%5,,@& rﬁfﬂ,ﬁ”{:g?ﬁfggn?a"d for use with EA | 50 265.00| $ 13,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 fg!ﬁ%ﬁi?L‘Tlfpoi'rigzns?gig” Stand for use with EA | 50 160.00| $  8,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 sx;rzepﬂgfEgi%'i?;;%;’”;gg's‘;ggsghe" or EA | 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Section 6 Total $ 42,930.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTES

1. Barricade Lites, Inc.'s Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for a submission error:
a. Section 1 Total was corrected from $51,822.77 to $68,004.77.

2. Lightle Enterprises of Ohio's Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
a. Section 1 Total was corrected from $79,928.88 to $79,938.88.
b. Section 3 Total was corrected from $99,635.87 to $107,324.31.
c. Section 4 Total was corrected from $43,076.16 to $43,928.00.

3. MD Solutions' Bid Tabulation was adjusted to correct for submission errors:
a. Section 3 Total was corrected from $111,913.30 to $111,913.34.
b. Section 4 Total was corrected from $77,177.58 to $81,964.23.
c. Section 5 Total was corrected from $70,277.91 to $71,419.35.

Bid Opening 10/24/25 @ 2:30 PM[ SR, BR
Invitations Sent 33
Total Vendors Requesting Documents 4
Total Bid Responses 6
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