
Arlowe, Amy

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subiect:

Matt Sutton < msutton@rapidview.com >

Wednesday, April 19, 202312:14PM
Arlowe, Amy
jeff@rapidview.com

RE: contract paperwork

[Caution: This email originated outside Dupageco.org. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and
know the content is safe.l

Hello Amy,
Yes, until such time as we have a dealer for your territory, then it may be through them. As of now, we have no dealer in
lllinois, but are handling it out of our headquarters in lndiana.

Thanks,

Motthew W. Sutton
VP SALES & MARKETING

RapidView IBAK North America
Office: 574-224-5427 | Main: 574-224-5426 | Toll Free: 300-656-4225
matt@rapidview.com 

I
www_rao .com

From: Arlowe, Amy <Amy.Arlowe@dupageco.org>

Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 L:02PM
To:'Matt Sutton' <msutton@rapidview.com>
Cc: jeff@ ra pidview.co m

Subject: RE: contract paperwork

Matt,
Thanks for the quick response. I am assuming that all invoices will come from and be paid to RapidView. Please let me
know if that is not the case.

Sincerely,

Amy Arlowe
Buyer ll
DuPage County Public Works
7900 S. Route 53

Woodridge, lL 60517
630.427.3548
Fax: 630.985.4802
amv.arlowe@du pageco.org

From: Matt Sutton <msutton@rapidview.com>
Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 tt:42 AM
To: Arlowe, Amy <Amv.Arlowe@dupageco.org>


