THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE

FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
VEHICLE UPFIT FOR ANIMAL SERVICES
24-115-ANS

BID TABULATION

v

Vehicle 1 Mavron, Inc.
NO. [ITEM UoM QTY PRICE EX;:E:I?EED
1 [Conversion EA 1 $ 37,083.60| $ 37,083.60
2 |Rear Cage Setback EA 1 NO BID
3 [Rear Cage Bank EA 1 NO BID
4  |Auxiliary Heat/AC install in Gas Engine EA 1 $ 358440| $ 3,584.40
5 [Installation of Cab File Desk EA 1 $ 493.20 ( $ 493.20
6 |Installation of Thermometer EA 1 $ 204.00( $ 204.00
! g:;?:llﬁ):lsa:roﬁi?/;r side-side trimwork) EA 1 $ 31080 $ 310.80
8 ZLC;CE;IIID(;?;?J ?nCrz;gros:tr?):\ck area) EA 1 $ 152.40 $ 152.40
9 g:;?:n?: :b%?/l; l\r;/isr:?:lltlav}ji:)n cab wall) EA 1 $ 68.40 | $ 68.40
o [fmereD i e 7S WX s o5 7seos
11 \(/i\r/]f:;ﬁrlo'l;)ArLeE;Sr ;rf\tzifdvisor with controller EA 1 $ 190920| $ 1,909.20
12 |Shipping EA 1 NO BID
Vehicle 2
13 |Conversion EA 1 $ 37,576.80 | $ 37,576.80
14 |Rear Cage Setback EA 1 NO BID
15 |Rear Cage Bank EA 1 NO BID




16 [Integration of rear factory AC option in van EA $ 693.60 | $ 693.60
17 [Integration of front factory Heat in van EA $ 693.60 | $ 693.60
18 [Installation of Thermometer EA $ 204.00 ( $ 204.00
19 (Ci:;f:lll:i):lﬁaaHrotljdri?/;r side-side trimwork) EA $ 31080 $ 310.80
20 z:i:mosc:;ll[)(;?;ri]ni ?n(:rz;%Os:trEt}):\ck area) EA $ 152.40 | $ 15240
21 g:;?:n?: :b%?/l; l\r;/isr:?jltlav}jit)n cab wall) EA $ 68.40 | $ 68.40
22 instelop fromtofveniae) | A s 786.00|$ 78600
23 \(/i\r/]r:;ﬁrlo'LArLeE;Sr ;r?\ingdvisor with controller EA $ 190920|$ 1,909.20
24 |Shipping EA NO BID

GRAND TOTAL| $ 86,986.80

NOTES
Quote Opening 10/18/2024 @ 4:00 PM HK, BR

Invitations Sent

Total Vendors Requesting Documents

Total Bid Responses
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