



**THE COUNTY OF DUPAGE
FINANCE - PROCUREMENT
VETERINARY PHARMACEUTICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 22-067-ANS
BID TABULATION**



NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
				PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	3-Ply Disposable Face Mask, Earloop 50 Ct Box	BX	6	\$ 5.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 5.97	\$ 35.82	\$ 37.36	\$ 224.16	No Bid	
2	Acepromazine Tablets, 25mg 100 Ct Bottle	BT	3	\$ 58.70	\$ 176.10	\$ 62.01	\$ 186.03	\$ 58.98	\$ 176.94	No Bid	
3	ALPHATRAK 2 TEST STRIPS 50 CT 1 MUL	EA	2	\$ 57.89	\$ 115.78	\$ 58.59	\$ 117.18	\$ 53.70	\$ 107.40	No Bid	
4	Amdent Piezo Scaler Tip, Universal, PE-39	EA	2	\$ 97.77	\$ 195.54	\$ 85.26	\$ 170.52	\$ 97.44	\$ 194.88	No Bid	
5	Anesthesia Gas Filter Canister	EA	3	\$ 6.59	\$ 19.77	\$ 5.10	\$ 15.30	\$ 5.48	\$ 16.44	No Bid	
6	Anesthesia Mask with Diaphragm, Feline, Medium	EA	2	\$ 42.35	\$ 84.70	\$ 18.09	\$ 36.18	\$ 43.47	\$ 86.94	No Bid	
7	Anesthesia Mask with Diaphragm, Feline, Small	EA	2	\$ 42.35	\$ 84.70	\$ 18.09	\$ 36.18	\$ 42.97	\$ 85.94	No Bid	
8	ANTISEDAN INJECTABLE SOLUTION 5MG/MLX10ML VLX1 TWN/US, 10ml - Vial	VL	1	\$ 221.30	\$ 221.30	\$ 221.30	\$ 221.30	\$ 221.30	\$ 221.30	No Bid	
9	Atropine Sulfate Injection, 0.54mg/mL , 100mL Vial	VL	2	\$ 25.89	\$ 51.78	\$ 20.94	\$ 41.88	\$ 19.16	\$ 38.32	No Bid	
10	Autoclave Indicator Tape, Steam, 3/4 in x 60 yd	EA	9	\$ 4.22	\$ 37.98	\$ 4.69	\$ 42.21	\$ 4.61	\$ 41.49	\$ 7.73	\$ 69.57
11	Azithromycin Oral Suspension, USP, 200mg/5mL, Banana-Cherry Flavored, 15mL Bottle	BT	6	\$ 5.98	\$ 35.88	\$ 3.74	\$ 22.44	\$ 7.01	\$ 42.06	No Bid	
12	Biopsy Skin Punch, Disposable, (33-36), 6mm	EA	2	\$ 2.41	\$ 4.82	\$ 2.01	\$ 4.02	\$ 1.91	\$ 3.82	\$ 3.35	\$ 6.70
13	Biopsy Skin Punch, Disposable, (33-37), 8mm	EA	4	\$ 2.41	\$ 9.64	\$ 2.01	\$ 8.04	\$ 1.92	\$ 7.68	\$ 3.35	\$ 13.40
14	Blade Wash 18oz - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 4.96	\$ 9.92	\$ 5.53	\$ 11.06	\$ 5.82	\$ 11.64	No Bid	
15	Bottle with Yorker, Plastic, 1/4 oz, 60 Count - Bag	BG	4	\$ 15.51	\$ 62.04	\$ 12.17	\$ 48.69	\$ 6.25	\$ 25.00	No Bid	
16	Bottle, Plastic, with Yorker, 0.5 oz, 48 Count - Bag	BG	3	\$ 11.86	\$ 35.58	\$ 12.66	\$ 37.98	\$ 5.70	\$ 17.10	No Bid	
17	Bravecto Chewables for Dogs, 1000mg, Blue, Large, 44.1-88 lb., 10 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	1	\$ 360.50	\$ 360.50	\$ 403.10	\$ 403.10	\$ 368.40	\$ 368.40	No Bid	
18	Breathing Bag, Green, 2L	EA	3	\$ 8.11	\$ 24.33	\$ 6.66	\$ 19.98	\$ 24.79	\$ 74.37	\$ 5.42	\$ 16.26
19	Breathing Bag, Green, 3L	EA	3	\$ 7.99	\$ 23.97	\$ 6.66	\$ 19.98	\$ 25.44	\$ 76.32	\$ 5.42	\$ 16.26
20	Bupivacaine HCl 0.5% Injection, USP, 250mg/50mL (5mg/mL), Flip top, 50mL - Vial	VL	4	\$ 3.11	\$ 12.44	\$ 3.28	\$ 13.12	\$ 6.00	\$ 24.00	No Bid	
21	Buprenorphine HCl Carpuject, Preservative-Free, 0.3mg/mL, C3, 10 x 1mL - Syringe	BX	5	\$ 104.12	\$ 520.60	No Bid		\$ 82.87	\$ 414.35	No Bid	
22	Buprenorphine HCl Injection, 0.3mg/mL, C3, 5 x 1mL - Vial	BX	20	\$ 74.74	\$ 1,494.80	\$ 84.88	\$ 1,697.60	\$ 79.70	\$ 1,594.00	No Bid	
23	Bur, Carbide, Round, FG 2, 10 Count - Pack	PK	2	\$ 12.70	\$ 25.40	\$ 17.50	\$ 35.00	\$ 8.28	\$ 16.56	\$ 32.01	\$ 64.02



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
24	BUSTER Comfort Elizabethan Collar for Dogs, 25cm, 5 Count - Pack	PK	2	\$ 40.96	\$ 81.92	\$ 16.75	\$ 33.50	\$ 3.02	\$ 6.04	No Bid	
25	BUSTER Easy-ID Color-Coded Canine Muzzle, Small	EA	4	\$ 6.66	\$ 26.64	\$ 5.33	\$ 21.32	\$ 4.97	\$ 19.88	No Bid	
26	Capstar Tablets for Cats and Dogs, 11.4mg, Blue, Small, 2-25 lb., Bulk Pack, 60 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 255.39	\$ 510.78	\$ 217.10	\$ 434.20	\$ 227.48	\$ 454.96	No Bid	
27	Carbolime Bulk Pack, 3lb - Bag	BG	6	\$ 6.28	\$ 37.68	\$ 6.50	\$ 39.00	\$ 6.46	\$ 38.76	No Bid	
28	Cephalexin Capsules, USP, 500mg, 500 Count - Bottle	BT	3	\$ 43.57	\$ 130.71	\$ 31.14	\$ 93.42	\$ 50.95	\$ 152.85	No Bid	
29	Ceraven/CeraSoothe P Anti-Itch Mousse, 6.8oz - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 12.19	\$ 48.76	\$ 10.10	\$ 40.40	\$ 13.64	\$ 54.56	No Bid	
30	CERENIA SOLUTION 10MG/MLX20ML VLX1 USA, 20mL vial	VL	15	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 182.90	\$ 2,743.50	No Bid	
31	Cerumene Ear Cleaner, 4oz - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 12.49	\$ 49.96	\$ 12.74	\$ 50.96	\$ 12.74	\$ 50.96	No Bid	
32	Chlorhexidine 2% Solution, 1 Gallon - Bottle	BT	5	\$ 9.38	\$ 46.90	\$ 11.88	\$ 59.40	\$ 8.83	\$ 44.15	No Bid	
33	Ciprofloxacin HCl Tablets, USP, 250mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	3	\$ 6.66	\$ 19.98	\$ 6.55	\$ 19.65	\$ 6.60	\$ 19.80	No Bid	
34	CLAVAMOX CHEW 125MG TAB 10X10 EN 100 Count - Box	BX	4	\$ 111.63	\$ 446.52	\$ 111.63	\$ 446.52	\$ 139.54	\$ 558.16	No Bid	
35	CLAVAMOX CHEW 250MG TAB 10X10 EN 100 Count Box	BX	3	\$ 185.85	\$ 557.55	\$ 183.85	\$ 551.55	\$ 229.81	\$ 689.43	No Bid	
36	CLAVAMOX CHEW 375MG TAB 10X10 EN, 100 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 262.70	\$ 525.40	\$ 262.70	\$ 525.40	\$ 328.37	\$ 656.74	No Bid	
37	CLAVAMOX CHEW 62.5MG TAB 10X10 EN 100 Count Box	BX	3	\$ 60.24	\$ 180.72	\$ 21.09	\$ 63.27	\$ 75.30	\$ 225.90	No Bid	
38	CLAVAMOX CHEW TAB 250MG 112CT ROLL USA	BX	2	\$ 170.10	\$ 340.20	\$ 170.10	\$ 340.20	\$ 170.10	\$ 340.20	No Bid	
39	CLAVAMOX CHEW TAB 375MG 112CT ROLL USA	BX	1	\$ 242.45	\$ 242.45	\$ 242.45	\$ 242.45	\$ 242.45	\$ 242.45	No Bid	
40	CLAVAMOX CHEW TAB 62.5MG 112CT ROLL USA	BX	1	\$ 57.20	\$ 57.20	\$ 57.20	\$ 57.20	\$ 57.20	\$ 57.20	No Bid	
41	CLAVAMOX DROPS 62.5MG/MLX15 ML BTX1 EN, 15ml - Bottle	BT	12	\$ 18.50	\$ 222.00	\$ 11.36	\$ 136.32	\$ 222.00	\$ 2,664.00	No Bid	
42	ClinTabs for Dogs, 25mg, 400 Count - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 116.79	\$ 467.16	\$ 116.79	\$ 467.16	\$ 137.40	\$ 549.60	No Bid	
43	CONVENIA 80MG/ML 10MLVLX1 US, 10mL - Bottle	VL	6	\$ 359.45	\$ 2,156.70	\$ 359.45	\$ 2,156.70	\$ 359.45	\$ 2,156.70	No Bid	
44	Cool Care Plus Lube 15.5oz - Each	EA	2	\$ 9.06	\$ 18.12	\$ 9.07	\$ 18.14	\$ 7.36	\$ 14.72	No Bid	
45	Cotton Tipped Applicators, Wood Shaft, 6 in, 1000 Count - Box	BX	4	\$ 7.86	\$ 31.44	\$ 7.25	\$ 29.00	\$ 4.75	\$ 19.00	\$ 62.22	\$ 248.88
46	Cough Tablets, 250 Count - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 46.60	\$ 93.20	\$ 44.81	\$ 89.62	\$ 41.78	\$ 83.56	No Bid	
47	Cryogen-X Blade, Size 40	EA	9	\$ 21.03	\$ 189.27	\$ 24.18	\$ 217.62	\$ 24.64	\$ 221.76	No Bid	
48	Curity Stretch Bandage, 4 in x 75 ft, 12 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 6.50	\$ 13.00	\$ 6.52	\$ 13.04	\$ 54.79	\$ 109.58	No Bid	
49	DEFENSOR 1 FE VACX10DS VLX5 EN US, 5 x 10 Dose - Box	BX	2,530	\$ 30.50	\$ 77,165.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 159,390.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 354,200.00	No Bid	



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50	DEFENSOR 3 FE VACX1DS VLX50 EN US, 50 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	150	\$ 149.00	\$ 22,350.00	\$ 67.05	\$ 10,057.50	\$ 149.00	\$ 22,350.00	No Bid	
51	Denamarin for Large Dogs, 425mg, 30 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 46.11	\$ 92.22	\$ 46.11	\$ 92.22	\$ 46.11	\$ 92.22	No Bid	
52	DEXDOMITOR SOLUTION 0.5MG/MLX10ML VLX1 USA/TW	VL	17	\$ 199.95	\$ 3,399.15	\$ 199.95	\$ 3,399.15	\$ 199.95	\$ 3,399.15	No Bid	
53	Dextrose Solution, 50%, 500mL - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 3.70	\$ 7.40	\$ 3.14	\$ 6.28	\$ 2.96	\$ 5.92	No Bid	
54	Diazepam Injection, USP, 50mg/10mL (5mg/mL), C4, 5 x 10mL - Vial	BX	2	\$ 221.40	\$ 442.80	\$ 231.25	\$ 462.50	\$ 224.14	\$ 448.28	No Bid	
55	Diphenhydramine HCl Capsules, 50mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 1.96	\$ 7.84	\$ 2.54	\$ 10.16	\$ 1.90	\$ 7.60	No Bid	
56	Diroban Injection 25mg/mL, 5 x 2mL - Box	BX	18	\$ 246.75	\$ 4,441.50	\$ 246.75	\$ 4,441.50	\$ 246.75	\$ 4,441.50	No Bid	
57	Disposable Needle, Soft Pack, 20 G x 1 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 3.53	\$ 10.59	\$ 3.75	\$ 11.25	\$ 8.07	\$ 24.21	\$ 26.58	\$ 79.74
58	Disposable Needle, Soft Pack, 25 G x 5/8 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	5	\$ 3.71	\$ 18.55	\$ 3.75	\$ 18.75	\$ 8.07	\$ 40.35	\$ 23.73	\$ 118.65
59	Disposable Syringe, Soft Pack, 12mL, Luer Lock, 100 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 12.70	\$ 25.40	\$ 12.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.32	\$ 44.64	No Bid	
60	Disposable Syringe/Needle Combo, Hard Pack, 3mL, 22 G x 3/4 in, Luer Lock, 100 Count Box	BX	27	\$ 9.06	\$ 244.62	\$ 6.73	\$ 181.71	\$ 12.59	\$ 339.93	No Bid	
61	Disposable Tuberculin Syringe/Needle Combo, Detachable Luer Slip, 1mL, 25 G x 5/8 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	6	\$ 18.18	\$ 109.08	\$ 9.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 22.14	\$ 132.84	\$ 15.92	\$ 95.52
62	DOUXO S3 PYO Shampoo, 16.9oz - Bottle	BT	3	\$ 27.99	\$ 83.97	\$ 27.65	\$ 82.95	\$ 27.65	\$ 82.95	No Bid	
63	Doxycycline Monohydrate Tablets, USP, 50mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	9	\$ 12.65	\$ 113.85	No Bid		\$ 16.19	\$ 145.71	No Bid	
64	DTM Culture Mini Plates, Dermatophyte Test Medium, Individually Wrapped, 6 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 9.92	\$ 19.83	\$ 12.85	\$ 25.70	No Bid		No Bid	
65	DuoDermatophyte Culture Plates, DTM/Enhanced Sporulation Agar, 10 Count - Box	BX	5	\$ 22.66	\$ 113.31	\$ 25.06	\$ 125.30	\$ 23.15	\$ 115.75	No Bid	
66	Elastikon Stretch Adhesive Tape Roll, 3 in x 2 1/2 yd, 4 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 23.00	\$ 69.00	\$ 14.01	\$ 42.03	\$ 14.76	\$ 44.28	No Bid	
67	Elastikon Stretch Adhesive Tape Roll, 4 in x 2 1/2 yd, 6 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 46.00	\$ 92.00	\$ 28.77	\$ 57.54	\$ 27.30	\$ 54.60	No Bid	
68	Encore Sensi-Touch Powder-Free Sterile Latex Surgical Gloves, Size 7, 50 Pairs - Box	BX	11	\$ 32.89	\$ 361.79	\$ 38.67	\$ 425.37	\$ 46.01	\$ 506.11	\$ 63.15	\$ 694.65
69	Encore Textured Powder-Free Sterile Latex Surgical Gloves, Size 6.5, 50 Pairs - Box	BX	2	\$ 72.61	\$ 145.22	\$ 59.38	\$ 118.76	\$ 240.92	\$ 481.84	No Bid	
70	Encore Textured Powder-Free Sterile Latex Surgical Gloves, Size 7, 50 Pairs - Box	BX	5	\$ 72.61	\$ 363.05	\$ 59.38	\$ 296.90	\$ 240.92	\$ 1,204.60	No Bid	
71	Endotube with Inflatable Cuff, PVC, Clear, 8.0mm	EA	3	\$ 4.74	\$ 14.22	\$ 1.55	\$ 4.65	\$ 19.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 3.74	\$ 11.22
72	Endotube, Cuffed with Murphy Eye, Clear, 10mm	EA	2	\$ 2.18	\$ 4.36	\$ 1.55	\$ 3.10	\$ 6.42	\$ 12.84	No Bid	
73	Endotube, Cuffed with Murphy Eye, Clear, 3.0mm	EA	4	\$ 2.08	\$ 8.32	\$ 1.55	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.42	\$ 25.68	No Bid	
74	Endotube, Cuffed with Murphy Eye, Clear, 4.0mm	EA	8	\$ 2.08	\$ 16.64	\$ 1.55	\$ 12.40	\$ 6.42	\$ 51.36	No Bid	
75	Endotube, Cuffed with Murphy Eye, Clear, 6.5mm	EA	3	\$ 2.18	\$ 6.54	\$ 1.55	\$ 4.65	\$ 6.42	\$ 19.26	\$ 3.74	\$ 11.22



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
76	Endotube, Cuffed with Murphy Eye, Clear, 7.0mm	EA	2	\$ 2.18	\$ 4.36	\$ 1.55	\$ 3.10	\$ 6.42	\$ 12.84	\$ 3.74	\$ 7.48
77	Endotube, Cuffed with Murphy Eye, Clear, 9.0mm	EA	2	\$ 2.18	\$ 4.36	\$ 1.55	\$ 3.10	\$ 6.42	\$ 12.84	No Bid	
78	Enrofloxacin Flavored Chewable Tablets, 22.7mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 50.38	\$ 100.76	\$ 42.43	\$ 84.86	\$ 50.39	\$ 100.78	No Bid	
79	Epinephrine Injectable, 1mg/ML, 50mL - Vial	VL	2	\$ 25.79	\$ 51.58	\$ 28.19	\$ 56.38	\$ 23.92	\$ 47.84	No Bid	
80	Epi-Soothe Oatmeal Cream Rinse And Conditioner, 16 Ounce - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 14.60	\$ 29.20	\$ 14.60	\$ 29.20	\$ 17.18	\$ 34.36	No Bid	
81	Epi-Soothe Oatmeal Shampoo. 16 Ounce - Bottle	BT	3	\$ 12.32	\$ 36.96	\$ 12.32	\$ 36.96	\$ 14.49	\$ 43.47	No Bid	
82	Exam Gloves, Latex, Powder-Free, Polymer Coated, Extra Large, 90 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 11.49	\$ 34.47	\$ 9.18	\$ 27.54	\$ 23.64	\$ 70.92	\$ 12.47	\$ 37.41
83	Exam Gloves, Latex, Powder-Free, Polymer-Coated, Medium, 100 Count Box	BX	38	\$ 11.30	\$ 429.40	\$ 9.18	\$ 348.90	\$ 23.64	\$ 898.32	\$ 18.12	\$ 688.56
84	Exam Gloves, Latex, Powder-Free, Polymer-Coated, Small, 100 Count - Box	BX	13	\$ 10.26	\$ 133.38	\$ 9.18	\$ 119.36	\$ 23.64	\$ 307.32	\$ 18.12	\$ 235.56
85	Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Powder-Free, Blue, Large, 100 Count - Box	BX	9	\$ 19.97	\$ 179.73	\$ 17.75	\$ 159.75	\$ 40.08	\$ 360.72	\$ 7.50	\$ 67.50
86	Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Powder-Free, Blue, Medium, 100 Count - Box	BX	8	\$ 19.97	\$ 159.76	\$ 17.75	\$ 142.00	\$ 40.08	\$ 320.64	\$ 7.50	\$ 60.00
87	Exam Gloves, Nitrile, Powder-Free, Blue, Small, 100 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 19.97	\$ 59.91	\$ 20.83	\$ 62.49	\$ 40.08	\$ 120.24	\$ 7.50	\$ 22.50
88	F/AIR Anesthesia Gas Filter Canister	EA	12	\$ 6.89	\$ 82.68	\$ 5.10	\$ 61.20	\$ 5.77	\$ 69.24	No Bid	
89	Famotidine Tablets, USP, 20mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	3	\$ 4.56	\$ 13.68	\$ 2.36	\$ 7.08	\$ 5.64	\$ 16.92	No Bid	
90	Fatal Plus Solution C2N, 250ml - Vial	VL	8	\$ 90.55	\$ 724.40	\$ 82.99	\$ 663.92	\$ 99.64	\$ 797.12	No Bid	
91	Feliway Classic Diffuser 30-Day Refill, 48mL - Box	BX	4	\$ 16.85	\$ 67.40	\$ 16.85	\$ 67.40	\$ 16.85	\$ 67.40	No Bid	
92	Feliway Classic Diffuser Starter Kit with 30-Day Refill Box	BX	12	\$ 20.17	\$ 242.04	\$ 19.91	\$ 238.92	\$ 19.91	\$ 238.92	No Bid	
93	Feliway Classic Professional Spray, 219mL - Bottle	BT	5	\$ 55.97	\$ 279.85	\$ 55.97	\$ 279.85	\$ 55.97	\$ 279.85	No Bid	
94	FELOCELL 3 VACX1DS VLX25 EN US, 25 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	1,825	No Bid		\$ 73.69		No Bid		No Bid	
95	FlexForm Conforming Stretch Gauze Roll, Non-Sterile, 2 in x 4 yd Stretched, 12 Count - Box	BX	6	\$ 1.91	\$ 11.46	\$ 1.28	\$ 7.68	\$ 33.90	\$ 203.40	No Bid	
96	Fluoxetine HCl Capsules, USP, 10mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 3.01	\$ 12.04	\$ 2.65	\$ 10.60	\$ 6.18	\$ 24.72	No Bid	
97	Fluoxetine HCl Capsules, USP, 20mg, 100 Count Bottle	BT	19	\$ 3.16	\$ 60.04	\$ 3.07	\$ 58.33	\$ 4.61	\$ 87.59	No Bid	
98	Flurbiprofen Sodium Ophthalmic Solution, 0.03%, 2.5mL - Dropper Bottle	BT	9	\$ 27.47	\$ 247.23	\$ 26.43	\$ 237.87	\$ 22.58	\$ 203.22	No Bid	
99	Gabapentin Capsules, USP, 100mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	8	\$ 3.83	\$ 30.64	\$ 2.08	\$ 16.64	\$ 3.46	\$ 27.68	No Bid	
100	Gabapentin Capsules, USP, 300mg, 500 Count - Bottle	BT	5	\$ 23.68	\$ 118.40	\$ 16.12	\$ 80.60	\$ 37.31	\$ 186.55	No Bid	
101	Gauze Sponges, Premium Non-Woven, Rayon/Polyester, 4-ply, 3 x 3 in, 200 Ct Bag	BG	105	\$ 2.31	\$ 242.55	\$ 1.68	\$ 176.78	\$ 3.62	\$ 380.10	No Bid	



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
102	Gauze Sponges, Premium Woven Coven, 12-Ply, 3 x 3 in, 200 Count Bag	BG	22	\$ 3.78	\$ 83.16	\$ 3.26	\$ 71.65	\$ 2.82	\$ 62.04	\$ 8.70	\$ 191.40
103	Gentamicin Sulfate with Betamethasone Valerate Topical Spray, 120mL - Bottle	BT	3	\$ 8.89	\$ 26.67	\$ 7.37	\$ 22.11	\$ 7.46	\$ 22.38	No Bid	
104	GLUture Topical Tissue Adhesive, with 10 Applicators 1.5mL Tube	EA	27	\$ 21.66	\$ 584.82	\$ 15.87	\$ 428.49	\$ 21.46	\$ 579.42	No Bid	
105	Heparin Sodium Injection, USP, 10,000 unit/10mL (1,000 unit/mL), 10mL - Vial	VL	2	\$ 5.23	\$ 10.46	\$ 4.24	\$ 8.48	\$ 2.95	\$ 5.90	No Bid	
106	Heparin Sodium Injection, USP, 30,000 unit/30mL (1,000 unit/mL), 30mL - Vial	VL	2	\$ 7.90	\$ 15.80	\$ 9.46	\$ 18.92	\$ 7.72	\$ 15.44	No Bid	
107	Hydrogen Peroxide 3%, USP Grade, 1 Gallon - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 3.93	\$ 7.86	\$ 5.92	\$ 11.84	\$ 4.41	\$ 8.82	No Bid	
108	Isoflurane Solution 250mL Bottle	BT	53	\$ 33.33	\$ 1,766.49	\$ 26.32	\$ 1,394.96	\$ 33.91	\$ 1,797.23	No Bid	
109	Isopropyl Alcohol, 70%, 1 Gallon - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 19.87	\$ 39.74	\$ 14.98	\$ 29.96	\$ 10.10	\$ 20.20	\$ 20.25	\$ 40.50
110	ITRAFUNGOL (itraconazole) Solution 10mg/mL, 52mL - Bottle	BT	13	\$ 35.30	\$ 458.90	\$ 35.30	\$ 458.90	\$ 41.53	\$ 539.89	No Bid	
111	IV Set, Primary A, with Injection Port, 15 Drop/mL, 78 in	EA	60	\$ 3.29	\$ 197.40	\$ 1.01	\$ 60.60	\$ 2.78	\$ 166.80	No Bid	
112	IV Set, Primary, MicroDrip, with Pre-Pierced Y-Site, 60 Drop/mL, 70 in	EA	3	\$ 2.10	\$ 6.30	\$ 2.09	\$ 6.27	\$ 2.78	\$ 8.34	No Bid	
113	Jackson Rees Non-Rebreathing Circuit with 1L Bag	EA	3	\$ 17.55	\$ 52.65	\$ 18.50	\$ 55.50	\$ 19.31	\$ 57.93	No Bid	
114	Keratolux Shampoo, 16oz - Bottle	BT	6	\$ 16.78	\$ 100.68	\$ 16.78	\$ 100.68	\$ 19.74	\$ 118.44	No Bid	
115	Kool Lube Spray, 14oz - Each	EA	2	\$ 6.68	\$ 13.36	\$ 6.23	\$ 12.46	\$ 5.84	\$ 11.68	No Bid	
116	KRULab V10 Urine Analysis Reagent Strips, 100 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 41.13	\$ 82.26	\$ 47.50	\$ 95.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 108.00	No Bid	
117	KRUTEX Surgical Gloves, Powder Free, Latex, Sterile, Size 7.0, 50 Pairs - Box	BX	2	\$ 36.50	\$ 73.00	\$ 29.69	\$ 59.38	\$ 45.63	\$ 91.26	No Bid	
118	Kwik Stop Styptic Powder, 42gm - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 9.18	\$ 18.36	\$ 9.89	\$ 19.78	\$ 10.44	\$ 20.88	No Bid	
119	Lactated Ringers Injection, USP, Preservative-Free, 14 x 1000mL - Viaflex Plastic Container	EA	6	\$ 61.78	\$ 370.68	\$ 62.69	\$ 376.14	\$ 62.69	\$ 376.14	No Bid	
120	Lidocaine 2% Injectable Solution, 100mL - Vial	VL	4	\$ 2.74	\$ 10.96	\$ 2.83	\$ 11.32	\$ 2.49	\$ 9.96	No Bid	
121	LifeShield T-Connector, Macro Bore, Luer Slip, 1.1mL Priming Volume, 5 in	EA	16	\$ 2.75	\$ 44.00	\$ 1.53	\$ 24.44	\$ 2.82	\$ 45.12	No Bid	
122	MalAcetic Otic Cleanser, 8oz - Bottle	BT	18	\$ 12.45	\$ 224.10	\$ 12.45	\$ 224.10	\$ 13.83	\$ 248.94	No Bid	
123	Meloxicam Injectable Solution, 5mg/ML, 20mL - Vial	VL	2	\$ 113.01	\$ 226.02	\$ 126.59	\$ 253.18	\$ 140.65	\$ 281.30	No Bid	
124	MetriZyme Low Foam Enzymatic Detergent, 32oz - Bottle	BT	8	\$ 38.58	\$ 308.64	\$ 23.96	\$ 191.68	\$ 22.50	\$ 180.00	\$ 23.95	\$ 191.60
125	Monoject Detachable Tuberculin Syringe, Luer Lock, Soft Pack, 1mL, 60 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 19.42	\$ 38.85	\$ 20.98	\$ 41.96	\$ 18.66	\$ 37.32	\$ 45.57	\$ 91.14
126	Monoject Disposable Needle, 250 Poly Hub Epoxy Insert, Bulk Pack, 27 G x 0.5 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 9.03	\$ 27.09	\$ 4.07	\$ 12.21	\$ 8.08	\$ 24.24	No Bid	
127	Monoject Disposable Needle, 251 Poly Hub with Aluminum Insert, Vet Pack, 18 G x 1 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 8.34	\$ 16.68	\$ 8.58	\$ 17.16	\$ 8.08	\$ 16.16	No Bid	



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
128	Monoject Disposable Needle, 251 Poly Hub with Aluminum Insert, Vet Pack, 22 G x 0.75 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 8.17	\$ 24.51	\$ 8.58	\$ 25.74	\$ 6.10	\$ 18.30	No Bid	
129	Monoject Disposable Needle, 251 Poly Hub with Aluminum Insert, Vet Pack, 25 G x 5/8 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 8.21	\$ 16.42	\$ 8.58	\$ 17.16	\$ 8.08	\$ 16.16	No Bid	
130	Monoject Disposable Needle, Soft Pack, 18 G x 1 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	4	\$ 10.09	\$ 40.36	\$ 9.10	\$ 36.40	\$ 8.07	\$ 32.28	No Bid	
131	Monoject Disposable Syringe, Luer Lock, Soft Pack, 20mL, 40 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 23.71	\$ 47.42	\$ 29.46	\$ 58.92	\$ 26.15	\$ 52.30	\$ 30.38	\$ 60.76
132	Monoject Disposable Syringe, Regular Tip, 3mL, 100 Count - Box	BX	10	\$ 11.43	\$ 114.27	\$ 12.33	\$ 123.30	\$ 11.61	\$ 116.10	\$ 29.78	\$ 297.80
133	Monoject Disposable Syringe/Needle Combo, Luer Lock, Vet Pack, 3mL, 22 G x 0.75 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	6	\$ 12.52	\$ 75.12	\$ 13.38	\$ 80.28	\$ 12.59	\$ 75.54	\$ 28.04	\$ 168.24
134	Monoject Tuberculin Syringe, Luer Slip, 1mL, 100 Count Box	BX	31	\$ 15.41	\$ 477.75	\$ 16.67	\$ 516.77	\$ 14.82	\$ 459.42	\$ 31.51	\$ 976.81
135	Monoject Tuberculin Syringe/Needle Combo, Detachable Luer Slip, 1mL, 25 G x 5/8 in, 100 Count Box	BX	40	\$ 23.14	\$ 925.59	\$ 24.93	\$ 997.20	\$ 22.14	\$ 885.60	\$ 28.40	\$ 1,136.00
136	Mupirocin Topical Ointment, USP, 2%, 22gm - Tube	EA	3	\$ 2.86	\$ 8.58	\$ 2.64	\$ 7.92	\$ 4.92	\$ 14.76	No Bid	
137	Murphy Eye Cuffed Endotube, PVC, Clear, 10.5mm	EA	4	\$ 9.02	\$ 36.08	\$ 8.80	\$ 35.20	\$ 36.60	\$ 146.40	\$ 3.74	\$ 14.96
138	Mycodex Plus Environmental Control Aerosol Household Spray, 16oz - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 10.03	\$ 20.06	\$ 10.88	\$ 21.76	\$ 10.07	\$ 20.14	No Bid	
139	Nobivac Canine 1-DAPPv Vaccine, 25 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	18	\$ 119.75	\$ 2,155.50	\$ 184.25	\$ 3,316.50	\$ 184.25	\$ 3,316.50	No Bid	
140	Nobivac Canine Intra-Trac 3 Vaccine, 25 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	20	\$ 116.75	\$ 2,335.00	\$ 179.75	\$ 3,595.00	\$ 179.75	\$ 3,595.00	No Bid	
141	Nobivac Canine Lepto4 Vaccine, 25 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	5	\$ 152.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 234.00	\$ 1,170.00	\$ 234.00	\$ 1,170.00	No Bid	
142	Nobivac Feline 1-HCP Vaccine, 25 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	10	\$ 97.25	\$ 972.50	\$ 149.75	\$ 1,497.50	\$ 164.75	\$ 1,647.50	No Bid	
143	Nosorb Cat Litter 5lb - Bag	BG	5	\$ 57.89	\$ 289.45	\$ 52.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 31.78	\$ 158.90	No Bid	
144	Nye Replacement Tourniquet, Neoprene Cord, 32 in	EA	2	\$ 7.08	\$ 14.16	\$ 32.28	\$ 64.56	\$ 30.92	\$ 61.84	\$ 56.40	\$ 112.80
145	Ofloxacin Ophthalmic Solution, 0.3%, 5mL - Dropper Bottle	EA	4	\$ 4.78	\$ 19.12	\$ 3.83	\$ 15.32	\$ 7.03	\$ 28.12	No Bid	
146	OK Steam Autoclave Sterilization Indicator Strips, 4 in x 9/16 in, 250 Count - Box	BX	7	\$ 15.53	\$ 108.71	\$ 15.81	\$ 110.67	\$ 12.91	\$ 90.37	No Bid	
147	Omega 3 Plus Vitamins, Liquid Spray, Cats / Dogs, 8oz - Bottle	BT	5	\$ 9.90	\$ 49.50	\$ 15.12	\$ 75.60	\$ 11.41	\$ 57.05	No Bid	
148	Onsior Tablets for Cats, 6mg, 30 Count - Box	BX	8	\$ 74.46	\$ 595.68	\$ 76.69	\$ 613.52	\$ 50.61	\$ 404.88	No Bid	
149	Optixcare Eye Lube 20grm Tube	EA	41	\$ 8.73	\$ 357.93	\$ 9.29	\$ 380.89	\$ 8.58	\$ 351.78	No Bid	
150	Osumia Otic Gel for Dogs, 20 x 1mL - Box	BX	2	\$ 135.19	\$ 270.38	\$ 135.19	\$ 270.38	\$ 150.21	\$ 300.42	No Bid	
151	Otomax Ointment, 215g, 8oz - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 181.09	\$ 362.18	\$ 203.45	\$ 406.90	\$ 58.08	\$ 116.16	No Bid	
152	Panacur 22% Granules, 1lb - Jar	EA	3	\$ 349.80	\$ 1,049.40	\$ 380.16	\$ 1,140.48	\$ 380.16	\$ 1,140.48	No Bid	
153	Pancreatic Enzyme Concentrate Powder, 8oz - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 73.47	\$ 146.94	\$ 79.24	\$ 158.48	\$ 15.39	\$ 30.78	No Bid	



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
154	PDO Absorbable Suture: Violet / 2-0 / NONE / 25m, Cassette - Each	EA	2	\$ 59.78	\$ 119.56	\$ 96.69	\$ 193.38	\$ 61.06	\$ 122.12	No Bid	
155	PDO Absorbable Suture: Violet / 3-0 / NONE / 25m, Cassette - Each	EA	8	\$ 50.06	\$ 400.48	\$ 81.19	\$ 649.52	\$ 106.78	\$ 854.24	No Bid	
156	PDO Absorbable Suture: Violet / 4-0 / NFS-2 Reverse Cutting 19mm / 30 in, 12 Count - Box	BX	2	\$ 51.21	\$ 102.42	\$ 69.31	\$ 138.62	\$ 382.87	\$ 765.74	No Bid	
157	PDO EQ Absorb Suture: Violet / #1 / NCP Reverse Cutting 40mm / 42 in, 12 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 107.99	\$ 323.97	\$ 70.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 477.78	\$ 1,433.34	No Bid	
158	Pet Doser Piller Gun with Rubber Tip, 7.5	EA	8	\$ 1.57	\$ 12.56	\$ 11.55	\$ 92.40	\$ 2.03	\$ 16.24	No Bid	
159	PGCL Absorbable Suture: Violet / #0 / NCT-1 Taper Point 36mm / 36 in, 12 Count - Box	BX	12	\$ 56.79	\$ 681.48	\$ 67.25	\$ 807.00	\$ 58.29	\$ 699.48	No Bid	
160	PGCL Absorbable Suture: Violet / 2-0 / NCT-1 Taper Point 36mm / 36 in, 12 Count - Box	BX	7	\$ 56.79	\$ 397.53	\$ 67.25	\$ 470.75	\$ 64.63	\$ 452.41	No Bid	
161	PGCL Absorbable Suture: Violet / 3-0 / NFS-1 Reverse Cutting 24mm / 36 in, 12 Count - Box	BX	7	\$ 45.85	\$ 320.95	\$ 66.69	\$ 466.83	\$ 59.89	\$ 419.23	No Bid	
162	PGCL Absorbable Suture: Violet / 3-0 / NSH Taper Point 26mm / 30 in, 12 Count - Box	BX	16	\$ 45.41	\$ 726.56	\$ 67.25	\$ 1,076.00	\$ 57.55	\$ 920.80	No Bid	
163	PGCL Absorbable Suture: Violet / 4-0 / NRB-1 Taper Point 17mm / 30 in, 12 Count Box	BX	28	\$ 51.99	\$ 1,455.72	No Bid		\$ 55.41	\$ 1,551.48	No Bid	
164	Pill Pockets for Capsules, Canine, Chicken Flavor, Value Pack, 60 Count - Bag	BG	10	\$ 12.25	\$ 122.50	\$ 3.43	\$ 34.32	No Bid		No Bid	
165	Pill Pockets for Capsules, Canine, Chicken Flavored, 6 x 30 Count - Box	BX	4	\$ 31.20	\$ 124.80	\$ 4.44	\$ 17.77	No Bid		No Bid	
166	Pill Pockets for Capsules, Canine, Hickory Smoke Flavor , 6 x 30 Count - Box	BX	4	\$ 30.91	\$ 123.64	\$ 3.57	\$ 14.28	No Bid		No Bid	
167	Pill Pockets for Capsules, Canine, Hickory Smoke Flavor, Value Sized, 60 Count - Bag	BG	15	\$ 11.87	\$ 178.05	\$ 4.46	\$ 66.93	No Bid		No Bid	
168	Potassium Chloride for Injection Concentrate, USP, Preservative-Free, 40mEq/20mL Vial (2mEq/mL), Flip top	VL	4	\$ 5.73	\$ 22.92	\$ 6.05	\$ 24.20	\$ 132.86	\$ 531.44	No Bid	
169	Praziquantel Injectable, 50mL - Vial	VL	7	\$ 369.56	\$ 2,586.92	\$ 364.88	\$ 2,554.16	\$ 417.27	\$ 2,920.89	No Bid	
170	Pro Plan Veterinary Supplements Canine Calming Care, 45 Count - Box	BX	10	\$ 27.49	\$ 274.90	\$ 149.94	\$ 1,499.40	\$ 27.49	\$ 274.90	No Bid	
171	Protective Plastic Film Gown with Thumb Hooks, Blue, Universal Each	EA	30	\$ 0.86	\$ 25.80	\$ 0.65	\$ 19.50	\$ 36.32	\$ 1,089.60	No Bid	
172	Provable Combination Kit for Cats and Small Dogs, 15mL Syringe, and 10 DC Caps	EA	6	\$ 15.36	\$ 92.16	\$ 15.36	\$ 92.16	\$ 15.36	\$ 92.16	No Bid	
173	PT10V Pre-Surgical Chemistry Diagnostic Test, 20 Cartridge - Box	BX	8	\$ 240.00	\$ 1,920.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
174	Purina Pro Plan Veterinary Diets FortiFlora Feline Nutritional Supplement, 6 x 30 Count - Case	CS	3	\$ 113.86	\$ 341.58	\$ 125.94	\$ 377.82	\$ 113.94	\$ 341.82	No Bid	
175	Rebreathing Bag, Reusable, Rubber, Black, 2L	EA	3	\$ 20.50	\$ 61.50	\$ 16.22	\$ 48.66	\$ 24.75	\$ 74.25	No Bid	
176	Rebreathing Bag, Reusable, Rubber, Black, 3L	EA	4	\$ 24.24	\$ 96.96	\$ 17.48	\$ 69.92	\$ 25.09	\$ 100.36	No Bid	
177	Rebreathing Bag, Reusable, Rubber, Black, 4L	EA	2	\$ 29.02	\$ 58.04	\$ 18.94	\$ 37.88	\$ 34.50	\$ 69.00	No Bid	
178	Reconcile Flavored Chewable Tablets for Dogs, 8mg, 8.8- 17.6 lb., 30 Count - Bottle	BT	7	\$ 8.85	\$ 61.96	\$ 9.47	\$ 66.29	\$ 9.47	\$ 66.29	No Bid	
179	Regular Surgeon 3/8 Circle Cutting Edge Needle, Size 12, 6 Count - Box	BX	10	\$ 10.03	\$ 100.30	\$ 9.13	\$ 91.30	\$ 10.20	\$ 102.00	No Bid	



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
180	Regular Surgeon 3/8 Circle Cutting Edge Needle, Size 16, 6 Count - Box	BX	8	\$ 10.03	\$ 80.24	\$ 10.42	\$ 83.36	\$ 8.04	\$ 64.32	No Bid	
181	Regular Surgeon 3/8 Circle Cutting Edge Suture Needle, Size 16, 12 Count - Box	BX	4	\$ 8.16	\$ 32.64	\$ 27.65	\$ 110.60	\$ 8.04	\$ 32.16	No Bid	
182	Replacement Bulb, Halogen, (#03100), 3.5V	EA	2	\$ 21.33	\$ 42.66	\$ 21.50	\$ 43.00	\$ 21.10	\$ 42.20	No Bid	
183	Replacement Bulb, Halogen, (#04900), 3.5V	EA	2	\$ 30.79	\$ 61.58	\$ 31.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 30.41	\$ 60.82	No Bid	
184	Rescue AHP Liquid Disinfectant Concentrate, 1 Gallon - Bottle	BT	17	\$ 37.81	\$ 642.77	\$ 39.69	\$ 674.73	\$ 39.83	\$ 677.11	No Bid	
185	Rescue AHP TB Ready-To-Use Wipes 160 Count Tub	EA	50	\$ 13.60	\$ 680.00	\$ 14.32	\$ 716.00	\$ 14.81	\$ 740.50	No Bid	
186	REVOLUTION PLUM 12% 3ML 360MG TBX6 US DOG 85-130LB	BX	40	\$ 355.65	\$ 14,226.00	\$ 369.25	\$ 14,770.00	No Bid		No Bid	
187	REVOLUTION PLUS 1.0ML TBX6 US	BX	10	Requesting more info		\$ 428.50	\$ 4,285.00	No Bid		No Bid	
188	RIMADYL CHEW TAB 100MGX180BTX1 EN US, 180 Count - Bottle	BT	7	\$ 82.43	\$ 577.01	\$ 82.43	\$ 577.01	\$ 103.04	\$ 721.28	No Bid	
189	RIMADYL CHEW TAB 25MGX180BTX1 EN, 180 Count - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 52.06	\$ 104.12	\$ 52.06	\$ 104.12	\$ 65.08	\$ 130.16	No Bid	
190	RIMADYL CHEW TAB 25MGX60BTX1 EN US	BT	1	\$ 18.32	\$ 18.32	\$ 18.32	\$ 18.32	\$ 22.90	\$ 22.90	No Bid	
191	RIMADYL CHEW TAB 75MGX180BTX1 EN US, 180 Count - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 65.03	\$ 130.06	\$ 65.08	\$ 130.16	\$ 81.35	\$ 162.70	No Bid	
192	RIMADYL INJECTABLE 50MG/MLX20ML VLX1 USA	VL	32	No Bid		\$ 66.45	\$ 2,126.40	No Bid		No Bid	
193	Sentinel Spectrum Chewable Tablets for Dogs, Blue, 50.1-100 lb., 5 x 6 Dose - Box	BX	6	\$ 243.35	\$ 1,460.10	\$ 243.35	\$ 1,460.10	\$ 243.35	\$ 1,460.10	No Bid	
194	Sentinel Spectrum Chewable Tablets for Dogs, Green, 8.1-25 lb., 5 x 6 Dose - Box	BX	3	\$ 165.65	\$ 496.95	\$ 165.65	\$ 496.95	\$ 165.65	\$ 496.95	No Bid	
195	Sentinel Spectrum Chewable Tablets for Dogs, Yellow, 25.1-50 lb., 5 x 6 Dose - Box	BX	5	\$ 201.95	\$ 1,009.75	\$ 201.95	\$ 1,009.75	\$ 201.95	\$ 1,009.75	No Bid	
196	SharpSafety Sharps Container, Hinged Lid, Red, 8 gal	EA	4	\$ 15.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 13.17	\$ 52.68	\$ 13.74	\$ 54.96	\$ 20.64	\$ 82.56
197	Sharps-A-Gator Sharps Container, Slide Lid, Red, 1 gal	EA	2	\$ 3.32	\$ 6.63	\$ 3.17	\$ 6.34	\$ 4.24	\$ 8.48	\$ 8.51	\$ 17.02
198	SIMBADOL BUPRENORPHINE INJ-1.8MG/ML 10ML	VL	2	\$ 221.30	\$ 442.60	\$ 266.40	\$ 532.80	\$ 266.40	\$ 532.80	No Bid	
199	Single-use Enema 12ml - Syringe	EA	5	\$ 2.86	\$ 14.30	\$ 3.90	\$ 19.50	\$ 3.59	\$ 17.95	No Bid	
200	Sovereign Feeding Tube, Sterile, 10 fr x 16 in	EA	5	\$ 1.17	\$ 5.85	\$ 1.25	\$ 6.25	\$ 15.72	\$ 78.60	No Bid	
201	Sovereign Feeding Tube, Sterile, 8 fr x 16 in	EA	4	\$ 1.17	\$ 4.68	\$ 1.25	\$ 5.00	\$ 15.72	\$ 62.88	No Bid	
202	Specialist Cast Padding, 2 in x 4 yd, 24 Count - Bag	BG	2	\$ 14.35	\$ 28.70	\$ 15.88	\$ 31.76	\$ 15.33	\$ 30.66	No Bid	
203	Specialist Cast Padding, 4 in x 4 yd, 12 Count - Bag	BG	4	\$ 14.63	\$ 58.52	\$ 15.59	\$ 62.36	\$ 15.02	\$ 60.08	No Bid	
204	Stelfonta (Tigilanol Tiglate) Injection for Dogs, 1mg/ML, 2mL - Vial	VL	2	\$ 359.70	\$ 719.40	\$ 359.70	\$ 719.40	\$ 359.70	\$ 719.40	No Bid	
205	Sterile Saline Solution 250mL, 250mL - Bottle	BT	7	\$ 3.77	\$ 26.39	\$ 2.80	\$ 19.60	\$ 2.68	\$ 18.76	No Bid	



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
206	Sterile Saline Solution 500mL Bottle	BT	6	\$ 3.29	\$ 19.74	\$ 4.34	\$ 26.04	\$ 3.08	\$ 18.48	No Bid	
207	Sterile Water Injectable Solution, USP, 250mL - Bottle	BT	2	\$ 3.08	\$ 6.16	\$ 2.80	\$ 5.60	\$ 2.62	\$ 5.24	No Bid	
208	SurFlash IV Catheter, Polyurethane, 20 G x 1.25 in	EA	10	\$ 1.74	\$ 17.40	\$ 1.39	\$ 13.90	\$ 1.26	\$ 12.60	No Bid	
209	SurFlash IV Catheter, Polyurethane, 24 G x 0.75 in	EA	10	\$ 1.32	\$ 13.20	\$ 1.39	\$ 13.90	\$ 1.26	\$ 12.60	No Bid	
210	Surflo Infusion Set, Winged, 12 in Tubing, 21 G x 0.75 in	EA	6	\$ 0.44	\$ 2.64	\$ 0.47	\$ 2.82	\$ 0.43	\$ 2.58	No Bid	
211	Surgical Blades, Stainless Steel, Sterile, #15, 100 Count - Box	BX	16	\$ 13.11	\$ 209.76	\$ 16.50	\$ 264.00	\$ 23.67	\$ 378.72	No Bid	
212	Surgilube Non-Spermicidal Lubricating Topical Jelly, Flip-Cap, 4.25oz - Tube	EA	4	\$ 3.64	\$ 14.56	\$ 1.58	\$ 6.32	\$ 3.46	\$ 13.84	No Bid	
213	SurVet Disposable Needle, Thin Wall, 25 G x 5/8 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	7	\$ 6.25	\$ 43.75	\$ 6.88	\$ 48.16	\$ 6.30	\$ 44.10	No Bid	
214	SurVet Disposable Needle, Ultra Thin Wall, 22 G x 0.75 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	5	\$ 6.25	\$ 31.25	\$ 6.88	\$ 34.40	\$ 6.30	\$ 31.50	No Bid	
215	SurVet Disposable Syringe/Needle Combo, Luer Lock, 3mL, 22 G x 0.75 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	12	\$ 11.72	\$ 140.64	\$ 13.13	\$ 157.56	\$ 12.01	\$ 144.12	No Bid	
216	SUR-VET Injection Plug, Luer Lock	EA	15	\$ 0.73	\$ 10.95	\$ 5.91	\$ 88.65	\$ 0.54	\$ 8.10	No Bid	
217	SYNOTIC OTIC SOLUTION 0.6%/MLX8ML DRPX1 EN, 12 x 8mL - Dropper Bottle	BT	8	\$ 171.60	\$ 1,372.80	\$ 171.60	\$ 1,372.80	\$ 171.60	\$ 1,372.80	No Bid	
218	SYRINGE LUER LOCK TIP 3CC X100 BX	BX	100	No Bid		\$ 6.19	\$ 619.00	\$ 10.19	\$ 1,019.00	\$ 32.83	\$ 3,283.00
219	Tattoo Ink Paste, Green, 5oz - Tube	EA	2	\$ 20.40	\$ 40.80	\$ 17.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 12.30	\$ 24.60	No Bid	
220	TELAZOL INJECTABLE 100MG/MLX5ML BTX1 EN, 5mL - Vial	VL	72	\$ 75.80	\$ 5,457.60	\$ 75.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 75.80	\$ 5,457.60	No Bid	
221	Telfa Ouchless Non-Adherent Dressing, 3 in x 4 in, 100 Count - Box	BX	3	\$ 20.51	\$ 61.53	\$ 6.98	\$ 20.94	\$ 17.79	\$ 53.37	\$ 28.50	\$ 85.50
222	Terramycin Ophthalmic Ointment 1/8oz - Tube	EA	12	\$ 15.75	\$ 189.00	\$ 15.75	\$ 189.00	\$ 15.75	\$ 189.00	No Bid	
223	Terramycin Ophthalmic Ointment 5MG/GMX3.5G TBX1 USA	EA	10	\$ 15.75	\$ 157.50	No Bid		\$ 15.75	\$ 157.50	No Bid	
224	Tom Cat Catheter, Semi-Rigid, Closed End, with Adapter, 3.5 fr x 5.5 in	EA	8	\$ 0.86	\$ 6.87	\$ 0.89	\$ 7.12	\$ 6.66	\$ 53.28	No Bid	
225	Tom Cat Catheter, Semi-Rigid, Open End, with Adapter, 3.5 fr x 4.5 in	EA	8	\$ 0.91	\$ 7.28	\$ 0.81	\$ 6.48	\$ 0.75	\$ 6.00	No Bid	
226	Tom Cat Catheter, Semi-Rigid, Open End, with Adapter, 3.5 fr x 5.5 in	EA	5	\$ 0.83	\$ 4.13	\$ 0.86	\$ 4.30	\$ 16.53	\$ 82.65	No Bid	
227	Trazodone HCl Tablets, USP, 100mg, 100 Count - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 7.62	\$ 30.48	\$ 4.35	\$ 17.40	\$ 6.62	\$ 26.48	No Bid	
228	Trazodone HCl Tablets, USP, 100mg, 1000 Count - Bottle	BT	16	\$ 75.06	\$ 1,200.96	\$ 19.59	\$ 313.44	\$ 64.00	\$ 1,024.00	No Bid	
229	Trazodone HCl Tablets, USP, 50mg, 500 Count - Bottle	BT	9	\$ 22.31	\$ 200.79	\$ 3.01	\$ 27.09	\$ 3.99	\$ 35.91	No Bid	
230	TrizEDTA Aqueous Flush, 4oz - Bottle	BT	3	\$ 9.60	\$ 28.80	\$ 9.60	\$ 28.80	\$ 10.67	\$ 32.01	No Bid	
231	VetScan UA Printer Paper	EA	4	\$ 3.83	\$ 15.32	\$ 4.25	\$ 17.00	\$ 4.25	\$ 17.00	\$ 15.44	\$ 61.76



				Covetrus North America		Midwest Veterinary Supply		MWI Veterinary Supply		Alphapromed LLC	
NO.	ITEM	UOM	QTY	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
232	VetSPON Absorbable Hemostatic Gelatin Sponges, 16 Cubes - Box	BX	3	\$ 79.56	\$ 238.68	\$ 81.95	\$ 245.85	\$ 79.56	\$ 238.68	No Bid	
233	Vetstarch Solution, 250mL - Bag	BG	2	\$ 22.15	\$ 44.30	\$ 20.76	\$ 41.52	\$ 19.63	\$ 39.26	No Bid	
234	Vet-Temp Rapid Digital Thermometer	EA	4	\$ 11.70	\$ 46.80	\$ 3.22	\$ 12.88	\$ 3.82	\$ 15.28	\$ 111.43	\$ 445.72
235	View Pack Self-Sealing Autoclave Sterilization Pouch, 5 1/4 in x 10 in, 200 Count - Box	BX	7	\$ 18.30	\$ 128.10	\$ 12.52	\$ 87.64	\$ 16.81	\$ 117.67	No Bid	
236	Vitamin B12 Injectable Solution, 5000mcg/ML, 100mL - Vial	VL	1	\$ 23.37	\$ 23.37	\$ 25.89	\$ 25.89	\$ 20.30	\$ 20.30	No Bid	
237	VNGRD FELINE RCP VACX1DS VLX25 EN US, 25 x 1 Dose - Box	BX	225	\$ 172.50	\$ 38,812.50	\$ 172.50	\$ 38,812.50	\$ 172.50	\$ 38,812.50	No Bid	
238	ZenCollar Premium Inflatable Recovery Collar, Size L	EA	3	\$ 11.58	\$ 34.74	\$ 12.02	\$ 36.06	\$ 16.04	\$ 48.12	No Bid	
239	ZenCollar Premium Inflatable Recovery Collar, Size M	EA	3	\$ 9.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 9.52	\$ 28.57	\$ 13.18	\$ 39.54	No Bid	
240	ZenCollar Premium Inflatable Recovery Collar, Size S	EA	3	\$ 8.17	\$ 24.51	\$ 7.32	\$ 21.97	\$ 11.18	\$ 33.54	No Bid	
241	ZenCollar Premium Inflatable Recovery Collar, Size XL	EA	4	\$ 13.14	\$ 52.56	\$ 14.58	\$ 58.33	\$ 19.21	\$ 76.84	No Bid	
242	Zylkene Sprinkle Capsules for Large Dogs, 450mg, 30 Count - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 43.34	\$ 173.36	\$ 45.51	\$ 182.04	\$ 45.51	\$ 182.04	No Bid	
243	Zylkene Sprinkle Capsules for Medium Dogs, 225mg, 30 Count - Bottle	BT	4	\$ 30.05	\$ 120.20	\$ 31.56	\$ 126.24	\$ 31.56	\$ 126.24	No Bid	
GRAND TOTAL					\$ 219,964.46		\$ 296,349.83		\$ 498,522.20		\$ 9,822.67

NOTES

- 1) Original scope included Felocell 3 Vac (line 94) but was subsequently removed from scope.
- 2) Miscalculations - Midwest Veterinary Supply Extended Price do not match and are highlighted to note error(s).
- 3) Miscalculations - MWI Veterinary Supply Extended Price do not match and are highlighted to note error(s).

Bid Opening 6/2/2022 @ 2:30 PM	VC, SJ
Invitations Sent	15
Total Vendors Requesting Documents	0
Total Bid Responses	4